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MS‘FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited co&eg Ho 2950009060 G5T ey Mo, 42 00016759
G Raffles Quay 421-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: {65} G222 2311 Faw (B5) 6222 3547

Chaims B Motor Undenwriting Depe 36 Robimsan Road #156-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax: (B5) 6507 3849
wiww, msfirstrapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No,

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
14-02-2019 QOur Ref No. D18001115MFSH
12-02-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHEOEER Third Party Vehicle. SJQ38632

45 PANDAN ROAD
CHEN CHEE KIONG

BBE7E919/ 68676919 Fax No.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA
NA

Fax No. 68416315

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

COMFORTDELGRO
ENGINEERING PTE LTD Attention. NIL
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

SANCE GROIN




Rasul (LKKAuto)
“

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 22 February, 2019 9:42 AM

To: 'CDGE Pandan Private Cars Crash Repair Counter'
Subject: 5JQ 3863Z DOA : 12/02/19

Hi Wang,

As spoken the repair limit for this vehicle is 3K, Due to repair cost is more than the repair limit, we as the opinion
treat this vehicle as uneconomical to repair

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4089133)

T Save the Earthe Print only when necessary-



Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@|kkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 22 February 2019 441 PM

To: ‘Eileen Lee'; 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc: assignments; SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001115MFSH/1
Attachments: 5]Q 3863Z - Preli Advise .pdf

Dear Eileen,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle 8JQ 3863Z
Date of survey: 20/02/2019

Vehicle recommended Total Loss.

We will submit our report accordingly.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall; Sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 19 February 2019 2:22 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001115MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@]kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubs Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Monday, 18 February 2019 4:16 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <EileenLee @msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001115MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

MNote: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

P'S: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




-' -" .-[ Auto

- Consulfanis
A S B L FPie Lid Company Registration No. 19960T1IER

S1URIAVE 1, #0225 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 405933 TEL : (065) 625363561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Rel: D19001115MFSH Date: 22 February 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI19003114/R1sd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ 5JQ 38637 .
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 20/02/2019 at the premises of M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 88 1205624 .
Revised Estimate Amount : 58 7.834.16
“Check” Items Amount : 85 1,964.16
Total : 5% 9,798.32
Market Value : 88 14.000.00 :
LTA Reimbursement Value +8%  10.821.00 g
Nett Value 55 3.179.00
Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear & front portion .

Comments/ Present Status:

Damages Consistent.

Vehicle recommended total loss due to uneconomical to repair.
Repair days: 14 days

Yours faithfully,
Mohammed Rasul
Automotive Assessor



SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please reporl coimactly | 2t io spead up the caims process
teted by the Policvholder andior the Authorised Driver
s truthul and accurate as possible. Any wilful misregresentation or witholding of malerat facls may allow neurance companies {

e issue and f this Form mganies is not an admissicn of solicy liabllity on e par of the Insuwrance ©

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

¥ the insurers of the GIA Records Management Cenlre e eneral Insurance Association of Singapore (GHA) fo

1ade avallable up

T&rs, you nanehy consent 1o the archiving of s repor &t the cenire and i cogles of the rapor baing made avalable

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Data Of Repart 13/02/2019 15:20

Data OF Accident 1 2002/2018 17:30

Exact Location Of Accidant ECP

Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

Vehicle Registration Mumber SJO28632
Insured/Policyholder

Mame Of Registered Owner ONG KAl YONG

MRIC No S7T932296B

Email Address KALYONG.ONG@GMAIL.COM
Mabile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-07 939880
Altemmalive Phona No OFFICE-NOPHONE
Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturear HOMDA

Made FREED-1.5 (A)

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was belng used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicla?

MNO

If Mo, Please state action to be taken THIRD PARTY
Wehicle Category FRIVATE CAR
Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company AXA INSURAMCE PTE LTD
Typa Of Coverags COMPREHENSIVE
Fleat Policy MO

Faolicy Numbar GAZ242420M1

Cover Note Number

Driver

Mamea of Driver ONG KAl YONG
NRIC No STH32296E

Date Of Birth 0211111979
Dccupation INDQOR

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experienca

Gander MALE

Mabile Mumbar

Fax Numbear

Contact Mumber OFFICE-MOPHOMNE

EMall Addrass ALY ONG.ONGERGMAIL COM



Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Delails Of Fropertles
Yehicle Category

Mamea of Driver
MRIC/Passpart Numbear
Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Mature Of Damage

Mo, Of Passangear (Including Drivar)

HYUNDAL 140

TAX
KWAN KAR WAl
S1738980F

BLK 7 UPPER ALJUNIED LANE #14-G7
3Booo?

Fage 3 of 24
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AN

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owener 1D Type:

Chwener 1D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo

WVehicle Lo be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Modal:

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Cutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE PeriodiYears):

0P Faid;

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 20 Feb 2019

PARFICOF Rehate Foning

Singapare NRIC
22948

S)03863L
Yes

20Feb 2019
HOMDA
FREED 1.5G A
Purpie

2008
L15A2330059
GB31029692
B7.0kW (114 bhp)
$21,324.00
07 May 200%
07 May 2009
2

£21.324.00

Yes
s May 2019
$10.662.00

06 May 2019

E - Open Category
10

$7.789.00
$159.00
$10,821.00

I'![[[..'I:.'LZ'."l'rl.|'-H."EIU'-‘.SQ-'I[b'll"i"rl.lHU[IUI'I.'EI'I(].JII'['!'I-"'.HE}HlﬂbYFLIUIICtSEI{}rELJETEﬁII'IF.'ILH TP | ML= U s |



2202019 Used Honda Freed Car for Sale in Singapore, Autolynx Pte Ltd - sgCarMart

sGCARMART.COM

New Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Farum Resources
-
. 5
w5
noneda fresd Frice Range ¥ Depreciaton ¥ 2009 v Viehiclke Type v L™
Resources Honda Freed 1,58 G {New 5-yr COE)
Car Buying Financial Insurance Accessories Simnifar Rasearch Photos Map

e E P TARLA SRR

Car Selling i b Crmipar Rixport B £l

Car Ownership

Price £34. 800
Car Aftermarket
Depreciation $6,960 fyr 7]
On The Move Reg Date 15-Apr-2008
(s COE lefty
Lifestyle
Manufactured 2004 7]
Car T Mileage 138,000 kem (14K fyr}
- ITVEL Transmission At

Engine Cap 1,496 o
Road Tax SEHZ fyr 7
RO Power B7.0 kW {116 bhp)
ntermicd View specs of the i

Curb Weight L3t0%kg [ 7]

Features Fued Eficiency Ang Yet Powerful 1,51 I-¥tec Engine,
Smaoth CVT Transmissian, 2 % Airbags, ABS, Auto
Digital Alrcon,

Accessories Leatir Saats, Sparts Bims, DVD ALGK System, ..# Il q | |
Reverse Camera/Sensors, Alarm And Remate, Side Locabon I.'-ap Frce Anaiyss

Mirrors Signal Indicators,

Description Consignment Uinit In Excedlent Condition For Cod
Renewal Onginal Paintwark, Well Kept & Regulardy Company Autolynx Pte Lid
Serviced. High Loan and Trade I Webcame. Call Now » deale
For Viewiing! w21 veds sald | 11 il
Coe = L7 Address 265 Serangoon Central Drive #02-
oMy $19,997 L 7] <ol
ARF $19.597 [#]
Office Mo 62R0E91
No. of Owners i 7]
Contact Person(s)  Jason Lzu SEREI0LO
Type of Veh - Ben 81892356
Category i Bl e Tk Chris 52531131
Availability Availabls - PEEMTLM AD Usaful Sarvicas
I Ad a3 Mot Afrand of lemens? Reguest to haeve
sra this car evalusted professanally
FTmLd AT
Ty oL T
I Find out the markes value for your car,
" Get a free Car Valuation.
- 5
Transfer Fea £25 7]
Dawn Payment $10,440 (1 [ +]
15t Instalment §487 [ 7]
Tatal linfrnnt Payment 510,047 7]

https:ifwww sgcarmant comiused_cars/infe.php?ID=80413T&0L=2744

(]



COMFORI
EMNCGINEERING
45 Pandan Road S (609286)
ACCIDENT REPAIR ESTIMATES

Our Ref;
Type of Claim : D Ohwn Damage Vahicle No. : SJ0Q38632
[x] 3ra Party Make & Model ; HONDA / FREED 15G A
D Windscreen Year of Manufacture 2008
Chaseis Ma. : GB31029692
In&s Company ; Ms first Engine No : L15A2330050
Excess : Puolicy No
Date of Accident 12002/2019 Time of Accident : 17:30
Suggested Days of Repair In-house Vehicle Assessar
Repair Estimates Mamse ;. WONG CHEE WEI /! CK
Slgnature
Parts (a) List Price ltems $8.407.80
Contact No GBGTE919

LESS 20 % %(1,681.56

{b) Nett Price ltems

Less % e { :

1

i) Special Nett tems $190.00 |
Total Parts Cost (Appendix A) 56,916.24 |
Labour (Appendix B) $5,140.00
Total Repair Cost $12,056.24 [ '

The above fotal wil be subjected to 7% G.5.T

MName of Surveyor : (?AIM,{_. - H‘. ‘:IW LD’UG%

Company oy | FIL b2¢ L 3“; L

Survey conducted an : '}0}' 0 th at (S {Fb
{ T

Remarks By Surveyor

(a) The repair of this vehicle is authorized / is not authorized until further notice.

(b) Recommended Days of Repair I’Lf' day(s)

(c) Resurvey & %}&r"ﬂ(fhv ; {Requ:ur@rdm Required b i ;

{d) Excess &

e} Signature of sureyor . (?‘/( Date: }'ﬂ/ﬂ L’ﬁﬂ
I I

/

ACTIDENT FEP R ESRRATES )
DE



COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
45 Pandna Road S (BOO2EA)
Tel: BBETES10 Fax 62626950

Appendix A

Spare Parts p
Vehicle No. $JQ38632Z/ Submit By WONG CHEE WEI | CK
Make & Mode! : HONDA FREED 15G A Year Manufacture : 2008
Chassis No. GB31029652 Engine No. L15A2330059
/ TP
/ S/0Order —
SNo. Part Deagrption % | pies | mics | mis | prcs
1 FRONT BUMPER Pﬁ/ ; 1 £324.00
2 FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMEN H =l 1 S2097.00
3 [FRONT BUMPER SPONGE 0% 1 NA
4 JFrrONT GRILLY chx 7 1 $270.00
& [FRONT BUMPER LHS TOWING CAP Ml S o i §23.40
6 PRONT BUMPER LIS BEACKET  faa 1 $18.00
7 [FRONT BUMPER RHS BRACKET %~ 1 $18.00
8 [FRONT LHS HEADLAMP (& ~ 1 $612.00
g [FRONT BONNE 1 - 1 $504.00
10 [FRONT BONNET LHS HINGE '7: 1 $50.40
11 JFRONT BONNET RHS HINGE T 1 $50.40
12 [FRONT LHS FENDER ﬁ""f 1 §630.00
13 JFRONT LHS FENDER LINER % 1 §122.40
14 [FRONT FENDER LINER CLIP A = 10 S1B8.00
15 [Reartan are B 1 $1.224.00
16 [REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING e f 4 5108.00
17 JREAR BUMPER e - 1 $324.00
18 |REAR LHS BUMPER BRACKET — Mlda o~ 1 $21.60
19 [REAR RHS BUMPER BRACKET Niga - 1 §21.60
20 [REAR 1AL LaMrRus  CAN 77 1 §252.00
21 [RAFR TAIL LAMP LHS (Lo~ 1 $252.00
22 [REAR TIAL GATE CENTER MOULDING ( NUMEER PLATE Lamp (B4l 4 5234.00
23 |REAR NUMBER PLATE LAMP ~ AM 7 1 545.00
24 [REAR BUMPER TOWING AP B 1 £21.60
25 |REAR END PANEL A 1 $342.00
26 [REAR TAIL GATE INNER TRIM g 1 $189.00
27 [RAER REVERCE SENSOR P 2 5180.00
28 [REAR HONDA LOGO e 1 532,40
29 [FREED LOGO e 7 1 $57.60
30 [REAR EMD PANEL TRIM -1- 1 865.40

Note: If any of the guated parts are recommended lo be repaired, then an additional labour charge

will be charged accordingly under supplementary




Spare Parts
Vahicle Na. - 5JQ38637 Submit By

Make & Modei : HOMDA FREED 1.5G A Year Manufacture
Chassiz No. GB31029692 Engine No.

WWONG CHEE WEI / CK

2008

R18A14016759

Paggs 2

ISiNo. Part Description Cost
Qty Price

Mett List 5- Mett
Prica Price Price

-
31 IREAR END PANEL FLOOR TRIM ¢ 1

NA

32 [FRONT RHS HEADLAMEP I? 1

$612.00

33 [WASHER TANK i 1

845.00

B

34 AU CONDERSER - 1

£810.00

35 JRAIDMOTOR -7_ 1

$630.00

36 [WINDSUREEEN SEAALNT M= o~ 2

340.00

37 [FRONT NUMBER PLATI e 1

535.00

38 [REAR NUMBER PLATE 127 Vel 1

$35.00

39 [BODY SEALANT hee — 1

5B0.00

64

Mote: If any of the quoted parts are recommended to be repaired, then an additional labour charge
will be charged accardingly under supplementary.




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD Appendix B
45 Pandan Road S (609386)
Tel: 68676919 Fax: 62626950,68676903

Labour

Vehicle No. SJQ3863Z Submit By : WONG CHEE WEI | CK
Make & Model HOMNDA Year of Manufact 2008

au Labour Description Esimated Adjusted

Price Price

1+ |TO REMOVE AND REPLACE DAMAGE PARTS ,PANEL SE)GG/DD /y
BEATING WITH REALIGN FOR DAMAGE PARTS S0, ov

, [TO REMOVE AND INSTALL REAR LHS TAIL GATE 120100 /
WINDSCREEN |

TO SPRAY PAINTING FOR NEW PARTS AND DAMAGE
3 |PARTS AFTER PANEL BEATING . SW [ Y00

4 |TO CHECK WIRING s?mﬁ (o

5 |[TO CHECK ALIGNMENT 540.00 )<




