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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 7 March 2019 8:58 AM

To: 'AVRIL HO'

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH3048X & SKC6802S *LKK REF: CC4/FWD19003108/ea3 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Hi Sir/Mdm,   

 

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA 

(subject to BOLA guideline settlement)  and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case. 

  

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your 

client’s vehicle.  

  

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the 

days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor. 

  

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051 

 

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate 

settlement. 

 

Thank You. 

 

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: AVRIL HO <avril@mova.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 7 March 2019 8:47 AM 

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH3048X & SKC6802S *LKK REF: CC4/FWD19003108/ea3  

Importance: High 

 

Dear Hsiao Tong/ Asher, 

 

Please kindly update. Owner is chasing. Urgent! 
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Thank you! 

 

Best Regards, 

AVRIL HO 

Claims Asst. 
Mova Automotive Pte Ltd 

Email:       avril@mova.com.sg 

Address:   Blk 1008 Bt Merah Lane 3 

                    #01-04/06/08 

                    Singapore 159722 

Telephone: 6272 3892     Fax: 6270 8314 

 

 

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have received this message in error, please do not copy, disclose or use its 
content.  We would be grateful if you would notify us by email and delete the original transmission and any attachment from your system.  
Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasonable precaution to minimize 
this risk, we do not accept any liability resulting from software viruses.  Please carry out your own virus checks before opening any attachment.   
 

 

From: AVRIL HO [mailto:avril@mova.com.sg]  
Sent: Monday, 4 March 2019 2:32 PM 

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' 
Cc: 'Asher Sng (LKKAuto)'; 'Admin A' 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH3048X & SKC6802S *LKK REF: CC4/FWD19003108/ea3  
Importance: High 

 

Dear Hsiao Tong/ Asher, 

 

My client is chasing the outcome hasty. 

Please kindly revert the liability for direct settlement. 

 
Thank you! 

 

Best Regards, 

AVRIL HO 

Claims Asst. 
Mova Automotive Pte Ltd 

Email:       avril@mova.com.sg 

Address:   Blk 1008 Bt Merah Lane 3 

                    #01-04/06/08 

                    Singapore 159722 

Telephone: 6272 3892     Fax: 6270 8314 

 

 

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have received this message in error, please do not copy, disclose or use its 
content.  We would be grateful if you would notify us by email and delete the original transmission and any attachment from your system.  
Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasonable precaution to minimize 
this risk, we do not accept any liability resulting from software viruses.  Please carry out your own virus checks before opening any attachment.   
 

 

From: AVRIL HO [mailto:avril@mova.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 1 March 2019 3:36 PM 
To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' 

Cc: 'Asher Sng (LKKAuto)'; 'Admin A' 
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Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH3048X & SKC6802S *LKK REF: CC4/FWD19003108/ea3  
Importance: High 

 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

 

Any update? Our client is chasing for the liability. 

 
Thank you! 

 

Best Regards, 

AVRIL HO 

Claims Asst. 
Mova Automotive Pte Ltd 

Email:       avril@mova.com.sg 

Address:   Blk 1008 Bt Merah Lane 3 

                    #01-04/06/08 

                    Singapore 159722 

Telephone: 6272 3892     Fax: 6270 8314 

 

 

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have received this message in error, please do not copy, disclose or use its 
content.  We would be grateful if you would notify us by email and delete the original transmission and any attachment from your system.  
Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasonable precaution to minimize 
this risk, we do not accept any liability resulting from software viruses.  Please carry out your own virus checks before opening any attachment.   
 

 

From: AVRIL HO [mailto:avril@mova.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 28 February 2019 3:38 PM 
To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' 

Cc: 'Asher Sng (LKKAuto)'; 'Admin A' 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH3048X & SKC6802S *LKK REF: CC4/FWD19003108/ea3  

 

Dear Hsiao Tong, 

 

Please kindly advice the liability for direct settlement. owner is chasing. 

 
Thank you! 

 

Best Regards, 

AVRIL HO 

Claims Asst. 
Mova Automotive Pte Ltd 

Email:       avril@mova.com.sg 

Address:   Blk 1008 Bt Merah Lane 3 

                    #01-04/06/08 

                    Singapore 159722 

Telephone: 6272 3892     Fax: 6270 8314 

 

 

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have received this message in error, please do not copy, disclose or use its 
content.  We would be grateful if you would notify us by email and delete the original transmission and any attachment from your system.  
Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasonable precaution to minimize 
this risk, we do not accept any liability resulting from software viruses.  Please carry out your own virus checks before opening any attachment.   
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From: AVRIL HO [mailto:avril@mova.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 25 February 2019 4:00 PM 
To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' 

Cc: 'Asher Sng (LKKAuto)'; 'Admin A' 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH3048X & SKC6802S *LKK REF: CC4/FWD19003108/ea3  

 

Dear Asher, 

 

Please kindly advice the liability. 

 
Thank you! 

 

Best Regards, 

AVRIL HO 

Claims Asst. 
Mova Automotive Pte Ltd 

Email:       avril@mova.com.sg 

Address:   Blk 1008 Bt Merah Lane 3 

                    #01-04/06/08 

                    Singapore 159722 

Telephone: 6272 3892     Fax: 6270 8314 

 

 

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have received this message in error, please do not copy, disclose or use its 
content.  We would be grateful if you would notify us by email and delete the original transmission and any attachment from your system.  
Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasonable precaution to minimize 
this risk, we do not accept any liability resulting from software viruses.  Please carry out your own virus checks before opening any attachment.   
 

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 2:21 PM 
To: 'AVRIL HO' 

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A 

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH3048X & SKC6802S *LKK REF: CC4/FWD19003108/ea3  

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Avril, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

The case is handled by Asher. 

 

Hi Asher, 

 

FYNA. CC4/FWD19003108/ea3 

 

 



5

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

 

From: AVRIL HO <avril@mova.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 19 February 2019 12:02 PM 

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH3048X & SKC6802S 

 

Dear Hsiao Tong, 

 

Refer to the attachment, please kindly revert the liability for direct settlement. 

 
Thank you! 

 

Best Regards, 

AVRIL HO 

Claims Asst. 
Mova Automotive Pte Ltd 

Email:       avril@mova.com.sg 

Address:   Blk 1008 Bt Merah Lane 3 

                    #01-04/06/08 

                    Singapore 159722 

Telephone: 6272 3892     Fax: 6270 8314 

 

 

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have received this message in error, please do not copy, disclose or use its 
content.  We would be grateful if you would notify us by email and delete the original transmission and any attachment from your system.  
Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasonable precaution to minimize 
this risk, we do not accept any liability resulting from software viruses.  Please carry out your own virus checks before opening any attachment.   
 

 


