Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Dear Lucas,

Hi Veron,

Confirm excess $500.00

Regards,

Lionel

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Tuesday, 12 March 2019 3:31 PM

‘Torque 5 Assessment’; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto); SUR
‘claims@torque5.com’; 'sam.chang@torque5.com'
RE: SLD 5018 D - Finalisation And Parts Invoice .

From: Do-Not-Reply [mailto:do-not-reply@merimen.com]

Sent: Tuesday, March 12, 2019 3:20 PM
To: Lionel Tan Tian Pei - 5GUser; losey Loh Kah Wai - 5GUser
Subject: DOUBLE COMNFIRM ON THE EXCESS

Dear Josey/Lionel,

Kindly re-confirmed on the policy excess.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 1 March 2019 9:41 AM
To: 'Torque 5 Assessment' <assessment@torque5.com>; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A
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<admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: claims@torque5.com; sam.chang@torque5.com
Subject: RE: SLD 5018 D - Finalisation And Parts Invoice .

Dear Lucas,

Confirmed finalize amount $3130 before excess $500 and GST @ 4 working days.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Torque 5 Assessment <assessment@torque5.com>

Sent: Thursday, 28 February 2019 7:29 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-
d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Torque 5 Assessment' <assessment@torque5.com>; claims@torque5.com; sam.chang@torque5.com

Subject: SLD 5018 D - Finalisation And Parts Invoice .

Hi Guo Qiang,

T

TORQUE
GROUP

Please kindly check the attach and confirm the finalise amount .

Thank You .

Lucas Chow
Assessor | Motor Claims Department

(65) 6452 4457 (65) 6452 4584

(65) 8131 6518
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