Asher Sng (LKKAuto) —————————— ———

From: ONG LI LI <liong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 5 September 2019 11:21 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuUto)

Ce: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] Our Ref. 18/19/19/VP05/021416 PRI 5LT1353C
DOA12.2.2019 Your Ref:SLEGS40A [External General]

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Lonpac External - General
Dear Asher

Please proceed.

The arrangement of Direct settlement is to expedite settlement where the workshops can
benefit by getting the payment fast.

Therefore in return, the settlement sum should be as low as possible.
Do remind your surveyors/& your team to take note of the above and act accordingly.

Thank you.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706
T

S— : The all “H&8% lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto: AsherSng@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 30 August, 2019 9:47 AM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021416 PRI SLT1353C DOA:12.2.2019 Your Ref:SLEG540A
[External General]

Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 20/02/2018 of Third-Party’'s request to do Direct Settlement with our Principal,
Lonpac Insurance Bhd.
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The said chain collision involved 5 vehicles whereby our insured was the 4th vehicle.
In accordance to the MCF guideline for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%.

Summary to offer to repairer ACCORD AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1, Cost of Repair (w/GST) $34612.08 $19,791.67
2. Loss of Rental (25days x $180) $ 4,500.00 § 3,200.00 (20days x $160)
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee 3 7.45 ] 7.45
Total | § 39,119.53 § 22,999.12

**18 days recommendation for repair.
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference,

The above is for your approval please.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Cose Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Fte Lid

phone; 4841-40581 | email: gshersng@ikkauto.com | fox; 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 21 February 2019 9:09 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@|onpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021416 PRI SLT1353C DOA:12.2.2019 Your Ref:SLE6540A [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Shu Pei

Please see attached for our Insured’s GIA report.

Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706
=_W

i I The all {885 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.



From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February, 2019 6:56 PM

To: ONG LI LI; GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/ 19/VP05/021416 PRI SLT1353C DOA:12.2.2019 Your Ref:SLE6540A [External General]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SLT 1353C at M/s Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer
proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6266-0055 | emall: shupei@ikkauta.con | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [ma|i_m:admin-d@lkkautq;om]

Sent: Monday, 18 February 2019 3:45 PM

To: 'ONG LI LI' <llong@lonpac.coms; 'Accord Claims{Av)' <avclaims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>; 'MT_Claim_SG'
<mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>; 'assignments@Ilkkauto.com' <assignments@Ikkauto com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021416 PRI SLT1353C DOA:12.2.2019 Your Ref:SLEG540A [External General)

Dear Celia,
Thank you for the assignment.

Shiau Chan on behalf of G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email; assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)



From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]
Sent: Monday, 18 February 2019 12:18 PM
To: Accord Claims({AV) <avclaims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>; MT _Claim_SG <mt claim@lonpac.com>;

assignments@lkkauto.com; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.coms
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021416 PRI SLT1353C DOA-12.2.2019 Your Ref:SLE6540A [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Resend

Catherine/Nivitha

Pls acknowledge receipt,

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: ONG LI LI

Sent: Friday, 15 February, 2019 4:50 PM

To: Accord Claims(AV); MT_Claim_ SG; assignments@lkkauto.com; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/ IEIHQNF’[}SIHEHIG PRI SLT1353C DOA:12.2.2019 Your Ref:SLE6540A [External General]

Lonpac External - General

Without Prejudice

Save as to Costs

Dear Celia

Please see the list of surveyors below and liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for survey.

Dear Catherine/Nivitha

Please follow up.

“No. |[Name Please tick v
1 Kalvin Ang

2 Xing Guo Qiang

3 Mohamad Taufikh




4 Bryan Ang

5 Adrian Ling

6 Mohammed Rasul

7 Marcus Chua

8 Kenneth Kong

g Muhammad Nazril Bin
Abdullah

10 Sathya Sai Kathirrasen

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of
these motor surveyors as a single joint expert.

Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

=y

The all (883 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Accord Claims(AV) [r_rla.-lto:ay_';_.g-_imﬁ:gnjgcam'a!'_k_img._mm@g]

Sent: Friday, 15 February, 2019 4:44 PM
To: MT_Claim_5G
Subject: PRI SLT1353C DOA:12.2.2019 Your Ref:SLE65404

Dear Officer In Charge,
Kindly arrange survey as above mentioned and please provide us 10 surveyor name list.

Thank you!

Kind regards,
Celia Lai

Accord Auto Services Pte Lid
Blk 1009 Bukit Merah Lane 3



#01-80
Singapore 159723

Mobile: (65) 9274 0999
Tel :(65)6271 7433
Fax :(65) 6274 5715

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view,
disseminate, use or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from
your system. Thank you.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.AVE.com
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ACCORD AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
BLOCK 1009 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3
#01-80 SINGAPORE 159723
TEL: 6271 5133/6271 7433 FAX: 6274 5715

GST Regn No: 2001113141 K
21 July 2019

Lonpac Insurance BHD
300 Beach Road
#17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Attn: Motor Claims Department

Dear Sars,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE: SLT1353C SLE6540A ,SLZS892F, SMA1407U And SGQS679L on 1222
Along P wis Changi Airport (Exit Jalan Eunos).

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: SLT1353C. which was involved in the
captioned accident with your insured vehicle: SLE6540A . The vehicle owner has requested and authorized us 1o
assist him in presenting his'her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving. we are submitting these claims for
vour consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

01) Cost Of Repair 5 18,496 89
02y 7% GST b 1.294.78
03) Car Rental 25 days @ S180 b3 4.500.00
(*Including 2 Days Pre-Repair & 3 non working day on 17.2.2019 , 24.2.2019 & 3.3.2019)
04) GIALTA Enguiry Fee £ 745
5 24,299.12
_——
We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:-
a) GlA report d) Driver NRIC & Driving License

b} Repair Statement BM366 e) GIA/LTA Enguiry Fee
c) Car Rental Agreement

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer's claims
as soom as possible,

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any
personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank vou
Yours fai

Tel: 6271 7433 /9274 (999
Email: avclaimsia mycarworkshop.com.sg



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

To Whom It May Concern,

Accident Involving Vehicle: ©17 13520 a0 2e LS40R  SIZz oo e | QWA '\t U and SHE 544
M 1. 3 W4 f‘l’.ﬂwJI e Tuds UMMT Pt'-.erf-} ( et Talan Gangs )

I'We, (ot Cua Woe . NRIC No: SHF3904 &
i
Of
Owner of motor vehicle no AT 1383L do hereby appoint Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd

as my/ours authorised representative and

as my/ours solicitors to write, to negotiate and settle my/our claim against the other party/parties involved

in the above mentioned accident. I/'We, D'y E“f‘; roe

shall have absolute discerption to settle the matter at the best term.

I/'We also confirm and instruct that any agreed settlement sum in respect my/our claims be paid

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd and such payment will be constitute a full and final discharge of my claims.

Signature of owner
(Company Stamp, if Applicable)



'j LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Without Prejudice

CLAIMNO : 18/19/19/VPOS/021416 on Injury Claims
DATE : 24 SEPT 2019
DISCHARGE VOUCHER

/'We, OOI ENG HOE confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or the owner SLE 65404 the sum of Singapore Dollars TWENTY TWO
THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED NINETY NINE AND CENTS TWELVE ONLY.
($22,599.12) in full and final satisfaction. liquidation and discharge of all property
losses competent 1o me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in
respect of all property losses sustained by mefus whether now or hereafter to become
manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident involving, SLT 1353C
on 12/02/2019 along/at PIE TWDS CHANGI AIRPORT (EXIT JALAN EUNOS).

1 /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (TAY WEI POH /LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made by any
person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum divectly to M/s
ACCORD AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

I/'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action,

FH i

7 155Ep 1

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

e g Boe.......... L3 SEP 201

Name of vehicle owner/Date



ACCORD AUTO SERVICES PTELTD

BLOCK 1009 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3
#01-80 SINGAPORE 159723

TEL: 6271 5133/6271 7433 FAX: 6274 5715
G5T Regn No: 201113141K

Date ;21 July 2019
Lonpac Insurance BHD Our Ref No : BM566
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 Insured : Ooi Eng Hoe
The Concourse Insured NRIC : S7173908B
Singapore 199555 Make & Model  : Honda Odyssey 2.4
DOA 1 12.2.2019
Claim Type : Third Party
REPAIR STATEMENT
Re: Vehicle Registration No: SLTI353C g
Cost Of Repair $ 18,496.89
7% GST $ 1,294.78

S 19,791.67

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd




www.MyCarWorkshop.com.sg

Ooi Eng Hoe

Customer Vehicle No.: SLT1355C
Replacement Vehicle No, =KD
Make & Medel: Toyola Camry 2.0
U Neo. 11230589923

Rental Information:

Accord Rent-A-Car Pte. Ltd.

Blk 1008 Bukit Merah Lane 3
H#01-80 Alexandra Village Ind'| Est

Singapore 159723
TEL: 4TEL0531
FAX: 6481 9516
Co Reg No.: 20113

Invoice #: RLCS51010

Start End Actual Duration / Cherged

Date / Tima 13022019 3:30 PM DR03/2019 .00 P 23 Days
Rental Cost

Daity 28 Ciaye $180.00 Fer oay ££.500.00
Weekly Weehkly Per weak

Momnthky Monghl Per monih

COW Per day

Others

Payment Detalls:
Hotes & Information
DOA12.2.2018

This = a compuier generaled invoice. Mo signature is reguired

Main Branch: 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A, #03-11 AMK Autopolnt, Singapore 568047, Tel: 6481 9518, Fax; 6481 951

Thank you for choosing Accord Rent A

Branch: Blk 1008 Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-80, Singapore 150723, Tel: 6271 5133, Fax: €274 5745

4

Car Pte Lid



VEHICLE HIRING AGREEMENT

Weticle No: SMDETZ0C Vehicle Oul Date: 13/02/2019 Time: 3:30 PM
Make & Model: Toyoia Camry 2.0 Wehicke In Date: Tirme:
THIRD PARTY INSURANCE NON WAIVER EXCESS: $3500 Rate Per Day: $180.00 M. of Days
OWHN DAMAGE INSURANCE NON WAIVER EXCESS: $3500 Total Charges:

HIRER'S PARTICULARS ADDITIONAL DRIVER'S PARTICULARS

Mama {(as in NRICk Ooi Eng Hoe Mama (as in NRIC):

MRIC | Passport Mo: ST1730088 NRIC / Passport Ng

Date of Birth: 301271971 Date of Birlh: -

Address: 42 Sea Breere Walk Singapore 487419 Address:

Employment Details: Employment Detalls:

Driving License Passed Date: 21111119092 Driving License Passed Data -

Contact DGEDERAS Contact

MILEAGE QUT :

CONTROL LEVEL (OUT & IN)

— AN

EMERGENCY BREAKDOWN AND TOWING SERVICE {24 HOURS) HELPLINE: 6481 9518 [ 6271 5133 HP 9229 9191
IMPORTANT INFORMATION AND DECLARATION

Before signing this agreement you should carefully read and understand the terms and conditions provided with this documants and
confirm below whether you consent o receiving infermation as set out,

4

. Only persans above 25 & below 635 years of age and signing this agreement may drive the vehicie,
2.
3,

WVehicle is strictly for use in Singapore only and may not diiven out of Singapore withoul the prior writlen consent of Precursor Invesiments,
All vehicles are fitled with anti theft device which will response to the RF at the Singapore Customs, Hirer will be fully liable for all costs and
charges incurred in event that the iImmobiliser is being acfivated at the Singapaore Customs. There will ba no refund of unused rertal and the
hirer shall bear the costs of the following charges i) $5300.00 for towing from Singapore Customs i) $$150.00 for resetting of iImmobiiser,

. Use of vehicle for ilegal purposes (e.g. In connection with theft, drug pedaling or trafficking, smuggkng) is stricily probibited,

In case of accident, the hirer shall report to the rental office immediataly, If there are bodily injuries, a police report must be made within 24
heurs.

. Punciured tyres. empty petrol lank, flal battery due to negligence, loss of vehicke's key or locked key inside the vehicle, by tselfl doss not

cansitute fo a breakdown and that in the event, the Owner's 24 hours Emergéncy Sanvice is called upon to respond fo such occurrence, the
Hirar ghall boar the costs of such response at S$50.00 per trip, Punclured and damaged tyras that cannot be reusad will be cha nged
accordlingly from SS80.00 o S5200.00 per tyra,

7. All vehicles are supplied with petrol and should be refumed with petrol lzvel Bkewise. There will be no refund for exeess pelrol.

9.
10,

. Mo refund or early retum of vehicle (The Hirer shall be kable for excess charges for any late return at rate shown per hour per day). Latest by

Gpm.
Winoscreen and windows damages are not covered under msurance (Range from S5300,00 to S31000.00).
Mo Smeking, Durans and Transportation of Pels are allowed, Hirer is responsible for a penalty of S3500.00,

| have read and agree 10 the lerms and conditions on both sides of this agreement as indicated. | consent to pay the final cost of rental and |
understand that the cost of rental sel out above is an estimate only. | may be fable to further charges as sot out in Clauses B and which includa,
bt are nat limited ta,my hability 85 owner of the vehicle for charges for traffic or parking viclations during the currency of this agreermentAll
infarmation | nave provided Precursor Investments in connection with this agreement is true.

Signature/Company Stamp (If Applicable) Date: 13/02/2019
Customer name: 0ol Eng Hoe (hirer)



> Back to OneMotoring

-X‘L‘l.i"i:! '

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-D006529-2

Print Date/Time

oW 13. 3. 201

15 Feb 2019/ 16:32:53

Receipt Date/Time : 15 Feb 2019/ 16:32:53
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. © ITNET-00000-180215-002746
Previous Receipt No
S/N ltem Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (8%) (55) (5%)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SLES5404
As at 12 Feb 2019/14:10:00
Insurance Co: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
1 Insurance Enguiry - SLEES404
Enquiry Fee 7.00 0.49 7.49
20190215163202219978
Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 749
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 745
Paid By
OO0 E4 30 Eirsid:uﬂ::tfﬁ ” 7.45
Total 745
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 745
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Flease ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider { financial Institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



