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Mivitha (LKK Auto)

From: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Sent: Monday, 18 February 2019 12:54 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com; admin-
di@mlkkauto.com

Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: FW: OD Claim / Arrange survey - SLU5803P accident on 07/02/2019 (Our Ref:
1201900004260)

Attachments: SLUSB03P GIA pdf

Hi LKK team,

Please refer to the email below and liaise with the repairer for OD survey arrangement. Policy excess has been
waived,

Attached is Ol GIA report, the password to open the attachment is "EWDENCRYPT".

Please create the case in Merimen and revert to us with your preliminary report.

Thank you,

Regards,
Josey

From: Sharon [mailto:sharon@ow.sg)

Sent: Monday, 18 February, 2019 11:07 AM

To: Motor Claims 5G - SG Common

Cc: Lily Loi OW; puitheng.chong@ow.sg; hockkong.ong@ow.sg
Subject: OD Claim / Arrange survey - SLUS803P accident on 07/02/2019

Dear Executive,
Owner will amend the GIA report to Own Damage Claim later.

Please arrange for survey as soon as possible.
Location: 9A Serangoon North Avenue 5
**Please avoid 1-2PM

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Sharon Ten (Ms)

Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011

OFPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Head office: & Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 T: +65 6472
1313 F: +65 6472 2112
Branch : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 T: +65 6484 9915 B

+65 6481 1011



Branch : 5531 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 T: +65 6452 GBEER B
+65 6452 9223

WWiW ., OW, 59
www . facebook. com/optimawerkz

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT

been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments.
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner |D Type:

Owner 1D

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo.:

Wehicle to be Exparted:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year:

Engine MNo.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value;

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years);

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 18 Feb 2019

PARFICNF Rehate Fronirg

Singapore NRIC
26828

SLUSBO3P

Yes

18 Feb 2019
MERCEDES BENZ

E43 AMG 4MATIC AUTO
White

2017
276B2330734531
wWDD2132642A339311
295.0 kW (395 bhp)
$93,962.00

07 Dec 2017

07 Dec 2017

0

$141,132.00

Yes
0é Dec 2027
£105,849.00

04 Dec 2027

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

£57.414.00

£45.931.00

$151.780.00

OK

MRS AVTLNE, GOV SQUTANT R ACHONTenjuIre ME0ale oy FUDICOEI OB LEreg INPULOr Ui D ILIN_ IL=E Uausu0s |



2/25/2019

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner |D:

WVehicle Details

Wehicle Mo

“ehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Yehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine MNo.;

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date;
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount;
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:;

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 25 Feb 2019

PARF/COE Rebale Enquiry

OK

Singapore NRIC
26828

SLUSBD3P

Mo

25Feh 2019
MERCEDES BENZ

E43 AMG AMATIC AUTO
White

2017

27682330734531
WDD2132642A339311
2950 kW (395 bhp)
§93.962.00

07 Dec 2017

07 Dec 2017

0

$141,132.00

Yes
06 Dec 2027
$105,849.00

06 Dec 2027

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW {130bhg)
10

$57.414.00

£50,40%.00

$156,258.00

NORS.AVILIE. QOV.39/ A/ VIVaCUOn enguireRataig oy - uDi CoeTore LrereQInput  F UG HIVN_IL=FUSUEUU | |

W
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Shirlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: puitheng.chong@ow.sg

Sent: Tuesday, 26 February 2019 12:56 PM
To: ‘Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)’

Cc: ‘SUR'

Subject: RE: S5LU 5803P QD (FWD)

Hi Shirley,

MNoted with thanks.
Best Regards,

Pui Theng, Chong (Ms)
Motor Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 T: 4656472 1313 F: +65 6472 2112
Branch : 94 Serangoon Morth Ave 5 Singapore 554500 T:+65 6484 9919  F: +65 6481 1011
Branch :551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 T:+65 6452 6B68  F: +65 6452 9223
WWW.0OW. S8

www.facebook.com/optimawerkz

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 26 February 2019 9:37 AM

To: puitheng.chong@ow.sg

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SLU 5803P OD (FWD}

Dear Pui Theng,
As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SLU 5803P (Excess $ 0/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email; Sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)
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ENTEY DATE & TIME: O0R0ai202 170w

10 AsH LE T

Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting
Actual e-Fliling Submission Date & Time: 05/06/2012 17:20

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

'] TA H =

1. Plaana T datails of the scoadent 1o specd up the daima procees

2. Thas Fanm must be

3, nfornation provided rrust be 83 tnakful ang aocurste &5 peasible. Any wilful misrepresentation or wilnolding of materal facts may allee inauwance comganies o

repudiate By oty

4. The msus and acoepiance of ihis Farm by inslranca companies is nol an admission of policy listdly o0 178 part of the inswence campanies.

5. Ay i FRporIng ST

. This report

PICE f0 TyeEiig

be forwarded by the insurers of e nsurers of Me GIA Records Managemeni Cenire establisned by e General Insurmnee Assoclaton of

SinghperslGIA) for arehhing snd that copiss of this rapon will for 2 fee be made avalabls upon applicasion by interested paries.
7. By I‘MJIHIQ\HI‘ID:T‘H!H thie repon o e Inaurers, you hereby congem o he archiving of this report &t the centre and b2 coples of the repon bl.'.lri; magde avalable
sforesaid.

Date O Report
Date Of Accident
Exacl Location Of Accident

ACCIDENT STATEMENT
05062021708

02/06/2012 18:00

TOA PAYOH LOR 1 BLK 148 CARPARK
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

i Hpldaraiss

Name Of Reglsln Owner
NRIC No

Manactet
Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being usad
at time of accident

Are you claiming under your own Insurance policy
for repair to your vehicla?

If Mo, Please state action io ba taken
Vehicie Category

A ELH

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Palicy

Folicy Number

Cover Mote Numbar

Name of Driver
NRIC No

Date Of Birth
Cecupation
Date O Driving Pass

Driving Expenence

Gender

Mobile Numier

Fax Mumber

Contact Number

EMail Address

Address

Posicode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

WONG KOK KEONG

WONG KOK KEONG

S8035TI1A

HISSAN
SUNNY-1.6 EX

Ma

Third Party
Prvate Car

NTUC Income Insurance Co-oparative Lid
Third Party

No

5050711758

S8035T31A
21101280

Indoar

G2M5/2002

10 Years And 1 Month
Mate '

{Local) +55-06820754

BLK 143 LORONG 2 TOA PAYOH #OG-184
310143

Mo

Cranar

Page 1 of §



21272019 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mall is associated with !

*SLUSB03P (1201900004260)
op
Feb 7 2019 2:00PM
[LOH SIN YEEN]
Optima Werkz Pte Ltd

E Reply I Rtpl',-'-m_h'lark as UnreadJ .Prlnt Message | Delete Mcssa'uge I Furwan&T

From FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ) (FWD_SG), sent on 26,/02/2019 09:10 AM.

To LKKE_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($%$2733.10) - SLUSBO3P - Claim Handler: Josey Loh

rﬁ.pprmred-.a?zfi. 10,

|DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
| There are no documents.

https:JIsingapura.merin-len.c:omfcIaims.n’indax.cfrn?ﬂ.mahuﬁsvcrnail&fuseaminn=d sp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1440669&Domainid=1 1&i0bjld=7... 112
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coregnosssorissr)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408333
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

To:  FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
& Temasek Boulevard 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
#18-01 Suntec Tower 4 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 038986 Singapore 408933

Attn:  Josey Loh Date: 25 Feb 2018

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No : SLUSB03P Accident Date : 07/02/2019
Make : MERCEDES-BENZ AMG E43 Policy No. : PNPV2018-00014351
Assignment Date  : 19/02/2019 Excess - 550.00
Date of Inspection  : 25/02/2019 Est. Duration of Repair | 2 days
Inspection At : Optima Werkz Pte Ltd (HQ)
94 Serangoon North Ave 5
Singapore 554500

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages rear portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident,

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 8% 2,933.10
Revised Amount 5% 2,583.25
Check Items (Estimated) 5% 149.85
Total 5% 273310
Lump Sum Repair ot

Total Loss Consideration

MNew for Old Value 5%
Pre-Accident Value 5% 323,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate S5 156,258.00
Salvage Value prot
Margin far Repair 5% 166,742.00
Remarks
{ X} The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage.

Kindly let us have your autharisation.
( ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

{ ) Other comments :






WEHH18019157-01 1 Aax Mars Pt Lid - Bukil Merah

ENTRY DATE & TIME: 11022079 1943 Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting
SUBMITIED BY: BoeyLoke Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 18/02/2019 12:10

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1, Please rapart mrrec]E the details of the accident 1o speed up fhe clams process.

2 This Farm must ba completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3, Information prov ded must be as truinful and accurale as possible. Any willul misrepresentation of witholding of matarial facts may allow INBUrance COMPamnes o
repudiata paliey Nabiliy.

4. The iasue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy lability on tha part of the insurance companias.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

&, This repart will be forwarded by the ingurers of the GI4 Records Managemaent Centre establshed by the Genaral Insurance Associafion of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this repart will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties

7. By the lodgement of this repart 1o the insurers, you nesely consent [o 1he archiving of this report at the cenire and to copies of the rapart heing made availabla
atoresaid

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 11/02/2019 19:43

Date Of Accident O7/02/2019 14:30

Exacl Location Of Accident KM 343 NORTH SOUTH HIGHWAY NEAR BIDOR PARK

Country/State of Loss MALAYSIA/PERAK DARUL RIDZUAN
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Mumber SLUSB03P

Insured/Policyholder

Mame Of Registered Owner LOH SIN YEEN

MRIC Mo 526026828

Ermail Address LOHSINYEEN@HOTMAIL.COM

Mobile Phone Mo (LOCAL) +65-93621983

Altermative Phane No OTHERS-93621983

Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturer MERCEDES-BENZ

Maodel E43 AMG 4MATIC

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

i fi
time of accident PRIVATE

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
. YES

for repair to your vehicla?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage
Fleet Policy

Policy Mumber
Cover Mote Number
Driver

Mame of Driver
MRIC Mo

Date Of Birth
Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Mobile Mumber

Fax Mumbear

Contact Number
Ehail Address

FWD SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

PNPYV201800014351

N.A

LOH SIN YEEN
526026828

15/08/1967

INDOOR

02/07/1991

27 YEARS AND 7 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-93621983

OTHERS-93621983

LOHSINYEEN@HOTMAIL. COM



Address

Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Drivers Own
ehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle
General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident
Weather Conditions

MIL

COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
CLEAR

Road Surface DRY
Other Information
Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? YES

Foreign Vehicle Registration Number
Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)

JDR7059 (PRIVATE CAR)

involved in the accident 2

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO -

Was any injured conveyed to hospilal by NO

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown persan(s) NO

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Mumber of Passengers (Including Driver) 5

FSEEERfIEE NAME: . PASSENGER 1
GZEMDER: . FEMALE

Passenger 2 NAME: - PASSENGER 2
GENDER: . MALE

Passenger 3 MNAME: PASSENGER 3
GEMDER: : MALE

Passenger 4 NAME: . PASSENGER 4

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?

If Yes, Please state which Police Station
FOLICE STATION NAME [OTHER]

Was notice of intended Prosecution given?
If Yes, against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

GENDER: : MALE

YES

JOHOR BAHRU TRAFFIC POLICE CENTRE

NO

REFER TO JOHOR BAHRU POLICE REPORT NO. TRAFIK TAPAH/000543/19. ON 07/02/2019 AT ABOUT 1430HRS. | WAS
DRIVING MY CAR NO. SLU5803P A MERCEDES FROM TAIPING PERAK HEADING TOWARDS JOHOR BAHRU. WHEN |
ARRIVED AT KM 343 NORTH SOUTH HIGHWAY, AT THE TIME TRAFFIC WAS CONGESTED. | BRAKED WHEN SUDDENLY
A CAR NO. JDR7059 FROM THE REAR COLLIDED INTO MY CAR. | DID NOT SUFFER ANY INJURIES. DAMAGE TO MY CAR
ARE TO ITS REAR BUMPER, DAMAGE PARKING SENSOR, OTHER DAMAGES | AM NOT AWARE OF YET. THAT'S ALL FOR
MY REFORT.

Attachment(s)
Are accident photos available for attachment? YES
Was there any video captured by Car Camera? MO

Was there any audio recorded? WO
Fage 2 of 19



Vahicle Registration Number
Wehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properlies
Vehicle Category

mMame of Driver
WRIC/Passport Number

Contact Mumber

Address

FPostcoda

Insurance Company Name

Mature Of Damage

Mo, Of Passenger {Including Drivar)

FPassenger 1

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

JDR7059

PRIVATE CAR
LEE TEK ON

60126061499

MAME:
GEMDER:

: PASSENGER 1

FEMALE

Page 3 of 19
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Police Report
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Oprimin WERKZ PTELTD

Head office : 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 Tel: +65 6472 1313 Fax ; +65 6472 2112
Branch office : 9A Serangoon North Ave § Singapore 554500 Tel : +65 6484 59189 Fax . +65 6481 1011
Co. Reg. No.  201212455W

Date : 25.02.2019 TO MOTOR CLAIM DEPT
Vehicle No: SLUS803P FWD SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.
Model: MERCEDES BENZ £43 AMG 6 TEMASEK BOULEVARD,
Chassis: WDD2132642A339311 - 2017 #18-01 SUNTEC TOWER FOUR,
Palicy No: PNPV201800014351 SINGAPORE 039896

Date of Accident: 07.02.2015

ESTIMATE

| NO. | DESCRIPTION QrY| UNIT $% AMOUNT 5% _
[ 1 [REAR BUMPER el 3 e e $1,665.00]
|2 |REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSORRH ]2 ] _S16650 7
|3 "[REAR BUMPER LOWER COVER 1 €727 SA62.50,
| 4 |REAR BUMPER CLIPS | 10 $6.50 Az, 565.00 —
| |

SUB TOTAL $2,359.00

\LIST -10% -§235.90

[PARTS TOTAL | $2,123.10
LABOUR CHARGES:
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE & REPLACE REAR ACCIDENT AREAS & ETC 25000 ZZc
LABOUR CHARGES FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINTS & FURNISHING MATERIAL $300.00 Z 7,
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE/REFIX REPLACE REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR $80.00 o/
TO CHECK WIRING & ELETRICAL DIAGNOSTIC $180.00 ;&g

LABOUR TOTAL $810.00

ONG TOTAL $2,933.10

| ﬁé‘/
\ ,.s-ﬂ'f':{ / § ﬂfuﬂ% e,
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7o,
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OPTIMA WERKEZ PTELTD

Head office : 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 Tel : +65 6472 1313 Fax:+65 6472 2112
Branch office : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel : +65 6484 9919 Fax : +65 6481 1011
Co. Reg. No. 201212455

Date : 25.02.2019 ' TO MOTOR CLAIM DEPT
Vehicle No: SLUS803P FWD SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.
Model: MERCEDES BENZ E43 AMG 6 TEMASEK BOULEVARD,
Chassis: WDD2132642A339311 - 2017 #18-01 SUNTEC TOWER FOUR,
Policy No: PNPV201800014351 SINGAPORE 039896

Date of Accident: 07.02.2019

ESTIMATE
NO. | DESCRIPTION QY UNITS§S AMOUNT 5$
1 REAR BUMPER 1¥67- 1 A /7 $1,665.00 —
2 REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR RH 1 g = $166.50 ;{r—//
3 REAR BUMPER LOWER COVER _ [ & €723 5462.50
4 _REAR BUMPER CLIPS = 10 _$6:50 Az $65.00 ——
- SUBTOTAL | $2,359.00
LIST -10% -$235.90
PPARTS TOTAL $2,123.10
LABOUR CHARGES:
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE & REPLACE REAR ACCIDENT AREAS & ETC 5250.00 2: Z::?/
LABOUR CHARGES FOR PAINTING B TO SUPPLY PAINTS & FURNISHING MATERIAL 5300.00 2.5:-:?'
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE/REFIX REPLACE REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR $80.00 do/
TO CHECK WIRING & ELETRICAL DIAGNOSTIC $180.00 J@;{
LABQUNTATAL . #83000
ONG TOTAL $2,933.10

14,
/ g oty e,
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Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

....... ot R S (N - i s - ;
Case | Motified Est Submitoed Agd) Assigned Adj Rpt Ad] Submitted ]Ins Auth'ed Status
OO .. L L = mitted | Ad] ASSignec : | -
18 Feb 201% Pending for Survey

'5$2,550.40 | §42,550.40 ;
Edit Estimates | | view Rpt |
|

|
| iin |21 Feb 2019 0000

[ .._E"ﬂl | Edit gy apt |

_

Claim Detalls

Reference

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [[Created by adjuster]
Tnsuredd; |LOH SIN YEEN, ID: 526026828 " .
vehicle Reg. _ | 070272019 14:00 - 159
ot SLUS803P - e of Loms: |0 o L7 mag Dite {Mar Y1) |
| Claim Type: | OD / 1201900004260 ;‘:::"ﬁ'f’;“r PNPVZ018-00014351 (Comprehensive)
- —  |Exeess: 5$0.00
__F_t_gEJr_E[_: jnptim Warkz Pte Ltd {_I_-_I_g_j_ 9A Serangoon North Ave 5, 554500 Serangocn - Ld;
'1":5:"':12':'3 | FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6727 5700 ... [Handled by Josey Loh]
) ! s - —
\Adjuster: | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .., [Handled by KENNETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt due 28/02/2019]
'ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View All | Compose Case Mail |

'+ FWD_SG (26/02/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$2733.10) - SLUSB03F - Claim Handler: Josey Loh

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= view All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | compiete |
| Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
No results.,

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 10/4/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

Claim Documents

*SLUSS03P (1201900004260)
oD
Feb 7 2019 2:00PM
[LOH SIN YEEN]
Optima Werkz Pte Ltd

Upload Docurments I Uptead Photos Compose New Letter J View m
lssﬁ:-;mtnt Reports - B 1 per page E & I
-a:-ln-Finah.z;;'l_I:-‘In | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) B Thumbnail | Print |
1 25/02/19 17:34 | Adjuster Immediate Advice - " @Y | Load M |
IE;&;;IMI“I e - . 3|:IE;|_.'.|E5! E
| No ;uﬁabel,fna_n!-m:r LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
|1 |28/03/19 11:47  General View Right O | waaws | A
|z |28/03/1911:47  General View Right 0  ladws | ¥
|3 |28/03/19 11:47 _t_B_ulur; View niﬁnt i _ﬂ | Lead e | B4
4 28/03/19 11:47 General View Right B | wadirc |
;5 :13fn3.f1g 11:47 | General View Right ) Load PG | o
6 28/03/1311:47  General View Right ) | @ | woadrc | & |
7 |28/03/18 11:47  Odometer Reading D | weaws | A
'8 |28/03/19 11147 | Chassis Number 5 © | caaws | A
' |28/03/19 11:48 | Reinspection Photo €Y | Load PG
10 [26/03/15 11:45 | Reinspection Photo [ @ [odres [
11 [28/03/19 11:48 Reinspection Photo | adire |
12 'rza,rna,rm 11:48 _Eﬂnsp-u:tinn Photo - ﬂ_' Load PG | B
‘Documentation . [1per poge [~} &
‘Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) [ Thumbnail | Print
1 |25/02/19 17:34 | ESTIMATE .par | K} Load POF
2 |28/03/1911:46 | ESTIMATE MARKED.pdf A € | Load FoF 1
{No_|Finalized On | FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
|1 |09/04/19 13:55 | Repairerinvoice + DV € | Load POF

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST - - reset | save | print |

There are no document checklists configured.

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To: O Handling Insurer
Mote: Rernarks are private unless you show Lo olher paries.
|

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 1 0/4/2019



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co reg o tassor1eer)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408533
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-BB05 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@|kkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. Our File No:  CS/FWD18003077/KSD3E2
& Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower 4
Eingapure DGEQBE Date‘. 10’!’0‘4\"2019
REFERENCE
Insured/Claimant; LOH SIN YEEN Policy Mo: PNPVZ018-00014351
Date of Loss: 0710212019 Mature of Claim: oD Claim No: 1201900004260
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SLUSE03P
Make & Model: t“;;ﬁEEEE'EE”Z AR STMATICRD e 27682330734531
Reg. Date: 071272017 (Man. Year; 2017) Chassis No: WDD2132642A330311
Colour: Metallic Pearl White Odometer; 28927 km
Engine Capacity: 2996 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: S$323,000.00
Sum Insured (S%): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 245/35Z R20 Rear Tyre Size: 275/30Z R20
Front Left Side: Yokohama 4 mm Rear Left Side; Yokohama 4 mm
Front Right Side; Yokohama 4 mm Rear Right Side: Yokohama 4 mm
The above values represent the remaining fyre ireads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %)
Pars 2,123.10 1,940.40 182.70 8.61
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour B10.00 610.00 200.00 2465
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 2,933.10 2,550.40 382.70 13.05
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%) 20532 178.53 26.79 1305
Nett Amount (S5) 3,138.42 2,728.93 409.49 13.05
INSFPECTION
Drate of Assignment; 18/02/2019
Date Inspected: 25/02/2019 Inspected At: Optima Werkz Pte Ltd (HQ)

9A Serangoon North Ave 5
Singapore 554500
Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days

Adjuster: KENMMETH KONG Manager: Hiew May Fung

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 10/4/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

NOTE. This report represents our findings af the time and place of inspection stafed herein. Such ingpection hes been carmed ouf fo the best of our
knowiedge and ability but any other iability under any other circumstances is hereby expressly excluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 10/4/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 08 Apr 2019)

Parts: 143 MERCEDES-BENZ AMG E43 3.0 4MATIC (R20 LED) (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0) |
Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)

|Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLUSB03F) [
Walidity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
Further Info: Items/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

Noc. Qty PartMNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *REAR BUMPER Buckled / Dented 1,665.00FL *1,462.00FL
2 1 *REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR RH Cracked 166.50 FL *166.50 FL
3 1 *REAR BUMPER LOWER COVER Cracked 462 50FL *462 50 FL
4 10 *“REAR BUMPER CLIPS Mecessary 65.00 FL “65.00 FL

F=Franchise part L=ListltemDisc
Sub Total (S%) 2,359.00 2,156.00
- List Item Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (S$) 235.90 215.60

Total Parts (S%)  2,123.10 1,940.40

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 10/4/2019



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour Items

1 LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE & REPLACE REAR MNew 250.00 220.00
ACCIDENT AREAS & ETC

2 LABOUR CHARGES FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINTS & New 300.00 250.00
FURMISHING MATERIAL

3 LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE / REFIX REPLACE REAR Mew 80.00 60.00
BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR

4  TO CHECK WIRING & ELECTRICAL DIAGNOSTIC New 180.00 80.00

Gross Labour Cost (3%) 810.00 610.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES =
https:Hsingapurc,merimen.comfcIairnsfindex,cfm?t‘usebux=MTRa-:ijuster&fuseactiun——-gen_... 10/4/2019



