Yaloo Mail - FW:; GBF 36111 ON 18.02 019/ AXA YNI9HA Imps.h‘umil._‘.nlwu.cumfd,nfi'oldcrﬁa'immﬁsagcsmMJll?ck_ch}iP

FW: GBF 3611L ON 18.02.2019 / AXA YN1944A 1

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuUtO) {Joylrene@lkkauto.com)
To  liusbro@ymail.com

Date: Monday, 10 June 2019, 10°53 am 5GT

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Susan.,
Kindly send back the DV sent on 4/6/14

Thank vou

Best Regards.

Jov Irene | Case Handler

| KK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

DID: 6841-2408 |email: jox irene o lkkauto com|Fax: 6741-4108

BIk 31. Pava Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue | #02-23 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only It may contain confidential and/or
privileged mformation I vou are not the mtended recipient (or have recen ed this email in ¢rror) please
notify the sender immediately and destroy this email Any unauthorized copying. disclosure or distribution
of the material i this emiaul is strictly fortndden.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 June 2019 1:13 PM

To: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com=

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: GBF 3611L ON 18.02.2019 / AXA YN1944A

Lol 3 [O-Jun-1%. 1:20 P!



Authorization To Act

Attn: Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance 5Singapore Pte Ltd
8 Shenton Way #27-01

AXA Tower

Singapore 068811

| / We, Messers Goldbell Leasing Pte Ltd (“the third party claimant”) of No. 18 Tuas
Avenue 10 Singapore 639142 (address), owner of GBF3611L (vehicle no.) hereby authorize
Liu’s Brother Auto Engineering Workshop (“the workshop”) to act for me / us with respect
to my / our claim for repair costs and / or rental and / or loss of use (“claim”) for my / our
vehicle no. GBF3611L that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on

18/02/2019 (date) along KIE Towards Tuas Before Exit 2 West Spring Primary School
(location) involving YN1944A (“the accident”).

| / We further authorize the workshop to settle my / our above mentioned claim in a
manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment
further to settlement of my / our claim with payment cheque / s being made in favour of

the workshop.

| / We further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my / our
behalf is on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver
/ owner [ insurers of the other vehicle / s is cancerned.

Dated this \o®, day of Rune (month) 20 A& _ (year)

3" Party Claimant; Workshop:

Signature: * ym— -~ Signature;
Mame: Goldbell Leasing Pte Ltd MName: Liu's Brother Auto Engrg Workshop
Address: No. 18 Tuas Avenue 10 Address: 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01
T AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 639142 Singapore 417883

Nric/ROC No: 199001196N ROB No: 232391793)



AXA THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

| VehideNo: | YN194A (insd veh) _
l GBF 3611L {TP veh] Model:  FIAT DODBLO
| Date of Accident/ Time: 1B/02/2010 1
| Repalr Est At . 5 |
_finatRepalepat =~ = =
tiss o Llgs < _ - | days at & el day
| Rental (If any), g | daysats par day
LTA Y GIASeaich Fee 5 |
Lrhers A [
i/ - o .
Final Settlement Sum TS 14,600.00 GLOBAL SUM
| | ]
Payee Name N |
Is Third Party Waorkshop GI Registerad? I ) YES: | ] NO ([Kindly indicate balow] |
e |
&) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability %l
B} Far GIA Registered Warkshop: BOLA Applicable: Yes/ Wo  BOLA Scemario No
HOLA Liability {* Assessed Labiling (*) !
tAssessed Lobdiy rtocbe fitted oy for chon collsians and for caseswhere BOLA does not app iy

Remarks —l

1. PLEASE EXPRESSLY RESERVE YOUR CLIENT'S RIGHTS IF SO REQUIRED IN THIS SETTLEMENT DOCUMENT.

2, THI5 SETTLEMENT 15 ON A WITHOUT PREJUDICE BASIS AND SHOULD NOT CONSTRUED A5 AN ADMISSION OF
LIABILITY ON AXA AND THEIR CLIENT/TORTFEASOR IN ANY MANNER WHATSOEVER.

3. AXA RESERVES THEIR RIGHTS UNDER THE POLICY TERMS B CONDITIONS AS WELL AS THEIR RIGHTS IN LAW.

Only applicable to rental claim - All document are ta be submitted with this settiement confirmation. In the event, rental
agregment [ invoices ae not received within 7 days of thissigned confirmation, we will automatically reven to loss of use dlaim
per the NIMA rates

Wa/l confirmed that this s a full and final settlement that we and ar our client have/had/has against you (AXA and their
policyholderfauthornsed driver ftortfeasor) forany and all losses {past/present/future) arising from this accident

We canfirmed that we have the authanty of our chient to act for and on their behalf in this accident, /%
\;
I A«
Signature of workshop represent) kehop Signature of Witness / Workshop stamp (if applicable] ——
Mame of Representative - Mame of Witness. Low Siew Yian - S15431348
Liu's Brather Auto Engineering Workshop :
DﬂM -I:UH Im, RﬂBNﬂ,ﬁSﬂQﬂﬁJﬂn Date:; 1 ﬂ -".I'H m’

Signature'of ARA'S surveyn rfrepremm:atuug
MWame of AXA's surveyor (Representalive.
Date

AKA Insurance PreLad (Company Reg, No.: 199303512M)
8 Shoriton Way #I4-00 A)A Tower Sinpapore 06461

ARA Cuslomer Coritre #01-21522

Felophone: =45 GES0 4888 - - awa cam 17}




