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51 UBLAVE 1, #0125 PAYA LET INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D19001012MFSH Date; 22 March 2019
Our Ref: CS/FC119002947/Eqd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir'/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SLJ 2106X .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 21/03/2019 at the premises of M/s TRANS EUROKARS . and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :88  11.042.06

Revised Estimate Amount :S§  3.586.79

“Check” Items Amount : 5% 556.92

Market Value (8% - i

LTA Reimbursement Value : S$ - ;

Nett Value 58 - .

Description of Damage: iiia

The vehicle sustained damages :

at the front n/s portion. - ; l' ] :.J . trew
offside

Yours faithfully

Steve
Automotive Assessor



MS ‘ FirEtCapital M5 First Caplital Insurance Limited cogeg b 1950001050 C37 Reg: Mo M2-0U0LETE-0

f Raffies Quay #21-00 Singapone 048580
Tel (G5 6222 2311 Fa {65) 622 3547
Claims & Moter Underesiing Degt: 36 Robinsan Road #16-01 Gty House Singapore (6BE7T

Tel: (B5) 6507 3B48 Fax (656507 3849
wwaw mefirsicapital.oom.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type
Appointed

Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

12-02-2019 Our Ref No. D19001012MFSH
10-02-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHD8809R Third Party Vehicle. SLJ2106X

5 UBI CLOSE

JESS FRANCIS CARLOS

81289802f 81289802 Fax No. 0

WITHOUT PREJUDICE!

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc: TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

TRANS EUROKARS PTE

Attention. NIL
LTD
A TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
HENRY KAD

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required




Shiau Chan [LI{KAutn!

From: jess.francis@eurokars.com.sg

Sent: Friday, 26 April 2019 3:35 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); catherinechua@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: Re: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D19001012MFSH ; YOUR REF: SLJ2106X
Hi Shiau Chan,

Still chasing liability.
Regards.

Jess Francis Carlos

Insurance Claim Executive
TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD
5 Ubi Close

Singapore 408805

HP: 8128 9802

This email, including any attachment, is intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain
information that is confidential and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received it in error, please notity
us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system. Please do not copy it or use it for any
purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, April 26, 2019 3:24:43 PM

To: Jess Francis Amurao Carlos; Catherine Chua

Subject: RE: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D19001012MFSH ; YOUR REF: SU2106X

Dear Jess,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@]kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, UThi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: jess.francis@eurokars.com.sg <je ss.francis@eurokars.com.sg>

sent: Tuesday, 19 March 2019 4:48 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg

Subject: Re: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D19001012MF5SH - YOUR REF: SLJ2106X

Dear LKK,

Can we arrange the survey on Mar 21, 2019 at 4 pm?

Reqgards.

Jess Francis Carlos
Insurance Claim Executive



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

f

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 22 March 2019 2:46 PM

To: assignments; 'CW5S Motor Claims’

Cc: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001012MF5H/
Attachments: CSFCI19002947Eqd3.pdf

Dear Henry,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SU 2106X.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: f256-9561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 15 February 2019 3:53 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001012MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Friday, 15 February 2019 11:29 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@ LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Henry Kao Cai lie




> Back to OneMotoring

PARENMNE Rahata Enaidag

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date;
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Calour;
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.;

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE PeriodiYears):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Mar 2019

Singapore NRIC
4462C

SLJ2106X

Mo

22 Mar 2019

MAZDA

BIANTE 5-DOCR WAGOM 2.0L SP.AEAT
Blue

2016

PE30900823
JM&CC1071G0109782
111.0 kW (148 bhp)
$22,139.00

30 MNov 20146

30Nov 2016

0

$22,995.00

Yes
29 Mov 2026
$17,246.00

29 Nov 2026

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

$53,001.00

$40,737.00

$57.983.00
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CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

MﬁZﬁh AUfD’ PROTECTOR PRIVATE VEHICLE

Name of Policyholder  : Ng Siong Boon Vehicle No, 1 SLJ2106X
Period of Insurance 1 20 Mov 2018 To 28 Nov 2018 Policy No. 1 2100403542-02
Engine No, : PE30900823 Endorsement No.

Chassis No. i JMBCC1071G0108782 Issued Date : 01 Nov 2018

ABOUT THE COVER

{ Make/fodel : MAZDA BIANTE
Engine Capacity/Tonnage @ 1,998.00 CC Sum Insured : Market Value First Year of Registration : 2018
Driver Restriction NA Off Peak Car : No Insuring with COE/PARF | Yes

Person or Classes of Persons Entitled to Drive*

al Thie Pakcyhalder
) Any olher parsan whe is drving o ihe Policyholder's order o wilh hisher permission
This Policy will mdeminify the Polcyhoider or any authorised driver cnly  hedshe meets the specified ags canditicn,

¥oul hawe o pay an sdo
vadrs' driving axpariancs

nal sum of 3,000 as "¥oung anddor inexperienced Drivar Excess® (YIDR) if You are or Your sutharised Driver (named ar unnamed) &8 under the age of 23 andior has leas than 2

Age Condition » All Age Condition

Limitation as to usa”

Lise only for ecial, damestic and pleasune purposes and for the Policyholoer's business. This Policy does not cover u=s for hire or reward, driving luition, driving fesl, racng, pace=m aking, refiabiily brial co
spand-tesing, the camiage of goods cther than samples in connection 'with any rade o business o ues far sny purposs in canrsclion wilh Mebar Trade

|
I Loss of Ulse 1500ce - 1800ce Optional

{ * Uimiations rendered inoperalive by Seclion B of the Motor Vehicles (Third-Party Risks and Compensation) Acl {Cap. 188) snd Section 85 of lhe Roead Trenaport Acl, 1887 (Malaysa), are nol 1o be
Imclisdad under thess headings

Section 1

Fira - 50 Own Damage - $600 Thef- 50 Flood Cover - 50

Bection 2 |
Property Damage - 50 |

i Windscrean : 100

' MNamed Driver and EXCESS (where applicable)

| Mg Siong Boon - $600 (Own Damags)

1.Trans Eurakars Pla Lid Add: 274 Tarjong Perjuny, Singapore 809042 63310608

Faoralhar Approved Repariing CenlreslG Authonssd Reparers, please cantact aur 24-hour acciden] amargency hatine at +85 6335 6200, Altematvely, you may refar io AlG websia wae, 5], com,.5g
or AIG 5G Mabile App. Simply search and download "20G SG° from iTunes or Google Piay.

IMPORTANT NOTES

Hire Purchase Company/Employer's Loan: OCBC Bank Ltd

[ heroby cerdy that the polley towiich this Cerfificats of Insurance relabes is [ssued in accordancs with ihe provisions of the Motor Vehiches(Third Party Risks and Compensation] Act (Cap, 188), Pan IV of
the Read Transpart A, 1967 [Malaysia) and Mator Vehicles [Thi Party Fsks) Rules, 1956 {Malaysia)

0503588160

W
ARF (£P) BTE LTD - MAZDA

T MAXWELL ROAD #01-100 ANNEX B MND COMPLEX

SINSARORE 0621117 AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
Underwritten by AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, AUTHORIZED REFRESENTATIVE

Ca. Reg, No 201004040 | Comymight © 208 ARG Asa FacAc neurance Pre. Lid

B50as8H

o Wy #07-16 AIG Bulldng SO0T9120 | T:+65 G419 3000 | wissel gig. Sorm.s A1G Asla Facific Insurance Ple. Lid.
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TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD

NO:5 UBI CLOSE, SINGAPORE 408605

ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIRS

(&) ELROKARS GROUP

mazpa
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD NAME : Mr Ng Siong Boon WIP : 42736
36 ROBINSON ROAD ADDRESS :  Blk 220b Bedok Central EXCESS :
#16-01 #15-42 DATE: 12-Feb-19
CITY HOUSE S5INGAPORE 068877 singapore 462220
ATTN. : MOTOR CLAIMS TEL: 98419416
FAX :
VEH NO : SU2106X DATE IN : CONTACT PERSON : jess 63957874
CHASSIS NO : IMBCC1071G0109782  |MILEAGE : TYPE OF CLAIM : THIRD PARTY CLAIM
MODEL : BIANTE DATEREG.: | 26-Nov-18  |POLICY NO. :
NATURE OF WORKS
Parts Description
NO ary REVISED PRICES
1 |FRONTBUMPER -~ []]] 1 MCE05-50-031CBB $ 1,023.10
2 |STRIPE LHS, FRONT BUMPER ./ AL( 1 MCA67-50-887 5 77.60
3 |STRIPE RHS, FRONT BUMPER - /L( 1 MC467-50-877 § 77.60
4 |RETAINERLHS — [/ 1 MC273-50-0U1D 5 38.80
5 |BRACKET LHS AN 1 MC467-50-161A s 127.10
6 |COVERLHS, FOGLAM | 1 MC605-50-C21A §  177.20
7 |FOGLAMPLHS | 1 MC461-51-690 $ 44160
g8 |cHROMELHS £ ) 1 MC467-50-7K 1 $ 54370
9 |CLIP, FRONT BUMPER .~ /U0 | 10 MC274-50-133 5 35.00
10 |SEAL RUBBER, FRONT BUMPER .~ L[ 2 MC467-50-2G2 s 80.80
11 |FRONTGRILLE Assy ¢ I 1 MCE05-50-7108 $  2,131.30
12 |FASTENER, FRONT GRILLE -~ /it 2 MD350-50-E21 5 21.00
13 |FASTENER, FRONT GRILLE - ||/t 2 MBO041-68-865 02 3 9.20
14 |FRONT FENDER LHS < I\ 1 MC275-52-2118 §  364.00
15 |mupGuarDLHs Ot VA 1 MC273-56-140C §  172.40
16 |FASTEMER, MUDGUARD I 10 MB45A-56-146A 5 28.00
17 |HEADLAMP LHS N 1 MC274-51-041D S 2,613.70
18 |cue, veaotame . VA 5 MC273-50-133A $  48.00
19 |RiveT, HEaDLame M| 1 MB092-51-833 s 3.30
m— TOTAL PARTS & 8013.40
En;:fq_ﬂul.u: u'f.:xu.q.u_: Tfﬁ';;- Frerry LESS 10% 5 201 34
» Ta resurvey beforelaftar spray painting TOTAL PARTS COST 7,212.06
» To Gisplay DAMaged parn|s) ounng resurvey
- " ! e ‘ﬁl:' el atabilaank bl o'l
» Third party survey is on a “Without Prejudics’ tkabour Description
» No ilegal modification(s) & allowed
¥ SUppREITET SRR DS TREN) . T
N —— ;mgﬂﬁﬂmmmﬁmﬁm ER LH. REPAIR ALL AREAS AFFECTED BY o r*:- s 132000
Arknoadedged be REE et
5> | mz-sp-sFRTO7 |TO'RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER AND FRONT FENBER LH S  1,260.00

SLJ2106X Page 1of 2




'
MZ-BR-CAVITY |TO CARRY-OUT BODY CAVITY PRESERVATION. 3 250.00 1,
MZ-BR-ELECTR |TO CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROFER FUNCTIONING. \ § &  250.00
MZ-BR-REPROG |TO REFROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR WORKS. --,_ 5 350.00
TO SUPPLY BRILA PREMIUM COATING. NETT /U] 5 300.00
MZ-BR-SUNDRI [SUNDRIES. NetT /Y s 100.00
TOTAL LABOUR 5 - $  3,830.00
TOTAL PARTS 5 - |$ 721208
TOTAL 5 - | % 11,042.08
LESS EXCESS 5 Y =
TOTAL AFTER EXCESS s -
GST 7% 5 - |s i
GRAND TOTAL 5 S =
REMARKS: TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD
THIS IS ONLY AN ESTIMATE FROM VISUAL INSPECTION AND SHOULD
THERE BE MORE DAMAGES FOUND DURING THE PROCESS OF
REPAIRING,YOU WILL BE INFORMED BEFORE THE REPAIRS ARE BEING
CARRIED OUT. TAKE NOTE THAT SHOULD YOU DECIDE NOT TQ PROCEED
WITH THE REPAIRS, A QUOTATION FEE OF $400 WILL BE APPLIED
ACCORDINGLY FOR MAN-HOURS INVOLVED IN SOURCING FOR PARTS
PRICE AS WELL AS LABOUR CHARGES.
Authorised Signature
o (A} S ; .
| TEF ' ’ |
2 o ol Bt | l T
_.-I 4 ¥l e
Y s Ul 4
Fill i

SLJ2106X Page 2 of 2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 £01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref :  CS/FCI19002947/Eqd3n2
somoensonnord sweoneosssrr o w= (NN
Code : FCI2

1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD BB0IR Veh. Inspected SLJ 2106
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18001012MFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From HEMRY KAD Assign Date 15/02/2019

2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MAZDA BIANTE c.C 1998
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. JMBECC1071G0109782 Colour BLUE
Odometer 52982 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD

3. Conditions of Tyres

Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 YOKOHAMA, 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 YOKOHAMA 7 mem
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 YOKOHAMA 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R18 YOKOHAMA 7 mm

4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT N/S PORTION.

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

5. General Information
Accident Date  10/02/2018 Inspection Date 21/03/2019
Survey held at TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD

NO 5 UBI CLOSE
SINGAFPORE 408605

5a. Remarks

AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

Sb. Estimate Days of Repair

!ES’TIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLJ 2106X

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
£1 Ubi Ava 1 #01-25 Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX; 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607193-R

Page Mo.:1of 2

I Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |\ 5 Chop o] {5%'
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER DENTED 1,023.10 1,023.10
1|STRIPE LHS FRONT BUMPER NECESSARY 77 60 77.60
1|STRIPE RHS FRONT BUMPER NECESSARY 77.60 77.60
1|RETAINER LHS BROKEN 38.80 38.80
1|BRACKET LHS NOT NECESSARY 127.10 -
1|COVER LHS FOGLAM * CHECK 177.20 -
1|FOGLAMP LHS * CHECK 441 60 -
1|CHROME LHS NOT NECESSARY 543.70 -
10|CLIP,FRONT BUMPER NECESSARY 35.00 35.00
2|SEAL RUBBER FRONT BUMPER MECESSARY 80.80 80.80
1|FRONT GRILLE ASSY MOT MECESSARY 2,131.30 -
2|FASTENER FRONT GRILLE NECESSARY 21.00 21.00
2|FASTENER,FRONT GRILLE NECESSARY 9.20 9.20
1|FRONT FENDER LHS TO REPAIR SEE 364.00 -
LABOUR
1|MUDGUARD LHS NOT NECESSARY 172.40 2
10|FASTENER MUDGUARD MOT MECESSARY 28.00 -
1|HEADLAMP LHS NOT NECESSARY 2613.70 -
5(CLIP HEADLAMP NOT MECESSARY 48.00 -
1|RIVET HEADLAMP NOT NECESSARY 3.30 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -801.34 -136.31
7.212.08 1,226.79
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SUNDRIES (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 10.00
100.00 10.00
LABOUR
TO REPLACE FRONT BUMPER AND FRONT FENDER 1,320.00 860.00
LH.REPAIR ALL AREAS AFFECTED BY THE
ACCIDENT.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT
FENDER LHS
TO RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER AND FRONT FENDER LH. 1,260.00 1,260.00

Report Ref No. CS/FC119002947/Eqd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3361 FAsl 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R G5T Reg. No. 19-0607188-R Page No.:2 of 2
3 Estimate By | Our Adjusted
D Cond ; e
Qty escription of Parts ondition Workshop (§)) ($)
TO CARRY-OUT BODY CAVITY PRESERVATION, NOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER 250.00 150.00
FUNCTIONING.
TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR 350.00 180.00
WORKS
TO SUPPLY BRILA PREMIUM COATING. 300.00 100.00
3,730.00 2.350.00

GRAND TOTAL 11,042.06 3,586.79
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS 3,586.79
(REPAIR COST NOT CONCLUDE)
(EXCLUDE CHECK ITEMS §$556.92 NETT) :

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19002947/Eqd3n2

=

CHEN TSUE YEE

Automotive Assessor

3

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng,AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appralser

DMSCLAIMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Clent namad on the front pags of this Report.

Mo Eability of responsibllity whatsoever. in conlact ¢ ton copled 1o any ihird party wio ms
Beport, inwhole or in pa. does 50 al his of

Jheer cowm risk.

part. Any third pardy acling




