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Consintants
e Y Pt Ltd Company Reglstration No 19960T198R

£1 URIAVE 1. #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : {065) BIEBASH] FAN @ (065 62264315

Your ref: D19001038MESH
Our Ref: CS/FCI9002942/R1vd3 Date : 12/3/2019
The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

MS FIRST CAFITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear SirfMadam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.SJW 1978

We thank you for your instruction on 15/2/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned

1/3/2019 at the premises of M/s HUA HONG PTELTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 1 5%3,274.40
Revised Estimate Amount ' §3616.00
"Check” Items Amount + 8%

Market Value 1 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 8%

Nett Value 1 5%
Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the

ofs front poriton front

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMMED RASUL
Automotive Assessor



MS‘ Fi rstca pital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coReg b 195000106 GST Reg Bo H2-0001676-9

6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D48560
Tel: [65) 6222 2311 Fac (65) 6222 3547

Claims & Moter Underwriting Dept: 35 Rolinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 058877
Tal: (S)A507 3848 Fax (65) 6507 3849
www msfirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
12-02-2019 Qur Ref No. D18001038MFSH
04-02-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC7247Z Third Party Vehicle. SJW187B

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1
JERLEEN TANG
66619688/ 0 Fax No. 66619699

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: LIABILITY UNCLEAR:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
A

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Ce : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

HUA HONG PRIVATE .
LIMITED Attention. MIL
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
HENRY KAQ

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspaction,

This is & computer generated letter, no signature required.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 16 May 2019 9:27 AM

To: Ashley Tan

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SJIW1978
Hi Ashley,

Finalised amount is 3 712 / 3 days part by part
Kindly confirm

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{408033)
r k717

SIS W Sgve the Earthe Print only when necessary

From: Ashley Tan [mailto:ashley@huahong.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 8 April, 2019 12:18 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Rasul (LKKAuto)
Subject: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SIW1978

Dear all

Please refer to the files attached for-:
- After paint
- Front fender inner shield

Please confirm LS finalisation.

Thanks & Regards
Ashley Tan

- HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

750 SUNGE! KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9690 | M, 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

{ Min MG

e




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 March 2019 9:33 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001038MFSH/1, SIW 1978
Attachments: 5JW 1978 PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SJW 197B
Date of survey: 7/3/2019
Number of days : 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 15 February 2019 10:22 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001038MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 62556-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: CWS Motor Claims [maiItu:q_wsmotorclaims@msfirstcagital.mm.5g]
Sent: Friday, 15 February 2019 9:44 AM
To: ASSIGNMENTSE@ LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Henry Kao Cai Jie <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001038MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail, Please do not reply to this mail.

AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: WWW.AVE.COM
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Cwner D Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 66880
Y N L 5 s A e AR PR T s s R A S A v |
Vehicle No.: SIW197B
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo
Intended Deregistration Date: 08 Mar 2019
Wehicle Make: HOMDA
Vehicle Model: AIRWAVE 1.5M A
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2008
Engine No.: L15A5208135
Chassis No.: GJ11306653
Maximum Power Output; 81.0 kW (108 bhp)
Open Market Value: $17,974.00
Original Registration Date: 26 Feb 2010
First Registration Date: 26 Feb 2010
Transfer Count; 3
Actual ARF Paid: $17,974.00
B nded PR R S e e e
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 25 Feb 2020
PARF Rebate Amount: $8,987.00
CQE Expiry Date; 25 Feb 2020
COE Category: A - Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $20,340.00
COE Rebate Amount: $1,963.00
Total Rebate Amount: $10,950.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 08 Mar 201%
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HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

250 Sungei kadut Street | Singopore 729332
Tel {55 6641 #6488 Fou: (45] 6661 697 Ervuil: infoas b eOng, Com. 50

Estimate Repair List

26 February 2019 ' HHTPClaims19-25

First Capital Insurance Limited
36 Robinson Road
#16-01 City House
Singapore 068877

Attn: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJW 197 B & SHC 7247 Z ON 04/02/2019 AT JURONG WEST ST 64
AT ABOUT 1615 HOURS

Insured . LIM SONG SENG (LIN SONGSHENG)
Vehicle Registration No : SJW197 B
Vehicle Make : HONDA
Vehicle Model : AIRWAVE 1.5M A
Vehicle Chassis No = GJ11306653
Policy No . MP306035
Date of Accident : 04/02/2019 Type of Claim: Third Party
S/N  Quantity Description Unit Price 5% Amount 55
1 1 Front Bumper fegeur L $ 1,050.00
2 10 Front Bumper Clip A& ”V % 200 $ 20.00
RH) rage¥ 70.
3 1 Front Fender (RH) Jl-f Cﬂf"f—* $ 570.00
4 1 Front Fender Inner Shield (RH) ﬁ* 140 3 120,00
5 1 Front Head Lamp (RH) <. AN $ 635.00
6 1 Front Head Lamp Bracket (RH) ¥_ /A L ! A $ 48.00
VL $ 2,443.00
19 = o,
_ :,( AN Less 20% 3 (488.60)
F 1,854 .40
To dismantle & change front bumper, front RH head lamp, front RH fender, $ M
knocking & pull straight front RH wheel house panel [) 7O e
S
To perform wire checking $ 20.00 XA "
To perform 4 wheel alignment $ 100.00 X1 71
To spray front bumper, front RH fender and touch up front RH wheel house $ ‘Betfﬁﬂ Qlfc"o
' : ' : - % 3,274.40
ul 7% GST _$ 229.21
. $  3,503.61

\ '%\O\ qumh'lrﬂﬁa’ Total  _
\’b 3 (ﬂw Tign

Authorised by Claims Dept [fo ; "-:,JT'L
Mrs Tan @ 9639 9195 s
D’(’bs{ﬂ("rﬁ? 2 Jan
¥ dcgueti

Co, Reg, Mo, 2009003094 | huahong.com.sg | G5T Req. Mo, 2002003068
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 &01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Req. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

#18-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 06BB77

Ref : CSFCIMS002942R1vd3n2

Date :

Code : FCI2

27-05-2019

LR

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. SHC 72472 Veh. Inspected S5JW 1978
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. D19001038MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From HENRY KAQ Assign Date 15/02/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA AIRWAVE 1.5M A c.C 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. GJ11306653 Colour WHITE
Odometer 180546 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IM ORDER Medification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/45R17 MICHELIN B mm
L/H Front T',rra 21545 R17 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/45R17 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/45 R17 MICHELIN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S FRONT PORTION.
CAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  04/02/2012 Inspection Date 07/03/2018
Survey held at HUA HONG PTELTD
250 SUNGEI| KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 728332
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|EST1MATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubd Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R G5T Reg. No. 19-96071588-R Fage No.:1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJW 197B
: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ($)
BEEPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE 1,050.00 -
LABOUR
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIP @%2.00 MECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1|FRONT FENDER (RH) TO REPAIR SEE 570.00 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD (RH) cuT 120.00 120.00
1|FRONT HEAD LAMP (RH) NOT NECESSARY 635.00 -
1|FRONT HEAD LAMP BRACKET (RH) NOT NECESSARY 48.00 -
1| TYRE PRESSURE KIT (NPA) NOT NECESSARY - -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -488 60 -28,00
1,954.40 112.00
LABOUR
TO DISMANTLE & CHANGE FRONT BUMPER,FRONT RH 600.00 200.00
HEAD LAMP FRONT RH FENDER KNOCKING & PULL
STRAIGHT FRONT RH WHEEL HOUSE PANEL.
TO PERFORM WIRE CHECKING. NOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
TO PERFORM 4 WHEEL ALIGNMENT. NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
TO SPRAY FRONT BUMPER FRONT RH FENDER AND £00.00 400.00
TOUCH UP FRONT RH WHEEL HOUSE
1,320.00 600.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,274.40 712.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | - 712.00]

U

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19002942/R1vd3n2

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A MMATAI

Licensed Appralser

MECLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Feport i made sobsly for the use and banafit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




