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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 3:40 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SJW197B

Dear all 

 

Confirmed $712/-, sorry for the late reply. 

 

 

 

Thanks & Regards 

Ashley TanAshley TanAshley TanAshley Tan 

 

 HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED  

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332  

T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699 

Follow us @ huahong.com.sg 

                 
 

 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 16 May 2019 9:27 AM 

To: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg> 

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SJW197B 

 

Hi Ashley, 

 

Finalised amount is $ 712 / 3 days part by part 

Kindly confirm 

 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Ashley Tan [mailto:ashley@huahong.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 8 April, 2019 12:18 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Rasul (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SJW197B 

 

Dear all 
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Please refer to the files attached for-: 

- After paint 

- Front fender inner shield 

 

Please confirm LS finalisation. 

 

 

 

Thanks & Regards 

Ashley TanAshley TanAshley TanAshley Tan 

 

 HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED  

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332  

T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699 

Follow us @ huahong.com.sg 

                 
 

 

 


