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Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

— =
From: QQI, Ben <ben@allswellmotor.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, June 06, 2019 8:39 PM
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
Cc: accounts leasing
Subject: Re: SKA1347H - after paint

Dear Steve,
We agreed and confirmed the L/S of $2,000 before GST @ 03 repair days..

Thank vou

Truly
OO0I, Ben

Allswell Motor Traders

25, Defu Lane 9

Singapore 339266

(ifice +HA5 6670 | 146

Mishale: +65 9147 8545
benddallswellmotor com.sg

On Thu, Jun 6, 2019 at 7:07 PM Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen(@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Ben,

We have come out with the finalize $2000 (L/S, before G5T). 3 repair days.

Kindly confirm.,

Thanks

Best Regards,



