Vic (LKKAuto)

e ————

From: Claims Dept of CT] <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 10 October, 2019 11:16 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc Chong Boon Sen; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Hslao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD34345 (OL
SNM19D200742C02/cbs) and GX8232K (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI19002860/Uha3) on
01/02,2019

LKK REF - CC6/CTI19002860/Uha3
CTPIS REF — SNM19D200742C02(cbs)

Dear Vic
We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter.

Please proceed to offer as follow:

Cost of repairs $8,774.00
Loss of Use ($60.00 x 12 days) $ 720.00
GIA Search fee $ 200
Total $9,496.00

We await your payment advice to enable Boon Sen to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID : (65) 6389 6183

FAX: (65) 6224 7478

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: XK ¥jif Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mall and any files transmitted with it Is Intended anly for the named recipients and may contaln confidential information,
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either In whale or partial, is prohibifed. if you are not the Infended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Ploase delefe the e-mail and any coples of it thereafter,

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 1 October, 2019 11:46 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon
Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD34345 (0l: SNM15D200742C02/cbs) and
GX8232K (TP : LKK REF - CC/CT119002860/Uha3) on 01/02/2019

CTI REF - TBA
LKK REF - CC6/CTI19002860/Uha3

Dear SirfMadam,



ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBD 34345 (01} / GX 8232k (TP) / OTHERS ON 01/02/2019
We refer to the above matter.

It was reported that Insured vehicle was involved in a 3 vehicle chain collision and was the last car and rear-ended TP
vehicle.

A letter was sent out to the Insured company to notify TP claim and NCD issues. No feedback received till date.

As such, in view of MCF and BOLA 28, liability may not be to our Insured's favour and we have to settle the claim
from the TP vehicle and the damages sustained to TP vehicle were consistent to the nature of the accident.

Summary to offer to repairer EASTECH AUTO PTE LTD is as follows:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 31,865.24 $ 8,774.00
Loss of Use ($120 x 12 days) S 1,440,00 S 1,440.00
GlA Search Fee L 2.00 5 2.00
TOTAL | § 33,307.24 $10,216.00

TP VEHICLE DETAILS:

MARKET VALUE : $10,500.00 (est)
LTA REBATE :$ 2,273.00 (est)
MNETT VALUE  :$§ 8,227.00 (est)

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Recommended Days 10 days
Weekends / Downtime 2 days
TOTAL | 10 days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.
For your approval and/or further instructions please.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

S F B el

Se2 22T ST Sove the Earth Print only when necessary:

This e-mall comain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the inlended reciplent. Use or distribution by an
unintended reciplent is prohiblted, and may be a violation of law. If you bellave thal you recelved this a-mall In arrar, pleasa do not
read this e-mall ar any attached lems. Please delele the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof, Thank you.



From: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 April, 2019 7:51 PM

To: 'claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com'’

Cc: Elaine Cheong; Ong Chin Kiat; 'Chong Boon Sen’; Joy Irene (LKKAuto); C5 A Team; Admin A
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD34345 (Ol : CTI - TBA) and GX8232K (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CTI19002860/Uja3) on 01/02/2019

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle GX B232K at M/s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit on a WP basis and TP
repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:

« TP GIA report
* TP estimated cost of repair
* Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2409.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank veur.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | S(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.svmanteccloud.com




IFASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67465405 / 67465376  Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Date :13.03.2019

China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pre Lid
3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Attn: Motor Claim Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE:  GX 8232K AND GBD 34348 ON 01.02.2019

We are the authonzed repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: GXB8232K . which was involved in
the captioned accident with vour insured vehicle no:  GBD34348 | The vehicle owner has requested and authorized

us 1o assist him in presenting his‘her claim against the party responsible for the damage 1o the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims {or
your consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

11 Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) 5 8.774.00
2)  Loss OF Use ( 10days + 2sun X $120) 3 [.440.00
3y  GIA Search Fee 5 2.00

s 10216.00

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:

a) Final Repair Invoice b) Vehicle Registration Log Card
¢) GIA Report/GIA Search Result d) VC & Driving Licence
¢) Insurance Certificate ) Lener of Authorisation, etc...

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from vou on the settlement of our customer’s claims
as soon as possible,

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (il any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank you.
Yours faithfully.

Jason Tang QJ

For Fastech Auto Pte Lid



F TN 8

S1 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408953 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (I65) 62564315
Our Ref: CC6/CTI19002860/Uhal
28 AUGUST 2019

GUAN LOO ELECTRICAL & GENERAL CONSTRUCTION
874 WOODLANDS STREET 82

#07-508

SINGAPORE 730874

Dear SirfMadam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 3434S AND GX 8232K ON 01/02/2019

We refer to the above accidemt where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Lid to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner
of GX 8232K against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and evidence at hand, liability 15 down
against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the
Third Panty.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

v

FAX: 6741 4108
Email: vicalpeh@Tkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre Lid
(Mator Claims Dept)
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owner of vehicleno, (% 3 0 & 0K in consideration of M/s FASTECH AUTO

PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle ('« * % > ko at my/our instruction and hereby
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I/'We ﬁn'ﬂn'agmemdmﬂmxknmhdemnﬂ‘yﬂm:; against the above-mentioned claim cost

Signature of Owner : H' Vix A A
Name of Owner :




*s* Thig Dl.ml-ﬂ:g‘q_! vOUCher agpdes oidy 16 e calmsnls claim
. for his property demage and will ‘nol sfiect his personal
injunes claim and/or uninsured loeses cdaim in a later gale
Further. the settlamant terma hersin should not be used 5 an
Evidence 10 prejudice 10 the claimant's personal injuries ciaim
and/or other uninsured losses claim arising of the

subsect matter in this action.

MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Policy Wo : DHCVSN1432731804 Claim Mo : SNM19D200742C02 (cbs)
Claimant : FLEXI FLEX PTE LTD

Amount 1 559.490.00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS NINE THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED NINETY ONLY

I/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount to be paid to mefus in Full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by me/us through an accldent involving

Claimant Vehicle Wo. : GX BZ32K
Insured Vehicle No. : GBD 34345

Date of Loas 1 01.02.2019
Place of Accident : PIE BEFORE JALAN BAMAR EXIT

IN CONSIDERATION pf the payment made to me/us of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAFORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agres absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. andfor

Insured Name : M/5 GUAN LOO ELECTRICAL & GENERAL CONSTRUCTION
Driver Name i LDO ENG GUAN (LU RONGYUAN)

from all claims, present or future in respect of all less, injury or damage
sustained by mefus arising out of the saild accident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

{1) Global Sum (all in}) 55 9.490.00

TOTAL . . . . v = = 2 = = = =« « - 55 9,490.00

: 1*“”"{"'5_7"[(

NRIC Np

Signature : -P \.\xcné Dbte = 1‘3\“' \ —

Claimant Mame : H'E:(\ H'k'i [TE LT{J




TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

I Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158  Fax No: 67458520
Tax.Reg No: 2000062621

China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pre Lid

Tax Invoice : 2089

3 Anson Road Date: 13032019
#16-00 Springleal’ Tower Vehicle No:  GX 8232K
Singapore 079909 Make'Model: TOYOTA DYNA
Accident Daie; 01022019
Attn: Motor Claim Department Claim No 0219-2089|
Reference
Palicy No
Amount
To proceed on lump sum repair 58 8.200.00
E.& Q. E. Total : 8% B,200.00
GST @ 7% : 88 574.00
Amouwrt Due - 8% 8,774.00

!

|
for FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
All Invoices are subjected to GST




01022019 , Involce

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

I"S'URANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to S5pm
GS3T Regislration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Third Party Insurer Enquiry

QOur Ref No: GR-19-018705
Date of Request: 01/02/2019 Your Ref No; Online Purchase

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue & #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883
Dear SirlMadam,
gquiw Date 01/02/2019
Enquiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan
TP Vehicle No, GBD34345
Accident Date 01/02/2019
Enquiry Result
TP Vehicle No.  |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel, No.
GBD34345 China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pie. Lid. 18/09/2018-17/09/2019 6389 6111
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or conlents and shall be under no llability whatsoever for any

‘ or damage arising oul of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is @ computer generated document and requires no signature.

https:/{singapore. mermean. com/claimaandex cfmPlusabox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&relid=20485394CFID=478E826TACFTOKEN=TA8... 12



02018,

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #1B8-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE rione 65 6222 0010 Fax. +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operaling Hours: Monday to Friday 9am lo Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Our Rel No GR-19-018705
Date of Requast: 01/02/2019 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Kim Chwee Auto Pte Lid
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-38
AuloBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Dear SirfMadam,
!‘lquiw Date 01/02/2019
Enquiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan
TP Vehicle No. GBD34348
Accident Date 01/02/2019
DESCRIFTION AMOUNT (5%)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
G5T Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a compuler generated document and requires no signature,

For GIARMC Official use;

te:
?; GIRO [ ] Cash | | Cheque

hitps:/isingapare merimen.com/claims/index cfm Husebox=MTRzas&luseaction=dep_geninviphrefid=20485304CF =4 TR6E267TACFTOKEN=TEB,.. 2/2



