Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 29 March 2019 9:29 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: PRS IRO SLM189D | Ol :YP8464L DOA: 06/02/2019 | ERGO REF: YP8464L /SL/WM
Attachments: Ol SAS.pdf

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) [mailto:claims@ergo.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 14 February 2019 3:35 PM

To: 'admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>

Subject: PRS IRO SLM189D | Ol :YP8464L DOA: 06/02/2019 | ERGO REF: YP8464L /SL/WM

Hi,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company to be the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request on without prejudice basis and to try finalise with the repairer on the repairs.
(Note: No repair estimate was provided to us)

Attached are the necessary documents for your further actions.
Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

NOTE: Please assist to quote our ref as the subject matter, when forwarding the Preliminary Reports / Survey Reports.

From: santeeauto@singnet.com.sg [mailto:santeeauto@singnet.com.sq]
Sent: Thursday, 14 February, 2019 1:28 PM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)

Subject: RE: Document from Devi

Hi



Please arrange for LKK Auto Consultants. Please call Devi @ 67556210 for survey arrangements.
Regards

Devi

SAN TEE AUTO PTE LTD BLK 1019, YISHUN INDUSTRIAL PARK A #01-388 SINGAPORE 768761 Tel
:67556210/67538276 Fax : 67592034

On Thu Feb 14 2019 12:06:18 GMT+0800 (Malay Peninsula Standard Time) ERGO Insurance
Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims @ergo.com.sg> wrote:
—————————— Original Message ----------

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir,

We acknowledged receipt of your email below for the PRS request as below.



In compliance with ‘“‘State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016, do select
an assessor from the list below.

1 |AIS Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
2 TA FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd

3 [IAS Infiniti Appraisal Service

4 JPK JP Knights Pte Ltd

5 |[LBS [L.B.S Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

6 |LKK [LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

7 |PS [Priority Services

8 [VAC Vicom Litd




Your request for inspection does not have your client’s cost of repair estimate, kindly forward a

copy

From:
santeeauto@singnet.com.sg [mailto:santeeauto@singnet.com.sq]

Sent: Wednesday, 13 February, 2019 5:12 PM
To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)

Subject: Fwd: Document from Devi

Dear Sir / Madam

We are attaching documents for a Direct settlement.

Please do the needful and for survey arrangements please contact Devi @ 67556210.



Regards

Devi

SAN TEE AUTO PTE LTD BLK 1019, YISHUN INDUSTRIAL PARK A #01-388
SINGAPORE 768761 Tel : 67556210/67538276 Fax : 67592034

On Wed Feb 13 2019 11:37:38 GMT+0800 (Malay Peninsula Standard Time)
Anjalai Devi Kuppusamy <kadevi61 @yahoo.com.sg> wrote:

SLM189D - Accident Report -06-02-19.pdf



Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

’ AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
. © Www.avg.com



