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51 UBL AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBIL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D19001007MFSH Date: 15 February 2019

Our Ref: CS/FC119002750/Kqd3

The Motor Claims Department

First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SJB 8572J .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 14/02/2019 at the premises of M/s INSURANCE’S AUTO. and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ;5% 3.430.91
Revised Estimate Amount : S§ 1.072.99
“Check” Items Amount 158 334.50
Market Value :S§ -
LTA Reimbursement Value : S -
Nett Value : 5% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the front portion.

Y ours faithfully

KONG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appraiser



MSs @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital insurance Limited  co#eq bu D950000060  CST Reg Mo H2-00016T6-9
£ Ratfles Quay #21-00 Singapore Q48580
Tel {65y 6222 2311 Fax (65) 6222 3547

Clais & Hotor Uederwribing Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 058077
Tel (5] B507 3848 Fax [65) 6507 3849
woww, ms firstrapitaloom,sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

12-02-2019 Our Ref No. D19001007MFSH
24-01-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHA8012M Third Party Vehicle. SJB8572J

BLK 5038 ANG MO KIO AVE 3 #01-405 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2
MELCDY

80085959/ 90089959 Fax No. 83373700

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

NA Fax No. 58416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report,

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

INSURANCE'S AUTO Attention. NIL

CHEONGHOH LAW
licit _
CORPORATION TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
SITHARA
IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey repart via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required,




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 15 February 2019 11:45 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments

Cc 'Sithara'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001007MFSH/1
Attachments: CSFCI19002750Kqd3.pdf

Dear Sithara,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SIB 8572).

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 14 February 2019 10:17 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001007MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

,_hfnl-_
13-

L

=

-

BEST REGARDS,
(;.Nivitha | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: CWS Motor Claims ImaiItu:cwsmoturcIaimaiﬁ‘fms.firstcanital.mm__sg]
sent: Wednesday, 13 February 2019 3:58 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS @ LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg=
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001007MFSH/1
1
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, > Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

PARF/COE Rebate Enguiry

Wehicle Owner Particulars

Crewner 1D Type: Singapore MRIC
Crwwnier 10: 2588F

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo SJBBSI2)
Wehicle ta be Exparted: Yes

Intended Dereglstration Date: 15 Feb 2019
ahicle Make TONOTA,
Vehicle Model: VIOS E AUTD
Primary Celour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2007

Engine Moz INZIXABARTL
Chassis Mo MROSIHY 305046241
Maximurm Power Output: BOO KW (107 bhp}
Cpen Market Value: $12,498.00
Original Registration Date: 25 Jan 2008
First Registration Date: 25 Jan 2008
Transfer Count; 4

Actual ARF Paid: 21374800
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Forfeitad

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

FARF Rebate Amount: £0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 30 Mow 2022
COE Category: A= Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period|Yearsh: 5

POP Paid: £20,997.00
COE Rebate Amount: $15,922.00
Tatal Rebate Amount: $15,¥22.00
Message

Please note that the S-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory
lifespan [if applicable), whichever 15 earlier,
The infarmation contaired herein s correct as at 15 Feb 201%

OK

NURSLVLItE. gov.sgitanvriachon/enguirekebate sy ublicBeroreereginputy EUMNL 1TIUIN_IL=F usuaud

LLh|



Insurance's Auto

Blk 5038 #01-405. Ang Mo Kio Ind. Park 2
Singapore 569541.
Email - insurancesauto(@hotmail.com

Fax: 64455393, Tel: 90089959,

Ting Siew Kim
Blk 5038 Ang MoKio Industrial Park 2
#01-405

Singapore 569541

Vehicle No  : SIB8572)
Chassis No MRO53IHY 9305046241

Make - Toyota Vios
Year : 2011
OTY Description

'{//ﬂ?‘ & ffﬁ/
/4' e, A 7%,- fomigy
?ﬁxﬂ.?/
Unit Price Amount

Estimate Cost Of Repair

| Fraid @ Clarnumt ',’I.ju:uld/wvs

St

I Front Bumper
1set Front Bumper Clips
Front Reinforcement
Front sponge
Headlamp Assy RH/LH
Front Support Panel
Front Grille
Front Grille Emblem
Front Bumper side retainerRH/LH

B etk

Labour Charges
To remove and replace damage parts including straightening
repositioning replacement parts.

Supply Paint Material and necessary items. To respray replaced
and other affected panels

Pt 2000 =

Arlim 532810 —
A, $40.00 —
A $267.00
fn $79.00
$223.80 J~ $447.60 X
7T 548030 ¥
Potllen $25435 =
Aee $3820 =
$35.00 So §70.00 X
$2.074.55
Less 25% $518.64
$1,555.91

> d?ﬁ!/

$750.00

Lot

$700.00



Reconnect wiring at the damage section and check for proper
functions. To focus headlamp height.

To carry out antirust treatment on affected panels.

To perform diagnostic checks on control units, Reset to factory
specification.

Special Nett Item

Front Number Plate

Front Number Plate Holder

$75.00

An ggn00 A

A~ $180.00 A

Ay $45.00

ﬁd"f
$45.00 g

Grand Total : §3.430.91

—_—



' V4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408033
e o TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607T108R GET Reg. No. 18-0807108-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
M5 FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref :  CS/FCI19002750/Kad3n2
s omosseoncaorcosserr % ez | [HHIHNN
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA BO12M Veh. Inspected 5JB 8572)
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19001007MFSH Excess () 0.00
Assign From SITHARA Assign Date 14/02/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAWVIOS (A) c.c 1497
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reqg. 2008
Chassis No. MROS3HYS305046241 Colour METALLIC GREEN
Odometer 215835 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |18560 R15 YOKOHAMA, 9 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/60 R15 YORKOHAMA 9 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/60 R15 YOKOHAMA 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre [1B5/60R15 YOKOHAMA 9 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTID“N.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  24/01/2019 |Inspection Date 14/02/2019
Survey held at INSURANCE'S AUTO
BLK 5038 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2
#01-405 SINGAPORE 569541
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 8256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Ruxg. No: 195807 128R GST HBQ. Mo, 19-9607188-R P‘Elga Mo.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJB B5T2J
o mate By | Our Adjusted
Q Description of Parts Condition | ESti
ty By Workshop S)|  (5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT GRILLE CHROME MOULDING DENTED T0.00 T0.00
1|FRONT BUMPER BUCKLED / 328.10 32B.10
CRACKED
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIFS NECESSARY 40.00 40.00
1|FRONT REINFORCEMENT TO REPAIR SEE 267.00 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT SPONGE SERVICEABLE 75.00
2IHEADLAMP ASSY RH/LH @%223.80 SERVICEABLE 447 80 -
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 480.30
LABOUR
1|FRONT GRILLE DENTED / 254 35 254 .35
SCRATCHED
1|FRONT GRILLE EMBLEM MECESSARY 38.20 38.20
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH/LH @%35.00 SERVICEABLE 70.00 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -516.64 -182 66
1,555 .91 547 99
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE (SN) ) BENT 4500 45.00
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE HOLDER (SN) } BENT 45.00
S0.00 4500
LABOUR
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS 750.00 200.00
INCLUDING STRAIGHTENING REPOSITIONING
REPLACEMENT PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
FRONT REINFORCEMENT AND FRONT SUPPORT PANEL.
SUPPLY PAINT MATERIAL AND NECESSARY ITEMS.TO 700.00 280.00
RESPRAY REPLACED AND OTHER AFFECTED PANELS.
RECONNECT WIRING AT THE DAMAGE SECTION AND NOT NECESSARY 75.00 -
CHECK FOR PROPER FUNCTIONS.TO FOCUS
HEADLAMP HEIGHT
TO CARRY OUT ANTIRUST TREATMENT ON AFFECTED |NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -

PAMNELS

Report Ref No. CS/FCI119002750/Kqd3n2




