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Pt
VGS Singapore s
247 Py
Alexandra Road A

1548934 Singapore

Phane No +65 6305 7298

Fax No. +65 6474 3643
V(GS Singapors. 247, 159534 Singapors E-Mail sarvice@vw com.sg
GOH YEW GUAN VAT Registration No. M20098505-2
735 TAMPINES STREET 72 Tax No 1891014947
#04-06
Singapore, 520735 .
itdn ol Service Quote
Customer No CV042663
Quote No SER/QUOI1900273
QuoteDate 07/02019
Salesperson Johanna Lim
Page 1
THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE
Make Model Description Mileage Service Advisor
Skoda Auto Karog 1.5 110kW Style 17 Chegng Paarlyn
License No. VIN Initial Registration Sales Advisor
SMGIHAM TMBKR7NU2K2014234 30/11/18 Johanna Lim
Engine Code Labor Type Engine No. Model Code
DAD 349539 NU74ND
No. Description Qty. UoM Unit Price Amount
P BA&P ALEX LABOUR LABOUR 4 Labor E¥u .
P BAP ALEX PAINT SPRAY PAINT 4 Labor Yov 00
P BAP DIAG PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION 1 Time Un 480.00—
P BAP MECH CHECK WIRE HARNESS, ECU, S 1 Time Un : 2an.ng/-
Sum Labor 7.320.0
P 57A807521 9B9 REAR BUMPER COVER €7 1 Pleces © 219000
P 57ABOT835 2ZN BUMPER LOWER COVER STRIP XM | Piaces 1.012.00
P 57AB07983 GRU BUMPER LHS COVER Seve CAN 1 Pleces B70.00
P 7N0919491 SENSOR BRACKET As- 1 Pleces gt 19
P 7NOS19491A SENSOR BRACKET As 7 1 Pieces g4 oui
P 7TNO918491A SENSOR BRACKET A~ ¢ 1 Pleces hu bk 1958
P 7N0S194928 GRU SENSOR BRACKET s 1 Pieces Bl Ve 19758
P 7N0S451058 REFELCTORLHS 7 A3 | Pieces 8139
Sum Item 423171
Sum Labor 7.320.00
Sum ltem 423171
Total  SGD 11,551.71
7% GST 11,551 71 BOB 62
Total SGD Incl. GST 12,360.33

Faymenis o - BBN - Acc-No



VG5 Sogapore. M7, 152034 Singapors

GOH YEW GUAN
735 TAMPINES STREET 72

#04-06

Singapore. 520735

Singapore

Make Model Description

Skoda Auto Karog 1.5 110kW Stiyle

License No. VIN

SMG38aM TMBKRTNUZ2K2014234

Engine Code Labor Type
Explanations

P = Proporiionately Charged

Payment Terms No Cradil

Paymenis ta: - BBN' - Acc -Na

VGS Singapore
247

Alexandra Road
159934 Singapore

Phone No. +65 6305 7299
Fax No +65 B474 3643
E-Mail sarvicevw com.sg

VAT Registration No M20088505-2
Tax No. 1991014842

Service Quote

Customear Mo CVD42663

Quate No SER/QUOMB002T3
QuoteDate 0710219
Salesparson Johanna Lim

Page 2

THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE

Mileage Service Advisor

17 Cheang Pearlyn

Initial Registration Sales Advisor

301118 Johanna Lim

Engine No. Model Code

DAD 349539 NUT4AND
ASul

Hp Govio0 &
2 duyy
f&{w{l“ 9’”;
Rusorg 21 17



Supplementary or Omitted List

VEHICLE NUMBER: SMG389M

MODFL KAROQ 1.5
CLAIMS DETAILS
LABOUR DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Total $0.00
No, ltem No, D tio! Qty | Amount
1 S5TABOTOBA COVER (CENTER) /i(# 1 134.78
2 D 180KUZAY ZKADHESIVE _ Hu 1 94 .34
3 D B22150A1 BOMDAGENT. ./ M 1 67 48
4
4]
5]
T
8
g
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
18
20
21
22
23
24
25
28
TOTAL:] $296.60
Total Labour & Parts 5296.60

Survey By
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Service Order Confirmation

TELEPHONE MO
ADORESS: T35 TAMPINES STREET 77 90408
Bangapom
VEH No.: SMG385M
Crviar Danm Za0ee
Hag Date. A [ 1
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Service Order Confirmation

BERVICE DMOER W THPGTT

Sl

CUSTOHMER MAME G0 YEW GLAN

TS TAMPINES BTREET T2 #0a-50

Singapa

VEH No.: SMG389M

Ciritey Dt
Heg Dare
Wik WO

MODEL

I0re

Elaiiy] ] L 1L
TRHKHTHUTHIN 8T ENGIME MDY

Koy 18 VI0KW Siyle MODEL MO NUTAND

DESCREFTION an o VMITPRICE  @EC% AMOLUWT
TOTAL 4.TAR %
GET AMOUNT N
TOTAL AMOUNT L
Con Bahalf DF "COMPANYT™ Cartifist DoodsSereice reoesesit
Authorired Signaiure Customar

NOTE: THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL RECEIPT



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From:
Sont:
To:

Cc
Subject:

Attachments:

Categories:

ear Poh Kin,

Waong Meiy (VGS - 5G/Singapore) <meiy.wong@vw.com.sg >

Wednesday, 22 May 2019 2:15 PM

Pah Kin (LKKAuto)

Cheong Pearlyn (VGS - 5G/Singapore); Goh Edmund (VGS - 5G/Singapore); Admin
A; Kong Charmaine (VGS - 5G/Singapare); Foo John (VGS - SG/Singapora)

RE: SMG389M - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING
SMG389M & SMCBES59C ON 02.02.19***LKK REF.CC3/AIG19002745/R1fb3
IMG_9818.JPG; IMG_9B19JPG; IMG_9820JPG; IMG_9821.JPG; IMG_9822 JPG; IMG_
9823 JPG

clear

O er nccepted. Please forward us DV, if any, and kindly process pavmenl. Thanks.

Manks and Best Regards,

Meiv
nsurance Service Advisor
'tersales

lkswagen Group Singapore Pte Lid

247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 158834

lirect line:  +85 6305 7216
{in Lina +65 6305 7299
tain Fax +55 6474 3643
Y WO e vw GO, 52
hitps iwww volkswagen com.sq/

¥ More than

meets

ithe eye.

: The new Touareq.

s not e-mall, if you print it Think Blue,

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin(@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 22 May 2019 11:52 AM
I'n: Kong Charmaine (VGS - SG/Singapore) <charmaine kong@vw.com.sg>

1




Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 22 May 2019 11:52 AM

To: ‘Kong Charmaine (VG5 - 5G/Singapore)’

Ce: Wong Mely (VGS - 5G/Singapore); Cheong Pearlyn (VGS - SG/Singapore); Goh
Edmund (VGS - SG/Singapore); Admin A

Subject: RE: SMG389M - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING
SMG389M & SMCBE59C ON 02.02.19***LKK REF:CC3/AIG19002749/R1fb3

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

SAVE ASTO COSTS

Our Ref: CC3/AIG19002749/R1fb3

Your Ref: SMG 389M
Dear Sir/Madam
We reler to the above matter and vour letter of demand.

Towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we offer
sttlement as below:

1. Cost of Repair (w/gst) SS 5,123.55

2. Loss of Use (560.00 x 3 days) 5$  180.00

3. GIA search 5 2.00
55 5,305.55

Kindly confirm acceptance.
In the meantime, we appreciate if you could furnish us a copy of the before paint photo for our file record.
Y our prompt reply will be very much appreciated.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affectfinfluence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settiement.”

Best Regards,

Foh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Plhione: 6841-2132 | email: pohkiné|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-3108

Blk 51, Paya Ubd Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408933)
74 P

b

SeSRER ST Save the Earthe Print only when npecessary



PAYMENT ADVICE

Your ref: AIG Insurance Venicle wo. SHMEPLE9€

'] [ o]
Claimant's Vehicle No. _ _fl-:';_! ?

1
Accident on 3"34 j _ Lnvelving vehlele/s Mo,

-

_ along/at

BREAKDOWN OF PAYMENT/S

g volkswagen Centre Singapore
1. Hepair Coat S8 _g_lh'f' " N e o
[_'tﬂl ZoR\Ys J
e

as U/ o g, Volkswagen Centre Singapo

S§_ _ _ _ _ _ Payable to o
IM and Volkswagen Centre Singapore

Besarch Fesn 5§ _?" o Payable to

Service Adviser

Contact HNe.H/P,



>
N
§§5

S| UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62363561 FANX : (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CCYVAIG19002749/R1(b3

22" February 2019

MA QIANG

Block 684A Edgedale Plains,
#11-613,

Singapore 821684,

Dear Sir'Madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING NOS. SMC 8569C AND SMG 389M ALONG
EU TONG SEN STREET ON 02.02.2019

We refer 1o the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Ltd to
resolve the claim against vou and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken
up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)if any) will be affected and reduced by 30%
{20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your
policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will
be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

e
PﬂthI'nr. Chong
Case Handler
DID: 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: pohkin@lkkauto.com

ce.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
fMotor Claims Dept)



Provide always that this discharge of my claim
for damages relating to the damage to my vehicle
shall not prejudice or affect or preclude me
from making a further claim for general and special
damages for my personal injuries sustained

AUTHORIZAT
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

. Goy Yew Auan (the third party claimant™) of
T35 Tampines  STREET T2 (address), owner of Smhzfam
(vehicle no,) hereby authorize Volkswagen Centre Singapore (“the workshop™)

to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim") for
my vehicle no _SM33AM  that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on
o2/otftoq (date) along Ew Tauh Sin  STARET (location)

involving vehicle no/s SMCEESAL  (“the accident™).

1 further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further o settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behall is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driverfownerfinsurers of the other

vehiclels i1s concerned.

Dated this 0¥ (day) of n"”'m {month) Eﬂi (year)

'S
]

Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by
(with chop if applicable) (with chop)

workshop™



pmyide always that this discharge of my claim -

T A=t lilnmnmking.muhgrchhuf&
in the same accident damages for % personal

RELEASE voulHER"*

(AIG Asia Pacific — EXPRESS T HIRD PARTY CLAIM)

Well,___\Jolkswanpn (erdte  Slrmapore

("the workshop”) hereby confirm that waf|

Vdve reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Lid.

Lk pute (onsalants phe L4} —("name of surveyor") with respect to the amount clalmed for
55 5,113.88 (repair costs), 83__[%0. 00

(loss of useirantal) 83_1-99 _ (search fees)
lot vehicle no. __SMG YIM  that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurmed
on_d1thol  (gare) along Ev Torna Gen Sheet . (location) Invoiving
vehicle nofs_____ SMC FbSaL —

This Is pursuant lo the Inspection conductedon  |1? |3 (1014 (date) at “the workshop®,
Well confirm that well arelam authorized by lhn owner __[_Jg"n Yew/ {:1 v ("third party claimant)
of vehicle no,__SMY 334 to make the claim as set out In the

-above paragraph and we/l have full
authority to settle the matter on histher behalf In & manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enciose herein the lettar of
authority given by “the third party clalmant®,

Wed further confirm that we/l will Indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple, Lid

expense that they will or have already Incurred In the event that “the third party claimant® afler the above said

agreement lodges a further clalm against the former for any loss and expenses suffered pertaining to costs of

'epairs andlor rental and/or loss of use pursuant 1o the damage to M i 384 1 (vehicla no.) as a resull
al tha accidenl.

¥

for all damages, loss and/or

Well confirm that the agreement reached above |s In full and final settlement of any claim of “the third party
claimant” pursuant to the accldent and that I'url}lur this seltlement ls reached on & without prejudice and without
admissicn of liabllity basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive
lurisdication over any dispute arising out of the sams.

Deted this __ %" Iday of

———Jdayot_M~d (monn)20 M _yemrse.nsiii

=ROUS
.-F"--\ . : H | =L Y k
W, | : ¥ .
() s -
— - 3 {2000 1]
Signed by AIG appolnted surveyor

Chopped & Signad by “the workshop"

X far dgmpgey relating to the damage to my vehicle Provife .1 it this discharge of my claim
| :Ec-‘ udice or .ngl or IIM;I;III me fit ‘& 10 the damage 10 my vehicle
| .

_ S el prejudice or affect or preclude me
my personsl injuries sustained .

general and special
injuries sustained

oAl



Volkswagen Centre Singapore

Service Tax Invoice No. SV18P10908

SERVICE ORDER NO: 181P04T7
SERVICE CUSTOMES NO.:  FOIOSSN
SURVICE CUBTORES MAME.. Ai0 ABIA PACIFIC SVEUSUANCE P2,
TELEPHDONE NOL.:
ADDREBS, T8 Sharas Wiy
P18 G Bgldeg

Paxt Cods oran

DIRECT SETTLEMENHT AGAINST AIG
DODA: 2.2.19

TP VEH: SMCBB59C

RASUL SURVEY

Lmbe®
1 LAROILIE
2 BFRAY BANT
3 Tow SVE- Qusiy Saccwery Sarvoes
i Tow VT Qiskty Agcovary Sarvces
4 PROCAANMING § CALIBAATION METT
L] CHEDH WIRE MARNESS BT SENSOR, Lag~T
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100
1
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100
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100
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Lo
1o

o
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DATE:

Vil MO
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woneL

Biz Rug. Fie. 3310EEV

G351 Ma. MI0098505-1
SMG389M
Rk e TRl Fichup
TuBCR PR 42 o
= Engins Mo
o 18 HOKW Sty
Channg Paan

Mt Appoimiment Date :
Next Appointment Milsage © 1]
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Volkswagen Centre Singapore

Service Tax Involce No. SV19P10908

SERVICE ORDER NO: 191P04ATT

SEWVICE CUSTOMER MO 013899

SEFVICE CUSTOMER WAME | AL ABLA FACIFIC INSURANCE PiL
TELEFHONE NO.

soDRESE: 78 Frwnian Wiy

AP0 A Biiiding

Singaoons
Foul Coge orenan
Ha RESCHETEN
Customer

NOTICE

Bix Eng. Mo, 5310308%¢

GIT Mo MIDOPES0S-2
VEH NO.: SMG389M
DATE: 1340349 PebLp:
il MO ThABATHLEIRC 14 ]34 K T
GEARDOX CODE- e Engine No.:
wOOEL. Marag 18 THOM Siyle
A Cheong Peurys
Mt Appoimment Date
Next Appalntrment Misage 1]
i d uon W1 FRICE AMOUNT

T NG DR DAY BRDUIT DE MESE eyshin m Volksesgen Gatup Singapore Pie Lig  Gere Assount 2S3EVAD0T Swk Coos DEUTEGSG  Swsss nnocms

CLNI0IMar Bamid @i Wil s SismDee o Fd T

247 Alexanara Road Singapors 158634 Phone B4T4AZ088 Fax : 64711022



Invaice hitps:i/singapore.merimen com/claimsfindex.cfmTusebox=MTR...

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
I"SMHCE & RafMas Quay #18-00, Singapors 048580
ASSOCIATION Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Opsrating Hours: Monday to Friday Bam to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: MA00017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Qur Rel Moo GR-19-018505

Dats of Raguest. 7022018 Your Raf No Onlina Purchasa

Volkswagan Cantra Singapon

247 Alpxandra Road

Singapore 150934

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 07/02/2018

Enquiry By Edmund Goh Hul Huang

TP Vahicls Mo SMCBB5BC

Acciiant Date p2r2r2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicla No. Insurar Pernod of Insurance |nsurer Tel, No
SMCBE58C AIG Asia Pacific insurance Pte Lid, 18072018 18072018 B5-6412-3000
SMCB&58C AIG Asie Pacific Insurence Pta. Lid. 26OTRZ0B-2507Tr2018 65-6419-3000
Thank You

The images provided W0 you are laken from ihe onginal repors forwsrded 1o the centre By the membars of e Genaral Insurance Association
of Singapote and we take no responsibility for hes scouracy or contents and shall ba under no Rabillly whatsoever for any loss or demage
arising oul of or In connaction with the reports o their images

This is a computer generated document and requires no signatura.

lof2 TrA2019, 1:38 PM



Invoice

2ol

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

hitps:/{ singapore, merimen.com/claims/index.cfmMusehoxr=MTER..

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay £18-00, Singapare 048580
Phona: +65 6224 D010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
Opermating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam ta Spm

GST Registration No: MADDD17735
TAX INVOICE

Qur Raf No: GR-18-019505
Date of Reguest: 0722018 Your Ref No Onling Purchass
Volkswagean Centre Singapore
247 Aloxandra Road
Singapore 158834
Dear SirffMadam,
Enquiry Date 07272018
Enquiry By Edmund Goh Hul Huang
TP Vahicia Mo SMCBB58C
Accidant Data 0200272019
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (55)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.67
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You

This |s a computer generated document and requites no signature

For GIARMC Official use
Date
%] GIRD | | Cash [ | Chegqus

7722019, 1:38 PM
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Express

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING -
|  Case  |Notifind Est Submitted Ad) Assigned Adj Apg | ha) Submitted Ins Auth’ed Statug
" 09 Fab 2019 i $$4,788.36 | $54,786.36 achey for, vy
L e agy e | | Ilm"ﬂl — Carcel Case | .

(CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [[Created by adjuster]
Insured: MA QIANG, 1D: SB576221D

Hain GOM YEW GUAN, 10 70712052

. l02jo2/2019 21:00 - :59
SMG389M Date of L0ss: |12 \onths and 3 Days Fram LTA Reg Date {Man Yr)]

TP / 666539168756 mﬁ‘"m 1BODOBE011 (Camprehensive)

Palicy Me.
SMCEESOC |(Camant): | VPAP2217613

ENCRES!
Volkswagen Centre Singapore (HQ) 247 Alexandra Acad, 153934 Alexandrs - Tel: 63057268

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Lid. [Express) - Tei; 65-6419-3000 ... [Handied by Foo, Chit Yan] Chityan. Foo@aig.com

Clsimant's
I sirer:

[mrummm{m}-m:iunnm
Adjuster. | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: £256-3561 .. [Handied by MOMD RASUL] .. [Final Rpt due 25/02/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | cumpq-mu;u_]]

There are no mall for this case.

|

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | compiete ||

| DueDate  Priority  Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On  Done?
| No results,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_c... 6/6/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SMG3B9M (66653916875G)

Page 1 of 2

[SMCBE59C]
T
GOH YEW GUAN
Feb 2 2019 9:00PM
[MA QIANG]
Volkswagen Centre Singapore
Uplond Documents | Uplosd Pratos | Compose tew Latter | Uploas vides | upioad Awdio | View [View in Browser | @]
ot/ Corvotppnioncns _________ tperpeoe To]| 4 |
No | Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail| Print
1 |(Draft) Third Party Express Settlement - Payment Breakdown O e |
Photo/images T
Ho | Relabel/Reorder |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) mumm!hmi
t |15/05/16 1847 | Odometer Reading © | loas s | g"!
2 |15/05/19 18:42 | Chassis Number D | cezs | A
3 15/05/19 18:42 | General View O | oadws | &
4 (15/0%/19 1842 | General View O | lsdwe B
5 |15/05/1% 18:42 General View 0D | e |
6 |15/05/19 18:42 General View D | tcesws |
7 15/05/19 1842 | General View O | edwc | A
B 15/05/19 18:42 | General View D | wws | B
9 | 15/05/19 18:42 General View 0 | texdis | M
10 |15/05/19 18:42 General View D | Leedies | A
11 15/05/19 18:42 | General View 0| Lsdws | B
131 |[15/05/19 1842 | General View 0| s | A
13 |15/05/19 18:42 General View 0D | toeaws |
14 |15/05718 18:42 General View D ! lesdwc | A
15 |15/05/19 18:42 | General View © | losdivc | BB
16 |15/05/19 16:42 | Genersl View © | Loadiec | A
17 15/05/19 18142 | Ganersl View | Losdiec | 4
18 15/05/19 18:42 | Ganeral View 0| leadiec | @ |
19 |15/05/19 18:42 | General View © | toaaws | B |
30 |15/05/19 16:42 | General View 0 | woears |
(21 |15/08/19 18:42 Ganeral View D | loadies | &
22 |15/05/15 18:42 | General View O | tosars | 6|
|23 |15/0519 18:42 Guneral View D | adwc | &
|24 |22/08/19 14:22 Reinspection Photo 0 | tcsdws | 4 |
iu |22/05/15 14:22 | Relnspection Phots O | lcediwc | A
26 |22/05/1% 14:22 | Ralnspection Photo D | lear: | [
27 |22/05/19 14:22 | Reinspection Photo O wwers | B
2B |22/05/19 14:22 Reinspection Photo D | wwdws | ¢
|20 |22/05/19 14:22 | Reinspection Phate © | Load WG
'nmmnnuﬂnn 1 per w] A
NG Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbrail | Prine
|1 [14/02/19 14:40 | TP ESTIMATE 8 Load POF
2 |14/02/19 14:40 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF
13 |14/02/1% 16:20 TP ESTIMATE- HARKED | iLoad POF

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docvi...

6/6/2019
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Letters/Correspandences tperpage v|| WA
{Ne |Finalizes On | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) o Thumbnail | Print
4 |23/02/19 1204 | LETTER TO O1 S b
|5 |22/05/18 14:47 | TP Estimate-Marked revise + supplementary Load POF |
B |D06/D6/1% 10:11 WOHRKSHOP INVOICE Load POF
7 |06/06/12 10:11 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF |
B |D&/DE/19 10:11 Release Voucher Load POF |
9 |06/D6/19 10:11 | GIA SEARCH Load POF ]
Ne | Finaliped Qn AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) Thumbmail | Print
(1 |15/02/19 15:27 | O1 GIA REPORT 0 | toadFoF | |
Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST reser | save | prnc |
(There are no document checklists configured.
Our Checklist Remarks - LKK (HQ)

"

Show Remarks Tor L] Handiing Ingurer
Sote Bemarks are Vet G you shaw i to othe partas

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docvi... 6/6/2019
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BEREAKDOWN)

| Vehicle No: SMC8659C (Insd veh) Model: KODA KODIAQ 2.0 TSI 4X4
SMG389M (TP veh) A)
| Date of Accident: |02/02/2019

Global Sum Settiement | :| [ 1 Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate 3 12,816.77
Final Repair Cost - 5,123.55
Loss of Use % ] 180.00 3.00 days at $60.00 per day
Rental (if any) 5 0.00 days
LTA f GIA Search Fee - 2.00
Others: -4 0.00
: 8
Final Settlement Sum 5 5.305.55
Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ ] YES [x ] NO  (Kindlyindicate
below)
A} For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

A le: No:
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: BOLA Applicable: Yes/ Mo BOLA Scenario No

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liabllity (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filed only for chain collisions and for cases whare BOLA does nol apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee’s Breakdown

1) |Volkswagen Centre Singapore - 5.305.549
2) ' 5
3) $
08 Jun
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Data

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher: Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Report! Bill {if any)

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_docltr... 6/6/2019
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd e reg ne 19seor1ear)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email suri@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

QOur Flle No: CC3IAIG19002749/R1FB302

Date: DE/06/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Policy No 1800088011
Claimant Vehicle SMG .
No : J8OM Insured Vehicle No: SMCBB859C
Date of Loss: 02/02/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 5665381687506
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF WVEHICLE
Reg No: SMG38aM
Make & Model SKODA KODIAQ, 2.0 TSI 4X4 (A) Engine No: DAD348538
Req. Date: 30/11/2018 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No; TMBKRTNUZ2K2014234
Colour: Black Odometer: 5341 km
Engine Capacity 1498 cc
Marke! Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S%): Markel Value/New Car Price
NDITION OF VEHI AT T F
Ganaral Condition, Steering (Serviceable). Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake {Serviceable) Yes Engine Modification; Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 215/50 R18 Rear Tyre Skze 215/50 R18
Front Left Side Bridgestone 6 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone 6 mm
Front Right Side Bridgestone 6 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 6 mm
The sbove valles represen! the semaning e reads deptlh
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %]
Parts 475175 2,788.36 1,863,309 41,32
Miscellansous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 7.320.00 2,000.00 5,320.00 72.68
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 12,071.75 4,788.36 7.283.39 60.33
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (SS) B45.02 335.19 509.83 60.33
Nett Amount (SS) 12,916.77 5123.55 7,793.22 60.33
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x S560.00/day) (5$) 180.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (5§) 2.00
Nett Liability (S5) 5,305.55
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 1310272019
Date Inzpected: 13/02/2019  Inspected Al Volkswagen Cenire Singapore (HQ)
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159934
Estimated Perlod of Repair 3.0 days

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_p... 6/6/2019
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Adjuster: MOHD RASUL Manager: Chong Poh Kin

NOTE: This repart represents our findinge af the bme and plece of inspection smded harein, Such inspeciion fas been camed ouf fo the besl of our
knpwiadge and abiity but any ofher lahiily under any other cireumasiances is hemby express!y arcluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_p... 6/6/2019



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR BUMPER COVER Scratched 2190.00FS  *2.180.00FS
2 1 ‘BUMPER LOWER COVER STRIP Nol Necessary 1.012.00FS *-F5
3 1 *BUMPER LHS COVER Not Necessary 870.00FS ~FS
4 1 *SENSOR BRACKET Necessary 88.00FS *BB.ODFS
5 1 *SENSOR BRACKET Necessary 88.00FS *BB.ODFS
B 1 *SENSOR BRACKET Necessary 62.B8FS *6LBBFS
T o1 *SENSOR BRACKET Necessary 62.88FS *62.88FS
B 1 *REFLECTOR LHS Serviceable 81.39FS *-FS
8 1 “COVER (CENTER) Scratched 134.78FS *134.7B8FS
10 1 “2KADHESIVE Necessary 84 34F5 “04 34FS
11 1 ‘BONDAGENT Necessary 67 48FS "67 48FS
F=Franchse pan. S=SpchNen.

Total Parts (S§) 4,751.75 2,788.36

Repont was unsubmitled during this print-oul.

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_p... 6/6/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellancous Hems selected,

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 LABOUR New 3.360.00 B40D.D0

2  SPRAY PAINT New 3,200.00 400.00

3 PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION Neaw 480.00 480.00

4  CHECK WIRE HARNESS ,ECU S New 280.00 2B0.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 7.320.00 2,000.00

[ Report was unsubmitied during this print-oul.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_p... 6/6/2019



