Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 9:26 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SJW8494R CLAIMING SKR6002E DOA 05.02.19 SM *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG19002715/Apa3

Without Prejudice

Hi Cecilia

For EZ Swift Car Rental & Leasing Pte Ltd rental agreement is their rental invoice as well.
So far for the submission not an issue, you may check with Hsiao Tong,thanks.

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, June 7, 2019 9:22 AM

To: sm automotive

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SJW8494R CLAIMING SKR6002E DOA 05.02.19 SM *** LKK REF: CC6/A1G19002715/Apa3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sukyi,

Kindly email the rental invoice/receipt to us(LKK) for submission on closing.
As we only have the rental agreement.

Thank you

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



