10/16/2019 Mail - Glockewerke Auto - Outlook

J(ﬁ tc

RE: ACCIDENT ON 03.02.2019 BETWEEN SLT1908C AND SKV3247P ALONG CTE TOWARDS AYE BEFORE BUKIT TIMAH RD EXIT

Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@Ilkkauto.com>
Wed 10/16/2019 3.25 PM
To: Glockewerke Auto <glockewerke@outlook.com>

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Annabelle,
We refer to the obove matter,
We propose settlement as follows:-

1. Cost of Repair $ 6,100.00
2. Loss of Rental (7days x $100) $ 700.00
TOTAL | $6,800.00

Please confirm acceptance.
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal
p dings. No admission of liability, wh er, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of ter
In the event of new evidence being di ed or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/Influence on the Issues of llability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubt Tndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Glockewerke Auto [mailto:glockewerke@outlook.com]

Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 4:14 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 03.02.2019 BETWEEN SLT1908C AND SKV3247P ALONG CTE TOWARDS AYE BEFORE BUKIT TIMAH RD EXIT

Dear Asher,
Can i check if you received the invoices?
Thank you

Annabelle Lim
8112 6485

From: Glockewerke Auto

Sent: Friday, June 7, 2019 4:49 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 03.02.2019 BETWEEN SLT1908C AND SKV3247P ALONG CTE TOWARDS AYE BEFORE BUKIT TIMAH RD EXIT

Dear Asher,

Xavier have left the company.

| have attached the LOD on the above.
Thank you

Annabelle

Glockewerke
8112 6485

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, June 7, 2019 12:25 PM

To: "Glockewerke Auto'; Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 03.02.2019 BETWEEN SLT1908C AND SKV3247P ALONG CTE TOWARDS AYE BEFORE BUKIT TIMAH RD EXIT

WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVEAS TO COSTS
Hi Xavier,

We refer to the above matter.

Please forward us the full set of LOD via email for our necessary action.
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Glockewerke

21 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-02 S417810
Hotline: +65 8112 6485
Email: Annabelle_lim90@hotmail.com

INVOICE
TAN LEE ANN ANNA Date: 5/4/2019
123 BEDOK RIA CRESCENT Vehicle No.: SLT1908C
SINGAPORE 489933 Model: BMW F20 116D

Chassis No.: WBA1V720905G86893

Lump Sum Invoice

Inclusive of supplying parts, spray painting and labour charges. $6,100.00

Rental 14days (04.02.2019 - 18.02.2019) $700.00
(Including Saturday/Sunday and also Chinese New Year)

Grand-Total: $6,800.00

Providad always that this discharge of my
olaim for damages relating to the damage to
my vehicle shall not prejudice or affect my
further claim for general and special

damages for my personal injuries sustained
in the same accldent,




Glockewerke

21 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-02 S417810
Hotline: +65 8112 6485
Email: Annabelle_lim90@hotmail.com

INVOICE
TAN LEE ANN ANNA Date: 5/4/2019
123 BEDOK RIA CRESCENT Vehicle No.: SLT1908C
SINGAPORE 489933 Model: BMW F20 116D

Chassis No.: WBA1V720905G86893

RENTAL VEHICLE INVOICE

Description of Rental Amount
Rental for 7 days  $100.00 per day $700.00
Vehicle No: SJX 2044 R

Vehicle Description: VW JETTA

Rental Period: 04.02.19 - 18.02.2019

(Including Saturday/Sunday and also Chinese New Year)

Total Amount Payable: $700.00

Provided always that this discharge of my
claim for damages relating to the damage to
my vehicle shall not prejudice or affect my
further claim for general and special
damages for my personal injuries sustained
in the same accicent.




Glockewerke

21 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-02 S417810
Hotline: +65 8112 6485
Email: Annabelle_lim30@hotmail.com

TAN LEE ANN ANNA
123 BEDOK RIA CRESCENT
SINGAPORE 489933

P

INVOICE

Date: 25/02/29
Vehicle No.: SLT1908C

Model: BMW F20 116D

Chassis No.: WBA1V720905G86893

PARTS AND LABOUR ASSESSMENT

DESCRIPTION OF PARTS

REAR BUMPER (M SPORT BODYKIT)

REAR BUMPER DIFFUSER (M SPORT)

TOWING COVER

REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT

REAR BUMPER PDC HOLDER (SET)

REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR

REAR BUMPER RETAINER

REAR TAIL LID

REAR TAIL LID BMW LOGO
“"REAR TAIL LID LOCK

REAR LH TAIL LAMP OUTER

DESCRIPTION OF PARTS

PDC SENSOR (SET)
REVESER CAMERA
REAR BUMPER SCREW (SET)

Provided always that this discharge of my
claim for damages relating to the damage to
my vehicle shall not prejudice or affect my
further claim for general and special

damages for my personal injuries sustained
in the same accident.
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UNIT PRICE
$1,500.00
$550.00
$60.00
$380.00

$60.00
$90.00
$100.00
$1,850.00
$120.00
$280.00
$500.00

Sub-Total before discount:
5% discount:
Sub-Total after discount:

UNIT PRICE

$500.00
$1,300.00
$30.00

Sub-Total before discount:
0% discount:
Sub-Total 2:

TOTAL PRICE

$1,500.00
$550.00
$60.00
$380.00
$60.00
$90.00
$200.00

$1,850.00

$120.00
$280.00
$500.00

$5,590.00
$279.50
$5,310.50

TOTAL PRICE

$500.00
$580.00
$30.00

$1,110.00
$0.00
$1,110.00



LABOUR

Diagnose, replace and repair to rectify electrical system : $30.00
for proper functioning

(Revese camera and PDC sensor)

To provide workmanship labour to remove damage parts for asse : $600.00

to new bodyparts, repair, re-construct and re-adjust structure, body alignments
and damaged consistent from the accident.

To re-spray painting for change bodyparts, repair portion : $600.00
and where consistent from the accident
Labour Sub-Total: $1,230.00
Parts and Labour Total: $7,650.50
-
20% discount Lump Sum: $6,120.00

discharge of my
Provided always that this o damage to

o th
ciaim for damages relating ;lce or affect my
ehicle shall not preju nd special
fortner claim for general a sustained
u]arrtn’;egres for my oersonal injuries




$1,500.00
$550.00
$60.00

: $380.00
PDC HOLDER (SET) s $60.00
ER REFLECTOR  Hf st $90.00

AINER Au~ $100.00
$620.00
$100.00

$1,850.00

$1,000.00

$50.00

$150.00
$120.00
$250.00
$280.00
$280.00




Glockewerke
21 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-02 Singapore 417810
Hotline: =65 8112 6485

Email: 2rpabe s iradliEantenan o
UEN: 533735834
MOTOR CLAIM DISCHARGE
INSURED: £LRGO INSURAA, CE O7E 270
CAR/LORRY/VAN VRN NO: SL7/908C POLICYNO:.  DPIP G /B8 0.0 %EFF

ACCIDENT CLAIM NO:

{/We confirm that | / We have taken delivery of Car / Lorry / Van Vehicle Registration Number:

SL7/908C from the repairers, Messrs GLOCKEWERKE

And that all repairs necessary as a result of an accident in which the said vehicle was involved in on or

about (date) have been completed to my / our own satisfaction, and that

I/we have no further clzim on the zbove cempany in Respect thereof.

92%

Date: Signature:

-~

Co's Stamp: NRIC No:




LETTER OF AUTHORITY
Name . AN LL£ ANA  ANAA
Address . /23 BEDoA R4
(RESCENT S*89 233
Contact No 308 BLE2
70
Dear Sirs.

ACCIDENT INVLOVING

J'(?/908(‘ AND

SELFI2# 7P ON 23 02 - /2

AT/ALONG (7€ 7LopS AyE GEF Buirr TNt RO
i/We,  7AN LEL Arn A AvA | am/are the registered owner of
motor car no. JL7 /908 C

Please note that | have assigned all compensation monies due to me/us in the above said accident to

GLOCKEWERKE.

I/We, hereby authorize you to release all compensation monies pertaining to the above-mentioned
accident to GLOCKEWERKE and forward your settlement chegue to GLOCKEWERKE whom | had

zuthorized to coliect the szid compensation monies.

Thank you

-
/]

Signature of Claimant

Exsr



LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

a\fVorkshop) : GLOCKEWERKE

From

Name (Owner / Company) :_ ZAA LEE AnrN A AAA
Address A QELOA RAA CRESCEN T
S$4£9933

NRIC No

ACCIDENT INVOLVING ¢ 7 7208 C  AnD SV 32472 on 23 "o0a /2

AT /ALONG __C7& 7L208 AYE BEL Bra)7  FIAFAL RO Ly

N’

I/We, __ZArv LE€ AN ANNA  am/are the registered owner of motor

car no. SL77 928C hereby do authorize you to commence repair to my above mentioned
vehicle.

| confirm that you are hereby authorized to handle the repair of the vehicle and/or to negotiate and
settle my claims, relating to the above mentioned accident, which I/We may have, against other third

party/parties, or insurers, and/or to instruct lawyers on my/our behalf, to facilitate the third party claim
for me/us.

You are hereby authorized to execute and/or sign my documents/discharge vouchers/agreements
regarding my/our claim/case for my convenience. You are also hereby authorized to receive on my/our
behalf any monies/claims, in correspondences/connection with this said claim.

| confirm that in the event of an unsuccessful claim, against the negligent party, and/or my own insurer

for the damages caused to my vehicle, | agree to pay for all repair costs and any incidental expenses

(including legal fees) incurred by you, or to lodge an own damage claim (only for comprehensive cover) L
to cover the expenses incurred. — e =~ e —

Witness’'s Name Dated:

Owner’s Signature: 4 ” [’)’V

hE

Witness's Signature:




Glockewerke

71 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-02 Singapore 417810
Hotline: +65 8112 5485

Email; Annabeile S CERGITETLoT,
UEN: 53373583A

Replacement Vehicie No S7¥ Do%4A#
Accident Vehicle No S rs208C
Owner/Driver Name . MARK TANG  SONG AANG
Address /23 BEDoA  R/A CRESCENT

S$45 9933 -
Driving License No S/95€ €37 Date of Birth: /9 o7 - 1997
Date Vehicle Taken o 03 -/ 9 Time Out /- 00RrPr,
Date Vehicle Return /802 . /9 Time In 2-.-00PN

We have been zuthorized by you to commence repairs and demand claims for your accident vehicle. In
the event, we provide you the above said replacemeant vehicle for your conveniences. Upon collection of
above replacement vehicle, you will be fully responsible for the following terms and conditions until the
date and time of returning the above said replacement vehicie.

¢ Any traffic summons and parking offences.

» Accident / Losses —you have to bear the Insurance policy excess and / or compensate the repair
cost / losses by yourself.

o This vehicle is to be used in Singapore only.

» Upon returning of the replacement vehicle, you must ensure that ail valuables and important

items are to be removed from above stated replacement vehicle. We will not be responsible of
such losses.

|. FULLY UNDERSTAND AND AGREED TO BE RESPONSIBLE ON THE ABOVE TERMS AND CONDITIONS
UPON REVEIVING THIS REPLACEMENT VEHICLE FOR MY CONVENIENCES AND BEAR ALL COSTS INCURRED
FROM SUCH INCIDENT. | FURTHER UNDERTAKE THE REPAIRER WILL NOT BE RESPONSIBLE FOR ANY LOSS
OF ANY ITEMS OR VALUABLES THAT MAY HAVE LEFT BY ME/US IN MY/QUR ACCIDENT VEHCILE WHEN !
HANDED IT OVER TO THEM FOR THE PURPOSE OF REPAIRS.

up.  BINE B8 ¢E2

Owner / Driver Signature



Glockewerke
21 Kaki Bukit Road 4 £01-02 Singapore 417810
Hotline: =65 8112 6485
Email: Srnate = GaslEantena ba
UEN: 533735834

MOTOR CLAIM DISCHARGE

INSURED: £LRGO IASURAA, CE pre L7

CAR/LORRY/VAN VRN NO: S$27/908C POLICY.NO: DI 1P G 18 0 04EFF

ACCIDENT CLAIM NO:

{/We confirm that | / We have taken delivery of Car / Lorry / Van Vehicle Registration Number:

SLr/908C from the repairers, Messrs GLOCKEWERKE

And that all repairs necessary as a result of an accident in which the said vehicle was involved in on or

about (date) have been completed to my / our own satisfaction, and that

I/we have no further claim on the above company in Respect thereof.

Date: Signature:

Co's Stamp: NRIC No:




