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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Sharon Ten
Cc: Admin A; Lily Loi
Subject: RE: Check Liability - Accident involving SLC3853C & SKV352M on 31/01/2019 (AXA) 

*LKK REF: CC4/ASM19002667/Kbb3

 

From: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 3 July 2020 11:27 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Lily Loi <lily.loi@ow.sg> 
Subject: RE: Check Liability - Accident involving SLC3853C & SKV352M on 31/01/2019 (AXA) *LKK REF: 
CC4/ASM19002667/Kpb3 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Our client would like to withdraw claims. 
 
Thanks 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Sharon Ten (Ms.) 
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department  
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 
 

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 
 
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 
purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person.  
Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after which. 

 

From: Sharon Ten  
Sent: Saturday, 6 June 2020 1:57 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Lily Loi <lily.loi@ow.sg>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Check Liability - Accident involving SLC3853C & SKV352M on 31/01/2019 (AXA) *LKK REF: 
CC4/ASM19002667/Kpb3 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Any update? 
 
Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 
 
Sharon Ten (Ms.) 
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department  
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 
 

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 
 
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 
purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person.  
Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after which. 

 

From: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg> 
Sent: Friday, 3 April 2020 7:20 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Lily Loi <lily.loi@ow.sg> 
Subject: RE: Check Liability - Accident involving SLC3853C & SKV352M on 31/01/2019 (AXA) *LKK REF: 
CC4/ASM19002667/Kpb3  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
  
We not yet receive any response to-date. 
  
Kindy revert. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 
  
Sharon Ten (Ms.) 
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department  
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 
  

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 
  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 
purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person.  
Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after which. 
  

From: sharon@ow.sg <sharon@ow.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 5 December 2019 2:52 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Angela Tan <angela.tan@ow.sg>; Lily Loi <lily.loi@ow.sg> 
Subject: RE: Check Liability - Accident involving SLC3853C & SKV352M on 31/01/2019 (AXA) *LKK REF: 
CC4/ASM19002667/Kpb3 
  
Without Prejudice 
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Dear Hsiao Tong, 
  
Any update? 
  
Kindly advise on the liability. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 
  
Sharon Ten (Ms.) 
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department  
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 
  

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 
  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 
purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person.  
Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after which. 
  
From: Sharon <sharon@ow.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 27 May 2019 9:44 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Check Liability - Accident involving SLC3853C & SKV352M on 31/01/2019 (AXA) *LKK REF: 
CC4/ASM19002667/Kpb3 
  

Without Prejudice 

Dear Hsiao Tong, 

Enclosed the Traffic Police Investigation Result for your perusal. 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

  

Sharon Ten (Ms.) 
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department 
DID: (+65) 6481 1522 | Fax: (+65) 6481 1011 

  

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 
  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 
purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content 
immediately after which. 



4

On 07-Mar-19 4:41 PM, Sharon wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

Dear Hsiao Tong, 

Our client don't have video footage. 

We are pending for traffic police investigation result. 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 
  
Sharon Ten (Ms) 
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department 
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 
  
OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD 
Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143                 T: +65 
6472 1313      F: +65 6472 2112    
Branch        : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500    T: +65 6484 
9919     F: +65 6481 1011    
Branch        : 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415        T: +65 6452 
6868      F: +65 6452 9223    
www.ow.sg 
www.facebook.com/optimawerkz 
On 02-Mar-19 8:18 AM, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote: 

Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached here with a copy of our insured driver 
accident report for your easy reference. 
  
Kindly let us have evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our necessary action. 
  
Thank you. 
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice 
basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal 
proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will 
materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, 
by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  

 

  
  

From: Sharon <sharon@ow.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 22 February 2019 2:10 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Check Liability - Accident involving SLC3853C & SKV352M on 31/01/2019 
(AXA) 
  

Without Prejudice 

Dear Hsiao Tong, 

Has your insured driver report the accident?  

Please advise us on the liability as soon as possible. 

Thank you.  
--  
Best Regards, 
  
Sharon Ten (Ms) 
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department 
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 
  
OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD 
Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 
159143                 T: +65 6472 1313      F: +65 6472 
2112    
Branch        : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 
554500    T: +65 6484 9919     F: +65 6481 1011    
Branch        : 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 
574415        T: +65 6452 6868      F: +65 6452 9223    
www.ow.sg 
www.facebook.com/optimawerkz 


