Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Daniel Jude <danieljude@motorimage.net>

Sent: Monday, 7 October 2019 1:49 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); CST; motor.doc@axa.com.sg; 'motor.survey@axa.com.sg'
Cc: Admin A; TPY Insurance Team; Mohamed Isman

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SKN397B *Our Ref: CC4/ASM19002658/pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SJB 113D(AXA) & SKN397B ON 01/02/2019]

Importance: High

Hi Team,
Kindly cancel and close case on your end.
Even though liability is cleared, our client has decided to not pursue the case further and wishes to close the case.

We will be closing the case on our end at 07/10/2019 — 1340hrs.

Thank You.

Best Regards

Daniel A Jude

Service Executive

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd

19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 319255

HP: 8611 3195

Email: danieljude@motorimage.net

Website: www.tanchong.com : www.motorimage.net

Disclaimer: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee you may not copy, forward, disclose or
use any part of this message. If you have received this message in error, please delete it and all copies from your system and notify the
sender immediately by return e-mail. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be timely, secure, error-free or virus-free. The
sender does not accept liability for any errors or omissions.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2019 10:39 AM

To: Daniel Jude <danieljude@motorimage.net>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; TPY Insurance Team <tpyinsteam@tanchong.org>; Mohamed Isman
<isman@motorimage.net>



Subject: RE: Your Ref: SKN397B *Our Ref: CC4/ASM19002658/pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJB 113D(AXA) &
SKN397B ON 01/02/2019]

Without Prejudice
Hi Daniel,
Noted.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Daniel Jude <danieljude@motorimage.net>

Sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2019 10:06 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; TPY Insurance Team <tpyinsteam@tanchong.org>; Mohamed Isman
<isman@motorimage.net>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SKN397B *Our Ref: CC4/ASM19002658/pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJB 113D(AXA) &
SKN397B ON 01/02/2019]

Importance: High

Hi Team,

Apologies on the late reply, was away on reservist and just got back.

Yes our client is pursuing the case as third party.

We have already contacted our client and currently awaiting revetment on survey date.
Kindly await for our update on survey date

Thank You.

Best Regards

Daniel A Jude

Service Executive

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd

19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 319255
HP: 8611 3195



Email: danieljude@motorimage.net
Website: www.tanchong.com : www.motorimage.net

Disclaimer: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee you may not copy, forward, disclose or
use any part of this message. If you have received this message in error, please delete it and all copies from your system and notify the
sender immediately by return e-mail. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be timely, secure, error-free or virus-free. The
sender does not accept liability for any errors or omissions.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 30 July 2019 12:41 PM

To: Daniel Jude <danieljude@motorimage.net>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; TPY Insurance Team <tpyinsteam@tanchong.org>; Mohamed Isman
<isman@motorimage.net>

Subject: Your Ref: SKN397B *Our Ref: CC4/ASM19002658/pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJB 113D(AXA) & SKN397B
ON 01/02/2019]

Your Ref: SKN397B Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC4/ASM19002658/pb3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJB 113D(AXA) & SKN 397B ON 01/02/2019
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise if your client is sfill pursuing third party claim against our insured / M/s AXA Insurance Pte Ltd on
this matter. If so, kindly arrange for survey.

Please respond and let us know within 10 days from the date of this e-mail. Otherwise, we will proceed to
close file at our end.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 29 May, 2019 4:35 PM
To: Daniel Jude; Admin-D (LKEAuto); 5G AXA Insurance SM Claims Service Team; Shirley

Hiew (LKK Auto); SUR; Shu Pei (LKKAuta); Admin A; C5 A Team; Customer Care;
Hsiao Tong (LEKAuto); Denise Tay (LEKAuto)

Ce: TPY Insurance Team; Mohamed Isman
Subject: RE: SKN397B-AIG-TP{SJBL13D)AXA-LIABILITY STATUS LKK REF
CC4/ASMI9002658/hb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Daniel,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is clear subject to
the BOLA guideline settlement.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to
your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the
consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the
number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal.

Kindly forward the LOD and all supporting documents to us if available to proceed with the settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regands,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Pack, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)
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