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Corsulfants
M 1 ; :- Pr-n:lL:j . Company Registration No. 13960T198R
5] UBIAYE 1. #02-25 PAYAL BRI TSDUSTRIAL PAREK, SINGAMORE J0%938 TEL @ i(a5) 25363361 FAN @ (065 [y R B
Your ref: D1g000asaMFSH
Our ref; CS/FCI19002650/T1vd3 Date: 28/2/2019

The Motor Claims Department
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO SKT 1259D
We thank you for your instruction on 12/2/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
26/2/2019 at the premises of M/s CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIA PTE LTD

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §34,826.00
Revised Estimate Amount 1 5§%2,316.00
"Check” ltems Amount : §%530.00
Total 183

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%

Nett Value 1 58

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear St

rear portion

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAL AMSAE-A
Automobile Assessor



1 i M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coReg ko 1950001060 G3F Reg Bo M OeLeTE-9
MS‘ F I rStca F"tal & Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D4B580

Tek{65)6222 2311 Fax: (B} 6222 3547

(laims & Motor Undenwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Read #16-01 ity House Singapore 062877
Tel: (F5) 6507 3848 Fax: (65) B307 3849
wiwnwimsfirsteapital.comosg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
11-02-2019 Our Ref No. D19000958MFSH
05-02-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHAZIBIBE Third Party Vehicle. SKT1253D

209 PANDAN GARDENS
TAY JIAN YE
65684567/ 0 Fax No. 65851240

DIRECT SETTLEMENT:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

MIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIA

ion. N
BTE LTD Attention. NIL
MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

| ::.'-: JRANCE GRUOLIF




‘Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

—#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 22 April 2019 1:36 PM

To: Loi Ai Ting

Cc: Songcuan JR Lauro Araos; Andre Chow En De; Cheng Jo Jo; Tay Jian Ye; SUR
Subject: RE: SKT1259D, finalisation (Kia WIP: 44178} - photos

Dear Ai Ting,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirmed finalize amount $2756 (@ 3 working days.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 18 April 2019 6:49 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Songcuan JR Lauro Araos <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Andre Chow En De
<andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Cheng Jo Jo <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Tay Jian Ye
<jianye.tay@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: 5KT1259D, finalisation (Kia WIP: 44178} - photos

Hi, Veron,
Please confirm finalised amount at 52,948.92.
Attached some photos for your reference.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Loi Ai Ting
Customer Service Advisor



@@ Exceptional Journeys

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Cycle & Carriage Singapore « 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
T: +65 5568 4556 « F: +85 6565 1240 - www . cyclecarriaqe com.sq

& A member of the |ardine Cycle & Carriage Group

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 18 April, 2019 5:44 PM

To: Don Bong Kiong Hua; Tay Jian Ye; Loi Ai Ting; Songcuan JR Lauro Araos; Coco Lu Ting; Andre Chow En De; Cheng Jo Jo
Subject: RE: PENDING FINALISE (3 VEHICLES)

Dear All,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

1) SLP 8838X-DOA: 24/1/2019 (CHINA TAIPING TP)
2) SKT 1259D-DOA: 6/2/2019 (FCI TP)
3) SLS 3974C-DOA: 26/2/2019 (CHINA TAIPING TP)

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 March 2019 1:34 PM

To: Don Bong Kiong Hua <kionghua.bong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Tay Jian Ye (jianye.tay@cyclecarriage.com.sg)
<jianye.tay@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; 'Songcuan JR Lauro Araos'
<lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Andre Chow En De

<andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Cheng Jo Jo (jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg)
<jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Subject: PENDING FINALISE (4 VEHICLES)




Dear All,

Kindly advise vehicle status,
If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

1) SLP 8838X-DOA: 24/1/2019 (CHINA TAIPING TP)
2) SMF 8728X-DOA: 2/1/2019 (CHINA TAIPING TP)

3) SKT 1259D-DOA: 6/2/2019 (FC1 TP)
4) SLM 2369M-DOA: 19/1/2019 (CHINA TAPING TP)

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity
named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that
any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are
those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its
related corporations.



Taz Jian Ye

From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 12 February, 2019 3:33 PM

To: Tay lian Ye

Cc: C\WS Motor Claims; Eileen Lee

Subject: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D19000959MFSH ; YOUR REF: 5KT1259D

Dear Sir/Madam

PRI Request For SKT1259D Accident Involving SHA3838E On 05-02-2019 AT 18:40:00HRS.

Please find below details for your reference

« Claim number : D19000959MFSH

« Insured vehicle number : SHA3838E

» Accident date : 05-02-2019

« Third-party vehicle number : SKT1259D

« Assignment type : DIRECT SETTLEMENT

« Surveyor : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
« Officer-in-Charge : EILEEN LEE

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 28 February 2019 8:30 AM

To: 'CWS Maotor Claims’

Ce: 'Eileen Lee’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1 go009samMESH/1, SKT 12580
Attachments: SKT 12590 PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKT 1259D
Date of survey: 26/2/2019
Number of days : 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 51408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 13 February 2019 11:23 AM

To: 'CWS Motar Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000959MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

o W
! J!s._
BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)



From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstca pital.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 12 February 2019 3:33 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmaotarclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <EileenLee @msfirstcapital.com.sg=
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000959MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

' AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
. © WWW.ave.com
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CYCLE & CARRIAGE

CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIAPTE LTD

PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE
209 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609339 Tel: 65684567 Fax: 65651240

Co Reg No : 199405410K ESTIMATE GST Reg No : MR-8500111-X
Inveice Name & Address Owner Name & Vehicle Info
Teo: Hus: Hues; Engel Cust No/Name LCW04073/TED HUET HUEI, ENGEL
Reg Mo/Reg Date SKT1259D / 25/05/201
Blk 138a Lorong la Toa Payoh Date In/Mileage / 0
#;]{I}ga Chassis No KNAFZ411MF5404380
Engine No G4FGFHT6B049
Contact Mo Make/Model KIA/ISMY F K3 1.6 A SX 690 BLACK
Colour/Trim MaY J WK
Account No Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIP No
LCV04073 CROVCH 08,/02/2019/ 12:34 465 / Tay Jian Ye 44178
Description of Goods | Services Qty Unit Price Disc% Amount
E PNTBE000 7 5%@ 1650.00
TO REMEW REAR BUMPER, REPAIR END PANEL
E PNT98000 7<% 1260.00
PAINT WORK SPRAY REAR BUHF‘ER END PANEL s
A 54900099 - 30,00
CHECK WIRING AND CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM
A 10028901 -~ 200.00
TO CARRY OUT DIAGMOSTIC CHECK USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST
USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST
E PNT88000 /" 60.00
TO TRANSFER REAR PARKING SENSOR_TO NEW PART
M SUNDRY Ay o 40.00
TO APPLY ANTI COROSSION
M SUNDRY _— 20.00 [nl
SUNDRIES ol
M STAY-RR BUMPER LH 1.00 75.00 00.00 75.00 =
M STAY-RR BUMPER RH 1.00 75.00 00.00 15,00 !
M BEAM-RR BUMPER \ﬂ\ 1.00 365.00 00.00| 8T 365,0{3 v
M BRACKET-RR BEAM LWR,CTR 1.00 5.00 00.00 4 500 K™
M BRACKET-RR BEAM LWR MTG 4 2.00 5.00 00.00 © 10.00 [
M COVER-RR BUMPER _ g 1.00 791.00 00.00| o0 ~"791.00
M COVER-RR BUMPER,UPR Tef 107 100 245.00 00.00| A9 245,00
IIf| ).‘w ;
..} \ l & LL | 'j- Uﬂ: :
.W? : FL-'. w\,_\ ”EJT l“_']:u\.a'rﬁ_
gv(? LUWJ‘} ‘W
)
Confirm & accepted by K At | CQM jtants hence notify
f’ﬂena dpdoshiecds Nett 4,826.00
o To ciankay da 7% G5T on 4826.00 337.82
:F 2 Total Payable 5,163.82
futhorized signatery and company s am}u? :
validity ef this estimate is 14 days from dat® &foquote) This is a computer generated document, no signature is required.
Estimated costs quoted are excluding G5T) We would mention that the above estimate is based on our initial inspection and does not include

any additional parts or labour which may
after work has started and needed for r
deposit of 50% of the above estimate is
cheque. You must also agree to pay full
the rubber seal or other repair requirin

reguired after repair work has commenced. Otcasionally worn or damaged parts are discovered
airs or replacement. However, should this occur, we would advise you. Please be informed that a
ayai'h ‘Hofore commencement of the work. Payment for this may be made in cash, credit card or

Hfor renewal of the windscreen in the eveht of inadvertent breakage in the course of renewing

Page 1 of 1



@@ l Exceptional Journeys

CYCLE & CARRIAGE |

VEHICLE NO : SKT 1259 D

Surveyor

TAUFIKH LKK

TP MS FIRST CAP

Company :

Emailed
Date survey

18/04/19, 6.50pm

26.02.2018

MODEL : KIAK3 1.6 A SX

WIP : 44178

Material 1,476.00
Labour 9 1,280.00
Sub-Total : 3 2,756.00
Less Excess b -~
Total % 2,756.00
GST 7% ) 192.92
Grand Total $ 2,948.92
Finalise By/Date LOI / 18/04/2019

Z

OTHERWISE WILL PROCEED WITH INVOICING

REVERT BACK WITHIN 7 DAYS,

[ ] SURVEYOR'S REPORT REQUIRED

REPAIRTOOK __ 3 _WORKING DAYS +

TOTAL DAYS REPAIR TOOK

TP claim SHA3838E

e

[_] Claim GIA/LTA fee
Claim Loss of [ [ JUse /[ ¥ |Rental

[_] Claim Medical Fee / Others

[ ] Third Party Report -

2 | Days (

0  Days (

L

ST
i/ 3

)
)

{
!

!
|
|
|
i

Wea@cends
F'ubl]'lﬂ Holiday

1




CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIA PTE LTD |
PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE |
|

@€

CYCLE & CARRIAGE 209 Pandan Gardens Singapore 608339 Tel: B5684567 Fax: 65651240

PRO-FORMA INVOICE |
Co ch' No : 199405410 THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE 6ST Reg Mo : NR-8500111-X
T nvoice Name &I Address i i T 00 Py Owner Name & VehiglelnfolPs i T

Cust No/Name
Reg Hujnng Date SKT12590
Date InfMt‘Iuge ]2‘.?_1'{12,!2!:!19]

MS First Capital Insurance Limited

A 25!05!2015
Motor Claims Cepartment A2389

36 Robinson Road #16-01

LC\’ND?E;’TED HUEL HUEI, ENGEL

_Chassis/Package lKHAquHFsmusc ﬂccm B

BLACK

City House

Singapore 068877 ngﬂﬂlﬂf “" oy ‘G#FGEH?ﬁgﬂﬂg

Contact No Make/Model (KIAJISMY F K3 1.6 A SX 690 Pl
26/02/ Colour/Trim MY ,H' WK

“AccountNo;iTerms i Date/Time. Printedl [ OSEL AL LOpeTalor s A s L WIR, NGOG b

CTPOODRO cash  18/04/2019/ 18:27 LT 260 / AiTing 44178

Fa ;éﬂ".w%%myﬁEﬂsﬁnnﬂvﬂmtﬁnudﬂfﬁnwlcﬂtﬁ'ﬁ%m%@ £ QtyEHUnitiPrice; Discl S Amount
E PNTEB0D0 v/ 550.00
REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS, REPLACE REAR BUMPER, REPAIR ALL OTHER
AFFECTED AREAS, ADJUST AND ALTGN BODY GAPS ALIGNMENT TO THE SAME
E PNT98000 l W/ 420.00
RESPRAY OM REAR BUMPER, AND ALL OTHER AFFECTED AREAS TO THE SAME i
A 54900099 Lo 30.00
CHECK WIRING AND CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM
A 10028901 w’ 200.00
CONDUCT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST AND CLEAR TROUBLE CODeE
E PNTBBOOD v 60.00
TRANSFER REAR PARKING SENSOR ) 'jﬁi’ BANEL F@ l:‘fl m
M SUNDRY v~ 20.00
SUNDRIES i
F % STAY-RR BUMPER LM 1.00 't 75.00 00.00f 75.00
v X BEAM-RR BUMPER 1.00 @ 365.00 00.00 365.00
¥ COVER-RR BUMPER 1.00 .~ 791,00 00.00 791.00
% COVER-RR BUMPER,UPR 1.00 -~ 245.00 00.00| 245.00
Z TEXT :
TP CLAIM FIRST CAPITAL SHA3JB3BE
DoA @ 05.02.19
SURVEYOR TAUFIKH LKK  26.02.19
REPAIR 03 DAYS :
':
%
Cycle & Corrioge celebraotes 120 yeors.
Visit www.cyclecarrioge.com/120 for more info!
Parts 1,476.00 Nett 2,756.00
Labour 1,260.00 7% 65T on 2756.00 192.92
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialist Job
Diagnastics dob g.g‘l: Total Payable 2,948.92
Sundry/0Others 20.00
Total(w/o G5T) 2 756.00
This 15 not an official tax invoice.
This is a computer generated document, ne signature is required. i
Page 1 of 1



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3581 FAM: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 198607198R ST Reg. No. 19-8607 198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD
#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

Ref : CS/FCI19002650/T1vd3n2

Date : 23-04-2019

Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 383EBE Veh. Inspected SKT 12530
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19000959MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From EILEEN LEE Assign Date 12/02/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model KIAFORTE C.C 1581
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. KMNAFZ411MF5404380 Colour SILVER
Odometer 42309 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |21540 R17 ROADSTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |21540R17 ROADSTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/40 R17 ROADSTOME & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/40 R17 ROADSTONE & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. General Information
Accident Date  05/02/2019 llnspactinn Date 26/02/2019
Survey held at CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIA PTE LTD
209 PANDAN GARDENS
SINGAPORE 809339
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5h. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

3 Working Days




g

-;:.L;_A

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKT 1259D

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 19900T1868R GST Reg, Mo, 19-9607188-R

Page Mo.1 of 1

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | &stima nf{;’“ “1}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|STAY-RR BUMPER LH (SN) MECESSARY 75.00 75.00
1|STAY-RR BUMPER RH (SN} NOT NECESSARY T5.00 -
1|BEAM-RR BUMPFER (SN} BENT 365.00 365.00
1{BRACKET-RR BEAM LWR.CTR (SN} NOT NECESSARY 5.00 -
2|BRACKET-RR BEAM LWR MTG (SN) WOT NECESSARY 10.00 -
1|COVER-RR BUMPER (SN) DEFORMED 791.00 791.00
1|COVER-RR BUMPER.UPR (SN} DEFORMED 245.00 245.00
1|SUNDRIES (SMN) MECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1,586.00 1,486.00
LABOUR
TO RENEW REAR BUMPER REPAIR END PANEL. 1,650.00 550.00
PAINT WORK SPRAY REAR BUMPER,END PANEL. 1,260.00 420.00
CHECK WIRING AND CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM. 30.00 30.00
TO CARRY OUT DIAGHNOSTIC CHECK USING HI-SCAMN 200.00 200.00
PRO TEST USING HI-SCAMN PRO TEST
TG TRANSFER REAR PARKING SENSOR TO NEW PART. 60.00 60.00
TO APPLY ANTI COROSSION MNOT NECESSARY 40.00 -
3,240.00 1,260.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,826.00 2,756.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | 2,756.00
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