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-' UU Auto

- Consutants
Y Pre Ld

51 UBLAVE I, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL Pa REK, SINGAPORFE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563561 FAX {065 62564315

Your Ref: D1900071 IMFSH
Our Ref: CS/FCI19002547/Aqd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

Date: 28 March 2019

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SLD 62168 .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 15/02/2019 at the premises of M/s AUTO N CARS. and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
“Check™ Items Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the o/s portion.

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, MMATAI

Licensed Appraiser

: 5% 5,227.28 .

:S§  2.800.00 (Lump Sum)
: 5% -

: 8§ -

: 5% s

53 -




Ms ‘ Fil'E tca Pital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited ceey no 1550001060 gst Reg b, M2 00016759

& Ralfles Quay #21-00 Singapore D4B580
Tel: (656222 2311 Fax |65) 6222 3547
Claims & Hator Underwitting Depe: 36 Robinsean Rooad #16-01 City House Singapore DGEATT

Tel: (B5) 6507 3848 Fax: (65) BSOT 3849
wivw.msfirstcapitalcom.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person
Contact Number.

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection,

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

28-01-2018 Our Ref No. D19000711MFSH
24-01-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHDBE80G Third Party Vehicle. SLD82165

AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT BLK 1 AREA "A" KAK| BUKIT AVE 6#01-04
JADEN CHOO
65552909/ 81881361 FaxNo. 0

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68418315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

AUTO N CARS ‘
SERVICES PTE LTD Attention. NIL
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
MAY CHUA

IMPORTANT NOTE

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

& Member of (ST INSURANCE GROUP



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Darla Balingit <darla@autoncars.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 March 2019 5:13 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FINALISE OF VEHICLE SLD 6216S (DOA: 24/01/2019)

Dear Shiau Chan,

COR $2,800 and 4 working days accepted.

Thank you!

On Tue, Mar 26, 2019 at 1:29 PM Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Darla,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Offer Lump Sum 52,800.00 before GST and 4 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 62560-3561 | email: siewsc@]kkauto.com | fax: b256-4315

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408933)

Best Regards,
Darla Balingit
Auto N Cars Services Pte Ltd

m: +65 84599 3326
0@ +65 6555 2909 Fax : 6841 7181



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
————— e e e i ——

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 28 March 2019 11:42 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments

Cc: 'May Chua Hui Chin'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000711MFSHA
Attachments: CSFCI19002547 Aqd3.pdf

Dear May,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of S5LD 62165.

Best Regards,

Shian Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 February 2019 12:13 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'May Chua Hui Chin' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000711MFSH/1

Dear May,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLD 62165 on 15/02/2019.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408053)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 February 2019 12:30 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=>
Cc: 'May Chua Hui Chin' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000711MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LEKAuta)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 February 2019 12:13 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments

Cc 'May Chua Hui Chin’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000711MFSH/1
Dear May,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLD 62165 on 15/02/2019,
We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Hest Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 February 2019 12:30 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'May Chua Hui Chin' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000711MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

~

ﬁ

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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Mew Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles  Forum Resources

FREE VALUATION

Let us tell you how much your car can sell for! is my car worth?

No obligations and il's FREE!

Post an Advertisement
Sell it yourselft Advertise It at just N il
$58 until it's SOLD! =

New 5 Years Coe Renewal Toyota Wish 1.84 - ¥
L L7 | Think One Automobile 28

 COMMERGIAL "

Browse by Category

GET YOUR
COE
RENEWAL
LOAN

2l & v s | © vont oo i

14 vehices | Search (G O > | 5 [sexci

Rush Ay Any 2008 Ay By fuy Avallabie

D Toyota Rush 1.5A X (COE il £33,800 46,530 fyr 12-Jan-2005 1,455 oc 87,000 km S Available
0172024

Well Maintainad, Super Low Genuine Mileage Dore. Well Groomed Inside Dut, No Repairs Needed, Comes With & Months Warranty By Our In House

Workshop., Free [slard Wide Towing In Event OF Emergency, We Br.,. [ PR

[[] Toyata Rush 1.54 X (New S-yr  $32,800 $6,560 /yv 15-Jan-2009 1,495 cc 120,000 km SUW Availabile
COE)

100% Loan Avallable. Low Monthly Instaliment, Low Mileage Done, Rellable And Excellant Fued Eficiency, Bank And In House Loan Avallable Well
Maintzined, Excellent Condition! Call For More Enguiries.

Motar Universs Credit Pie Ltd

[l Teyota Rush 1.5A X {New S-yr §30,838 6,160 jyr 19-Jan-2009 1,455 cc 134,000 km UV Available
COE)

Just Arrived! Excellent Condition Assured And Peace OF Mind. Very Well Malntained, Trade In Welcome, Act Fast Before [t's Gone! 100% In House
Loan Available. View To Believe! Don't Miss, Call Today!

[] Toveta Rush 1.5A X (Hew S-yr  $30,800 46,160 fyr 21-lan-2009 1,495 cc 85,000 km sV Availabie
COE)

Crily 1 Dwner! 100% [mmediate Loan Approval Package! Additional & Months Warranty And Road Tax For You! Priced Lowest 1n The Market! Accident
Frae Unit With Mo Repairs Needed! Drive With Ease OF Mind! ., [ Feanainas

Is your COE expiring? Let us help you renew it!

Gesting your COE renewed s easy, fast and affordable. We'll help you renew your COE and gt a loan for it, Get the cheapest loan in town and an
approval in 2 days without effort] Enquire today.

7] Toyota Rush 1.5A X (COE till $31,800 $6,440 fyr 22-Jan-2009 1,495 ¢cc 105,000 km v Available
01/2024)

1 Owner Only! High Loan Avallzble, Genuine Low Mikeage Done. Excellent Condition. Beautiful Interior And Exterior, No Repairs Needed. Bank Loan Or
In-House Loan Avallable, Please Call For Viewing Nowl

Creatre Suta

[ Toyota Rush 1.54 X {COE till $32.800 45,550 fyr 22-Jan-2009 1,495 c¢ £4,859 km sy Available
01/2024)

High Loan. Low Mileage, New Paint, Beautiful Condition, Clean Interior. One Of The Mast Popular Compact Japanese SUV In The Market. Still In Great
Condition, Dont Miss, Call Now|

BOCRTLISTIE  RdETONT Toyota Rush 1.5A X (New 10- $46,585 44,660 fyr 22-Jan-2009 1,455 oc 122,500 km s Available
compare[3] © [Rilaadld



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner 10 Type:
Owner 1D:

Singapore NRIC
44284

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Male:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Criginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

SLDE2145

Yes

15 Feb 2019
TOYOTA

RUSH 1.5% &
Red

2008
3522212505
J20DEDD24515
80.0 kW (107 bhp)
$16,386.00

14 Jan 2009

14 Jan 2009

1

$16,386.00

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date;
PARF Rebate Amount:

Forfeited

30.00

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period{Years):
PP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount;

13 Jan 2024

A= Car (1600cc & below)
5

$13,024.00

$12,792.00

$12,792.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry ar when the

vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier.
The information contained herein is correct as at 15 Feb 2019

OK
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Y/ Auto N Cars oS _

Co. Reg: 200922007 GST Reg. Mo 20T K
Auto Bay @ Kaki Bukit Blk | Area D7 Kaka Bukit Ave & o090 (%) 417883
o Tel (6516555 2900 @ Fax (63) 6841 TIE] & Web www sulomcars.com sg

Date : 29/01/2019 ){iaa ( I\{.ﬂ ' Total Pages : 1
TO: ("First Capital Insurance Ltd Our Customer - SHAFRUDIN BIN SHAFIE
36 Robinson Road Vehicle No; SLDG2165
#16-01 City House Model : Toyota Rush 1.5%
Singapore 068877 Manufacture Year : 2009
Date of Accident : 24/01/2019
Total Estimate Repair Days : 7
Attn : Motor Claim Department
Fax: 6829 9248
Re: Repair Estimate For Third Party Claim against : SHD6680G
O | IS Remarks From
No. Item Descriptions Qty | Unit Price ou Surveyor
A. Spare Parts
1 RHF door ' o 1 SO80.10 SOR0.10] —
2 RHF door out handle L= 1 205,20 SO0
ER RHF door lock mechanism ™ jL—* 1 450,10 %450.10] =
4 RHF door key barrel .a_..,,c'* 1 521050 5210501 ~—
g RHF door key barrel outer cover AL 55/ *\1 1 $48.10 S48 10 &=
[ RHF door frame sticker A 1 51820 518.20] —
7 RHF door handle base /4. ./ & i 5155.50 2190.00] .~
] RAR door T JE~dth 1 %1,180.70 S1,120.70] o
] RHR door frame sticker  Alg i 518.20 S18.20| o
Sub Total %3,196.60
™ i 5 e J
<[5 60 Tess JO%[75 563932
N2 Q) . Total Spare Parts $2,557.28
B. Labour = = T =
1 To knock & straighten RH ctr pillar panel joint & realign the same 93 ¢V
To putty & spray RHF door outer & inner, RHR door outer & inner & |- . 9
75080 & J ¢
< RH ctr pillar Sr
To remove & transfer RHF & RHR door fitting & fixture & conduct L
35000 i
9 windnoise & water seepage test > / '{; 2
To remove & refit RHF seat,RH ctr pillar inner trimming, RHF safe _
a e . L ® i/ $200.00| X
belt & RH carperting to assist workload ;
5 o supply material & labour to install RAF door (nsulation 5280001 /S
[3 To rust proof the alfecied areas SB0O.00| A
7 To check winng and all ightings SM' r %
Total Labour 52,670.00 TT
[ 7
{* The abave gquoted are exclusive of G51.) Total Repair Cost $5,227.28
LEK Auto Cans tante hanea riatif -
the Repairer of (he f = Skt Surveyor's Details
 TO Pesuiy Beforel= s crn Name Eaq =
sl o Contact Gk 37 4.5
PG Survey Date /5702]IT
L e Recommender Authorize [ Not Authorize
= ] 8" bas Before Paint i Yes / No
Yours faithfully, : ) ‘/‘5,( 7 ;)
eved 2 Signature 5 ™ 6«?"
rpsleblidagis ulﬂdH‘ 1gna ( //_{; ; !
Acknowledged by Repairer DATE Remark From MR CHOO
faden Signature: 12/27/2016 Please arrange for survey asap
fAute N Cors Sefvicesfte Lid

—+o ted

L

23T HS

¢t 2R




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automohbile

36 ROBINSON ROAD

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Ref ; CS/FCI19002547/Aqd3n2

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 S Ao ” um”"lm“l‘lmm
Code: FCI2
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 6680G Veh. Inspected S5LD 62165
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19000711MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  MAY CHUA Assign Date 12/02/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA RUSH c.c 1495
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Req. 2009
Chassis No. J200E0024515 Colour RED
Odometer 141803 Steering IN CRDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/65 R16 YOROHAMA & rnm
L/H Front Tyre |215/85 R16 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/65 R16 YOROHAMA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/55 R16 YOKOHAMA B mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  24/01/2019 |Inapactiun Date 15/02/2019
Survey held at AUTO N CARS SERVICES PTE LTD
ELK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE &
#01-80 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883,
Sa. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CHIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

4 Working Days




g

-—,f,-#'_q

1 74 /4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 198607188R GST Reg. No. 19-96071%8-R Page No.1of2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. 5LD 62165
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Q Description of Parts Condition -
o = Workshop (5))| _($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|RHF DOOR DENTED 980.10 880.10
1|RHF DOOR OUTER HANDLE CRACKED 8520 6520
1|RHF DOOR LOCK MECHANISM DAMAGED 450.10 450.10
1|RHF DOOR KEY BARREL DAMAGED 210.50 210.50
1|RHF DOOR KEY BARREL OUTER COVER MISSING 4B.10 4810
1|RHF DOOR FRAME STICKER NECESSARY 18.20 18.20
1|RHF DOOR HANDLE BASE CRACKED 195.50 195 50
1|RHR DOOR DENTED 1,180.70 1,180.70
1|RHR DOOR FRAME STICKER NECESSARY 18.20 18.20
LESS 20% DISCOUNT 539,32 2
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - 79915
2,557.28 2,397 45
LABOUR
TO KNOCK & STRAIGHTEN RH CTR PILLAR PANEL JOINT 850.00 400.00
& REALIGN THE SAME.
TO PUTTY & SPRAY RHF DOOR OUTER & INNER RHR 750.00 400.00
DOOR OUTER & INNER & RH CTR PILLAR.
TO REMOVE & TRANSFER RHF & RHR DOCR FITTING & 350.00 160.00
FIXTURE & CONDUCT WINDNOISE & WATER SEEPAGE
TEST.
TO REMOVE & REFIT RHF SEAT RH CTR PILLAR INNER  |NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -
TRIMMING RHF SAFETY BELT & RH CARPETING TO
ASSIST WORKLOAD.
TO SUPPLY MATERIAL & LABOUR TO INSTALL RHF 280.00 150.00
DOOR INSULATION.
TO RUST PROOF THE AFFECTED AREAS. NOT NECESSARY B0.00
TO CHECK WIRING AND ALL LIGHTINGS, 60.00 30.00
2,670.00 1,140.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,227.28 3,537.45

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19002547/Aqd3n2




Page No.-2 af 2

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

2,800.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19002547/Agqd3n2
MARKET VALUE: $30,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $12,792.00=NETT VALUE: §17,208.00

%2‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOEAMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DESCLAIMER DF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Chent named on the front page of this Report.




