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F1UBLAVE 1, #11-25 PAYA LUK INDUSTRIAL FARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (D65) 62563561 FAX : [065) 61564315

Your Ref: SJQ2028A/SL/WM Date: 19" February 2019
Our Ref: CS/EGI19002544/Kgd3 Without Prejudice

The Motor Claims Department
ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd

Attn: SirrfMadam
Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.__ SGZ T272R

We thank you for the instruction on _12/02/2019.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 18/02/2019 at the premises of M/s LIM TAN MOTOR and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 5% 4.124.61
Revised Estimate Amount 1 8% 1.864.46
“Check™ Items Amount 1 5% 1.734.62
Market Value 1S3 -
Salvage Value : 588 -
Nett Value 1S3 -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear n/s portion.

froeg

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages consistent,

Days of repair: 3 days.
We have NOT authorise repair.

Yours faithfully

KENNETH KONG
Licensed Appraiser



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 12 February 2019 2:15 PM

To: ‘admin-d@Ilkkauto.com’

Ce: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)

Subject: FPRS IRO SGZ7272R | Ol :SJQ2028A DOA: 04/02/2019 | ERGO REF:SJQ2028A
SSLAWM

Attachments: Ol SAS pdf

Importance: High

Hi,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company to be the “Single loint Expert”,

Please conduct this survey request and confirm direct settlement with the repairer.

Attached are the necessary documents for your further actions (Note: Reports not to be released to any Third
Party).

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

For Claims Department

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

From: richard@Itm.sg [mailto:richard@ltm.sq]

Sent: Tuesday, 12 February, 2019 11:57 AM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)

Cc: Mandy

Subject: RE: Survey Request - Our Client : SGZ7272R Your Insured : 5JQ2028A D.O.A : 04/02/2019
Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Qur ref : LTPD22015/013 (SGZ 7272 R)
Dear Sir,

In reference to your email dated 12" February 2019, we select LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct the survey
to our client’s vehicle.

Please advised if this a direct settlement case 7
Thank you and regards,

Klskard Arp

Claims Executive



Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd

www. LTM.sg
+65 6452 0893 (Office)

+65 6458 5127 (Facsimile)
+65 8484 5418 (Mobile)

Like us in Facebook!!
www.facebook.com/LTMsg
www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore
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From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) [mailto:claims@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 12 February 2019 11:31 AM
To: richard@ltm.sg

Cec: Mandy <mandy@Itm.sg>; ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Survey Request - Qur Client : 5GZ7272R Your Insured : 5]Q2028A D.0.A : 04/02/2019

WITHOUT PREJIUDICE
Dear Sir,
We acknowledged receipt of your email below for the PRS request as below.

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016”, do select an assessor from the list
below.

1 AlS sutomobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
12 FTA FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd

3 JIAS Infiniti Appraisal Service

sl IPK IP Knights Pte Ltd

5 LBS L.B.S Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

B |LKK LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

7 [PS Priority Services

I WV AC Wicom Ltd




Kindly let us have your reply on the selection of the surveyar

From: richard@Itm.sg [mailto:richard@itm.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 12 February, 2019 9:05 AM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)

Cc: Mandy

Subject: RE: Survey Request - Our Client : SGZ7272R Your Insured : SJQ2028A D.O.A : 04/02/2019
Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Qur ref : LTP022019/013 (5GZ 7272 R)
Good Morning Sir / Madam,

We are assisting our mutual client the vehicle owner of SGZ7272R to submit a claim against your insured, SJQ2028A
which we understand that yvou are insurer at the material time of the accident,

We now enclosed the following documents for your easy reference :

o  Ourmutual client GIA report
*  Repair Estimate

Please let us have a list of your external surveyor for us to choose.

Thank you and regards,

Klokard firp
Claims Executive
Lirn Tan Motar Pte Ltd

www. LTM.sg
+65 6452 0893 (Office)

+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile)
+65 8484 5418 (Mobile)

Like us in Facebook!!

www.facebook.com/LTMsg
www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore
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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 February 2019 3:26 PM .

To: 'ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)’; assignments

Cc: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.); SUR

Subject: RE: FPRS IRO SGZ7272R | Ol :SJQ2028A DOA: 04/02/2019 | ERGO REF:SIQ2028A
SSLAWM

Attachments: CSEGI19002544Kqd3.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SGZ 7272R.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-4561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 February 2019 3:08 PM

To: 'ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)' <claims@ergo.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: FPRS IRO SGZ7272R | OI :SJQ2028A DOA: 04/02/2019 | ERGO REF:SJQ2028A /SL/WM

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)




> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars -
Orwner 1D Type:

Owner 1D

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo

Wehicle to be Exparted:

Intended Deregistration Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour;

Manufacturing Year

Engine Ma.;

Chassis Mo,

Maximum Power Output:

Open Market Value:

Crriginal Registration Date:

First Registration Date:

Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE PeriodiYears)

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount: _
The information contained herein is correct as at 16 Feb 2019

Singapore MRIC
4220F

SGZT272R

Mo

16 Feb 2019

AUDI

Q3 20TFSI QUATTRO (211BHF)
Blue

2013

CP5017950
WAUZZZ8U3DROT 7419
155.0kW (207 bhp)
$38.932.00

17 Apr 2013

17 Apr 2013

2

23893200

Yes
16 Apr 2023
$27,252.00

16 Apr 2023

B-Car (1601 cc & above)
10

£96,210.00

£40,087.00

£47,339.00

OK
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~ LIM TAN MOT0R

E A SURVEYOR NAME
DATE OF SURVEY
VEHICLE NO. :SGZ7272R TIME OF SURVEY
MAKE s AUDI
MODEL Q320 TESIQUATTRO (211 BHP) DATE : 12-Feb-19
YEAR : 2013 DATE OF ACCIDENT : 4-Feb-19
CHASSIS NO : WAUZZZBU3DR0O77419 THIRD PARTY REF : SJ0 2028 A/ ERGO
No. Parts Description/ Labour Type | Unit Price | Nett Item Amt Amount E
1 pc Rear Bumper Pp) $é,“‘*~ 901.954—
1 pe Rear Bumper Lower Garnish A4t s 331.35{—
1 pc Rear Bumper Reflector $ %2 197.85 —
1 pc Rear Bumper Tow Cover 14 & My 18 258 4
2 pcs Rear Bumper Sensor $ 194.75 TI7% 389.50 |7
2 pes Rear Bumper Retainer ¢ 30.85 $ &~ 61.70 |¥
1 pc Rear Bumper Reinforcement $ T 452,25 |2
1 pc Rear Exhaust Silencer Box ' % 1,022.55 |7
1 pc Rear Exhaust Silencer Clamp S~ g 63.05 |7
$ 3,438.45
Less 10% % 343.85
$ 3,094.61
. Z5ey
To putty and spray painting % 550.00
To check rear wiring and replace $ ‘{"’(’ 80.00
sensor
2 =/
Labour Charges % 400.00
o7 Asth s
frne, B¢ o
‘;ﬁ,ﬁff
TG/RA- Total $ 4,124.61
_Lim 1a~_}ﬂ::1cr Pte Ltd
Bik 176 Sin Ming Drive #03-09 Sin Migg Autocare Singapore 575721
Tel65-64520893 Fax§5-54589127  Emaik EBgWAd@LTM so Website - www.LTM sg
Co Reg No. 1993072770 GST Reg No M2-0018086-0
This dacument must nof be reproduced, in whole or In part, or disclosed to third party or parties withoul the priar wrtten

consant of L

m T

an Motor Pte Lid
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LIM TAN MOTOR

ESTIMATE TO REPAIR SURVEYOR NAME
DATE OF SURVEY ] ﬂ FEB 2019
VEHICLE NO. :sG7 7272 R TIME OF SURVEY
MAKE P ALDI
MODEL PR3 2.0 TRSI QUATTRO (211 BHP) DATE : 12-Feb-19
YEAR ' 2013 DATE OF ACCIDENT : 4-Fgh-19
CHASSIS NG WAUZZZBU3DROT7419 THIRD PARTY REF : SJQ 2028 A/ERGO
I _'HL-._. ' - [ _i’_é_:rts De::riEtlunL Labour Type | Unit Price | Nett Iterm Amt Amount
1.pi (Fear Bumper Doy 5’?"" 801,954~
pC Rear Bumper Lower Garnish “lln L 331.35 ¢—
1 pc ‘Rear Bumper Reflector $#%z 197.85 {—
L p |tear Bumper Tow Cover - $ *r 18.254—
2 pes ‘Rear Bumper Sensor $ 194.75 $ 389.50 |7V
- Lear Bumper Retainer $—30:85 £ -y
- cur Bumper-Reinforcement — =% gLt N .
— L pc |fear Exhaust-Silencer-Box $—1:022.55-|.2
— ¥ Rear Exhaust-Silencer-Clamp % 53057
% 3,438.45
Less 10% g 343.85
$ 3,094.61
_ 25.:7,;
O putty and spray painting % 550.00
o check rear wiring and replace % “{"’t’ BO.0O
=2 NS0T
ch:f
Labour Charges 5 400.00
o7 At phq LS | §1R38.90
) A 8% pa; ~\0% $193.
$1655. 01
]"/"‘7’1
labour | ©560. 0
e | WS ol U
| 3 ,11: T s dcw@
TG_-"I-‘:'.J Eu[é_l = - *_ 4! 24.51
« - ye gkim Jan Motor Pte Lid
8ix 176 Sin Ming Drivé #03-09 SIF Autocare Singapore 575721
C4520893 FoxG5-64589127  Ema ELTM.5g Website : www.LTM.sg
Co.Reg No. 1993072770 GST Reg No M2-0019086-0

sl rot ne reproduced, In whole or in part, or disclosed to third party or parties without the prior written
consent of Lim Tan Mator Ple Ltd



'Y V4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

BdE A 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
,"__! TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No- 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607158-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ERGC INSURANCE FTE LTD Ref | CS/EGI9002544/Kqd3n2
AR
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date : 27-02-2019
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. 5JQ 20284 Veh. Inspected SGZ 7272R
Policy No. Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. SJ02028A/SLAMM Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From CLAIMS (ERGO) Assign Date 12/02/2019
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model AUDIQ3 (A) c.C 1984
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2013
Chassis Mo. WAUZZZBU3DROTT419 Colour METALLIC BLUE
Odometer 90743 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |235/50 R18 PIRELLI B mm
L/H Front Tyre |233/50 R18 PIRELLI B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |235/50 R18 PIRELLI 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyrre 235/50 R18 PIRELLI B mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  04/0212019 |Inspection Date 18102/2019
Survey held at LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD
BLK 178 SIN MING DRIVE
#03-09 SIN MING AUTOCARE
SINGAPORE 575721
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGZ 7272R

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 5258 3581 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mao. 19-3807136-R

Page No.:1 of 1

; Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) (s)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER BUCKLED 901.95 801.95
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH DENTED / CUT 331.35 331.35
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR BROKEN 197.85 187.85
1|REAR BUMPER TOW COVER MISSING 16.25 18.25
Z2|REAR BUMPER SENSOR @%194.75 SHORTED 380.50 389.50
2|REAR BUMPER RETAINER @$30.85 SERVICEABLE 61.70 -
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT TO REPAIR SEE 452 25 -
LABOUR
1|REAR EXHAUST SILENCER BOX TO REPAIR SEE 1,022.55 -
LABOUR
1|REAR EXHAUST SILENCER CLAMP SERVICEABLE 63.05 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -343.84 -183 89
3,004 61 1,655.01
LABOUR
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING. 550.00 250.00
TO CHECK REAR WIRING AND REFPLACE SENSOR 80.00 &0.00
LABOUR CHARGES.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF 400.00 250.00
REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT AND REAR EXHAUST
SILENCER BOX,
1,030.00 560.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,124.61 2,215.01
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 2,215.01

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18002544/Kgd3n2

54

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

DMSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report ks made sobely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




