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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

e —————————————————————————

From: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 22 February 2019 9:42 AM

To: Shu Pe) (LEKALUtO)

Ce: Admin A; Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBETD43E (OI : EQI - TBA) AND SLTB349U (TP
LKK REF - CCB/EQI18002531/Afb3 ) on 04.02.2019

Attachments: TP GIA REPORT.PDF, SAS2556153 PDF

Dear Shu Pel,

0l report as attached.
Regards,

lanet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190

Www. BQINSUrance.com.sg

-

.

d\ sttt oy P

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please natify the sen

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, February 12, 2019 6:26 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=; Poh Kin (LKKAuta) <pohkin@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBET043E (Ol : EQJ - TBA) AND SLTB343U (TP : LKK REF -
CCE/EQI19002531/Ab3 | on 04.02.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter,

We have inspected TP vehicle SLT 83490 at M/s Leang Automotive on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for a
direct settiement.



Enclosed for your perusal is:
TF's GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Poh Kin and he can be contacted at DID: 6841-2132.

Thank you.

Best Regards.

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone! 6366-D055 | emall: shuped (@ likauto cam | fax: 6741-4108
flk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5408933)
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STURIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UDLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (D65) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Our Ref: CC&/EQIIY002531/Afb3
31 JULY 2019

OCEAN ELECTRICAL PTE LTD
50 TUAS AVENUE 11

#03-25 TUAS LOT

SINGAPORE 639107

Dear SirMadam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE TIM3E AND SLT 83490 ALONG/AT JUNCTION OF
BENDEMEER RD AND GEYLANG BAHRU ON 04/02/2019

We refer 1o the above accident where we are acting for EQ Insurance Company Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

We have received a claim from SLT 8349U against your motor insurance policy.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other
information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appoinied agent of
your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant.

If you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us
have them in writing within the next 10 days i.c. by 13/08/2019, after we shall proceed with
negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not
bind any claims whatsoever by yowyour driver against the other party’s insurer arising from this
particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20%
for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy
has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Poh Kifl, Chong
Case Handler

DID: 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: pohkin@llkkauto.com

cc EQ Insurance Compary Lid
(Movar Clafms Depit)



Report Remarks Entry

Report Remarks Entry - CC6/EQIT1Y002531/Awb3
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25272018
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[|LoD in by fax CPK [11:32:05
AM
|4/4/2018
[]|TP CALLED I[N CHASING FOR OFFER CHT [10:54:06
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video footaga, he dispute that TP also changing lane and without gnaing way, he also 0712010
based on the video footage, liabllity is not in his favor, he is nol agree 100% at faull, agree AM ’
lo lel insurance handle the matier, also mention that NCD already affacted due 1o last year
accidenl
30/7/2019
| | [C]|send letter to O1. 50/50 format ICPK [11:53:24
AN
| ao7rRO19
[ |file pass to SU, for send jetter to Ol ICPK 1:;‘53:41
| 30/7/2018
. |[C][Sent Letter To O1***File Pass Back POHKIN STU I:ﬂd:ﬂﬂ
| 307772019
[T][FILE TRANSFER TO VIVIAN FROM PK CPK |3:44:05
PM
| 30/712019
[7] to review the matter CPK (34442
FM
. = S E— — — _— - = i
hitp://www.init.com.sg/VIEWS/entry/ReportRemarks Entry aspx?md=293620 20/9/2019



EQ Insurance Company Limited
Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Dear Sir/ Madam
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLT 8349U & GBE T043E ON 04/02/2019

We understand that you are the insurer of GBE 7043E vehicle.

We are instructed by the owner of A VIIAYAKUMARI to write, negotiate and settle the
claim on their behalf for the abovementioned accident. We therefore propose to claim from
you as follows: -

I Cost of repair S§ 3,100.00

2 Loss of Rental (5§120.00 x 4days) S§  480.00

3. LTA Search fee S$ -
TOTAL S 3.580.00

Please let us have your reply soonest possible.

Thank you.

Yours faithfully




RECEIVED 25/84/2815 87:43
82/18/2815% ©83:42 E7dislag FAGE 21/8B1

EQ Insurance Compauy Limited

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Dear Sir/ Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLT 8349U & GBE 7043E ON 04/02/2019
We understand that you are the insurer of GBE 7043E vehicle.

We are instructed by the owner of A VUAYAKUMARI to write, negotiate and settle the
claim on their behalf for the abovementioned secldent. We therefore propose to claim from

you as follows: -

L. Cost of repair S$  3,100.00
2. Loss of Rental (5$120.00 x 4days) ¢  430.00
3. LTA Search fee . L4 -

TOTAL 85 3.580.00

Plense let us have your reply soonest possible.

Thank you.




§ 74 7.

51 LUBEAVE 1, #00-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL ; (065) 62563561 FAX 1 (65} 61564315

Our Ref: CC6/EQIT19002531/Agb3
24 SEPTEMBER 2019

OCEAN ELECTRICAL PTE LTD
50 TUAS AVE 11

#03-25/26

SINGAPORE 639107

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 7043E AND SLT 8349U ON 04/02/2019

We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster
Company by your Motor Insurer (EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED) to resolve
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy
taken up with them.

This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SLT 8349U,

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter,

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit
the following to ceciliachong@Ikkauto.com within 10 days from the date of this

letter_if not provided at our reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive

and further document may be required:

. Drgtefs driving license or foreign driving license (if any)
 Accident Video Footage
» Employment Letter/ Authorisation letter from your company

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

é



CECILIA CHONG

Case Handler

DID: 6749 4274

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: ceciliachongf@lkkauto.com

ec.  EQINSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Motor Claims Dept)



To:  Mis Leang Automotive
Neo. | Kald Bulds Averus 6
#01-68
Singapore 417883

LETTER OF AUTHORITY & INDEMNITY
|

'wa ﬂ VIJHWHkUmQRJ NRIC No./ Co Registration No.
8 ILS! CERE  of (address) BLK 3¢ \WHRAMPOR Hob-21 (&)33c03¢
the registersd owner (or his/er/their/agent) of motor vehicle registration no. & 1| #3491
hersby authoriss M/s Leang Automotive (“the Repairer™) 10 commence repairs (o my/our
vehicie and to forward the claim for inter alia the costs of repairs to the owner/insured of the
mﬁhwrmmhkﬁrﬂunﬁdwﬁdnﬂm{mﬁtﬁ,-&b_ﬁ_hwmmm
nos NBE42E  along SENDEMEER RoAN 1 further amthorise M/
!sang Automotive to sign and execnte all documents in my name inchoding but not Hmited 10
the Discharge Voucher in connection with the claim agairst the Thind Party

However, i the third party rejects liability for whatever reasons and/or if the claim is
reverted o mylour insurers and myfour insurers do not settle the ropair costs and
disbursemants unde mylowr own nsamnce policy, Vwe will be fully responsible for the
repair costs and disbureements

| also agree that if 1 do not fully co-operste in the Third Party claim, [ will be
responsible for any losses incorred by my Repairer.

My/our vehicle is repaired by the Repairer on my/our own free will and without any
threat, mducement and/or promise.
|
: |
hhm&at&&ﬂmi:mmmwmm;lupum
Uwe shall pay for the legal costs incurred by the Repairer on a solicitor end clienr full
indemnity basis.

¥ [ T This Discharge Voucher upplies only 1o the claimant’s claim
éﬂy'qm‘sm for property damage and will not affect the personal
injuries claim and/or uninsured losses claim on a later date.

W.%W&m@:ﬂuhaﬁnmumhnﬂu
evidence 10 prejud claimunt's personal injuries claim
and/or other uninsured losses claim arising out of the
subject matter in this action.



. LEANG AUTOMOTIVE ™o

Auto Bay @ Kaki Bukit 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-68 Singapore 417883

Tel: 6909 3048 Fax: 6909 3046
Vehicle No: ELT 354 U
WA UE s
M/s 7B \whueants LweiNy Ty VehldeModel:-M

Date: ;\E*E*l@fi

l'_ . r

Quantity | DESCRIPTION I Unit Price ¢ Amount .
1

]
Wﬁmm"mw‘—*——“““——’"——
for and wil no affect he persosl | ||
% J'
|
!’ evidence ehic e climan's pesoal s cim
|

|
| | |

— e

é
g
3

ToTALS | £ 27008,

B Ay

Authorised Signature For LEANGAUTOMOTIVE

L2,
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DAWN ENTERPRISES

Tel: 63832661 Fax: 64842816

21 Seletar West Farmway 1

Singapore 798125

Reg No.430058/000

'Luwo o

N? 36457

RENTAL AGREEMENT

HIRER'S PARTICULARS

e O A

DRIVER'S PARTICULARS

name A VEiRga Fomwoe Niina (Qnm_:ﬂnn |
s BN TW whevgen  wes) P ALY m-tpdln wesd
& ob-2 | S (33=e3u7) ) HO6 -2\ S(Tleezu

UG of Passpori No. S\ ISHE R Country _ Sfama
Oocupaton_ SHORAAY e~

VO Passparitio, BANMREOIR |y, 'Porve
Ottupation |

Dot Bimn OU/02] 1968 Age o4 oue ot e 27 /0| Q. age AW
Driving Lioenos fo, Diate Pt e Drving Liconce Me. Date Fazeen
Tak: (HF (Femisenca) Tkl {Crifiog ) q."'.' 1 382u |Residance)
IMPORTANT NOTES: L CHARGES

1 mmmn‘ huﬂmmmhrmzmmumu ™y ™
7 Trua e s et i caery Bamsangery orvy Wﬂw & s lnaﬁU per days | ‘J(%B‘UU
#  irgr m isble 5> jay Brgt § 20 LA Ary SCcinEnt iis ‘oee t E—

dwmmﬁiimmﬁ' Day st & par weay |
' hmhﬂ-mwmmmﬂ 7 el e
5 MMMMMEMM'W&:M 0 e Jd nry ]
[ M#ﬂduwmmmm Doy &t 3 pm'mnmhf
7 \um.nﬂ-«munmhrm-dhnnm
] 'ﬁrnmumnmm'mnnﬂ:u—m B
Ve 10 e swtirm diring efion hour sy f '[TD—l
10 o Bervicn on Btk Howday and funcey \ TOTAL AMOUNT %Acm

T AMOUNT PAID $W
- ‘ B BALANCE DUE

|
Tima | Wisage __| Days Extension Fram To :

1) 214{‘}?"‘! i

< * |

L '} Amount Depoart (refundabia) §

L

FROM

I
u\’}.‘\ﬁ

" 1§ 'J\"j

hw-hnuruuuuummndwtﬁmwm
Sborve Bnd herely sgresd to abids

O .

Hirer's Signature

DriveriGiurantor's Signature

DAWN ENTERPRISES
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Company Registration No. 190607 198R

S| LRI AVE 1, #1235 PAYA URI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL 1 (065] 62583361 FAX ; (003) #25a4315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Date: 15/10/2019

IRD | LEME!
e s GBE 7043E (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. - DMCPHQ18-001060
R SLT 8349U (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No.: CC6/EQI19002531/Agb3q2

Date of Accident 4/2/2019 -
Liabllity 100%
Final Repair Cost ] 3,100.00
Loss of Use 9 days
Rental (If any) - 400.00 4 days
Others: N $ B

- - B

3,500.00

Final Settlement Sum |: § 3,500.00
Remarks
Payment | ion. Payee's Breakdown

1 |LEANG AUTOMOTIVE

' 9 3,500.00

JOANNE LEE

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL 6258 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Rag MNo: 198507188R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref : CCB/EQI19002531/Agb3g2
O TonER o L
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 15-10-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, GBE 7043E Veh. Inspected SLT 83400
Policy No. DMCPHQ18-001060 Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 12/0272019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition 7
Make & Model MAZDA3 e.c 1498
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 207
Chassis No. JMBBN22ABHO157250 Colour BLUE
Odometer 45879 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 TOYO B mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/80 R18 TOYO & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R18 TOYO 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 TOYO & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. ‘General Information
Accident Date  04/022019 Inspection Date 12/02/2019
Survey held at LEANG AUTOMOTIVE
BLK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6
#01-68 AUTOBAY@ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AYTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. | Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl B B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
= = S TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 128607188R GST Reg. No 18-9607198-R Page No.:1 ol 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLT 83490
Qty ,l Description of Parts Condition mg] D Tﬁw
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 1,031.70 1,031.70
1|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE HOLDER LH DAMAGED 38.00 38.00
1|HEADLAMP LH CRACKED 1,157.90 1,157.90
1|FRONT GRILLE CRACKED 325,00 325.00
1|FRONT GRILLE LOGO NOT NECESSARY 68.80 .
1|FRONT LH FENDER DENTED 334.00 334.00
1|FRONT LH FENDER INNER SHIELD TORN 129.00 129,00
1|FRONT LH FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIPS NECESSARY 30.00 30,00
1|FRONT LH SHOCK ABSORBER NOT NECESSARY . 287.00 .
1|FRONT LH WHEEL HUB C/W BEARING NOT NECESSARY 325.40 .
1|FRONT LH LOWER ARM NOT NECESSARY 485.00
1|FRONT LH KNUCKLE ARM NOT NECESSARY 384.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT . 615,12
4,625.80 2.460.48
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT LH WHEEL RIM (SN) cuT 850.00 550.00
850.00 550.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING. 800.00 400.00
SPRAY PAINTING. 800.00 400.00
WIRING. 50.00 30.00
TO PERFORM WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 150.00 80.00
TO DISMANTLE FRONT UNDERCARRIAGE. NOT NECESSARY 350.00 I
2,150.00 910.00
GRAND TOTAL 7,625.80 3,920.48

Report Ref No, CCEB/EQI19002531/Agb3qg2
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RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,100.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report RefNo CCB/EQI19002531/Agb3q2

%2.
ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOE.AMIRTE.AMSAE-A M MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart s mads solely for the uss snd benefil of the Cleni named on he frent page of this Report.

ihird pacty sho may cecly on the Report wiholl or in parl Any third arty sciing ot replying o this




Joanne Lee (LKK Auto)

EE—————————————————————————————————————————————

From: Joanne Lee [LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 October 2019 3:52 PM

To: ‘egiprs@eqinsurance.com.sq’

Cec: 'CeciliaChang @lkkauto.com'

Subject: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE 7043E (Ol) and SLT 8343U (TP} on
04/02/2019

Attachments: LKK REPORT & PHOTO.pdf; TP DS SUPPORTING DOCUMENT. pdf

Dear Sir'Madam,
Please be informed that the above-mentioned case had been settled.
Enclose herewith final report & relevant documents for your necessary action please.

Thank yow

Best Regards.

JOANNE | Reparts

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: reporti@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933



