Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Elite Automotive <elite.automotive13@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 4 November 2019 9:24 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Accident Involving Of Vehicle No: SFQ 101G & FBG 3948K
Hi Cecilia,

Good day! Client decided not to proceed to claim. Thanks!

Regards,
Christy

On Mon, 4 Nov 2019 at 09:08, Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Your ref: SFQ 101G

Our Ref: CC4/ASM19002380/gb3

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBG 3948K & SFQ 101G ON 22/01/2019

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly check and advise if your client is still interested to pursue with his third-party claim against our principal M/s
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd.



