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Insured Vehicle No. j Claim No.
: Name of Insured W 14\, Policy No,
WW] insured Tel No  Hp: 5 Make / Model
Excess Sec I1 :8§ DOA: Y\ Place of Accident :
Is drrver the owner? { YES I\,ﬁ@) Mature Bfﬁﬂc:lidc,nt: _ e
I NO, Driver Name / Age - R Ol GIA REPORT: F!‘_E/B'FNO - TP GIA REPORT: ?rm
Driver Tel No, (VIL: YES /1ND) Insured Lisbility : %  Final? Yes/No
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= Eh:R:mnt Invoice: w | |
- |Towing tnvoice e
' ) - = LTA/ GIA - )
- Medical Bill;
B e 1 1 |
- Mandate/Reject Instruction: |~ |
|Lop 1]
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PRELIMINARY ADVICE DateTime. Sent By: [Post-Repair Photos: B ! Y o
IOihr::S: ]
FINALI?AT!EII\' Date/Time: Confirm with; Confirm by: (& - .
Repair Cost: BiE 5% LAkt o0 { 3 days) Reduction: 43 % Email [ — | Call E B
FINAL SETTLEMENT  Date/Time: 1 0414 Confirm with &vius Emaill = | cal |
Final Liability: % o (Agrecd / Assessed) BOLA S/NNp,; 3% I NO or B 28, Ass. Lia :
Repair Cost: Wikt (8E1L50.30 Ohv RENERSED Wi Podpes IR o )
Loss of Remtal (LORY 9IS, (5% 2. { & days) x e ]
Losgs of Use (LOUY 5 - (% x days) L% ﬁ_’\‘ﬁ; Ei
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Medical: _|5% - 1) Claim status: Nermal Reject/Private Settle
Disbursement; 2 . {e.g. Tow! Independent 2)Report Format: | %
Legal Cost i 3) Survey fee: + 250
Total: S5\ EBA 0. Global Sum 55:
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> Back to OneMotoring

PARF/COE Rebate Enguiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output;
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
FARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years);

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
37601

SLW3108R

No

12 Feb 2019
HONDA

JAZZ 15CVT
Grey

2017
L15B33111699
JHMGKS5850JX203900
96.0 kW (128 bhp)
$16,223.00

06 Feb 2018

06 Feb 2018

0

$16,223.00

Yes
05 Feb 2028
$12,167.00

05 Feb 2028
A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$41,400.00
$37,185.00
$49,352.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 12 Feb 2019
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1] HONDA

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.
(A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)

Service and Body Repair

Tel +55 6841 3838

Website: www honda.com sg

For 24-hours Roadside Assistance. Call 98203838

QUOTATION

G5T Reqg Mo, M200050223
Company Ref. No. SB0FC1380G

Customer : INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE Document No. . SQT18000601 Page 1
64 CECIL STREET Date . 8. Feb 2019
#04-00 & #05-00 10B BUILDING Customer No. : WZI007
SINGAPORE 049711 Svc Advisor : ARY CHUA WAI NGEE
Registration No : SLW3I108R Engine No : L15B33111689
Chassis No s JHMGKS850JX 203900 Date | Time : B. Feb 2019 3:46:33 PM
Model - JAZZ 1 5VTIR CVT 18YM (EURO B) Surveyor Name
Owner's Name - KUA CHI KIONG Survey Date
Ins Policy No. . Authorization Date
Date of Accident  : 4/2/2019
0% GST Amount
Item Description Qty  UnitPrice Disc%  Amount Amount incld GST
TP DIRECT SETTLEMENT [J/NO: )
OWHNER: KUA CHI KIONG
COWHER INSURER: TOKIO MARINE INSURANCE
ACC DATE: 41218
SURVEYED BY:
DATE:
REF NO:
TR INSURER: INDIA INTL, INSURANCE
TP VEH: SHCBBS5L
BOSUN SUMNDRIES L g 1 30.00 X 30.00 210 3210
BKDR11K STRAIGHTEM ALIGN FR L & RR DOOR. 1 1120.00 _:'lféﬂ 1120.00 7840 1195.40
BPOZR E?F";I?AY FPAINTING ON REFAIRED OR REPLACED AREAS. 1 1350,00 ?0‘? 1350.00 04 50 1444 50
Sum Labor 2500.00 175.00 2,675.00
Sy e ey Ll
Date & Time f W ;//‘I,- q Total Amount 2.500.00 175.00 2.675.00
Excess —-L"'J i Total (Inclusive of GST) 2.675.00
st o ALl
Sionature

Zilot af?,ﬁ s P

Printed on 922019 9:17:10 AM
This s @ com puler genedalad inaica, Mo signature is reguired

Pan prices are subjecied o change withowt notice
The atave estimabed cast af repair do mat inclode any unforesesn damages

GET Amount is caloulated from mdividusl line(s]



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 11 February 2019 9:43 AM

To: Faeaz; 'sur@lkkauto.com’; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: Ary Chua; Manivel Privadarshini

Subject: RE: Accident involving SLW3108R & SHCBES5L On 4/2/19
Attachments: 4076_001.pdf

4:Stam @ 3
Dear Sir / Mdm, pudon ® Pﬂ‘j
Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SLW32108R and let us have your report urgently. wehide N’jf I
This claim will be handled by Ms Priya.

*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

. INDH
' . lNTERNATlDNﬁL
( INsurANCE
S I HGCAFrPORTLE
Serving the region xince J967

64 Cecil Street; #05 - OB Building
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: Faeaz [mailto:faesaz@honda.com.sg]

Sent: 11 February, 20138 89:26 AM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>; Sundari Nagarajan - |ll <sundari@iii.com.sg>
Cc: Ary Chua <arychua@honda.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SLW3108R & SHC8855L On 4/2/19

Dear Gabriel,

Please kindly arrange LKK for the survey.

Best Regards

Mohd Faeaz Bin Yaacob
Senior Executive

Kah Motor Body Repair Centre
15, Ubi Road 4



Singapore 408610
- Tel : 68465678
Hp : 82886304

From: Motor Claim - [l cmotorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 11 February, 2019 9:24 AM

To: Faeaz <faeaz@honda.com.sg>; Sundari Nagarajan - ||l <sundari@iii.com.sg>
Cc: Ary Chua <arychua@honda.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SLW3108R & SHC8855L On 4/2/19

Dear Sir / Mdm,

We acknowledge receipt of your email.
We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
* Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

® INDIA
® @ [NTERNATIONAL

IHSUIMNCE
SINGAPrPDRE
Serving the region since 1957

64 Cecil Street; #05 - 10B Building
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: Faeaz [mailto:faeaz@honda.com.sg]

Sent: 09 February, 2019 9:30 AM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim @iii.com.sg>; Sundari Nagarajan - Il <sundari@iii.com.sg>
Cc: Ary Chua <arychua@honda.com.sg>

Subject: Accident involving SLW3108R & SHCB855L On 4/2/19

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Kindly arrange your surveyor to inspect our client vehicle which involve in the
above accident with your insured on the above date,

Attached claim documents for your necessary action.

Best Regards



Mohd Faeaz Bin Yaacob
Senior Executive

Kah Motor Body Repair Centre
15, Ubi Road 4

Singapore 408610

Tel : 68465678

Hp : 82886304

From: Printer Service <printservice@honda.com.sg>
Sent: 5aturday, 9 February, 2019 9:25 AM

To: Faeaz <faeaz@honda.com.sg>

Subject: Attached Image

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you.

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
[nternet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this

message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission
or any modification.
Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment,

3



India International Insurance Pte Ltd.
Registration No. 198703792-K

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you.

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
vou by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd.
Registration No. 198703792-K
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Claim Audit

Remarks

(204360) HONDA JAZZ 1.5 (A).

Reg No: SLW3108R. Acct Date: 2015/02/04, Claim Type: TP, Insurer: India Internationa
| Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ). TP Insurer: Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd (HQ). Works
hop: Kah Motor Co Sdn Bhd (Ubi}

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ):

Mext Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2019/02/720

Approved:0.00.Reinsp: Adj decides.

(30651):Vehicle Mot In,(30653): Direct Settlement.

[None] -= MARCUS CHUA

CurReq:0.00:PODS: LIABILITY: 100% REMARK: B:23 OID REVERSED HIT PARKED TP
(REFER TO TP VIDEO VIA EMAIL)

Mext Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2019/02/20. Mandate Remarks: PLEASE FORWARD US THI
RO PARTY VIDEO FOOTAGE

Maintained:PLEASE FORWARD US THIRD PARTY VIDEOQ FOOTAGE

(30651 ):Vehicle Not In.

Cur.Req:0,00: TP VIDEQ HAVE SEND TO YOUR EMAIL ON 13.02.19

Cur Rpt:Final Rpt. Cur Due Date;2019/02/20, Mandate Remarks: LIABLITY-100%

Approved:0.00: LIABLITY-100%

Insured Mame: => -,

Claimant's Name: -> -, Claimaint's ID: => =,

JP] Reg. Date: -> 2018/02/06.

Cur.Req:1883.20:PODS: LIABILITY: 100% QUANTUM: (a) COR w/GST: $1,562.20 + (b)

LOR w/GST: $321.00 (3days x $100) Total: a+b = $1,883,20 VEH MODEL: HONDA JAZ
Z 1498cc PLEASE REVERT WITH YOUR APPROVAL / MANDATE / INSTRUCTIONS, IF ANY,

On Audit
11 Feb 2015 ¢y, ah Model Changed
15:32
1;1‘;:;&2“‘ 2019 cym Created
11 Feb 2019
15:32 Adj Co Assigned
11Feb 2019 444 Next Rpt Changed
15:32
11 Feb 2019
1 0 Adj Mandate Set
11 Feb 2019
15:32 Label Addad
11 Feb 2015
ks Adj Adjuster Assigned
13 Feb 2019
12:54 Adj Mandate Request
E_';gb 2015 agj Next Rpt Changed
13 Feb 2019
aay Adj Mandate Set
14 Feb 2019
S5ias Label Removed
18Feb 2019 adj Mandate Request
11:20
%?.ﬁb 2019 adj Next Rpt Changed
18 Feb 2019
g Adj Mandate Set
06 Mar 2019
Bt Adj Rpt Initiated
06 Mar 2019
et Cim Dtl Modified
06 Mar 2019
i Cim Dtl Modified
06 Mar 2019
12:41 Cim Dtl Modified
06 Mar 2019 ¢ym Details Notified
12:41
25 Mar 2019
e Adj Mandate Request
Date From

4|E ] pateTo

4|77 = Audit Typa | None

— vllee]

By
[A]
HOW |
MEL [
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[A]
HOW
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(Al |
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Print Received Message

This mall is associated with :

“SLW3108R (MCT18020256)
[SHCB855L]
TP
KUA CHI KIONG
Faeb 4 2019 5:00PM

]
Kah Motor Co Sdn Bhd

From India International Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) (I1I_SG), sent on 25/03/2019 14:47 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5$1883.20) - SLW3108R - Claim Handler: Priya

Approved:1883.20.




Merimen e-Claims

Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Direct Settlement

Case Notified Est Submitted | Adj Assigned | AdjRgt | |  Adj Submitted | Ins Auth'ed | Status .

11 Feb 2019 11 Feb 2019 ssmu.nn 1| 5%1,460. DT Pending for Survey
Pain Edit Reg 0:0:00 Edit Estimates View Apt Report

Ao | Edit ad) Apt || | | Cancel Case |

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS
| Insured:
| Main Clalmant

Wehicle Reg. Noot

Claim Type:
Wehicle Reg. No. (Insured):

Repairer:
Handling Insurer:
Claimant’s Insurer:

i KUA CHI KIONG,

TP / MCT19020256
| SHCBBS5L

:Indla International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 ..
| Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6221 6111
.. [Handled by MARCUS CHUA] ..

Reference Claim Details

ID: 579337601

SLW3108R |Date of Loss:

| Policy/Cover Note No.:
| Policy No. :Clmmanll
Excess:

04/02/2019 17:00 - .58
[11 Months and 29 Days From LTA
Reg Date (Man ¥r)]

MCOMO015

MT000712

|Kah Hutnr Cn Elin BI‘Id (Ubi) 15 Uki Road I GDEGIH Ubl - Tel: BB465671

. [Handled by Priya]

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .

_[Final Rpt

Adlysers | due 20/02/2019]

:ASESBEIATED MAIL RECEIVED View All ]

' 111.SG (25/03/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$1883.20) - SLW3108R - Claim Handler: Priya
(w111 5G (18/02/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($5$0.00) - SLW3108R - Claim Handler: Priya
| e 115G (13/02/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - Sl-;'lﬂ_'ilﬂl_l! = Claim Handler: Priya

Compose Case Mail I

| B
ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS

Create New Task
Completed On

View All 1 Search Tasks |
Assigned By

I Complete _1.
Created On

Due Date
Mo results.

Priority  Type Task Group Subject  Handler Done?

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 15/5/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Updoad CroCiEments

Claim Documents

*SLW3108R (MCT19020256)
[SHCBB55L]
™
KUA CHI KIONG
Feb 4 2019 5:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Kah Motor Co Sdn Bhd

Video
Mo | Finalized On
1 | 18/02/1%9 11:39

Photos/Images

| No Rel.ah.eU.REi:rder

1 [25/0371% 12:21

2 [25/03/1912:21
:j _25_#_&_3_."19 i2:21

4 | 25/03/19 12:21

§ |25/03/19 12:21
-] .25;'03.-'19 1
7 .J.SIQEHB 12:21
.B .25;‘93.-‘19 12:21
L] “251‘1]3}1’9‘ 12:21

10 | 25/03/1% 12:21
11 25;'&3;’1912:21

12 25!D3f19 12:21
13 |25/03/19 12:21
14 25)’03,"19 12:21

15| 25.”}3#1'9 1z

16 1 |25/03/19 12:21

17 |25/03/19 12:21
18 :_25.5'_0_3!!19 12:21
13 1250313 1 21
20 25/0371912:21
-21 'zsma,fm 12:11
22 125/03/19 12:21
23 '25,ru3;19 12:25

24 25;'03;’1‘!' 12:25

25 25![?3;"19 12:25%

26 |25/03/19 12:25
27 :25."93."19 12:25

Documentation -

o Relabel/Reorder

1 11/02/19 15:32
2 11/02/19 15:32
3 16/02/19 17:47
4 06/03/19 12:45

5 06/03/19 12:45

6 15/05/19 12:36

7 |15/05/19 12:36

B 15/05/19 12:36

| Mo |Finalized D-n

1 ___E.I'_DI."I'Q 15:35

Page 1 of 2

[ Iipkoad Phaotos Coampise Mew Lerler | View Uss ‘u;izwzr -
1 per page | @ |
India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) o Thuml:rlall Print
Video - Accident = J_ € | Load MPa
R - 3 per page - | M
|LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - o | Thumbnail | Print
General View [ ] | Load s | @
General View - | adwe | [F |
General View B 0 adws | @ |
| Genaral View (i ] Load G | @ |
General View 1) mad PG ' IE
General View | oadws IPE
General View 8 ledirc | [
General View O | oad PG |
‘General View . O | ladwe | @
General View 0| adirc | [
‘General View o | Load G | [
| Genaral View @ | Load G
| General View O | Ladws | [@
| General View 8 | Loadwc | [
| General View O waows | F
| General View O adwc | @
:Ganaml View | n LN“.?]?.G..' _[gl
Reinzpection Photo n_' Load JpG | (@
Reinspection Phota O | cadwc | [
Reinspection Photo ﬂ | Load 1PG
Reinspection Photo fi] | Load 1¢G | [
Reinspection Photo 1] l Load JPG
Reinspection Photo © | waiws |[@
Ilelmpocljﬂn Photo [ 1] | Load PG il
Reinspection Photo O  oadws | @
-Itainspactinn Photo In  Load JPG i
| Reinspection Photo n Load JPG = |
o ) tperpae v @ |
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) = | Thumbnail | Print
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO III DD 11.02.19 € | Load FOF
 NOTIFICATION FROM WORKSHOP + TP ESTIMATE + TP GIA REPORT @ | LoagPoF |
TP ESTIMATE - MARKED | €9 | Load POF
'RENTAL RECEIPT - | Load PEF
Lop | Load POF
mnusuup INVOICE - | Load POF
.II.ITHDRIE.I.TIDH TO A.CT FORH N | Load P‘Pf
| DISCHARGE VOUCHER Load POF
| !n_:_lig_ll_'ltp_rpatiunal In:uraru:e_Pte Ltd (HQ) - Thumbnail | Print
|1D SAS REPORT @ | Load POF
htips://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_... 15/5/2019
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno19ss07198Rr)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC4/111190023T0/UEA3NZ
Date: 15/08/2019

REFERENCE

mﬁg:‘g India Intemational Insurance Ple Lid  Policy No: MCOMO0015

g'aif““"t _ SLWS3108R Insured Vehicle No : SHCBB55L

ehicle No :
Date of Loss: 04/02/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT19020256
CRIP M &l TIFI T F H

Reqg No: SLW3108R

Make & Model: HOMDA JAZZ 1.5 (A) Engine No: L15B33111609

Req. Date: 06/02/2018 (Man. Year: 2017) Chassis No: JHMGKSB50JX203900

Colour: Grey Odometer: 10759 km

Engine Capacity: 1498 cc

Market Value/New Car N/A

Price:

Sum Insured (5%): Market Value/New Ca

r Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/55 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 185/55 R16
Front Left Side: Dunlop 7 mm Rear Left Side: Dunlop 7 mm
Front Right Side: Dunlop 7 mm Rear Right Side: Dunlop 7 mm
The above values represent the remaining fyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  DIff %
Parts 30.00 0.00 30.00 100.00
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2.470.00 1,460.00 1.010.00 40.89
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 2,500.00 1,460.00 1,040.00 41.60
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 175.00 102.20 72.80 41.60
Nett Amount (S§) 2,675.00 1,562.20 1,112.80 41.60
+ Car Rental (3.0 x $33100.00/day + 7.00% GST) (S§) 321.00
Nett Liability (S%) 1,883.20
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 11/02/2019
Date Inspected: 12/02/2019  Inspected At Kah Motor Co Sdn Bhd (Ubi)
15 Ubi Road 4
Singapore 408610
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yi

NOTE: This report represenis cur findings at the fime and place of inspaction stated herein Such inspechion has been camed out o tha bast of our
knowledge and ability buf any cther iablity under any ofher clrcumstances is hereby expressly excluded
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REPAIR DETAILS

'Reference

Part Source: MEM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 06 Mar 201%)

Parts: 144 HOMDA JAZZ 1.5 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLW3108R)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
|Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *,

Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *SUNDRIES Mot Necessary 30.00FS *-FS
F=Franchize parl S3=SpcNett

Total Parts (S§) 30.00 0.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Mo  Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 STRAIGHTEN ALIGN FR L & RR DOOR MNew 1,120.00 560.00

2 SPRAY PAINTING ON REPAIRED OR REPLACED AREAS New 1,350.00 900.00
Gross Labour Cost (S5) 2,470.00 1,460.00

Feport was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 15/5/2019



