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MS‘Firstca pital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited cersg ho 1950001060 G5T Reg Ho. M2 00016769 -

& Raffles Quay £21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (B5) 6222 2311 Fax (65)6222 3547

Claims & Moter Underariting Depr: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 058877
Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax (B5) 6507 3849
wiww mafirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
01-02-2019 Qur Ref No. D19000854MFSH
01-02-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHDE700H Third Party Vehicle. YJ8583H

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 BLK C #01-43 AUTOBAY@KAKI BUKIT
REENA/SUKYI
67479241/ 67479241 Fax No. 67417276

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No, 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

NEW HOCK TECK R
MOTOR PTE LTD it

NA TP Solicitor Fax No. N4
MAY CHUA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

mher of EEEERIE IREUHANCE BROLS



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 February 2019 12:31 PM

To: 'CWS Maotor Claims'

Cc: 'May Chua Hui Chin'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000854MFSH/1, Y] 8583H

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle YJ 8583H on 11/2/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler on behalf of Shirley

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 7 February 2019 11:11 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'May Chua Hui Chin' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000854MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank yau for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

.\!.:-'i.:__

ay
1‘.*

%
BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@]kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)



From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com)

Sent: Thursday, 7 February 2019 10:08 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'May Chua Hui Chin' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000854MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed workshop is closed for CNY, repairer will arrange after CNY.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Monday, 4 February 2019 11:11 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; May Chua Hui Chin
<maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000854MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System
Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848
Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WwwW.avg.com
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PARF COE Rebate Enguiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type:
Crwner 10
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exparted:
Intended Deregistration Date
Vehicle Make;

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year;
Engine No.;

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
POF Paid:

COE Rebate Amaunt:
Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Company
S208W

¥J8583H

Mo

01 Feb 2019

1sUZU

FTR33F

Elue

1994

oHH1226585
JALFTRZ3FT 3000257

35537400
28 Feb 1998
28Fch 1998
3

$2.7469.00

No

80.00

31 Mar 2022

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
&

$24.3%4.00
$15436.00
$15.436.00

https

vrl lta.gov.sg lavel acnon’enguircRebate By PublicBefore..
A

Please note that all future COE renewals for this vehicle can only be for a 5-year period, subject to the statutory lifespan (if applicable) of the

vehicle.

The information contained herein is correct as at 01 Feb 2019

lofl

OK

1/2/2019, 3:26 PM



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner 1D Type:
Owner 1D;

Company
6708w

Vehiche No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year
Engine No.:

Chassis No,;

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date;
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

YI8583H

Yes

12 Feb 2019

ISUZU

FTR33F

Blue

19964

6HH1226585
JALFTRIIFT3000257

$55,374.00
28 Feb 1998
28 Feb 1998
3

$2,769.00

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Mo

£0.00

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period{Years):
PGP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount;
Total Rebate Amount:

31 Mar 2022

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
5

$24.3%4.00
$15,292.00
$15,292.00

Please note that all future COE renewals for this vehicle can only be for a S-year period, subject to the statutory lifespan (if applicable) of the

vehicle,
The information contained herein is correct as at 12 Feb 2019
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NHT ) New HocK TECK MOTOR PTE. LTD.
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Blk C #01-43 Autobay@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883
Email: admin@nhtmotor.com Website: www.nhtmotor.com
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276
UEN: 201718370K
03/02/2019
Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-43 TP 15t Lap
Singapore 417883 £,
d
Accident date: 01/02/2019
Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: YJ8583H ISUZU FTR33F 8.2 M '98
CHASSIS: JALFTR33FT3000257
S/n Qty Items U/price Amount
1 1 Front Panel  plof pes $850.00 =
2 2  FrontSide Panel bt poe $290.00 $580.00 X
3 2 Front Head Lamp c $325.00 $650.00
4 2 Front Head Lamp Cover /.. | $110.00 $220.00 ~
5 2 FrontSide Lamp  *lt f/e $95.00 $190.00-"
6 1 Front Grille eruel e $450.00 -
7 1 Front Bumper )</ $650.00 -~
8 2 Front Bumper Bracket . _ $120.00 $240.00
9 1 Front Bumper Bracket Top Rubber 1, 1. & $180.00 ~~
10 1 Front Bumper Centre Lower Cover ' - $240.00~
11 1 Front Bumper Number Plate e S5000°50/4"
12 2  Front Bumper Side Reflector ! 5120.00 5240.00 —
13 2 FrontStep Panel ' (o $325.00 $650-00- 5 7
14 1 Front Center Member =", T $680.00 -~
15 1 Frontl/HChassis /. ‘[ $950.00.%
Subtotal :- $6,820.00

(52
2
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Labour charges

360
To repair front L/H chassis member S450-60——

To check wiring S]ﬂ}ﬂﬁ 50
Tuff kote $150.00 x

Towing fee !430 $150.00 .

Panel beating $1,000:00 677

Spray painting SIM &0

Subtotal :- $2,850.00

Total:- $9,670.00

Toted . 374550

B . | L../j; 3l

' : W C g
. I a3l B

« Third o t Prajudice” DasIS 3

al Neal modileations 5-adinwed

. bt FESUMEYED B.nd'

ewval from Insurance Company

Acknowledged by Reparar
Signature:
Drata:




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
TEL:

Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
6256 3561 FAX. G256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607T198R GST Reg. No. 13-5607138-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI12002200/Asd3n2
$16.01 CIT HOUSESINGAPORE 068677 Dy “2eRbein |“lm|||"||“”|”|"u
Code: FCI2
1, Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh,. SHD 6700H Veh. Inspected J B5B3H
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D19000854MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From MAY CHUA Assign Date 04/02/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model ISUZUFTR33F C.C B226
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 1998
Chassis No. JALFTRI3FT3000257 Colour WHITE
Odometer 248083 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Medification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[10.00 R20 AGATE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |[10.00 R20 AGATE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[10.00 R20 MIRAGE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |10.00 R20 MIRAGE 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  01/02/2019 Inspection Date 11/02/2019
Survey held at NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-43 AUTOBAY @ KAK] BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883
5a, Remarks
ADAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
EJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|E$TIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

5 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. YJ 8583H

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Reg. No: 199607 138R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607198-R

Page Mo.:1of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT PAMEL MOT NECESSARY B50.00 -
2|FRONT SIDE PANEL @$290.00 NOT NECESSARY 580.00 £
2|FRONT HEAD LAMP @$325.00 0/S CRACKED 650.00 325.00
2|FRONT HEAD LAMP COVER @%110.00 CRACKED 220.00 220.00
2|FRONT SIDE LAMP @%85.00 NOT NECESSARY 190.00
1|FRONT GRILLE CRACKED 450.00 450.00
1|FRONT BUMPER DISTORTED 650.00 50.00
2|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET @$120.00 BENT 240.00 240,00
1|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET TOP RUBBER DEFORMED 180.00 180.00
1|FRONT BUMPER CENTRE LOWER COVER NOT NECESSARY 240.00 -
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE REFLECTOR @%120.00 CRACKED 240.00 240,00
2|FRONT STEP PANEL @$325.00 O/S DAMAGED 650.00 325.00
1|FROMT CEMTER MEMBER TO REPAIR SEE 680.00 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT L/H CHASSIS TO REPAIR SEE 850.00 -
LABOUR
LESS 5% DISCOUNT - -394.50
6,770.00 2,235 50
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT BUMPER MUMBER PLATE (SM) BENT 50.00 30.00
50.00 3a0.00
LABOUR
TO REPAIR FRONT L/H CHASSIS MEMBER. 450.00 350.00
TO CHECK WIRING. 100.00 30.00
TUFF KOTE. MOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
TOWING FEE, NOT NECESSARY 150.00 .
PAMEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT 1,000.00 600.00
CENTER MEMBER AND FRONT L/H CHASSIS,
SPRAY PAINTING. 1,000.00 500.00
2,850.00 1,480.00
GRAND TOTAL 9,670.00 3,745.50

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18002200/Asd3n2
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Page Mo.:2 of 2
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,000.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref Mo, CS/FCI19002200/Asd3n2
MARKET VALUE: $40,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $15,292.00=NETT VALUE: §24,708.00

% g‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:: This Roport is made solaly for the use and baneli of the CRent named on the front page of this Report.

ponashility whabs oy N conk; or bool, i5 sccepted to any third party who may regly oo the Repert wholly of in oart. Any third g




