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MS@ FirstCapital

M35 First Capital Insurance Limited coReg ke 155000006C C5T Reg Mo M2 00016769
& Ralfles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (B5) 6222 2311 Fax (B5) 6222 3547

Claimn & Hoter Underwiting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tel (65) 6507 3848 Fax: (55]6507 3849

wanvr mafirstcapital.comsg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person
Contact Number,

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
01-02-2019 Our Ref No. D19000840MFSH
29.01-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHAS457G Third Party Vehicle. SLS125G

303 ALEXANDRA ROAD SINGAPORE 159941

GARY SEAH
63190174/ 63190174

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

Fax No. 64734601

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA
NA

Fax No, 68416315

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Flease submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

PERFORMANCE —
MOTORS LIMITED Sl
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
HENRY KAO

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

t [EEEER sisumance GRous




Shirler Hie.'_w (LKK ﬂ;u_to]

e . ——
From: Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevinleong.waikit@simedarby.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 21 February 2019 3:40 PM
To: SUR
Subject: RE: Accident involving : SLS125G
Attachments: 2ac62709-0850-4ac1-94dd-8c1aedf6173e jpa;

2b021249-4ecd-431a-84ea-1952ecaf3bd0.jpg;
73fe9ab5-2c84-4665-8094-3f9bd21233e3 jpg;
99cbfbS-Be31-41ab-84a4-9f122747aa%4 jpg; 301d8166-e4c3-46f4-955d-
afdfcba7f25d jpg; a05adb70-f919-423b-9034-b50c4aaf81f2.jpg; b4335136-
f887-43dc-8a49-5a76de3009d1 jpg; bf9eBdb1-71fa-4a23-822e-5f1b84ca5899 jpg;
bf895eab-6123-46a2-911f-47e39623f655 jpg; d2ebad79-
c43-44ff-81¢9-7414bfc55162 jpg; d22b5c18-70ee-493a-8914-82e137ba2590 jpg

Dear All,

Just to inform that we are unable to continue to repair this vehicle as both of the front chassis is badly damaged.
We will need to replace both front chassis to continue for completion of repair.

However, we understand that, LTA only allow to replace either one side of the front chassis only.

We have also inform the surveyor to take photo on the damage.

Kindly inform QBE on current situation.,

Thank you

Regards,

Kevin Leong
Customer Service Advisor | Body and Paint
Performance Motors Limited

303 Alexandra Road

Sime Darby Performance Centre

Singapore 159941

Hp (+65) 9116 5600 | Fax [+65) 6479 4601
Kevin.leong.waikit@simedarby.com.sg

MAY THE ROAD AHEAD BE
I~ BLESSED WITH GREAT FORTUNE.

From Performance Motors and Performance Munich Autos.

From: Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman [mailto:syaheeda.othman@gbe.com]
Sent: Friday, February 01, 2019 10:09 AM

To: Mervyn Fong; Kevin Leong Wai Kit

Cc: Young May

Subject: RE: Accident involving 5L5125G

Received with thanks, sir.
Best Regards,
Syaheeda Othman

Senior Executive, Claims
QBE Asia Pacific — Singapore

{ 1



From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 February 2019 10:37 AM

To: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie’

Cc: assignments; SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'CWS Motor Claims'
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000840MFSH/1

Dear Henry,

Please be inform that the vehicle recommended total loss due to the front chassis is badly damaged.

We will submit our report accordingly.

Thank you.

Bost Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 7 February 2019 3:54 PM

To: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 'CWS Motor Claims'
<cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-
d@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000840MFSH/1

Dear Henry,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle 5L5 125G.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall; Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 1 February 2019 4:54 PM

{;
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Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com=>
Sent: Thursday, 7 February 2019 3:54 PM

To: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie’; "CWS Motor Claims'

Ce: ‘assignments’; 'SUR’; "Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D12000840MFSH/1
Attachments: 5LS 125G - Preli Advise - pdf

Dear Henry,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLS 125G.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 1 February 2019 4:54 PM

To: 'CWS Mator Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000840MFSH/ 1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email; assignments@lkkanto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)




From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 1 February 2019 3:17 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmaotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; Henry Kao Cai lie
<HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI; SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000840MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System
Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848
Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




l‘ r!!'{" Auto

Conswitanis

A sn miz B Pia Lid Company Registration Mo, 1956071951
S URIAVE 1, #02.25 PAYA URT INDUS TREAL PARK, SINGAPORE JOSS33 TEL @ (065) 62363561 FAX : (065) 62564515
Your Rel: D19000840MESH Date: 07 Fehruary 2019

Qur Ref: CS/ECII9002158/T 1sd3

The Motor Claims Department

First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ SLS 125G .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 01/02/2019 at the premises of M/s Performance Motors Limited and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 188 69,802.40
Revised Estimate Amount + 8% 50,121.90
“Check™ Items Amount : 88 1573145 .
Total ;5% 65,853.35 ;
Market Value : 8% :
LTA Reimbursement Value ¢ 5%

Nett Value 155

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the front portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 20 Days

Yours faithfully,
Mohamad Taufikh
Automotive Assessor



Sketch Plan Pg. 3

SINGAPORE _ LT

D180 302034

Folice Station Of Origin: 10t 4

Bukit Timah M.P.C Reporl Mo TRO1E0130/2031
1 Duke's Road SINGAPORE 268914

Tel Mo 1800-4629999

REPORT OF A TRAFFIC ACCIDENT

Date/Time Report Made: Vide Repart No - | Statien Diary N+
300120149 10:20 D/20180129/0118 ag

Infermant's Particula i

Mame of Infurmanf

; TDUNG WOO CHENG 38 DUCHESS AVENUE SINGAPORE 268110

1D Type /1D No.: Contact No.. ' -
NRIC NO /3512848850 HomelOffice. Mobile: 81388398

Nalionality Email. =
SINGAPORE CITIZEN

Sex Age: Date of Bith | Type of Informant: =
Female G0 1210641958 Diriver -

Race: Language: Institution / Schoal Name: B
Chinese

Crecupation. Driving Licence Information:

HOUSEWIFE Class: 3 Date of Expiry:

General Information of the'Aceident 000 i n
Date.f'l'ime of

Tyrp-a uf Lecahon

[ Injury
Type of
Aecidart: [ Others AI:I:IdEnt.1 . X-Junction
| ocation: =
Along Road 1

HEMDERSON ROAD .

| At the juncilon of Henderson K arah
Weather: Road Surface: Road Speed Limit:
Claar Dry 50 ¥mfh
Traffic Flow: Traffic Control: Traffic Volume:
Cne Way o, Liﬂht_ PR—
Type of Collision: Anyone conveyed by
Between Moving Vehicles - Head To Side zmbulance:
o

Details of Vehiclg
Vehicle No. T ; B g wethColoretin®
SHAZ45TG Bar HYLINDA! .F'.E IONIQ

HEV 1.6
_ CT
ELE126G | Cer BMW 730LI LED | Biack

MAV HUD

Page G of 10



Sketeh Plan Pyg. 4

POLICE PORCE AT

2018013002031

Paolice Station OFf Origin; 2:ol4
Bukit Ttmah N.P.C

| Duke's Road SINGAPORE 268914
Tel Mo, 18004629009

Haport Mo, TLOTR09 30001

CONTINUATION OF REPORT

-ﬂuny Pedeslﬂan Inmluad Nu o
No_of Pedestrians Injured. NIL — | Use of Pedesinian Crossina A |

TLIM HOCK KEE

STlEIEIE-ITD
Related Vehicle | SHAD457G (Car) Contact No.| NIL
HospitalClinic | NIL "~ |Classof |Class 3
Drriving Date of Expiry: NIL
Licence &
_ e Expiry Date |
Date Treatment | NIL Dale Dvlscharqa MIL

Nuaf Da sranled Mad:cal L

YDUNG WOO CHENG

Related Vehicle | SLE125G (Car) Contact No.| B1388399
|
Hospital/Clinic | NIL Classof | Class 3 |
Driving Date of Expiry: NIL
Licence &
| — Expiry Date -
Date Treatment | NIL Date Discharge | NIL
| Mo. of Days granted Medical Leave | NIL Cegree of Injury | Slight
Erief Details.

On 29/1/2018, at about 1955hrs while | am driving Black BMW 730LI LED NAV, SLS125G at the junclion
of Henderson Read and Jin Bukit Merah on the right of a two lane road. The traffic light signal Green and
| wanted to proceed straight. While proceeding straight This Yellow Hyundai AE IONIQ, SHAS457G
Suddenly came from the right even though the traffic light was red and my vehicle collided into his
vehicle.

There is camera around the vicinity which focus at the collision place and there is In built camera inside
the taxi loo,

Both of us did exchange the particular after the scens.

At that point of time A TP was at scene and ambulance was called in to convey my passenger namely
Tan Siew Ngoh, Chrislina was conveyed to 5GH after the Collison,

Subsequently | fell pain as such | went to SGH and the doslor infermed there was a fracture onmy  Right

Page Tof 10



Sketch Plan Py. 5

g smomvone TR

TI201901 302031
Palice Station Of Origin: Jof 4
Bukit Timah M.P.C Report Mo, TROS013002031
I Duke's Road SINGAPORE 288414
Tel No: 1800-4629999 CONTINUATION OF REFORT
wnst

Damages to my vehicls
Front bumper, engine and bayonet seriously damaged and dented

L]a':nug&s 1o the yellow taxi
Side left seriously dented and damaged

Page 8 of 10



Sketch Plan Pg. 6

@Y Potice rorce R

TRM
Folice Station OF Ongin: dof4
Bukit Timah N.P.C Repart Mo, TR01801 302031
1 Duke's Road SINGAPORE 268514
Tel No: 1800-4629099 COMTINUATION OF REPORT
Sketch Plan

Informant is not able 1o provide sketch plan

IMPORTANT: Pleasa attach a copy of your vehicle's Insurance Certificale to this report. If you don't have
the cedificate with you now, please fax a copy to 65474885 stating the report number as reference

Signature Of Officer Recording The Report: 1 [ Signature Of Informant:
Ef ==
Bgt 2 LUI CHONGLU i Y —
a OMGL fﬁ} ! {_L
“Signature Of Interpreter. _ Date/Time: o B o
Mot applicable 30012019 10:20
Officer In Charge Of Case: . _ Classification Of Case: h o
TP/ AEIT / fr«g;';; S =
Sr Staff Sgt ONG YONG HOGK | 45 755 POLC: FoRiE
Contact Mo.: 65476436 e |
_— N | N
Authentication Stamp i -
HP1ES e s ]
 SIGNATURE |

Page 9 af 1
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= Back to OneMotoring

PARF/COE Rebate Enguiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Chaner |10 Tygue

O 1D

Vehicle Details
Wehicle Ma:

Wehiele o be Expusied;
Intended Deveghtration Date
Vehicla bake

Wt e Moidke]

Pramaity Cadiin
Maraifacturing Yoar

Engtine Mo

Lhassis

P airnuim Paweer Chatmt
e Markel Walue:

Ot iptiesd Hopasirallon Diate
First Regictratian Date
Trarvsfer Copmnt

Artual ARF Paid

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligllslity

PARE Eligilsatity Expity Dode:

FARF Falaate A

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Erpiry Diate:

COE Categney

COE Peer loeli Years)

3P Pkt

COHE Relaate fumount

Tatal Rebate Amount

Thir infoe ination contaimsd Dereinis correct as 21 30 Jan 2019

Ok

Singapors MIRIC
4RRSD

SL51256G

3 1)

Ak ban FOYF

BMW

FIOLNLED HAY HUD SR
Hlack

21
AR T IBAANI0N
WHATECQUPNG 25220
THROEW (254 Bhp)
£72.535.00

3 Sep 2014

0 Sep 2014

1

$102,563,00

=
T S W2
a9 1.00

i Sep H024
E-Open Category
10k

fhs BRe00
361400
$120.534.00
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Mew Coars

Lised BMW 730 Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMarl

Losgine S g
Sell My Car [irectory Products Insurance Articles Farum
o Lpahhchf/ Y DE-car pooling seme:
s Volksersnen Sharan
& Carpark thal only accepl cashoard (with chip)
Post an Advertisement ) ARWINT

Sed it yoursel! Achvertise it ot just

$58 until it's SOLD!

i

Helive L Auitomcbee

Resources

el Al Mo lisatr Ladilin Wy of Daelirig
Browse by Caleguey v Sort by Date Posted ¥ || 20 resultsfpage Y
h wehicl BMW 730 B’
Model Frice Legrecintan Eng Cagy Mileags el Ty
Search Selection BMW a0 fuy 20146 My Ay iy Availahbe
na— BMW 7 Series 7300 Sunroaf $215, 600 $23,220 fyi 5 Jul- 2016 1,908 o 13,500 ki Ly Airiilatsbis
A || Fromation 1L9E% Interest Rse! 5 Years PML Warranty, Fully Maintained By PML. Nice Bamber Mate, Pristing Wide Paintwoik With Pash Black Leatles
Interion, Expect BMWS Premium Quatty Finishes In Thi...
CPREWLW D

Fos

Ao foom Enlorpnse Ple L

s Ale-Fowy 2014 Tag h, [ TEE, Doy 7300 B

BMW 7 Secles 7300 Sunraaf £330, 0490 424 1000 fyi M-Meve- 2006 1008 oo 02 000 km Ly

| Ut Agent Warranty! Immacuilate Condition! Sgorty Brown Extericr And Besge Lnterson! Présminem Gramedd L Ponts Check, Flesible Dmancing
Package And Trade In. Phease SMS Or Call Mohile For Yiewdng, .,

Prommivn Aosoweabile:

BMW 7 Seres FI0L Sanrao] $229.BOD £24,140 fyr 29- - 16 L95 ex 19,138 kmi Ly

Latest Certitied Pre-awned BMW GL2730L In The Markel. The Epitome OfF Lusury And Driving Dynarmecs Clad Ly Sapphae Black with Dakota Can
Bege Interor, Saft Doar Clasing, BMW Comdort Access, View An,.,
Peskleds 0 Mty T00A

S RN AT WG Davud TARH, PAAY 75

BMW ¥ Senes 7001 Sunmofl 248,800 $26,400 jfyr 21-Aug-216 1,958 o L IO ko Lagiary

Latesl 1.2 Moded, | Owner, 1008 Accldent Free, Linw Mileage Done B4008m Anmasally, 3 Years Or 1000 Warranty By PML Mator, Sporty Black In
Codour, Conditan Like New, Please Call For Viewing And Frau, ..

Hn Lung Aulo P1e Lid

BMW lunches the all new 7 Sernes
Thie mens BIFWY T Senies Sets 0wt IS 1all @s the ultimate vehichs Tor lusurioss driving pleasare with more technologecal adeancements.

Rl Hiis artich

BMW 7 Series 730LI Sunianl T 1B BHE 425500 i 21-0t- 2016 1,598 cc 26,000 km |uiwiary
Full Agent Sesviced, Gonuine Mieage, Latest Model RMW G12/7300, Owner Consignment. Stoictly By Appalnitment, Call Now,
Pzt P 1 Vit B A, MO1E Divee 2300, HMW 0L b 230k, B, 500 fiy s D104
L thitk sl crtetb, 1o g el skerts shereer a metcl i fouad
Madel iy [iepreciation iy Caps Miliage Vet Typa
virwdd ads FI

https ithwww sqoarman . comiused cars/isting php?MOD=BMW-+ 730EPRC=08DEP=0&RGD=201 68 VEH=0&ML =2
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HHM s

Performance Motors Limited

Ry Gf the Sime Darty group

' Beeg, Moo 19TA0155%H GET Meg. NO HI-0DI0GEEL-X

104, Abexandra Hoad SO0, Kamgong Arang Foad

Gime Darby Berformance Cent e EasC Coast Centre

Singapore 19954 ) FAvsgapnes  VRTRD

Tel B340 [Gales & Amnini TEl GALY0BEE (ATEETSALER)
31503111 Imtierdales) s BILAGTTE

GST REG. HO

1%, Alwsardon Nood
Sime Darby Busisens Centie
gingapore 155544

Tel, G31PQSIE (AfEwrfaio
BITU0%I2/E30 iMotorrad)

Fax., &47 96801 {AtterSales)
AT Mot orrad)

M2 - 0020081 - X

01 FEB 201
ESTIMATE
e '
Eetimate HNo. : bl 494972 Page Noa. ¢ 1 of 7
Date Estimated : 31/01/20149
| Prepared By : Kevin Leong Wai Kit J
- 3
- ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR - = ACCOUNT - 84
Young Woo Cheng QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
38 Duches=a Avenue 1l Raffles Quay
#29-10 South Tower
Singapore 048583
Singapore 269110 §
REGHN. NO. CHASS5IS NO. REGH. DATE MODEL MILEAGE
SLE125G G245220 30/09/2016 730Li 4]
DESCRIFTION _ VALIE
To replace frl bumper, bonnet, suppor, reinforcement, both L, B.800.00
frt side panels, both chassis support, both fog lights, air
ducts, ar flaps and all attachments cause by accident.
Painting on frt bumper, bonnet | bath trt side panel & LH 7TL0] 4.779.00
A pillar
To replace radiator assembly, fan housing with fan including FI" v :IJ () 82600
o conduct pressure tesl, bleed bleed cooling system and check
for leak.
) ity
To replace charge air cooler including conduet checks for {' Lt 85 { 531.00
leak and proper function,
l'o replace air con condenser and air con hose including to (1Y 1,003.00
vacuum system, lop up freon gas and check for leak.
To mount accident vehicle on celette bench to facilitate b _'. 2.950 00
re-alignment of body/chassis according to BMW specification !
To replace front dashboard panel and conduct checks for G+ 79700
proper function
LKK Auto Cansultants hence notify
T'o check electrical winng systems at the front section the Repairer of the following: | = 177.00
far proper function * To resurvey beloralafier spray painting
* To display damaqed pari(s) during resurvey
To replace left & right headlight * Pants puces are subject 1o confirmation 1 HJ a62.00
= Third party survay s on a “Without Prejudice” basis
- il e ) .
To replace both front seat bells and tensioners including o lhegal modiic 0n(s) s allowed ht‘r i 531.00
resel and checks for proper function * Supplemertary temis) muest be and
. B subject 1o lnal approval from Insurancs Company
To replace both rear seat bells and lansioners Acknow!edged by Repairer = | s31.00
including resel and checks for proper functions. PR
To replace front dashboard passenger air bag including o= 4 > | 531.00

resel and checks for proper function

_—




Performance Motors Limited

. & mepber of bhe Sime Darby TN I @
Fieg 19740155 9K ST Reg. Ho M2-RO2U0HL-¥
T e
Einqapdr 15404 1 ".|.‘|I}Ilj‘|rl:|lt :| 'I.I::h o [EN LTSS T
TR RTINS, R les : EILFULIN/EI0 [MHotsrradh
E3150111  (KPrerSalend Fan. B4T566HI] TRETEr Gales
Fad. Gayein BYTHR LR IR G rad b
GST REG. HNO M2 - 0020081 - X
ESTIMATE
[ Eetimate BMNo. * bl 499'}'2 Page Hao. 2 of 7
Estimated : 31/01/2019
| Prepared By : Kevin Leong Wai Kit
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DESCE]PTLON MALUR
To replace fronl seal crash-active head restraint 45 r 531.00
air bags including reset and conduct check for function,
To replace roof lop headlining and both ITS head air bags ﬁ."l % 1.018.00
including resel and checks for proper function
To replace steenng wheel and air bag including reset and 451 53100
checks air bag syslem for proper function
To carry out body cavity preservation, foal 118.00
(Per panel) Bonnet
fod
To carry out body cavity preservation. ¢ bl 2P0 236.00
(Both panel) Frt RH & LH side panel FH b
AT
Ta supply front emboss number plate. B3.00
To tow accident vehicle to PML workshop ~ 18500
Sundries, / 150.00
Total Labouar 23.280.00
DESCRTIPTION Q7Y PRI VALUE
Screw 10 1.85 718.50
BLIND RIVET 2 155 310
Hex bolt 4 10.90 ' 4360
HEX BOLT MBXT7S 2 105 ! 810
ISA SCREW MABX 100 4 345 13.80
RADIATOR 1 103265 7 1,032.65
COVER TOP 1 74 95 7495
COVERING LOWER 1 74495 74495
COVERING RH 1 4650 4G50
COVERING LH 1 46.50 46 50
RADIATOR 1 1,147 40 1,147 .40
HOSE RADIATOR TRANMISSION OIL COOLE 1 100,10 710010
FAN HOUSING WITH FAN 1 144685 1,446 85
LH ENGIME HOOD HINGE 1 9275 L
RH ENGINE HOOD HINGE 1 92 75 L9275
FRT LH SIDE PANEL ALUMINILIM 1 1.292.756 b~ 1,2892.745
FRT BEH SIDE PANEL ALUMINILINM 1 129275 R 1,292.75
FRT LH SIDE FPANEL BRACKET 2 1 325 adi 7 34 25
FRT RH SIDE PANEL BRACKET 2 1 3425 £ 3425
FRT SIDE PANEL BRACKET 3 2 57.05 7 11410
ALUMINILIM BONNET 1 301285 bt~ 201285
SET MOUNTS PDC SENSOR FRT 1 G8.00 g~ _EEJ.G'JU J
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REGN. NO. CHASSIS NO. REGHN. DATE MODEL MILEAGE
SL5125G G245220 30/09/2016 T30L4i 0
> =
LESCRIPTION OTY PRIU VALUE
FRT BUMPER BOTTOM CARRIER 1 461,60 b —461.60
VERTICAL CONNECTION LH | 19,40 ~ 18,40
VERTICAL CONNECTION RH 1 10,40 T 1940
GUIDE TOP LH 1 30.35 T 3p.as
GUIDE TOP RH 1 30.35 1 30.35
ADAPTER LH 1 77.00 ' 77.00
ADAPTER RH i 77.00 1 77.00
LH SUPPORT FOG LAMP 1 61.90 As B1.90
RH SUPPORT FOG LAMP 1 51.90 A-761.90
IMPACT ABSORBER TOP 1 84 45 o 7 B4.45
FRT BOTTOM IMPACT ABSORBER 1 70 45 i =70 45
FRT BUMPER CARRIER 1 839 .25 Bt ~8an 25
LH PROTECTIVE STRIP BOTTOM 1 53.25 At =" 5395
RH PROTECTIVE STRIP BOTTOM 1 53.25 Ai~ 5325
PROTECTIVE STRIF TOP LH 1 86.40 A~ AB.40
PROTECTIVE STRIP TOP RH ! 86 .40 & < B6.40
BUMPER GUARD CENTRE 1 81.05 4 -B1.08
DAMPER KERB DESCENT P 5.25 i -—10.50
FRT BUMPER PANEL PRIMED (PDC/PMA) 1 157170 A 167170
FRT BUMPER TOWING LUG COVER PRIMED 1 5710 wih =BT 10
LICENGE PLATE BASE 1 70.65 de 70,65
GRILLE AIR INLET MIDDLE (PURE EXCEL 1 B1.45 Ay~ 81,45
GRILLE AIR INLET LH (PURE EXCELLENC 1 8510 847 8510
GRILLE AIR INLET RH (PURE EXCELLENC 1 85.10 8510
LH TRIM AIR DUCT SIDE PANEL 1 5460 7 5460
TRIM GRILLE I-CAM 1 21.70 - 21,70
FRT LH GRILLE (PFURE EXCELLENCE) 1 232.30 1723230
FRT RH GRILLE {PURE EXCELLENCE) 1 290.35 “T7 20035
AR FLAPS TOP 1 330 50 733050
EMBLEM GROMMET 2 0 80 == 160
BMW EMBLEM 1 71.25 Wt =725
LOCK LH | 120.05 T 12005
LOCK RH i 120.05 12005
HEADLINING LIFT UP & SLIDE BACK SUN 1 1.974.10 M A 974 10
INSTRUMENT PANEL (SCHWARZICOGNAC) 1 427305 W4 273.05
COMNECTION REAR TOR 1 147 .55 T 14755
COMMECTION FRT TOP 1 252.05 252,05
AR DUCT BOTTOM 1 3900 7 39.00
LH HEADLIGHT MOUNTING 1 121.20 112120
RH HEADLIGHT MOUNTING 1 121.20 " 12120
CROSSLINK FRONT 1 220.55 © 22055
SUPPORT FRONT PANEL 1 109.95 109.95
¥ STRUT 1 27 45 27.45
FRT LH WHEEL ARCH COVER FRT SECTION 1 144 05 At~ 144 05
FRT RH WHEEL ARCH COVER FRT SECTION 1 144 .05 /144,05
COVER BULB REPLACEMENT 2 10.30 72060
RH TRIM AIR DUCT SIDE PANEL 1 54,60 T 5480
COVERING CROSS MEMBER (ECE) 1 3350 7 3380
g __AIR DUCT RADIATOR TOP 1 61.60 B1.60 )
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REGH. HO. CHASSIS NO. REGH. DATE MODEL MI1LEAGE
SLS12EG G245220 30/08/2016 T30L1 0 )
DESCRELET LM J T PRIC VALUE
AR DUCT RADIATOR BOTTOM 1 61.50 7 6150
LH LOCK PANEL 1 29.00 29.00
LH LOCK PANEL 1 20.00 2900
LH COVER BOTTOM 1 55.95 , 5585
RH COVER BOTTOM 1 R O5 _ G505
SEAL ENGIME HOOD FRT 1 79.25 7025
BOMMET SIDE LH GASKET 1 33.70 1 3370
BONNET SIDE RH GASKET 1 3370 1 33,70
SEALING SIDE PANEL LH 1 5945 '_' 59.45
SEALING SIDE PANEL RH 1 50.45 T 5045
COVER OF CENTRE ENGINE COMPARTMENT 1 a1.00 1 91.00
COVER OF CENTRE ENGINE COMPARTMENT 1 91.00 ' 91.00
(DG) REPAIR KIT CRASH ACTIVE HEAD R 2 163.80 wel o 327.80
LH HEADLIGHT LED AHL HIGH {(1ICOM LIG 1 584760 wa— 5,847 60
RH HEADLIGHT LED AHL HIGH (ICON LIG 1 584760 i~4 <5 B47 60
LED MODULE TURN INDICATOR 1 T8E6.65 T TBE.G5
*LED MODULE DAYTIME DRIVING LIGHTS 2 22810 cvd~458 20
CONTROL UNIT FRT LIGHT ELECTRONICS 2 BG3 00 " 1,787.80
LH FOG LAMP LED 1 459 .65 : 459 65
RH FOG LAMP LED 1 459.65 _ 45065
ULTRASONIC SENSOR BLACK 3 24870 74610
ULTRASONIC SENSOR BLACK 1 248.70 248,70
DECOUPING RING PDC TORQUE CONVERTER 2 5.05 wh = 10.10
DECOUPING RING PDC TORQUE CONVERTER 4 5.05 | He-720.20
(DG) FRT LH UPPER BELT (SCHWARZ) 1 101945 T 1.019.45
(DG) FRT RH UPFER BELT (SCHWARZ) 1 1,01945 wil 1.019.45
RR SAFETY BELT UPPER STRAP (SCHWARZ 2 38635 aut= F72.70
(DG) HEAD AIRBAG LH 1 699.05 ail - 69995
(DG) HEAD AIRBAG RH 1 699,95 st 69085
(DG) AIR BAG MODULE FOR PASSENGER 5 1 1,399.85 a4 399 B5
'otal Parts 46,522.40
2 1AQ 'lh",rw. ,;}:A-
okl e N
" J‘*‘TH"*’"‘ E&L A
1L I
il YL - LiEhan
RV Labour 1 23,280.00 |
- Parts 46,522.40
. L: M Labour 2 0.00
Ja '-J.J“]l“"" 0 Moo e Excess 0.00
2 O luga Total Q8T @ 7% 4.886.17
3
(\ i Grand Total 74,688.57

** THIS ESTIMATE 15 VALID FOR A PERIOD OF 30 DAYS ONLY™
** PRICE FOR PARTS ARE SUBJECTED TO CHANGE WITHOUT PRIOR NOTICE **



