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L Your Ref; CCAMINB001T20/KksY

Our ref; LTPO12018/010 (SKC T176 J)

( WITHOUT PREJUDICE |

Atwntion To : MR ZAINI I ouaems LK Ajite © smvasdains P | )
irvrance Company : INOLA INTERMATIONAL INCURANCE PTE LTD

Oar BliiMidm,
1N THE MATTER OF ACCIDENT INWOLVING SKCT1TE) & SHETEID ON 22812018
VW rater fo the sbove matter.

We are instructed snd suthorissd by our clienl e quantity, 1o sct and negolisis setliement
iy relatedt Lo Lhe abowve road Ualfic sccident thel was Caused by your nsured.

Al gupponing documenis sre snclosed herewith:-

[ t ] Aiithserizabion Te A=t [ & ] Ovigined Tas wwesce na. INVIIE
I ]viging Pesisl Racet and Agresmant [ ] LTA psrch recens
[ ]isne: Of Dischargs [ 1

Swwey wan done by bmsurence instroction and was surveped by Mr Kenneih
on 18 -Jan-18

As a resull of 1he scoadenl, our cheni's vehicle was damaged and has been pul la loss and
Eaxpenses, pariiculsrs of which sre s loliows:-

1] Coeut of mepair [inclugive of 7' GST) S 1.712.00
2] Loss of Use & 5150.00 x 3 Days $ 450.00
5 2,162.00

Plesse acknowledge recelpt of 1his letter within 14 days. |f you agreeabis to Ihe above, please forward
ynufmml'lymﬂlhh“ﬂuﬂﬂfhﬂﬂﬂﬂﬂiﬂmmuﬂwﬂnlﬂl.m

11 WITHOUT PH

P! L CRI00ART 7. . J w100 ng



To Whom It May Concern

AUTHORIZATION TOACT

I/'We, SPACE ATELIER PTE LTD ("the third party Claimant”) of 6 HARPER ROAD
#0507, LEONG HUAT BUILDING SINGAPORE 369674 (Address) Owner of
SKC71764 (vehicle number) hereby authorize LIM TAN MOTOR FTE LTD ('the
workshop') to act for me with respect 1o my/our claim for repair costs and/or rental
und/or Loss of use ("claim’) for my/our vehicle number SKC7176J that was damaged
pursuant 1o the nccident which occurred on 20-Jan-18 (date)Along KOEK ROAD
(locate on) invoiving velicle number SHES73D (the accident').

1/We further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned clnim
in a manner that they deem fit and the workshop is Turther aulhorized to receive
Payment further to settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made In
favour of the workshop,

Dated this 0 _(day ) of January (month) 2018 (year)

o

Signed By * the third party claimant * Signed By ' the workshop'
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SPACE ATELIER PTELTD TAX INVOICE
& HAPTER ROAL
#0507 LEDNG HUAT BUILDING N0 s INVI2A6
SINGAMORE 160694
RATE | Dl 7= 201 R
ATTN ¢ MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT MILEAGE .
1L . W.O NG - S033 TERMS : CASH
FAX . CAR KO, SKCTIT8)
ACND  © 050Ess MAKE : HMW PAGE 3
- MODEL iig e .
DESCRIFTION B ooy LPRICE  DIS  AMOUN]
I TOLUMP SUM REPAIR AS RECOMMENDED RY SURVEYOR I UNIT 1,600.00
Bl AR DOLLANY DA THOLSAND SEVEN HLMINUED ANt TWELYE OHLY
W RAAILES _mn.' U ACTHWENT Him.';l-u =5 TOTAL m;' ot | SLIRTOTAL | oot O3
[T
R DISCOUNT B 1101
’ TOTAL | 400 00
GST 7% 11300
= ,"' NIET L7
/ L Ieponit 0.00
x Balance B LTI

AUTHORISED mmawumt{ CUSTOMER NAMY | SIGNA TURE / DATE

Ir\\':mﬂmIhlWlhunﬂlhnﬂlrmmﬂuuﬁﬂnhnrnrhirwmmnpﬂmm

declare the repair fur The shuve vehicle huve been cumpleted 1o myour satisfacthon



‘ Jt_ax Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Sundari Nagarajan - Il <sundari@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 1 February 2019 11:15 AM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAUto)

Cc: Admin A; C5 A Team

Subject: RE: TP / MCT18010618: (TP SKC 7176J) ON 20,01.2018 / Ill SH 6753D
Dear Sir

We refer to your email below. We agree to settleTP Claim up to 51,006/-
Best Regards,
Sundari Nagarajan

DID: 63476071

From: Joy Irene (LKKAute) [mailto:loylrene@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 1 February, 2019 11:01 AM

To: Sundari Nagarajan - lll <sundari@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TP / MCT18010618: (TP SKC 7176)) ON 20.01.2018 J I 5H 753D

PODS - Express Settlements
Dear Sundari,
We advise our recommendation as follows:

(a) Liability : 50%
(b} Quantum :
COR : $ 856.00
LOU : § 150.00(5100 x 3days)
Total : § 1,006.00
Veh Model : BMW 2979cc
(c) Remarks : Surveyor recommend 3 days

Please revert with your approval on quantum.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841-2409 | emall: Jovirene @|kkauto.com [Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email s intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
infarmation.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this emall in error) please notify the sender

1



T p. 45
L LIM TAN MOTOR

Date:  21-Feb-18 Your Ref: CCa/MI18001726/Kksa

Our ref: LTPO12018/010 (SKC 7176 J)

{ WITHOUT PREJUDICE )

Altention To : MR ZAINI [From LKK Aulo Consullanls Pte L)
Insurance Company ; INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD

Dear SirffMdm,
IN THE MATTER OF ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKCT178J & SHETS3ID ON 20.01.2018
We refer (o the above matier.

We are instructed and suthorised by our client to quantify, to act and negotiate settlement
in related to the above road traffic accident that was caused by your msured,

All suppaorting documents are enclosed herewith:-

[ x ] Authorization To Act [ x ] Original Tax Invoice no. INV32464
[ ] original Rental Receipt and Agresmant [ ] LTA search receipt
[ ] Letter Of Discharge [ 1

Survey was done by Insurance instruction and was surveyed by Mr Kenneth
on 0-Jan-18

As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle was damaged and has been put to loss and
Expenses, particulars of which are as follows:-

1] Cost of repair (inclusive of 7% GST) $ 1,712.00
2] Loss of Use @ 5$150.00 x 3 Days L 450.00
5 2,162.00

Please acknowledge receipt of this letter within 14 days. If you agreeable to the above, please forward
your payment. Payment to be issued directly to LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD within 4 weeks. Should there

be any injury related to this matter, any settlement agreed Is WITHOUT PREJUDICE to the related injury
claim.

Your faithfully
Mandy Lim
Email: mandyi@itim.sq

Tel 6564520890 F = 4550 www LTM sg




To Whom It May Concern

AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

1/'We, SPACE ATELIER PTE LTD ('the third party Claimant’) of 6 HARPER ROAD
#05-07, LEONG HUAT BUILDING SINGAPORE 369674 (Address) Owner of
SKC7176J (vehicle number) hereby authorize LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD ('the

workshop') to act for me with respect to my/our claim for repair costs and/or rental

and/or Loss of use ("claim') for my/our vehicle number SKCT7176J that was damaged
pursuant to the accident which occurred on 20-Jan-18 (date)Along KOEK ROAD

(locate on) involving vehicle number SH6573D (the accident').

1/'We further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim
in a manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive
Payment further to settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made In

favour of the workshop.

Dated this 1) (day ) of January {month) 2018 (year)

,p
\
|f 2
\+

S

n

r,--J

Signed By ' the third party claimant ' Signed By ' the workshop’



INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTT LTD

o% [vou
INTI L fieg Mo PIUTRATHIN | UST Neg, Mo M2-00T BRFL
RRATIONAL
il | Uit Street | ®04 | 905 | #0507 | 308 Building | Singapore 045711
IM’!UWH (Mfire (65) GEATHRI0N  Emal  pneuredracomag
IO arpal Pan  (RE)BI244174 Wielnile wwullLommsg

iy B s S | W

EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

lll-Direct Settlement (PODS)

India Ref: MCT18010618

Claimant Ref: SKC 7176J

wayn, LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD. ("the warkshog”) hersby confirm thet well have rsached an agresment
with the appainted Survayor of India Inlemational Insurance Ple Lid _LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD __ (name
of Surveyor) with respect 10 the amount claimed for 58 856.00  (repsir coet) §8_150.00  jiosaof
useiren, S5 (smarch fee), vehicle no SKC T176J that was damaged pursuant Io the aceident which occurmad
on 20.01.2018 _ (date) st KOEK ROAD (location) invelving venicle noSH 87530 (104, req

vehicla). This s pursuant to the imepection conducted on 30.01.3018  (date) af “the workshop®

Wall confirm that we!l are‘am authorzed by Iha owner SPACE ATELIER PTE LTD {“the thid party
claimant’) of vehicle noSrC 7 178y, rake the ciaim as set out in the sbove paragraph and wed) have full authority 1o ssitie
tha matior on hisiher behall in a manner that wa/l deam fit Wall anclose herein the letter of authority given by "the third
party claimant”

Well further confirm that we/l will indemnify India intemationsl Insursnce Pla Lid for all damages, loss andlor expense that
they will or hive siready imcumed in the event thal “ine third party clsimant® afier the above said agreement lodges a
further claim against the former for any loss and expenses suffered partaining to cost of repairs andior mntal andior loss
of use pursuant lo the damage 10SKC T178J (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

Wall confirm that the agreemeni reached above is in full and final settisment of all daims of “the thid party claimant
pursuant to the accident and thal further this setflement is mached on & withou! pmjudice and without admission of liability

basis

This agreemant & subjsct 1o the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive junediction over any
dispute arising oul of the sama.

Wafl authorize youlo pay the total amountefss_1,006.00 » LIM TAN MOTCR PTE. LTD.

Dated this 1o day of . FeBIUANY

:;T JL L __________________

WITNESS:
Eignature % L
Signed by "Ihe workshop” (wi Signed by appoinied Surveyor
Nima: LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD Nama LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
NRIC 1 asau?zfm NRIC: 189807198R
PO BLK 176 SIN MING DRIVE Addrass: §1 UBI AVENUE 1 #01.26
#03-09 SE 575721 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK (5) 408933
Nationality B Nationality:




LV

Branch

i Wy s Peelormanes ) [N 9 Soctar © 00 -J8M40042
S Ming Inchustrial Estate, Singapore ST5644

Tel +6S 6452 2135 Faxe: 4065 6452 2159

BRIk 17 Sector A #01-68
Sin Ming Industnal Estate, Singapore 575675

LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD
HEBREERLAFIRLS

Coonpamy s B g Wi 99000 P IT

LR Mo iainmmss B Rl 000 s

Ak OTice ( Workabugp

Al | Ter Sim Ming Divvve 80305 100
Sin Ming Autocare Saingapore 375721

Tel 108 6432 OR93 (24Hrs)

Fax: +65 6458 9127
Email: sles@ifl TW sp

WWW.LTM.SG

SPACE ATELIER PTELTD
6 HAPPER ROAD

TAX INVOICE

#0507 LEONG HHUAT BUILDING
SINGAPORE 3169674 N INVI2404
J DATE 10-02-210)
ATTN = MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT MILEAGE - i
I'El W.0 NO, S0O33136 TERMS - CASH
FAX CAR NO. : SKC7176)
AICNO.  : 30S0/568 MAKE - BMW PAGE
MODEL  : 535l
DESCRIPTION Ty LL.PRICE RIS AMOLUNT
I TO LUMP 5UM REPAIR AS RECOMMENDED BY SURVEYOR I UNIT 1.600.00
SINGAPCHE DHLLARS @ ONE THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED AND TWELVE ONLY
REMARKS! DATE OF ACCIDENT 2001 2018 TOTAL OTY, 1. q "
WEF- SH6TS3D J SUBTOTAL 1.600.00
DISCOUNT 0.00
TOTAL 1,600.00
GST 7 % 112,00
NET |, 712,00
\-.'“‘I ../ /L \/ Deposit 0.00
AUTHORISED SIGNATURE(S CUSTOMER NAME / SIGNATURE / DATE Lonance 1,712.00

I/We confirm that I/We incurred the repair costs herein and will observe my/our Agreement with the repairer. 'We
declare the repair for the above vehicle have been completed to my/our satisfaction



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

..«CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settiemeant

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING [ . ]
_ Case | Norified | 5t Supmien At Assignea Auj lp-: JAd) 5unrrr-l't[nd [l Auth'ed Status = |
27jan 2018 |27 Jan 2018 ;: J;B" 2015 €$1,600.00  S%1,600.00 Pending for Survey
Main 11:48 : Report
__._.Is"mlmm.on B AdjRpt | | ES Estimates | | view v | Cmencae |

Clalm Detalls

tLA.'I.'H SUBFOLDER DETAILS

Insured: | COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. A Rlu No.: 199303821R
SPACE ATELIER PTE LTD, Co. Reg No.: 20140750406

Vehicls Rag. I 20/01/2018 16:00 - 58
Moz LA b |;n Months and 24 Days From LTA Rieg Date {Man Yrj]

Claim Type: TP / MCT18010618 { Palicy/Caver |Mcomoors

—_—] | Note No.:
| Wehicke Reg. |F:|II|:\|- N
Mo . | SHETS3ID | (Claimant): A BOAS03690MX
(Insured): |
! |Excess- |
Regairer: | Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd (HQ) &lk 176 Sin Ming Drive #03-0%/10, Sin Ming Auto Care, 575721 Sin Ming - Tel: 6452 0893
::..':::‘1 | India International Insurance Pie Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 ... [Handled by Sundari Nagarajan - 6347 6071]
Claimants

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: «65 BBZ7 7888
/LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd {ﬂ) - Tak: ﬂs&-]ﬂl ... |Final Rpt due 07/02/2019]

| CHEW ENG THIAM {} , NRIC: S08366081 Emal!

view All_| _ Compose Case Mail | |
o [11_SG (23/02/201B): Adert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - SKC7176] - Claim Handler: Sundarl Magara... l

e [11_5G (D&/02/2018): Alart - Adj Mandate Approved ($$0.00) - SKC7176) - Clalm Handler: Sundari Nagara...

|MLISHCIMI—DHIKIE view M| | SearchTasks | Creats New Task -] Complete |

Due Date Priority Type  Tesk Group Subject  Handler Assigned Dy Completed On Created On Done?
NO results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 25/2/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2

Claim Documents

SKC7176) (MCT1B8010618)
[SHE753D]
TP
SPACE ATELIER PTE LTD
Jan 20 2018 4:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd

Upload Documants | Uplasd Photos | Cormpone tew Letter | o View [View in Brewser [ =]
Videe o 1perpage  [v]| BA
[Na_|Finalized On tndia International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - [ Thumbnall | Print
1 106/02/18 09117 | Vides - Accidant - B O | Load me

rrme——r—— ' D  [peree 1 M
No_[Fiaized On LmTanMotorPtated (WQ) Thumbnail| Print|
L 27/0118 11:48 | Repairer Estimates @ | Lasa HTM

Photos/images oerpage ] M |
fio |Relobel/Reorder | LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnall | Print
1_[3004/1817:53 |GeneraiView = — © | Lost¥s | B2
2 30/04/1817:53 | Genersl View O  aws | B
3 [30/14/1817:53 | General View 0 | weaws | A
4 3004181753 | Genersl View 0 | waws | A
5 30/04/1817:53 | General View gmdrﬁ M
6 30/0418 17153 | Genaral View - 0 Ly | @
7 3004181753 General View QO ilsaiws | A
g Eaumms 17:53 | General View 0D adwc | A
] :qfwm:;rn General View D s | A
(10 30/04/18 17:53 | Ganaral View © | waews |
11 30/0418 1753 | General View . - O wceaws | =2
12 30/04/18 17:53 Genaral View 0| wedwe | & |
13 30/04/1817:53 | Genaral View - O s | B
rl.il'.u:.ll'l'h:l'll:sﬂinll'l = Lper page E g__.
‘Mo [Finalized On [ India :nlmnlmﬂlmumﬂ.m{nq; Thurmilrerall | Print |

1 29/01/1806:37  Singapore Accident Statement -
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

(1 .nmmntn: TP GIA REPORT S
f2 unrs.rwm 1103 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED

3 [0I/05/1813:54 | REJECTION EMAIL

25/01/1% 16:47 | WORKSHOP INVOICE

AT IR AUTHORTSATION TOACY FORM

"
5
6 | 25/02/19 16:47 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER
7 lzw/02/1916:47  [LOD

i
i

ecesces ©
1
)

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reses | Save | print J]

Theere &r# N0 document checkhsts confligured, |

| |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 25/2/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 0f 2

Our Chechlist - d 1

Show Remarks To: [ Repairer [ Handiing Insurer

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 25/2/2019



Adjuster Report Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico reg o 1sss07198m

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Indusirial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@lkkauto com;assignments@Iikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC4/11118001726/KJB30Q2-\

Data: 25/02/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer India International Insurance Pte Lid Palicy Nao: MCOMODD15
ﬁ':'_“""‘* Vehicle oyc71780 insured Vehicle No: SHE753D
Date of Loss: 2000172018 MNalture of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT18010618
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SKCT176J
Make & Model: BMW 5351, 3.0 GRAN TURISMO [A) Engine No: 17937755N55B30A
Reg. Dale: 2709/2011 (Man. Year: 2011) Chassis No: WBASN22070C 194234
Colour: Metallic Grey Ddometer: 52148 km
Engine Capacily. 2878 cc
Markel Value/New Car Price: NIA
Sum Insured (S$): Marketl Valus/New Car Price
NDITION OF VEHI AT TH ] = H
General Condition: Stearing (Serviceable). Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla): Yas Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition,
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 245/40Z R20 Rear Tyre Size 275/35Z R20
Front Left Side: Falken 8 mm Rear Laft Side: Falken 8 mm
Front Right Side: Falken 8 mm Rear Right Side: Falken 8 mm
The shove valles reprasani the remaning fyre tresds geplh
COST OF CLAIMS _ Repairer's  Adjuster’'s  Difference  Diff %
Parts 1.800.00 1.200.00 600,00 b fic x|
Miscellaneous llems 10.00 10.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 410.00 360,00 50.00 12.20
Paintwork Labour 500.00 440,00 60.00 12.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (5§) 2,720.00 2,010.00 710.00 26.10
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 1,600.00
(S8) 2.720.00 1.600.00 1,120.00 41.18
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%5) 190.40 112.00 78.40 41.18
Nett Amount (S8} 2,910.40 1,712.00 1,198.40 41.18
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x 5$100.00/day) (S$) 300,00
(55) 2,012.00
Liable Amount (50.00%) [S5) 1.006.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment 20/01/2018 Present Location: Lim Tan Motor Ple Ltd (HQ)
Date Inspected 30/01/2018 Inspected At Lim Tan Motar Ple Ltd (HQ)

Bik 176 Sin Ming Drive #03-08/10, Sin

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 25/2/2019



Adjuster Repont Page 2 of 4

Ming Auto Care
Singapore 575721
Estimated Pearod of Repair: 3.0 days
Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Joy lrene Bascao

NOTE This report mpresants our Bndings al the Kme and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has boen carmed ouf o the bast of owr
knowfedge and ability buf any ofher labiity under any olther circumstances i herelly sxpressiy saciuded
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MEM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 03 May 2018)

Parts: 143 BMW 5351 3.0 GRAN TURISMO (A) (Catalogue:Menmen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominaled Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitied, no print-code for SKC7178J)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page [

numbers wilh the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
Fuﬂh!r Info: tems/values not in reference catalogue are prefived with an nﬂuﬂnk bs'

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo.  Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *N/S REAR SPORT RIM Dented 1,200.00FS *1,200.00FS
2 9 *N/S REAR TYRE Nol Necessary BOO.DOFS “FS
F=Franchiss part S=Spchat,
Total Parts (SS) 1,800.00 1,200.00
Repor was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
25/212019
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

Ne Qty Particulars Repairer's Amount

Miscellaneous llems

1 1 OD/TP Case (Insurer) 10.00 10.00
Sub Total (S$) 10.00 10.00

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Paintwork Labour

1 TOPUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING. Mew 50000 440.00

Labour ltems

2 TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT. New &0.00 60.00

3 LABOUR CHARGES. Mew 350.00 300.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 910.00 800.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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