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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta’vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBefore...

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type:
Owner |D:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended
Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:
Maximum Power
Output:

Open Market Value:
Original Registration
Date:

First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:

Singapore NRIC
0890H

FN6130Z
Mo
07 Feb 20179

HOMNDA
CB400SFHV M
Blue

2004
NC23E2062624
NC391052613

$8,470.00
28 May 2004

28 May 2004
1
$1,271.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry
Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Mo

$0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

31 Mar 2024
D - Motorcycle
10

$2.474.00
$1,273.00
$1,273.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 07 Feb 2019

1of |

OK

/22019, 10:07 AM



<> HKL LIM

LA TEAM MOTORSPORT

FNB130Z

1 LAMPSTAY
2 METER ASSY
3 FRONT FORK ASSY LH / RH
4 FRONT FORK UNDER BRACKET
5 STEERING COME BEARING
6 FRONT FORK TOP CRAM
7 BODY FRAME ALIGNMENT
8 FRONT FENDER
9 FRONT WHEEL RIM
10 FRONT WHEEL SHALF
11 FRONT WHEEL BEARING 2PCS
12 FRONT WHEEL BEARING OIL SEAL 2PCS
13 FRONT BRAKE DISC LH / RH
14 HEAD COWLING + SPRAY
15 FRONT SIGNALS LH / RH
16 U UNIT
17 1U UNIT BRACKET
18 HANDLE BAR
19 HANDLE BAR GRIP
20 HAMDLE BAR BALANCER [MOTOVATION)
21 BRAKE LEVER
22 HEADLIGHT ASSY
23 HEADLIGHT BRACKET LH / RH
‘124 BRAKE PEDAL
25 REAR FOOT REST RH
« 26 REAR FOOT REST BRACKET RH
27 EXHAUST HEADER + GASKET
28 EXHAUST MUFFLER (YOSHIMURA TITANIUM BLUE)
29 EXHAUST INSPECTION
30 FRAME GUARD
31 TOP BOX
32 TOP BOX BRACKET
33 RADIATOR
34 RADIATOR GUARD
35 COOLANT WATER
36 SIDE PANEL LH/RH
37 TOWING
38 LABOUR

Blk 1008 #01-24, Bukit Merah Lane 3, Singapore 159722  Tel: 6275 6656, 5275 6566, 62727292 Fax: 6272 9281
Email: support@hkiimmotorspor.com.sq  Websita: www.hidimmotorsport.com.sg

$150.00 P —
f?
$950.00

$1,800.00 6 &~

$450.00 £~
$120.00 A&~
s180.00 bt —
$650.00 B
$220.0084 —
$680.00 7
$12000 7
$50.00 1
$30.007
$1,200.00 1
$180.00 Qun
5160.00%
$170.00 & %
$30.00 %
$185.0057
$20.00 ¥ V4
s12000 el
$45.00 2(—
$350.00 2
$160.00 7
5120.004
$70.00 fr>—
$250.00 K ¥
¢850.00 17—
$1,200.00 o/i/—
$82.00 7
$150.00 #f—
$550.00 vz~
$160.00
$720.00 H(—
5120.00 < by —
$45.00 AL, —
5120.00 A ™MA
540,00 .~
$750.00 450 .



TOTAL

$13,247.00 ¢

Tacdbin THISHH

L

w7

{ l'g I[ﬁ 2 "H'S(’w

Um 7

iy T

Quv g U,LI.LW fihe=

é*zgy

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify

the Repairer of the following:

= To resuriey before/atter spray painting

» Todiseiay samaged pans) during resuney

* Parts prices ara subject fo confirmation

® Third party survey is o a “Withoul Prejudica” basis
* Noilizgal rmod fication(s) is allowsd

® Suppis 30 lem|s) must be resurveyed angd
B sutoach 1o final approval from Insurance Company

Acknow'piized by Repairer
Signat: +a:

Data:




Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: HKL Lim Team Motorsport <hkllimteam@gmail. com=

Sent: Thursday, 31 January, 2019 2:13 FM

To: 5G AXA Insurance SM AXA 5GP - Motor Survey

Subject: FMNB1307 / SJZ5876B on 09/12/2018

Attachments: FN6130Z 10,jpg; FN6130Z 3 ,jpg; FN6130Z 9.jpg; FN6130Z 2.jpg; FN6130Z 1,jpg;

FN6130Z 4.jpg; FN6130Z 5,jpg; FN6130Z 8.jpg; FN6130Z 7.jpg; FN6130Z 6.jpg

Categories: Mateen

Hi to whom it may concern,

Do arrange surveyor for this case.

Thank You,

Best Regards

James Lim ( Keong )
Tel:+65 9242 3895

BLK 1008 #01-24 Bukit Merah Lane 3, Singapore 159722
Tel:+65 6275-6656, 6275-6566 Fax: 6272-9291



113172019 Claim Portal

LK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) - Menu

<« Service Request Details

Claim
S58MO16H8

Reference

None ¢
Loss Date 310004 Q LH";?M

December 9, 2018 .
ﬂhﬁmwg} W 0

Request Date
January 31, 2019

Due Date
February 11, 2019

Vendor Name
LEK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

Type of Loss
Third Party Vehicle Damage

Services
Pending verification - Direct Settlement

Actions

Next Step
Agree to perform service

Decline Wark " A Ve

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
FNA130Z

Make
TEVD HONDA

https:/ivp smartclaims axa com sgiclaim-portal/tmi/index-vendor-service-requests. himi#service-requesis/?serviceRequestNumber=06666 12



1312019 Claim Portal

LKE AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTER (TP) - Flem

2ErnvVICce AQAress

Primary Contact/Insured

LOW JIA JUN
APT BLK 759 YISHUN STREET 72, #12-306, 760759, Singapore

INSURANCE@DICKSONINSURANCE.COM.SG

Claim Handler
AMG Richard

richard.anghs@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions

viessages Invoices Histary Documents Assessment Metrics Notes

https:/'vp . smariclaims.axa.com_sg/claim-portal htmlindex-vendor-service-requests. himl#/service-requesis/?service ReguestNumber=0B6664 22



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 22 February 2019 2:43 PM
To: "HKL Lim Team Motorsport’
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: EN6130Z / SJZ58768 on 09/12/2018 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19002135/T 1fa3
Importance: High
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS
Our Ref: CC4/ASM19002135/T1fa3
Your Ref: FN 61302

Dear James,
We refer to the above matter.

Thank you for furnishing witness statement.

Please be informed that we unable commit any Liability as we are still in the midst of engaging our Insured
due to our Insured disputing the Liability and counter claim against your client.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our
Ol we will revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal

assistance until you heard further from us.

In order to justify your client’s claim smoothly and promptly, we appreciate if you could kindly furnish us a
copy of Traffic Police Investigation Result for our necessary action(if you have).

SKETCH PLAN
A R
an ‘;.—1'-_"*.'_? | H I‘I
NN RENARENEN paENa 'I]_f.}_'Li ‘[
S OO T T o e T
T e e A
HEEREENRERD [ = SERR.E 2 4 EEREE
reppr e R AR
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I T PR SSERNNEAEAARNENEREED
Lo T REENERRNEBEENENREEE

L e e o S e P Y B VR SO O |
DEECR!EE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

Peter Polia &Imm_f




Brief Details.
On 9/12/18 at about 1850hrs, | was driving along Pasir Panjang Drive right turning into a carpark infront of
Pasir Panjang Terminal Building 3. As it was heavy rain, | checked my nppouﬁeh-t:glracﬂon anrg: was clear

for me to proceed forward. | then continue make ht tum, suddenly a m j
right sicle of my driver door. my ig y a motorcycle collided into the

| stopped my car_inmediatuly and exited my vehicle to help the said motorcycle rider to the nearest
shelter before shifting my car into the sald carpark. | then asked my colleague who happen to pass by the
area to call for the ambulance and subsequently the rider was then conveyed by the ambulance. After the
rider was send off by the ambulance, traffic police gave me a call to request me to go back to the accident
area. | then met up with the traffic police and was given a case card which require me to lodge a traffic
aocﬂ:ant report. The collision caused my vehicle damage on the right side skirt, side mirror, rear fender
and right door. The collision also caused the motorcycle suspension to be damaged. On 10/12/18, | woke
up and felt pain on my neck and shoulder so therefore | then went to seek for medical aashtanm.'I was
then given 3 days of MC from 10/12/2018 to 12/12/2018.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement,

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(40 8933)

324
P e Gae the Sardke i M& ke AECESSITY”

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you

From: HKL Lim Team Motorsport [mailto:hkllimteam@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 22 February 2019 1:34 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FN6130Z / $JZ5876B on 09/12/2018 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19002135/T1fa3

Hi Poh Kin

Do refer to the witness statement attached and let us know the liability

Thank You.



~ Best Regards

James Lim ( Keong )
Tel+65 9242 3895

&SHKL

Lim Team Motorsport 533473468

BLK 1008 #01-24 Bukit Merah Lane 3, Singapore 159722
Tel:+65 6275-6656, 6275-6566 Fax: 6272-9291



ATUTORY DECLARATION

I, MOHAMED YASIN BIN OMAR NRIC No: S7833667F , Address : Blk 748C
Bedok Reservoir Crescent #01-41 Singapore 473748, do solemnly affirm and say as follows :-

1. On 9® December 2018 at about 6.50 pm, [ was walking near the pathway across
Harbour Drive Road near PSA Pasir Panjang Terminal. [ saw a motorcyclist riding
motoreycle No FN 6130Z riding on the right lane towards my direction. Out of 2
sudden, I saw a black car No SJZ 5876B suddenly made a right tum from the left
lane without signalling. [ saw the motorcyclist was not able to stop in time and hit
the black car. On that evening, it was raining heavily.

2, After the accident, I ran towards the motorcyclist who was lying on the road. Two
other males came to help the motarcyclist. I recognised the two male persons as my
colleagues. They also helped the motoreyclist to the side of the road.

: The three of us helped to push the motorcycle to the side of the road. The black car
turned right and parked away far away from the accident area. The car driver
walked towards us. The car driver kept saying “my fault, my fault”. I asked for the
car driver’s driving licence and identity card. The car driver refused to give me.

4, The car driver repeated that he was at fault. I could not stay any longer as I needed
to report for work. [ took a photograph of the accident location and the parked
motorcyelist.

5. After that, I told the motorcyclist my name and my working place ie PSA. I also gave

him my handphone no. I told him to contact me as [ needed to leave for work. It
was then I realised that the motorcyclist was working for PSA as well. At that time, I
do not really know the motorcyclist even though we both work at PSA. [ annex a
copy of the photograph which [ took marked "A”.



And 1 make this solemn declaration by virtue of the provisions of the Oaths and
Declarations Act 2000, and subject 10 the penalties provided by that Act for the
making of false statements in statutory declarations, conscientiously helieving the

sratements contained in this declaration to be true n every particular.

MOHAMED YASIN BIN OMAR ) %‘f

Declared before me at Singapore this |Gt dayof ‘fﬁ‘quj 2019

A Commissioner for Oaths
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This is the exhibit marked “A”
referred to in the Statutory Declaration of

MOHAMED YASIN BIN OMAR declared
this 15" day of January 2019.
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S1UBTAVE 1 #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62364313

22™ February 2019

LOW JIA JUN

Block 759 Yishun Street 72,
#12-306,

Singapore 760759.

Dear SirfMadam,

OUR REF : CC4/ASM190021356/T1fa3
YOUR REF :SJZ 5876B
ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJZ 5876B AND FN 6130Z ON 09.12.2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Lid to deal with the third party claim
against your policy.

We have received a claim from M/s HKL LIM TEAM MOTORSPORT, acting on behalf of
the owner of FN 61302 against your motor insurance policy.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable
settlement with third party claimant.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the
claim against your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according
to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your
own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the
following to pohkin@Ikkauto com within 7 days from the date of this letter_if not provided
at AXA's reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further document may
be required:

« Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence
and status (if any)

Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)
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AdE RA R Ple Lid

51

V U Auto

- Consulianfs

UBI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBIINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563361 FAX : (063 h2564315

« If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third
Party(s), you are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the
status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with
any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or
settlement without AXA’s prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised
driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6841 2132 or email us
at pohkin@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more
effectively.

Yours sincerely,

[/

Foh Kirt-£hong
Case Handler
DID: 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108
Email: pohkin@|kkauto.com

c.c. AXA Insurance Ple Lid (AXA)
{Motor Claims Dept)



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: HKL Lim Team Motorsport <hkllimteam@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 July 2018 7:37 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: FNG130Z / SJZ5876B on 09/12/2018 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19002135/T1fa3
Attachments: FN6130Z 1.jpa; FNE130Z 2jpg

Categories: clear

Hi Poh Kin

Please find attached PI DV and give offer

On Wed, Jul 17, 2019 at 6:33 PM HKL Lim Team Motorsport <hkllimteam(@gmail.com=> wrote:
HI Poh Kin

May i know any liability update , because my client said his pi claim get 100%

On Fri, Feb 22, 2019 at 2:42 PM Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.com> wrote:
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS
Our Ref: CC4/ASM19002135/T1fa3
Your Ref: FMN 61302

Dear James,

We refer to the above matter.
Thank you for furnishing witness statement.

Please be informed that we unable commit any Liability as we are still in the midst of engaging our
Insured due to our Insured disputing the Liability and counter claim against your client.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with
our Ol we will revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for
legal assistance until you heard further from us.

In order to justify your client’s claim smoothly and promptly, we appreciate if you could kindly furnish us
a copy of Traffic Police Investigation Result for our necessary action(if you have).




CATHERINE LIM LLC

¥ ADVOCATES & SOLICITORS

2 NOTARY PUBLIC -4 GFE P

¥ COMMISSIONER FOR OATHS- ¥ B Fr

e

Bf CATHERINE C.L.LIM

fi DIRECTOR
LLB [HONS) SINGAPORE-EE i -1l
MLBLA. [BUSINESS LAW)- i d: §-50 +

Our Reft CL/190124/T/EX .sc

5 July 2019

Mr Muhammad Firdaus Bin Azmi
Blk 840 Jurong West St 81
#03-109

Singapore 640840

Dear Sir

20 Havelock Road $03-01
Central Square Singapcre 055765
UEN & GST Reg No. 201310922K

Telk: {65} 6438 5500

Fax: (65) 6438 0111
wiww_catherinalimiic.com

Email: info@catherinelimiic.com
CATHERINE LIM LLC & a law
corporation with limited liability

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YOURSELF (INJURED)/FN 6130Z/SJZ 5876B ON 9.12.18

We refer to your acceptance dated 29.6.19.

We enclose the discharge voucher for your signature and mail back to us with the enclosed stamp affixed
envelope. You may get anyone above 21 years of age to be 4 witness to your signature.

As agreed you will get back $4,575.25 for your

injury claims excluding our legal cost and disbursements.

The third party insurers will also pay for our legal cost inclusive of GST at $2,336.50 and disbursements
incurred by us at $88.25 and agreed by us. The total sum in the discharge voucher includes our legal cost

and disbursements,

Thank you.

Y@ﬁithﬁlﬂy

Enc.



M redefining /insurance

CLAIM REF SBMO16HEMC/DOM
DISCH.
We/l Muhammad Firdaus Bin Az'mi , NRIC/FIN NO:
_S4303601 hereby agree to accept the sum of
Seven Thousand Only { S$7.000.00 4

paid to us/me by AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD as full and final settlement of all claims of whatever kind
including damages for personal injuries and damages to property and all costs and expenses that
we/l have and/or may have against the said AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD or their Insured or the driver

of motor wehide no. SIZSB76B  , as a result of an accident at ALONG
Harbour Drive on __ 9122018  of which we/l were/was the

hirer/owner/driver/rider/pillion/Passenger of motor vehicle no, FN 81302 .

We/l hereby declare that the said insurer or owner and/or driver of insured vehicle shall not be
liable for all claim(s) whatsoever and whosoever present or future that we/l have and/or may have
against the said Insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SJZ 58768  |n connection directly or
indirectly with the said accident and give our/my full and final discharge.

We/l hereby declare that we/l are/am the personis) antitled to receive the above settlement and
hereby undertake to indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or to be made In
respect of this settlement,

It Is understood and agreed that payment herein is made without admission of liability whatsoever
on the part of the said insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SJZ 58768 |

Dated this day of 2019

Claimant’s Signature

NRIC no./ Company Stamp

Decupation/ Business

Address

Telephone No.

Witness's Name

Witness's Signature

Witness’s NRIC No.

AXA Insurance Pie Lid (Compsny Reg. No. 199903512M)

E Sheriton Way. #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapors OGB811

Customer Centre #B1-01

Tel: +65 65660 4888 Fax: +85 6338 2522 Wabshe: www.oxa.com.sg



8232018 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PFTE LTD(TF] =

<« Pls reject TP's claim

Type
@ Question

Message
Their driver was charged for careless driving. Pls upload your tax invoice for the services rendered. Thank

3

You,

https:/ivp.smartclaims.axa.com.sglclaim-poralfhtmiindex-vendar-servicerequests htmi# service-requestsiview-message/TserviceRequestNumbe... 11



Cecilia Chnnﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 23 August 2019 3:08 PM

To: HKL Lim Team Motorsport

Subject: YOUR REF; FN 6130Z (OUR REF: CC4/ASM19002135/T1ga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SJZ 5876B & FN 6130Z ON 09/12/2078 ***

Attachments: Ol PIR.jpeg; Ol GIA REPORT.pdf

Your Ref: FN 61302 Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/ASM19002135/T1ga3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJZ 58764B & FN 6130Z ON 09/12/2018
We refer to the above matter.

Attached is a copy of our insured Police Investigation Result and accident statement for your easy reference.
We have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that our driver is not liable for the accident. Your client is
charged for being careless driving.

In view of the above, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable to look into your client's
matter.

Thank you.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice engagement
should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related claims.”

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

- . e

SeSRER SN Save the Larth Friné only when necessary



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref . CC4/ASM19002135/T1gal3s2

B SHENTON WAY #24-01 :

AXA TOWERSINGAPORE 068811 Deke JOR-0e-2e0 ” “““”“NM"“ |‘|
ATTN: RICHARD ANG Code : ASM

1; Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. 5JZ 58788 Veh. Inspected FMN 61302
Policy No. GA42512891 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. S8M016H8 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From RICHARD ANG Assign Date 3110112019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA CB400 c.C 399
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2004
Chassis No. NC391052613 Colour BLUE
Odometer . Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [120/60 R17 PIRELLI 5mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre [160/60 R17 PIRELLI 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUATAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION AND O/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  08/12/2018 Inspection Date 01/02/2019
Survey held at HKL LIM TEAM MOTORSPORT
BLK 1008
#01-24 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3
SINGAPORE 159722,
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|EETIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 6 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Ad BE B 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 188607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Fage Mo.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. FN 61302
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | - b {{l} $)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|LAMPSTAY (CONSISTENT) BENT 150.00 150.00
1|METER ASSY (CONSISTENT) * CHECK 950.00 -
2|FRONT FORK ASSY LH / RH (CONSISTENT) BENT 1,800.00 1,800.00
1|FRONT FORK UNDER BRACKET (CONSISTENT) BENT 450.00 450.00
1|STEERING CONE BEARING (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 120.00 120.00
1|FRONT FORK TOP CRAM (CONSISTENT) BENT 180.00 180.00
1|FRONT FENDER (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 220.00 220.00
1|FRONT WHEEL RIM (CONSISTENT) * CHECK 680.00 2
1|FRONT WHEEL SHALF (CONSISTENT) * CHECK 120.00 !
2|FRONT WHEEL BEARING (CONSISTENT) * CHECK 50.00 -
2|FRONT WHEEL BEARING OIL SEALS (CONSISTENT) * CHECK 30,00 .
2|FRONT BRAKE DISC LH / RH (CONSISTENT) * CHECK 1,200.00 -
1|HEAD COWLING + SPRAY (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 180.00 180.00
2|FRONT SIGNALS LH / RH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 160.00 :
11U UNIT (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 170.00 .
11U UNIT BRACKET (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 30.00 ;
1|HANDLE BAR (CONSISTENT) BENT 185.00 185.00
1|HANDLE BAR GRIP (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
1|HANDLE BAR BALANCER (MOTOVATION) (CONSISTENT) |CUT 120.00 120.00
1|BRAKE LEVER (CONSISTENT) BENT 45.00 45.00
1|HEADLIGHT ASSY (CONSISTENT) cuT 350.00 350,00
2|HEADLIGHT BRACKET LH / RH (CONSISTENT) * CHECK 160.00 5
1|BRAKE PEDAL (CONSISTENT) E)B%EUPRAIR SEE 120.00 2
1|REAR FOOT REST RH (CONSISTENT) BROKEN 70.00 70.00
1|REAR FOOT REST BRACKET RH (CONSISTENT) ‘[EB%EUPF?IR SEE 250.00 -
1|EXHAUST HEADER + GASKET (CONSISTENT) BENT 850.00 850.00
1|EXHAUST MUFFLER (YOSHIMURA TITANIUM BLUE) DENTED 1,200.00 1,200.00
(CONSISTENT)

1|EXHAUST INSPECTION (CONSISTENT) * CHECK 82,00 ;
1|FRAME GUARD (CONSISTENT) DENTED 150,00 150.00

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18002135/T1ga3s2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bdis BE B 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607188-R Page Mo.:2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | v Chop {;}1 {sj}
1|TOP BOX (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 550.00 550.00
1|TOP BOX BERACKET (CONSISTENT) * CHECK 180.00 -
1|RADIATOR (CONSISTENT) BENT 720.00 720.00
1|RADIATOR GUARD (CONSISTENT) MISSING 120.00 120.00
1|COOLANT WATER (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 4500 45.00
2|SIDE PAMEL LH/ RH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 120.00
11.807.00 7.505.00
LABOUR
BODY FRAME ALIGNMENT. B650.00 380.00
TOWING. 40.00 40.00
LABOUR. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF BRAKE PEDAL 750.00 450.00
AND REAR FOOT REST BRACKET RH
1,440.00 B70.00
GRAND TOTAL 13,247.00 8,375.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 6,700.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
(REPAIR COST NOT CONCLUDE)
(EXCLUDE CHECK ITEMS $$2,700.00 NETT)

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM19002135/T1ga3s2

M_

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

EHU’);I\ﬂ

HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made salely for the use and bensfit of the Cllent namad on the front page of this Repert.




