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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 31 January 2019 3:48 PM

To: Admin A

Subject: RE: PROGRESSIVE/TP/SKM 5207 P(GBE2324C - EQ)/DOA 28.01.2019/EST $12357.00  

Attachments: SKM5207P.PDF; GBE2324C.PDF

Dear LKK 

 

Attached both accident reports for your attention. 

 

Best Regards,  

 

Joel Goh  

Executive | Claims 

  

  
EQ Insurance Company Limited  
 

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110  

did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190 

www.eqinsurance.com.sg         
  

   
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender i
 

 

 

From: Joel Goh  
Sent: Thursday, January 31, 2019 3:46 PM 
To: 'Claims' 
Cc: Janet Tan; Admin A 
Subject: RE: PROGRESSIVE/TP/SKM 5207 P(GBE2324C - EQ)/DOA 28.01.2019/EST $12357.00  

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Lily 

 

We welcome direct settlement and will appoint LKK to take over this matter. 

 

Dear LKK 

 

Please assist on this direct settlement. 

Claim officer: Janet. 

 

Best Regards,  

 

Joel Goh  
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Executive | Claims 

  

  
EQ Insurance Company Limited  
 

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110  

did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190 

www.eqinsurance.com.sg         
  

   
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender i
 

 

 

From: Lily [mailto:bhlim@procarcare.com.sg] On Behalf Of Claims 
Sent: Thursday, January 31, 2019 2:45 PM 
To: EQI PRS 
Cc: Joel Goh; Janet Tan; Claims 
Subject: FW: PROGRESSIVE/TP/SKM 5207 P(GBE 2324 C)/DOA 28.01.2019/EST $12357.00  
Importance: High 

 

Dear Sirs 

 

URGENT 

 

Please refer to our email below and advise. 

 

Thank you 

 

Regards, 

 

Lily LIM 

Claims Advisory 

Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd 

Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716 

T: +65 6741 5336  |  F: +65 6741 7208 

E: claims@procarcare.com.sg  

W: www.procarcare.com.sg  

 

 
 

*With effect from 1 Sep 2018, Progressive Automotive Pte Ltd has been rebranded as Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd. You 

may now reach us at our new email addresses (@procarcare.com.sg). We look forward to your continued support. 

 

From: Peiwen On Behalf Of Claims 
Sent: Tuesday, 29 January, 2019 9:45 AM 
To: 'eqiprs@eqinsurance.com.sg' 
Cc: Lily; Soo Leong Keat 
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Subject: PROGRESSIVE/TP/SKM 5207 P(GBE 2324 C)/DOA 28.01.2019/EST $12357.00 
Importance: High 

 

Hi Sir, 

 

Please refer to the attached and arrange survey. 

 

Vehicle is IN workshop. 

 

Thank You. 

 

Regards, 

 

Pei Wen NG 

Claims Advisory 

Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd 

Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 01-45/46 Singapore 408716 

T: +65 6741 5336  |  F: +65 6741 7208 

E: claims@procarcare.com.sg  

W: www.procarcare.com.sg  

 

 
 

*With effect from 1 Sep 2018, Progressive Automotive Pte Ltd has been rebranded as Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd. You 

may now reach us at our new email addresses (@procarcare.com.sg). We look forward to your continued support. 

 


