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2112019 Adjuster Immediats Advica
' Note: This document has not been finalised.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregne 1essor198r)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Emall: sur@Ikkauto.com;assignmentsi@ikkauto.com

Ta: AlG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
AIG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-28
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408833
Attr: Date: 01 Feb 2019
Preliminary Advice
Vahicle No : SGJB33EG Accident Date . 26/01/2018
Make s AUDI A4 Palicy No. : 1800117367
Assignmeni Date - 01/02/2019 Excess . 550.00
Date of Inspection  : 31/01/2019 Est, Duration of Repair :5.00
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UB1)
55 UBI ROAD 1
SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact | General Description of Damages
The vehicie sustained impact / damages front o/s portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 88 17,747.00
Revisaed Amount 55 11,654.00
Check ltems (Estimated) 55 500.00
Total 55 12,154.00
Lump Sum Repair 'S8

Total Loss Consideration

MNew for Old Value 5§

Pre-Accident Value 'S8 158,000.00
COE / PARF Rebats 5% 59, 364,00
Salvage Value 535

Margin for Repair 5§ 88,636.00

Remarks

{ X} The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly
let us have your authorisation,

{ ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be rapaired, you are advised 10 invile tender for the wreck.

{ ) Other commants

hitps:/isingapore merimen.com/claims/index cfm ?fusebox=SVCdocAfuseaction=dsp_viewersmart&docid=39680874&preview=1&nolayout=14CF1...
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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 May 2019 2:30 PM

To: Boo seng yak: SUR; Carrine Leong; jiayee yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee
Sing

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SGJ6336G - OD AIG - SURVEYED 31 JAN 19

Dear Mr Boo,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm final fig $9,790.80 before excess $1,600.00 & GST and 5 repair days.

Kindly expedite the discharge voucher and tax invoice to us for close case.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sipwse@kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrinl Park. Ubi Avenue 1. #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, B April 2019 8:29 AM

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@Ikkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@Ikkauto.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; Jlayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg;
Chang Chee Sing <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SGJ6336G - OD AIG - SURVEYED 31 JAN 19

Hi Adrian and all,

Revised attached.

Please confirm repair cost of 49790.80 @ 5 days of repairs.

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Best regards - jb



Shiau Chan SLKKAuto] '

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 11 February 2019 5:30 PM
To: ‘Claims Dept’; SUR

Subject: RE: OD claim for SGJ 6336 G

Dear Kelvin,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SG) 6336G (Excess $1,600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection,

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Shinu Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3501 | email; siewse@ kkuto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, 202-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims Dept <claims@ premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 1 February 2019 9:35 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims Dept’ <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD claim for 5GJ 6336 G

Dear Shiau Chan,
Kindly assist for approval.
Thank You.

Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd ey s i)
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 4086599
p. +65 6388 7323 d.-65 6768 9511 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims w._wwvw . audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audl Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. <65 636 2223
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
9150B

SGJ6336G

No

01Feb 2019

AUDI

A4 SEDAN 2.0 TFSISTRONIC (NAV)
Grey

2018

CVKO063151
WAUZZZF47]A180419
140.0 kW (187 bhp)
$33.419.00

04 Oct 2018

04 Oct 2018

0

$38,787.00

Yes
03 Oct 2028
$29,090.00

03 Oct 2028

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

$31,301.00

$30,274.00

$59,364.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 01 Feb 2019

OK
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SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT MOTICE

. Pisasa ropar I;urrm:llx iha deinils of tha acciderd o spssd wp the caims orocess

2 This Form must be completed by the Policyholder andior tha Authonsed Drver

A inlormabion proveded must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Aoy wilful msrepressntalion o witholding af matensl Lacts may alfow INSursnce SempRnies o

rEpuchate policy Illltnill'.'y

4 Tha issus and scoopiancs of thil Form by meurancs companma & nol an admistaon of policy lasslity on ihe gart of the iInsuranca compaEnies

5 Ay falss reporting may be referred to the Police for imvestigation

B. This repon will e forwardod Dy ha insemrs of the GIA Records h‘,mﬂgun:nrll Conra esmndishad by 1he Ganersl insurancg hssocinpon of SMapaTe (k) Toar
grohesing and ihal copies of this mepon will, lor 8 fee, be made available upoen applcation by intaresiad pafis
7. By ha iodgament af Mis repor 10 [ Meurers, you hﬂn."l:, Corsgai i e archiving of this mpor 81 the cenire and o copies of e repon Deing mace Ivalabse

mloresaid

Data Of Raport

Date Of Accidant

Exact Location Of Accidamt
Country/State of Loss

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

28/01/2019 11:26

28/01/2019 0B:45

KALLANG WAVE MALL BASEMENT CARPARK
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Nama Of Registared Ownar
HRIC No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Allermative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufaciurer

Mode|

Exact Purpose for which vehicie was being usad al
time of accidant

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicla?

If No, Please state action 1o be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company
Type O Coverage

Fleet Policy

Palicy Mumbar

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Data Of Birth

Ocoupanon

Date Of Driving Pass

Drving Exparience

Gandar

Mobila Number

Fax Mumbar

Contact Numbar

EMail Address

SGJEIIEG

CHEAN EE MENG, PETER
ST8391508
PETERCHEAN@GMAIL.COM
(LOCAL) +85-20056505
HOME-64066484

ALIDI
A4 SEDAN 2.0 TFSI 8w

PRIVATE USE

YES

PRIVATE CAR

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

18001173867

CHEAN EE MENG, PETER
STE391508

23121878

INDOOR

22/10/19498

20 YEARS AND 3 MONTHS
MALE

[LOCAL) +65-80056505

HOME-B4066484
PETERCHEANEZGMAIL.COM

Page 1 of 18



Address 24 LORONG SIGLAP
Poslcoda 456818

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OWMNER

Vehicle Regstration Number of Driver's Cwn
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vahicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accidan! HIT AND RUN / VANDALISM / DAMAGED WHILST PARKED
Weathar Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY
Other Information

Was any loreign vehicle Involved in this accident? NO
Number of vehicles (including own vehicle) 1
invalved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Acciden? MO
Was any Injured conveyed to hospital by

ambulance?

Was any other matenal or property damaged? YES

| have been approachad by unknown person(s)

solicifing/offering accident claims assistance N
Number of Passangers (Including Driver) 0
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reponed to the polica? NO
If Yes Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
if ¥es, against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO POLICE REPORT NO: G/20190127/7012
Attachment(s)

Ara accident pholos availlable for attachment? YES

Was thare any video captured by Car Camera? MO
Was there any audio recorded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Mumbar

Vehicle Make/Modal/Colour LINKNOWN
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Catlegory NA/UNKNOWN

Namae ol Driver

NRIC/Passport Numbser

Contact Number

Address

Posicode

Insurance Company Name

Nature Of Damage

Mo, Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 2 of 10
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REFER TO POLICE REPORT NO

3 sweasone T

POLICE FORCE
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REFER TO POLICE REPORT NO

'5)) siweapore 10 O
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REFER TO POLICE REPORT NO
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CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

AUDI AUTO PROTECTOR PRIVATE VEHICLE

Name of Policyholder  : CHEAN EE MENG PETER Vehicle No. : 5GJB336G
Period of Insurance : 04 Oct 2018 To 03 Oct 2020 Policy No. : 1BO0T17367
Engine No. : CVK DB3151 Endorsement No.  :
Chassis No. : WAUZZZFATJAIB0410 Issued Date : 08 Oct 2018
Make/Modal : AUDI A4 Sedan 2.0 TFSI S tronic
Engine Capacity/Tonnage : 1,984.00 CC Sum Insured - Market Value First Year ol Registration : 2018
Ditiver Restriction : NA Off Peak Car - No Insuring with COE/PARF : Yes
Parson or Classas of Persons Entitled to Drive® .
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b} Any ciher perscr who = Srwing on e Pabicyfolders ander of wem Hisfher pamminsion,
This Polcy will hmﬁ;hlnﬁnymﬂﬁﬁmlmwmrwﬂrlb—w el T epecad ge oo
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VREMY SFivify] EaESErTE

Age Condition All Age Condition

Limitation as o use”
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pumnEEs of wes K ARy PUERCRE i SOPFCRon wan bolor Trde

Loss of Use 1800ce - 2000cc Optional
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Baction 1
Fire - $0 Own Damage - 51600 Thefi - 30 Fiood Cower - 50

| Section 1
Propety Damage - 32

wWinascrean ; §100

Mamed Driver and EXCESS (wem appicabis)
CHEAN EE MENG PETER - 51800 [Dwn Dasnags )
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i N _J

Hire Purchase Company/Employer's Loan: DBS BANK LTD
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CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

AUDI AUTO PROTECTOR PRIVATE VEHICLE

Name of Policyholder  : CHEAN EE MENG PETER Vehicle No. : SGJGIIEG
Period of Insurance : (4 Oct 2018 To 03 Oct 2020 Policy No. : 1800117367
Engine No. : CVK 063151 Endorsemant No. .
Chassis No. : WAUZZZF4TIAIBD418 Issued Date ¢ D9 Oct2018
MakeModel AUDI A4 Sedan 2.0 TFSI S tronic
Engine Capacity/Tonnage - 1,884.00 CC Sum Insured : Market Value First Year of Registration . 2018
Driver Restriction MNA Off Paak Car : No insuring with COE/PARF . Yes
Person or Classes of Parsons Entitled to Drive®

u) Tha Polcyrdaides
b} vy 0BT paTEOn WD & g an e Policyholter'y Shdel of wiih fisfTee peersssion
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Premium Automobiles

55 Ubl Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel - B366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183
Emaill: Nora khal@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate Acciden! Repairs
Workshop Ubi Road 1

Contact No 6366 2323

Fax No 6841 1183
Reference PA/OD/OT131/201897KN
Date 18-Jan-19

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AlG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept

Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name Mr. Peter Chean Ee Meng

Address 24 Lorong Siglap
Singapore 456818

Telephone HP +85 90056505

Type of Claim Own Damage Claims

Policy No. 1800117367

Vehicle No SGJ 6336 G

Model Code Audi A4 SEDAN 2.0 TFS| 8W

Model / Year 41102018

Engine No CVK D63151

Chassis No WALUZZZFATJAIB0419

Mileage

Date In

Liability

Excess Cost .

Estimated By Johnny Boo { Allan Wu

Accident Date 28-Jan-18

Place of Accident

KALLANG WAVE BASEMENT CARPARK



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubl Road 1, Singapore 408609

Tel: 6366 2323 Fax 6841 1183 J
Telefax
Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SGJ 6336 G
Estimated Surveyor's
Sin Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendation
To remove and transfer front wire hamess for B
1 headlights, homs, oulside lemperature sensor, SIN § 480.00

headlight washer assy and front parking aids

To dismanile and renew front bumper, rhs front fender
and rhs headlight. Re-organize crash managementi
companants. Reinstall all parts removed

P
To raspray front bumper and rhs lender
To renew rhs front im and carry oul wheel alignment

To carry out diagnostic check

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES

$ 2.1@}6& [1€0

§ 1_?)0'6.’“"‘3

SIN § 28000 X

SN § 182.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

All charges are nol inclusive of GST
Legend : Remarks (OK)= Approved, Remarks (X) = Nol approved
Spare paris are Special Neil

Telefax
Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SGJ 6336 G
Damaged Parts & Prices
S/N___ Parts Description S/Nett Remark
1 FRONT BUMPER COVER <7 il krd $ 1,989.00 <~
2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS T4 hae 5 258,004
3 FRONT BUMPER SECURING STRIP ML 2s 64.00 &
4  FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT - LOWER cemh;nm 3 191.00 X
§ FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE-RH 15 /- 4 a0
6 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE - RH /%L A s 123.00 &
7  FRONT BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-RH /™ » $ 34,00 ¥
8 FRONT BUMPER FOAM FILLER PIECE &4 = s 113.00 %
9  FRONT BUMPER CARRIER Mo, pas s 733.00%
10 FRONT BUMPER SUPPORT - RH Net - $ 26.00
11 FRONT PARKING SENSOR - FRONT INNER/OUTER _ § 231.00%
12 PARKING SENSOR SEALRING /~© 4 12.00 4
13 FRONT BUMPER WING - RH ?-T.r’ $ 700.00 X
14 FRONT BUMPER ATTACHMENT PARTS § 183.00
15  FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT - RH $ 45.00 L
16 FRONT BUMPER BRACKET - RH A 5 32.00 >
17 FRONT BUMPER BRACE - RH s s 107.00
18 FRONT WHEEL HOUSING LINER-RH [~ =~ s 220,00 &
19 WHEEL HOUSING LINER ATTACHMENT PARTS /% i— -1 82.00 &
20 FRONT BUMPER WHEEL SPOILER /%L o $ 66.00
SUB TOTAL SPARE PARTS : $ 5,275.00



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SGJ 6336 G

Damaged Parts & Prices

SIN  Parts Description S/Nett Remark
21 FRONTSPOILER-RH  plt in $ 3300 X
22 FRONT STONE CHIP GUARD - RH /// file $ 48.00 _-
23  FRONT BUMPER COVER-RH ¥ $ 28.00
24 FRONTFENDER COVER-RH M Ae $ 2100 A
25  LED HEADLIGHT - RH Lok $ 7.087.00 ~
o5  FRONT HEADLIGHT WASHER LIFT CYLINDER - RH “f $ 192.00 +
27  RUBBERVALVE M s 4 S 1300 4
og  FRONT RIM-RH AL A~ TBC X
20 SUNDRIES Net Nee $ 500.00 1

TOTAL SPARE PARTS $  13,195.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 4,552.00
GRAND TOTAL $§ 17,747.00

All charges are not inclusive of GST
Legend : Remarks (OK)= Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved
Spare pars are Special Nett.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date

Excess Cost

Liability :
Remarks :

Please Note

L

Yours faithfully,

1ence nolity
Wing.:
AL ey ey
T
Srejicice” s
athom |
* Gup rrarveyed gd
i Sty Pt gy T iarRnoe Compamy

This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khal at
Tel:6768 9828 for appoiniment.

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo
Body Repair Manager

Allan Wu
Claims Consultant



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubl Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 5366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Email: Nora khal@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Workshop ¢ UbiRoad1

Contact No 1 63862323

Fax No T 6B41 1183
Reference :  PAJODIO131/2018/KN
Date ¥ 18-Jan-18

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building

Singapore 078120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name
Address

Telephone
Type of Claim
Policy No.

Vehicle No

Model Code
Model | Year
Engine No
Chassis No
Mileage

Date In
Liability
Excess Cost
Estimated By
Accident Date
Place of Accident

Mr. Peter Chean Ee Meng
24 Lorong Siglap
Singapore 456818

HP +85 80056505

Own Damaga Claims
18001173867

SGJ 6336 G

Audl A4 SEDAN 2.0 TFSI 8W
4/10/2018

CVK DB3151
WAUZZZIF47JA180419

Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
28-Jan-19
KALLANG WAVE BASEMENT CARPARK



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubl Road 1, Singapore 408809
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax 6841 1183

Telefax
Estim bour Charges for Ac t Vehicle S
Estimated Surveyor's
Sin Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendation
To remove and fransfer front wire harness for
1 headlights, homs, outside temperature sensor, SIN § 480.00 5 480.00
headlight washer assy and front parking aids
To dismantle and renew front bumper, rhs front fender
2 and rhs headlight. Re-organize crash management s 2,100.00 5 750.00
components. Reinstall all parts removed
3 To respray front bumper and rhs fender s 1,500.00 $ 1,100.00
4 To renew rhs front rim and carry oul wheel alignment SN % 280.00
5 To camry out diagnostic chack SN § 182.00 $ 192.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 4,552.00 5 2522.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax
Materia for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SGJ 6336 G
Dama Parts
SIN Parts Description S/Nett Remark
1 FRONT BUMPER COVER $ 189900 § 1,599.20
2  FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS $ 258.00
31 FRONT BUMPER SECURING STRIP 2§ 64.00
4 FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT - LOWER CENTER  § 191.00
§ FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE - RH $ 58.00
6§ FRONT BUMFER AIR GUIDE GRILLE - RH $ 123.00
7  FRONT BUMPER GUIDE SECTION - RH 3 34.00
8 FRONT BUMPER FOAM FILLER PIECE $ 113.00
@ FRONT BUMPER CARRIER $ 733.00
10  FRONT BUMPER SUPPORT - RH $ 26.00
11 FRONT PARKING SENSOR - FRONT INNER/ OUTER $ 231.00
12 PARKING SENSOR SEAL RING 45 12.00
13 FRONT BUMPER WING - RH $ 700.00
14  FRONT BUMPER ATTACHMENT PARTS s 183.00
15  FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT - RH $ 45.00
16  FRONT BUMPER BRACKET - RH $ 3200
17  FRONT BUMPER BRACE - RH $ 107.00
18 FRONT WHEEL HOUSING LINER - RH $ 220.00
18 WHEEL HOUSING LINER ATTACHMENT PARTS $ 82.00
20 FRONT BUMPER WHEEL SPOILER $ 66.00
SUB TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 5,275.00 1 1,599.20

All charges are nol inclusive of GST.

Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Neft.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SGJ 6336 G

Damaged Parts & Pri

SIN  Parts Description S/Nett Remark
c/f 5 1,595.20
21  FRONT SPOILER - RH 5 33.00
22  FRONT STONE CHIP GUARD - RH 3 46.00
23  FRONT BUMPER COVER - RH 5 28.00
24 FRONT FENDER COVER -RH s 21.00
25 LED HEADLIGHT - RH 5 7,087.00 [ 5,669.60
,g  FRONT HEADLIGHT WASHER LIFT CYLINDER - RH $ 182.00
27 RUBBER VALVE 4 S 13.00
28  FRONT RIM - RH TBC
28 SUNDRIES 5 500.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS 5 13,195.00 7 7.268.80
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 4,652.00 $ 2,522.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 17,747.00 _§  9,790.80

All charges ara not inclusive of GST

Legend

Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X} = Nol approved
Spare parts are Special Netl.




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note

Yours faithfully,

This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khal at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo

Body Repair Manager

Allan Wu
Claims Caonsultant



Premium Automobiles

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Norah Khai
78 Shenton Way 6768 9911
#07-16 AIG Building 6841 1183
Singapore 079120 Nora khaif@ premiumauto.com.sg
Attn: Motor Claims Dept Body & Paint Dept
Yr Ref: SGJ 6336 G PA/OD/O1312019/MAS
15 May 2019
Dear Sir,

RE: INSURANCE CLAIM FOR SGJ 6336 G, Audi A4 Sedan 2.0 TFSI

With reference to the above-mentioned vehicle, no. SGJ 6336 G, claimant,
Mr, Chean Ee Meng, Peter, please find the related document per attached.

1. A copy of the Original invoice no. 85013745 - 558,764.16

-

2. A copy of the Discharge Voucher duly signed by client.

Based on the above document, we would appreciaie yvou could expedite the
payment soonest possible,

If vou require any further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me at
6768 9911.

Regards

This is a computer-generated document. No signature is reguired.

Norah Khai
Claims Dept

Encls

AlG - 5G] 6336 G

from

Telephone +65-
Telatax +85-
EMail

Our department
Our Ref

Your Ref

Date

total pages

Premium Automobiles Ple Lit
Showroom

8 Leng Kes Road

Singapore 159080
Telephone (65) 6586 1111
Telefax  (85) 6471 3733

Service & Parts Centres
55 Libi Rd 1

Singapore 408689
Talephene (65) 6338 2323
Talefax (65) 684 11183



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |
...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)
|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Cowé | MNotifeed | Est Submiited | Ad) Adsigned | Ad] Rpt _ Adj Submitted Ins Authled Status
01 feob 2019 01 Feb 2019 5$9,790.80 $$9,790.80 Pending for Survey
Main 14:18 10155 Eit Estimates || Viewmpe | | Report
et aa hpt | | — | Cancel Case |

| CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS
| Insured:

Vehicle Rag. No
.Enum 1'.1; pe

| Repairer:
Hamdiing nsurer;
.M}uﬂ#

Priver/Custndian

| ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

‘s AIG_SG [11/02/2015): Alert - Ad) Mandate Approved (5511654.00) - 56163366 - Clalm Handier: Dally Amii,..
» AIG_SG (11/02/2019): $G16336G / OD / 26/01/2019 / Coverage & Excess update

[=:
ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS

Due Date  Priority  Type
Wo results

_CMEAN EE MENG, PETER, 1D S75391508, Tel: +6590056505, Email: PETERCHEANGGMAIL COM

0D / 544275669956

_Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (UBI) 55 Ubi Rond 1, 408699 Uibi - Te: 67689825/9827/3911 —
ATG Asia Pacific Tnsurance Pte, Ltd. (5G] - Tel: 5-6419-3000 ... [Handied by Daily Amri, Mimi Zarina]
 MimiZarina.DalyAmni@aig.cam

Ple Ltd (HQ) - Tl 6256-1561 ., [Handied by ADRIAN LING] . [ Final Rpt

LEK Auto Consultants
|due 14/02/2019]

Reference Clalm Details

|26/01/2016 08:00 - 58
|3 Manths and 22 Days From LTA
| Reg Date (Man Yri]

_| 1800117357 (Comprehensive) =
S31,600.00

SG16336G | Date of Loss:

Tﬁﬁ'm'mr Note ho.:
Excess

CHEAN EE MENG, PETER (40 / Male), NRIC: STE391508, Tel +B590056505 Email
PETERCHEANBGMAIL COM

ﬁnm |_ _t:mu-tu!ﬂlll I

view all | Sesrch Tasks | Create New Task
Task Group  Subject  Mandier  Assigned By Completed On

| comeiete |
Created On  Done?
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Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*5GJI63366 (54427566995G)

Jan 26 1019 B:45AM
[CHEAN EE MENG, PETER]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd
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7 2105191253 WORKSHOP INVOICE | "Losd PoOF
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Merimen e-Claims Page 2 0f 2

S K | @

Documentation . o B tperpoe = | W

No |Finulized On [Premium Automoblles Pre Ltd (UBT) | Thumbnail| Print

|1 |3001/1911:55 | Shetch Plan O | tsdwc | B
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Documents Checklist
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ice reg o 19ss07158m)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Emall: sur@lkkauto.com assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Ltd. Our File No:  CCHAIG19002107/AQD3NZ
AlG Building, 78 Shenton Way #D8-16
Singapore 079120 Date: 21/05/2019
REFERENCE
Insured/Claimant: CHEAN EE MENG, PETER Policy No: 1800117367
Date of Loss: 28/01/2018 Mature of Claim: 0D Claim No: 5442756690505
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SGJB3I6G
Make & Model: AUDI A4, 2.0 TFSI QU S-TRONIC (A) Engine No: CVKDB3151
Reg. Date: D4/10/2018 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No; WAUZZZF47JA180410
Colour: Black Cdomater: 3618 km
Engine Capacity: 16884 cc
:II: I:rt?t Valua/New Car S$$158,000.00
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 24535 R19 Rear Tyre Size: 245/35 R19
Front Laft Side: Goodyear 6 mm Rear Left Side: Goodyear 6 mm
Front Right Side: Goodyear 6 mm Rear Right Side: Goodyear 6 mm
The abcve values represant the remaning lyre reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Paris 13,195.00 7.268.80 592620 44 91
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labaur 4 552 00 252200 2,030.00 &4 .60
Paintwaork Labaur 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 17,747.00 9,790.80 7,956.20 44 83
- Excess (S$5) 1,600.00 1,600.00 0.00 0.00
(55) 16,147.00 8,190.80 7.956.20 4927
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 1.130.29 57336 556,93 4927
Nett Amount (S§) 17.277.29 8.764.16 8,513.13 49.27
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 01/02/2018
Date Inspectod: 31/01/2018 Inspected At: Pramium Automobiles Ple Lid (UBI)
55 Ubi Road 1
Singapore 408699

Estimated Period of Repair: 50 days

Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: SHIAU CHAN

NOTE: This mpart represents pur findings &t the time and place of inspeciion alaled herein Such inspection hat been carmed out it the best of our
knowisdpe and abiity but any other lnbility under any other circumitances is hersly avpressly sxcluded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty W™  Particulars Condition ~ Repairer's  Amount

1 1 *FRONT BEUMPER COVER Distorted 1,899,00F5*1,500.20FS

2 1 *FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS Nol 258.00FS *-F5
Necessary

3 2 *FRONT BUMPER SECURING STRIP Nol B4 00FS *-FSs
MNecessary

B 1 *FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT - LOWER Mot 191.00FS "-FS

CENTER Necessary

5 1 *FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE - RH Nol 56.00FS "-FS§
Necessary

8 1 *FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE - RH Not 123.00FS *.FS
MNecessary

7 1 *FRONT BUMPER GUIDE SECTION - RH Not 34.00FS *-FS
Mecassary

8 1 *FRONT BUMPER FOAM FILLER PIECE Not 113.00FS *-F5
Mecessary

9 1 *FRONT BUMPER CARRIER Not 733.00FS *-FS
Mecessary

o 1 *FRONT EUMPER SUPPORT - RH Mol 26.00FS *FS
Necessary

11 1 *FRONT PARKING SENSOR - FRONT INNER/OUTER  Not 231.00FS *-FS
MNecessary

12 4 "PARKING SENSOR SEAL RING Not 12.00F8 *-FS
Necessary

13 1 ‘FRONT BUMPER WING - RH Repair T00.00FS *-FS

LL S *FRONT BUMPER ATTACHMENT PARTS Not 183.00FS *-FS
Mecessary

15 1 *FRONT EUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT - RH Not 45.00FS *-F5
Necessary

1B 1 *FRONT EUMPER BRACKET -RH Nol 32.00FS *-FS
Necessary

17 1 *FRONT EUMPER BRACE -RH Not 107 .D0FS *-FS
MNecessary

18 1 *FRONT WHEEL HOUSING LINER - RH Not 220.00Fs *-FS
Mecessary

18 1 “WHEEL HOUSING LINER ATTACHMENT PARTS Not B2.00FS *-FS
Necessary

20 1 ‘FRONT BUMPER WHEEL SPOILER Not 66.00FS *-FS
Necessary

21 1 *FRONT SPOILER - RH Not A3.00FS *-FS
Necessary

2 1 *FRONT STONE CHIP GUARD - RH Not 46.00F5 *FS
MNecessary

3 1 *FRONT BUMPER COVER -RH Not 2B.00FS *FS
Necessary

24 1 *FRONT FENDER COVER - RH Not 21.00FS *-FS
Necessary

25 1 “LED HEADLIGHT - RH Cut 7.087.00FS*5,668.60FS

26 1 *FRONT HEADLIGHT WASHER LIFT CYLINDER - RH Not 192.00FS *-FS
Necessary

27 4 *RUBBER VALVE Nol 13.00FS *Fs
Necessary

28 1 *FRONT RIM - RH (NPA) Not D.00Fs *-FS
MNecessary

28 1 *SUNDRIES Not 500.00FS *-Fs
MNecessary

F=Franchiza parl. S=SpcNatt

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul.
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No. Qty ::" Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

Tolal Parts (S8) 13,195.00  7,268.80

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.
Recommended Labour
Ne Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour llems
1 TO REMOVE AND TRANSFER FRONT WIRE HARNESS Mew 480,00 480,00
FOR HEADLIGHTS, HORNS, OUTSIDE TEMPERATURE
SENSOR, HEADLIGHT WASHER ASSY AND FRONT
PARKING AIDS.
2 TO DISMANTLE AND RENEW FRONT BUMPER, RHS New 2,100.00 750.00
FRONT FENDER AND RHS HEADLIGHT. RE-ORGANIZE
CRASH MANAGEMENT COMPONENTS. REINSTALL ALL
PARTS REMOVED.
a TO RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER AND RHS FRONT. New 1.500.00 1,100.00
4 TO REMEW RHS FRONT RIM AND CARRY OUT WHEEL New 280.00 0.00
ALIGNMENT.
5 TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK. MNew 192.00 182.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 4,552.00 2,522.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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