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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Accounts (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 8 February 2019 9:22 AM

To: 'claims'

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: III Ref:MCT13111113/01/ST; TCS REF: AAD1312-012--Accident involving 

SH8064X & SHB9668J on 29.11.13-request for survey report

Attachments: LKKInv_AC1901081.pdf

Dear Calvin 

 

We’ve completed the survey report for the above. 

 

Attach please find our invoice for your payment of $483.64. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Regards 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Chew Lian | Account Dept  

LKK Auto Consultants 

DID: 6742 9588 | email: account@lkkauto.com | fax: 6844-8805 

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 25 January 2019 9:25 AM 

To: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: claims@transcab.com.sg; 'Accounts (LKKAuto)' <account@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: III Ref:MCT13111113/01/ST; TCS REF: AAD1312-012--Accident involving SH8064X & SHB9668J on 

29.11.13-request for survey report 

 

Dear Sir/Mdm 

 

Please refer to my previous email and above mention case. 

 

May we have an update on the survey report for this case? 

 

Attached GIA report and estimate marking for your reference. 

 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Calvin Er 

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.307 
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*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 

 

 
 
This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If 
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this 
message or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are 
not screened for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet. 

 

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 14 January, 2019 1:22 PM 

To: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: claims@transcab.com.sg 

Subject: RE: III Ref:MCT13111113/01/ST; TCS REF: AAD1312-012--Accident involving SH8064X & SHB9668J on 

29.11.13-request for survey report 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sir/Mdm 

 

This is a pass 2013 case. 

 

We would like to have a copy of the survey report. 

 

Addition information. 

 

Accident involving SHB9668J & SH8064X 

Location TANJONG PAGAR ROAD X LIM TECK KIM ROAD 

DOA 29.11.13 

Manufacturer CHEVROLET 

Model EPICA-2.0 DSL TURBO (A) 
 
Attached GIA report and estimate marking for your reference. 

 

 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Calvin Er 

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.307 

 

*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 

 

 
 
This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If 
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this 
message or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are 
not screened for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet. 

 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111 

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666   Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764  

Website: www.transcab.com.sg 

 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111 

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666   Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764  

Website: www.transcab.com.sg 



3

 

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 18 December, 2018 1:16 PM 

To: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: FW: III Ref:MCT13111113/01/ST; TCS REF: AAD1312-012--Accident involving SH8064X & SHB9668J on 

29.11.13-request for survey report 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sir/Mdm 

 

This is a pass 2013 case. 

 

Could you forward us a copy of the survey report? 

 

Addition information. 

 

Accident involving SHB9668J & SH8064X 

Location TANJONG PAGAR ROAD X LIM TECK KIM ROAD 

DOA 29.11.13 

 

Attached Estimate Marking and GIA report for your perusal. 

 

 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Calvin Er 

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.307 

 

*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 

 

 
 
This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If 
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this 
message or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are 

not screened for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet. 

 

From: calvin.er [mailto:calvin.er@transcab.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 16 November, 2018 9:53 AM 

To: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: claims@transcab.com.sg 

Subject: FW: III Ref:MCT13111113/01/ST; TCS REF: AAD1312-012--Accident involving SH8064X & SHB9668J on 

29.11.13-request for survey report 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111 

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666   Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764  

Website: www.transcab.com.sg 
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Dear Sir/Mdm 

 

This is a pass 2013 case. 

 

Could you forward us a copy of the survey report? 

 

Addition information. 

 

Accident involving SHB9668J & SH8064X 

Location TANJONG PAGAR ROAD X LIM TECK KIM ROAD 

DOA 29.11.13 

 

Attached Est Marking and GIA report for your persual. 

 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Calvin Er 

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.307 

 

*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 

 

 
 
This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If 
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this 
message or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are 
not screened for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet. 

 

From: Pooi Chin Han Daniel [mailto:danielpooi@iii.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 16 November, 2018 9:28 AM 

To: 'calvin.er@transcab.com.sg' <calvin.er@transcab.com.sg> 

Cc: Sundari Nagarajan - III <sundari@iii.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: III Ref:MCT13111113/01/ST; TCS REF: AAD1312-012--Accident involving SH8064X & SHB9668J on 

29.11.13 

 

Without Prejudice save as to cost 

 

Dear Calvin, 

 

We refer to the above accident and your letter dated 5/10/2015 

 

Please forward us your survey report to enable us to review the matter.   In the meanwhile please hold hands. 

 

Daniel Pooi 

Motor Claims Department 

India International Insurance Pte Ltd 
64 Cecil Street  #04-02 IOB Building  

Singapore 049711 

Tel: 6347 6100 Ext 202  Fax: 6224 4174 

 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111 

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666   Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764  

Website: www.transcab.com.sg 
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S&P ‘A-‘ (stable) rated Company 

 

 

 

From: calvin.er [mailto:calvin.er@transcab.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 11 October, 2018 2:40 PM 

To: Motor Claim - III <motorclaim@iii.com.sg> 

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg; 'Ng Wai Yin' 

<waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: III REF: MCT131111130/01/ST; TCS REF: AAD1312-012--Accident involving SH8064X & SHB9668J on 

29.11.13 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Sir/Madam 

 

We are making a claim against the owner of SH 8064X. 

 

May I know any offer to us? 

 

 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Calvin Er 

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.307 

 

*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 

 

 
 
This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If 
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this 
message or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are 
not screened for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet. 

 

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 18 May, 2018 5:29 PM 

To: 'India international' <motorclaim@iii.com.sg> 

Cc: 'JASMINETAN@TRANSCAB.COM.SG' <JASMINETAN@TRANSCAB.COM.SG>; 'claims@transcab.com.sg' 

<claims@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: III REF: MCT131111130/01/ST; TCS REF: AAD1312-012--Accident involving SH8064X & SHB9668J on 

29.11.13 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Sir/Madam 

 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111 

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666   Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764  

Website: www.transcab.com.sg 
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We are making a claim against the owner of SH 8064X. 

 

May I know any offer to us? 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Ng Wai Yin 

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308 

 

*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 
 

 
 
This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If 
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this 
message or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are 
not screened for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet. 

 

 

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, 

disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers 

(located both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, 

including the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, 

handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with 

applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.  

DISCLAIMER: 

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.  

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.  

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached  

you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby  

notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination  

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. 

Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be  

intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.  

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this  

message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission  

or any modification.  

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.  

India International Insurance Pte Ltd.  

Registration No. 198703792-K 

 

 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111 

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666   Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764  

Website: www.transcab.com.sg 
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This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software. 

www.avg.com  

 


