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Congiliants
mdamam Pl Eampany Registration No, 199607138R

31 UBLAVE 1. #02-25 PAYA UBI (NDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408313 TEL : (0651 62363361 FAX : (h3) h2SRAALE

Yourref;  D19000777TMFSH

Our ref: CS/FC19002063/Avd3 Date : 27/2/2019

The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SJM 8898L
We thank you for your instruction on 31/1/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
31/1/2019  at the premises of M/s NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §§11,289.50

Revised Estimate Amount + §$5,200.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check” Items Amount : 5%

Market Value 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value ¢ 5%

Nett Value 1 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
ofs body

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAl PING
B.Eng.AHEDE.MHHTE,AHSAE—A.II.MATN
Licensed Appraiser



MS@FirstCapital

MS First Capital Insurance Limited CoReg Mo 1950000060 CST Rew Mo M2.00016756.9
& Ralfles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (B5) 6222 2311 Fax: (BS) G222 3547

Claims & Moter Underwriting Cept: 36 Roinson Road ¥ 16-01 City House Singapore 062877
Tel: (55) 6507 3848 Fax (R5) 6507 3849
wivri myfirstcapltal.comosg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person,
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
29-01-2019 Our Ref No. D19000777MFSH
29-01-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC8060M Third Party Vehicle. SJMBB98L

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 BLK C #01-43 AUTOBAY @KAKI BUKIT
SUKY| CHONG

67479241/ 0 Fax No. 67417276

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cec : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

NEW HOCK TECK
jon. NIL
MOTOR PTE LTD Attsntion
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
MAY CHUA
IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspaction.

This is a computer generated |etter, no signature required.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 February 2019 11:31 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto); ‘May Chua Hui Chin’; 'CWS Motor Claims
Ce: SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000777MFSH/1, SIM B898L
Attachments: )M 8898L PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SITM 8898L
Date of survey: 31/1/2019
Number of days : 5 days

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

glk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 1 February 2019 2:41 PM

To: 'May Chua Hui Chin' <maychua @msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 'CWS Motor Claims'
<cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000777MFSH/1

Dear May,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SIM 8898L on 31/01/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phaone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauta.com]
Sent: Thursday, 31 January 2019 9:33 AM
To: 'CWS Motar Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assipnments@lkkauto.com>

Ce: "May Chua Hui Chin' €<maychua @msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000777MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 31 January 2015 9:24 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmaotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; May Chua Hui Chin
<maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000777MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.




Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 1 February 2019 2:41 PM

To: ‘May Chua Hui Chin’; 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc: assignments; SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000777TMFSH/N
Dear May,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SIM 8898L on 31/01/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408533)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 31 January 2019 9:33 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'May Chua Hui Chin' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000777MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 31 January 2019 9:24 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; May Chua Hui Chin



<maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D13000777MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.

Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW. avE.com
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Triple Crown Winner of the Premium Dealer Award
Select

s
shopping vouchers with every purchase.

Post an Advertisement Mow 5 Years Coe Renewal Toyota Wish 188 r((i HIN LUNG AT
Sell it yourself| Advertise it at just o B o) 2.8E%P A Lo HoBee Group

%58 until it's SOLD! One Stop Car Hub

Finance, Insurance, Workshop oy
New and Used Cars ﬂ

Search Selection 5 Seried 523 Ay By 010 Any Ay Ay Available

[[] BMW 5 Series 5231 Highline $43,500 $16,160 fyr 21-May-2010 2,497 oc 150,000 km Ly Availabie

Original Gray With Dark Grey Interior, Mon-smoker Owner, Well Maintained Exterior And Interior By Owner, 'With PML Records Available, Accident-free,
Highfine Maodel, Luxirious And Spacious Cabin. For Yo..,

Car Empire Autormobiles Pre Lid

[C] BMW 5 Series 523i 545,888 $22,330 fyr 0&-Jun-2010 1,497 ex - Luseury Available

PML Unit, Excellent Condition, One Of The Bast Maintained And Reliable & Cyfinder Naturally Aspirated Engine 5231 In The Market, Car Has Baen

Regularly Service, D
o 5231, 2000 bemw 533, BN 523, bimwe 5231, BMW, 5231, Used B

r_.-' BMW 5 Series 5230 $41,800 £15,300 fyr 25-Jun-2010 2,497 oo - Lusury Available

Luxurious And Sporty 5231 Executive Sedan, Nice Bidded Flate, Regularly Serviced, Pristine Condition, For That Responsive, Smooth, Quiet, And

Powerful Drive, With Luxurious And Spacious Cabin To Ensur... T

Car Search

[[] BMW 5 Series 523i $42,999 $17,350 jyr 28-Jun-2010 2,497 cc - Lusiury Available

No Gimmicks! Price Negotiable, Low Mileage Done, 100% Beaulifd Condition, Low Deprecialion, Low Interest Rate, Most Worthy Buy, Coll Now For
Viwing,

Plsled: 25-Jur-2018  Tepds 2000 BMW 523, 2010 beive 5330 BMW 5235, b S23), B, 523, Used By

iri h i
GET mu“ 1s your COE expiring? Let us help you renew it!

Getting your COE renewed Is easy, fast and affordable, We'll help you renew your COE and get a loan for it, Get the cheapest loan In town and an
HE\IEWHI. approval in 2 days without effort! Enguire today,
LOAN

D BMW 5 Serles 5231 (New 10-yr  $759,900 47,980 fyr 25=Jun=2010 2,457 oc S0, 000 ke Lumsiury Available
COE)

1 Ownier Only! 100% Genuine Super Low KM Donel Fully Service By PML From Day 1 Till Current To Prove! Just Done Major Service At BBKT Car
Totaky In Very Good Running Conditicn! Engine Super Smooth & G,..

Peoshed: 1 eefilS . Togs: 2000 BMW SEX, 301 b 5 MW S50 bt 520, B, SO, Lsed B

D BMW 5 Serles 5231 (New 10-yr 571,500 $7,140 fyr 30-Jun-2010 2,457 oc 92,000 km Lumury Availabie
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Only $71.5K] Guarantesd Lowest Price BMW 5230 Available, PML Agent Unit, High ARF OF $42,6781 Genuing Low Mileage OF 52K KM Only Zero
Repairs, Sdky Smooth Engine, Zero Vibrations, Just Spent §2,000+T..,

D BMW 5 Series 523§ (New 10-yr  $79,900 $7.,930 fyr 30-Jur- 2010 2497 oc 100,000 krr Luxury Available
COE)

i 1 Owwnaer Omly! Company Expat Director Usage Only! 100% Genuine Super Low KM Dona With Proof To Show! Interior Like Newl Steering Whaes| Like
wonnsree wesrems EW] Engine Block Like New! No Qil Staint Drive Like New! Sup...

Compare [ 4] © eyt ¥ ] 1 W SEN, HIL0 v S200 PMWCSZEI omw 525, BMW, 513, Used BrAW




PARF COE Rebate Enguiry

lof'l

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

WVehicle Owner Particulars
Crwmer 1D Type;

Crmner 10:

Vehicle Details

Viehicle Mo

ehicle to be Exported
Intended Deregistration Date

Wehicle Make:
Wehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year;
Engine No.:

Chassis Mo,

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years}:

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
47521

SIMBREOEL

Mo

29 Jan201%

B

5231 2.5 AT D/AB 2WD 4DR
GAS/D NAV SR

Black

2010
05257443N52B25AF
WEAFP32050C544747
1500 kW {201 bhp}
54333400

22 Jul 2010

22 Jul 2010

2

$43,334.00

Yes
21 Jul 2020
$23,833.00

21 Jul 2020

B - Car (1601ce & above)
10

$39.911.00

5587000

$29,723.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 29 Jan 2019

OK

https: vrllia.gov.sg a vrlacuon enquircRebateByPublicBefore..

29/1:2019, 1:52 PFM
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NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE. LTD.

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Blk C #01-43 Autobay@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883
Email: admin@nhtmotor.com Website; www.nhtmotor.com
Tel: 6747 9241 Fax. 67417276
UEN: 201718370K

M pts)

30/01/2019
Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 —
#01-43 Ll - -
Singapore 417883 Vecon .
Accident date: 29/01/2019
Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: SJM8898L BMW 523i 2.5 A '10
CHASSIS: WBAFP32050C544767

S/n Qty Items U/price Amount
1 1 Front R/H Door Deadic $1,774.50 “
2 2 Front R/H Door Hinge ™ pdo~s $116.30 $232.60 X
3 1 Front R/H Door Inner Lock S A $287.75
4 1 Front R/H Door Inner Rubber ;Mx $168.85 <
5 1 Front R/H Door Frame Sticker < $62.90 7
6 1 Front R/H Door Outer Handle Cover With Chrome e d $594.00
7 1 Front R/H Door Outer Handle Bracket Assy i pdrr $164.25
8 2 Front R/H Door Outer Handle Rubber Seal Ai.. $102.40 $204.80 <
9 1 Front R/H Door Glass Outer Moulding e, » $115.95 L/
10 1  Front R/H Door Side Mirror Assy o, " ¢ $1,831.00 <
11 1 Rear R/H Door “Tp.iléd - ! $1,774.50
12 1 Rear R/H Door Inner Lock 4@ s~ 5287.75 X
13 1 Rear R/H Door Inner Rubber 7.y, $168.85
14 1 Rear R/H Door Frame Sticker 4 | $162.80 -~
15 1 Rear R/H Door Outer Handle Cover With Chrome ) $594.00
16 1 Rear R/H Door Outer Handle Bracket Assy N s $164.25 X~
17 2 Rear R/H Door Outer Handle Rubber Seal J $102.40 $204.80 V
18 1 Rear R/H Door Glass Outer Moulding Nev i $115.95

Subtotal :- $8,909.50




. Labour charges

To remove & refit front R/H door, glass, moulding, lock,

rubber, trim board & frame sticker

To remove & refit rear R/H door, glass, moulding, lock,
rubber, trim board & frame sticker

To reset computer

To check wiring

Panel beating

Spray painting

LKK Auto uc-nsultﬂh nence nofify

the Repairer of the follow wing:

L] :nre'-‘ur'.-pfl sfaradaher Dray painting

= T chisply :.r':h"uf-:l arl{s} during regun ey

l.n-';rfg PNCES gre wect i -'|rr;‘- "
hird party survey is on a Withaut Prejudice” basis

Mo r||Ega modificatic nis) is allowed

* Supplementan ¥ IIEms) mus! be ress

15 subect to final an TS ||. |.-|.. .

anl.'!
rance |v( mpany
Acknowledged by Repaires
Signature:
Data:

$240 [6D

szan/eﬁ:m 102

Subtotal :- $2,380.00

Total:- $11,289.50

'{'D'{'&l 6529:30

,I'.)E. “ SJ-L

085y

Sk



I | V” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i - 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX;: 6256 4315

Reg, No: 198607108R GST Reg. No. 18-8807198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CS/FCI190020683/Avd3n2
o omeroseeancaroreosssrr oo oros2oe | [HIFHHNNN
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC BO&OM Veh. Inspected SJM BBIBL
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D190007 77TMFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  MAY CHUA Assign Date 31/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model BMW 523 c.C 2497
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. WBAFP32050C544767 Colour BLACK
Odometer 170384 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification SPORTS RIM
General GooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |245/45R18 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/45R18 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |245/45 R18 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyra 245/45 R18 MICHELIN & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE Orf5 BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  29/01/2019 |iInspection Date 31/01/2019
Survey held at NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR FTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE & #01-43 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

Sh. Estimate Days of Repair

|EST1MATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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| 74 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 195607T198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9807198-R Page No.1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJM 8898L
b Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Q Description of Parts Condition | =°- a8 By
R o - 3 Workshop ($)]  ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT R/H DOOR DENTED 1,774 50 1.774.50
2|FRONT R/H DOOR HINGE @$116.30 NOT NECESSARY 232 60 -
1|FRONT R/H DOOR INMER LOCK DAMAGED 287.75 287.75
1|FRONT R/H DOOR INNER RUBBER NECESSARY 168.85 168 85
1|FRONT R/H DOOR FRAME STICKER NECESSARY 62.90 62.90
1|FRONT R/H DOOR OUTER HANDLE COVER WITH DAMAGED 594.00 504.00
CHROME
1|FRONT R/H DOOR OUTER HANDLE BRACKET ASSY NOT NECESSARY 164.25 ;
2| FRONT R/H DOOR OUTER HANDLE RUBBER SEAL NECESSARY 204 80 204.80
@$102.40
1|FRONT R/H DOOR GLASS QUTER MOULDING MECESSARY 115.95 11585
1|FRONT R/H DOCR SIDE MIRROR ASSY TO REPAIR SEE 1,831.00 :
LABOUR
1|REAR R/H DOOR DENTED 1,774.50 1,774.50
1|REAR R/H DOOR INNER LOCK NOT NECESSARY 287.75 >
1|REAR R/H DOOR INNER RUBBER NECESSARY 168.85 168 85
1|REAR R/H DOOR FRAME STICKER NECESSARY 162.80 162.80
1|REAR R/H DOOR OUTER HANDLE COVER WITH NOT NECESSARY 594,00 X
CHROME
1|REAR R/H DCOR OUTER HANDLE BRACKET ASSY NOT NECESSARY 164 .25 -
2|REAR R/H DOOR OUTER HANDLE RUBBER SEAL NOT NECESSARY 204.80 &
@$102.40
1|REAR R/H DOOR GLASS OUTER MOUDLING NECESSARY 115.95 115.95
LESS 5% DISCOUNT i -271.54
B,809.50 5,158.31
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REFIT FRONT R/H 240.00 100.00
DOOR, GLASS, MOULDING LOCK, RUBBER, TRIM BOARD &
FRAME STICKER.
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR R/H 240.00 100.00
DOOR,GLASS MOULDING,LOCK, RUBBER, TRIM BOARD &
FRAME STICKER.
TO RESET COMPUTER, 200.00 100.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19002063/Avd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408033

TEL: 6250 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198 G3T Reg. No. 18-3607136-R

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Page No..2of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Condition s - -
Qty Description of Parts Workshop ($)) ($)

TO CHECK WIRING. 100.00 30.00

PANEL BEATING INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT T50.00 500.00
RfH DOOR SIDE MIRROR ASSY.

SPRAY PAINTING. 850.00 550.00

2,380.00 1,380.00

GRAND TOTAL 11,289.50 5,530.31

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REF;_MRE- 5,200.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19002063/Avd3n2

MARKET VALUE: $40,000.00 (EST)-PAPER VALUE: $29,700.00=METT VALUE: $10,300.00
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ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE. AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is
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made solely for the use and benefil of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




