Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Thursday, 25 March 2021 2:24 PM

‘claims@kkimhin.com.sg'

Margaret KKH; Admin A

RE: LOD - O/REF: 190056/01, Y/REF: CC4/11119002016/Kpa3 - ACC INVLG GBD8436D
& SHB4331M ON 30 JAN 2019

DV_GBD8436D.pdf

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: claims@kkimhin.com.sg <claims@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 March 2021 10:54 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Margaret KKH <margaret@kkimhin.com.sg>

Subject: Re: LOD - O/REF: 190056/01, Y/REF: CC4/11119002016/Kpa3 - ACC INVLG GBD8436D & SHB4331M ON 30

JAN 2019

Dear Hsiao Tong

Reference to your email dated 22 Mar 2021.

Strictly for quick and amicable settlement, we confirm acceptance your offer @$14,850/-. Please forward
Discharge Voucher and payment to be made in favour of K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd.



Thank you.

Best Regards

Carin

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive #02-20
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

Tel: 6452 7018

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, March 22, 2021 11:13 AM

To: claims@kkimhin.com.sg ; Admin A

Cc: Margaret KKH

Subject: RE: LOD - O/REF: 190056/01, Y/REF: CC4/11119002016/Kpa3 - ACC INVLG GBD8436D & SHB4331M ON 30
JAN 2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $14,850.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: claims@kkimhin.com.sg <claims@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 19 March 2021 10:52 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Margaret KKH <margaret@kkimhin.com.sg>

Subject: Re: LOD - O/REF: 190056/01, Y/REF: CC4/11119002016/Kpa3 - ACC INVLG GBD8436D & SHB4331M ON 30
JAN 2019




Dear Hsiao Tong

Reference to the LOD dated 04 Feb 2021.

We would appreciate if you could kindly look into the matter and look forward to your reply soon.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Carin

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive #02-20
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

Tel: 6452 7018

From: claims@kkimhin.com.sg

Sent: Thursday, February 04, 2021 10:34 AM

To: Hsiao Tong ; admin-a@LKKauto.com

Cc: Margaret KKH

Subject: LOD - O/REF: 190056/01, Y/REF: CC4/11119002016/Kpa3 - ACC INVLG GBD8436D & SHB4331M ON 30 JAN
2019

Dear Hsiao Tong

Enclosed are the following Letter of Demand documents for you to process the claim:

Letter of Demand

Cost of Repair Invoice
Car Rental Agreement
GIA/LTA Search Fee
Letter of Authorization

AN E

We look forward to hearing from you.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Carin

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive #02-20
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

Tel: 6452 7018



