Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 September, 2019 2:40 PM
To: kumchewl

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: RE : ESTIMATE FOR SKZ 5781 D
Attachments: SKZ 5781D.pdf

Hi Mdm Lim,

Refer to attachment
Finalised amount is $ 3,200 / 5 days lump sum Kindly confirm

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-
25 | S(408933) Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.

From: kumchew1 [mailto:kumchewl@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 25 September, 2019 11:28 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: RE : ESTIMATE FOR SKZ 5781 D

Hi Mr Vic,

URGENT!

Refer to our email dated 04/3/2019 & 23/3/2019.

Please let us hear from you soon.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Mdm Lim

From: kumchew1 [mailto:kumchewl@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Saturday, March 23, 2019 11:24 AM

To: 'Rasul (LKK Auto)'

Cc: 'Team A'

Subject: FW: RE : ESTIMATE FOR SKZ 5781 D

Hi Mr Rasul,

We refer to our email dated 04/03/2019.

Please assist.

Thanks & Best Regards,



Mdm Lim

From: kumchew1 [mailto:kumchewl@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, March 04, 2019 2:11 PM

To: 'Rasul (LKK Auto)'

Subject: RE : ESTIMATE FOR SKZ 5781 D

Hi Mr Rasul,

Refer to the above matter.

Kindly find attached estimate for you to mark and reply us by email.

Your early revert is much appreciated.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Mdm Lim



