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¥ L/ LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Libi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg, No 126807198R GST Reg. No. 18-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CCE/EQI19002000/K B3
oo ToNER B T
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 30-071-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code  EQI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJY 4098S Veh. Inspected SKV 7879P
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 30/01/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
" |R/H Front Tyre o
L/H Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date 22/01/2018 Inspection Date 29/01/2019
Survey held at CHENG HOE MOTOR PL
BLE 1019 YISHUN IND, PARK A
#01-374/382
SINGAPORE T6ETE
Sa, Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A™"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS.
B)iN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
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Your ref: To Be Advised
Our ref: COEQI H002000/Kib3 Date; 30.01.2019

The Motor Claims Department

M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SKY7879P
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 29.01.2019
at the premises of Mfs _Cheng Hoe Motor Pre Lid and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8§ 3.960.00

Revised Estimate Amount : 58 337200

"Check” Items Amount 1 58 3800

Marker Value : 55 -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 58

Nett Vialue (88

Description of Damage: r———

The vehicle sustained damages at the e : - T=_':'¢ aws
(/S Rear portion ~ — i —

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 6 days

Yours faithfully,

KENNETH KONG
Licensed Appraiser



Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Bik 1019, Yishun fndustrial Park A 800 -374/382, Singapore 768701
TEL 67585142 (YIS) FAX: 67557T719(Y15) Email: chinotori singnet com.sg
GST201001I158E RCB NO-201001 15KE

M/S:  EQINSURANCECOLTD Claim No: ESI991111
22 GEMMILL LANE Estimate No: ESI1991111 ES1991111/WS
SINGAPORE 069257 Date: 29 Jan 2019
Policy No:
TEL: 62239433 FAX: 62243003 Veh Reg No: SKVTR79P
ATTN: Motor Claim Department ~ Make/Model: HYUNDAI ELANTRA
WS Ref: TP EQ A’ﬂ' Sl hei s/ Chassis No:  KMHDH41CMGU640254
Claim Type: Third Party 2l & 7 Engine No:
Accident Date:  22/01/2019 % /2., Reg.Date:  01/102015
TP Veh Reg No:  STY4098S Aty wier
Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No : SKV7879P
Description & e "/‘Zr UPrice  Quantity Cost Amount
8§ S8
Cost Plus g
| REAR BUMPER 21000 1 PC 7% 21000
2 REAR BUMPER LOWER 90,00 1 PC & o000 =
3 REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH 13.00 | PC vF 1300 —
4 REAR BUMPER CLIP 150 6 PCS 900
5 REAR RH FENDER 650.00 | pPC A 65000 —
6 REAR RH FENDER INNER SHIELD 20.00 1 PC €/ 200 —
7 REAR RH MUDFLAP 16,00 | PCS Az 1600 —
8 REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING 25,00 I PC M 2800
9 REAR RH SPORT RIM 190,00 I PCS 2t 0000 —
Il REAR SHOCK ABSORBER RH 140.00 | PC 14000 .ﬂm‘\
1.575.00
Add 20% 31500 1,890.00
Specinl Net
Il REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS SEALANT Ae. om | PC 40,0000 —"
40.00
Labour -
12 REMOVE AND REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS 0.00 I LA 120,0000
13 TO PANEL BEATING 0.00 | LA R00.0000 7@y
14 TOPUTTY AND RESPRAY ON RR BUMPER, RR PANEL, RR RH 0.00 I LA 750.0000 47
FENDER. ROCKER PANEL o
15 TO REMOVE AND REFIX TOP ROOF LINING, GARNISH, 0.00 I LA 1200000 /20y
SAFETY BELT, SEAT ETC
I6 REMOVE AND REFIX RER RH UNDERCARRIAGE .00 I LA 1500000 WA
17 TO CONDUCT COMPUTERIZED WHEEL ALIGNMENT 0,00 | PC 60,0000 "
I8 RUSTPROOFING 0.00 I LA 30,0000
203000
Total $$ 3,960,00
Add GST (m ™4 27720
’ Total Amount pavahle §84.23720
| For Cheng Hoe Motor Pie Lid

AUTHORISED SIGNATURE



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

————— e ————————

From: loel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.comsg>

Sent: Thursday, 31 January 2019 10:50 AM

To: Shu Pel (LKEAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Poh Kin (LEKAuto)

Subject: RE- Direct Settlement - Acoident Invalving 5JY40985 (01 - EQI - TBA) and SKVTBTAOP (TP
LKK REF - CCA/EQI19002000/kfp3 ) on 22.01.2019

Attachments: SI¥40985 PDF

Dear Shu Pei

Attached our insured’s accident raport for your attention.
Best Regards,

loel Goh

EQ Insurance Company Limited

did tel fax

@
B & stermbier of C ity e

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. [f you are not the intended recipient, please natify the senc

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, January 30, 2019 6:18 PM

To: EQI PRS; Janet Tan; Joel Goh

Cc: Admin A; Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJY40985 (OI : EQI - TBA) and SKV7B79P (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/EQI19002000/KfM3 ) on 22.01.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/ Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SKV 7879P at M/s Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed
for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
. TP GIA report
. TP estimated cost of repair



Preliminary advice
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Poh Kin and he can be contacted at DID: 6841-2132.

Thank Yow

Beut Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auta Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall shupelElkkauto.com | fae 6741-4108
Wik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)



Hsiao Tnng (LKKAuto)

From: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun-June) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 11 January 2020 4:53 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: ACCEPTANCE - our Ref: SKV7879P “LKK Ref: CC6/EQI19002000/Kpb3 [ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SJY 40985(EQ) AND SKV 7879P ON 22/01/2019]

Without Prejudice
Hi Hsiao Tong,
Your offer of $53060.00 as below is accepted.

Pls process payment to be made payable to “CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD"
Thank you.

Rgds

June Phua

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd
Tel :67556142

Fax : 67557719

From: Ti

Sent: Saturday, January 11, 2020 11:41 AM

To: mailto:chmotor@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Admin 4

Subject: Your Ref: SKV7879P *LKK Ref: CC6/EQI19002000/Kpb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJY 40985(EQ) AND SKV

7879P ON 22/01/2019]

Your Ref: SKVT879P Without Prejudice
LKK Ref: CC6/EQI19002000/Kpb3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5JY 40985(EQ) AND SKV 7879P ON 22/01/2019
We refer to the above matter,

We propose settlement at a global sum of $3,060.00{all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basls, and should not be construed as an admission of lability on
our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in
respect of the accident. Dur offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be
made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made
payment an the settlement sum.”



wtﬁ]rﬂfﬁaﬂwand?mwmﬂn‘mr

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultanis Pre Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email; chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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Company Aegistration Mo. 19960T198R

£ U AVE 1, #02-2€ PAYA UBEINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 808933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (085 62504315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Date: 20/01/2020

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Vehicle N SJY 40988 (Insd Veh) Yui.lr Ref No. . DMPPHQ18-005609
- SKV 7879P (TP Veh}_ Our Ref. No. : CCB/EQI18002000/Kpa3q2
Date of Accident 221172019
Liability - 100% - o
Final Repair Cost '$ 2,889.00 B
Loss of Use $ 180.00 B days
Rental (If any) ' $ | days -
Others: Y- . .
- B

3,069.00
Final Settlement Sum |: § 3.060.00 |GLOBAL SUM
Remarks
P nt Ins :

1) |CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD

3,060.00

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubil Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408633
TEL: 6258 35681 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 1906807198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Rel CCB/EQI19002000/Kpa3g2
Ty |ANEARR
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 20-01-2020
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code: EQI
m Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, SJY 40085 Veh. Inspected SKV 7879P
Policy No. OMPPHQ18-005609 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 29/01/2019
2. ‘Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI ELANTRA (A) c.c 1591
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. KMHDH41CMGLUG40254 Colour METALLIC SILVER
Odometer B5135 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOoD
% Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/55R16 MICHELIN 9 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/55R16 MICHELIN 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/55R16 MICHELIN 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/55R16 MICHELIN g8 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/5 REAR PGR'?IDN.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 22012018 Inspection Date 29/01/2019
Survey held at CHENG HOE MOTOR PL
BLK 1018 YISHUN IND. PARK A
#01-374/382
SINGAPORE 788781
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|E5TLMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 6 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
E1 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL 5256 3581 FAX G256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg Mo 15-5607198-R Page No.1af 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKV 7879P
: = — e e L Our # ,
Qy|  Description of Parts Condition hmm'“gi f’"""‘“m“f o~
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER (WCP) BUCKLED 210.00 210.00
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER (WCF} CuT 80.00 90.00
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH (WCF) DISTORTED 13.00 13.00
6|REAR BUMPER CLIP @8$1.50 (WCP) NECESSARY 9.00 9.00
1|REAR RH FENDER (WCP) BENT 650.00 850.00
1|REAR RH FENDER INNER SHIELD (WCP) CRACKED 29.00 29.00
1|REAR RH MUDFLAP (WCP) NECESSARY 16.00 16.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING (WCP) NECESSARY 28.00 28.00
1|REAR RH SPORT RIM (WCF) DENTED 390.00 390.00
1|REAR SHOCK ABSORBER RH (WCP) NOT NECESSARY 140.00
COST PLUS 20% 315.00 287.00
1,890.00 1.72200
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 40.00 40.00
40.00 40.00
LABOUR
REMOVE AND REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS 120.00 120.00
TO PANEL BEATING. 800.00 700.00
TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY ON RR BUMPER .RR 750.00 600.00
PANEL RR RH FENDER ,ROCKER PANEL.
TO REMOVE AND REFIX TOP ROOF LINING, GARNISH | 120.00 100.00
SAFETY BELT ,SEAT ETC.
REMOVE AND REFIX RR RH UNDERCARRIAGE. NOT NECESSARY 150.00
TO CONDUCT COMPUTERIZED WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 60.00 60.00
RUSTPROOFING 30.00 3000
2,030.00 1.610.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,960.00 3,372.00

Report Ref No. CCE/EQI19002000/Kpa3g2
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KONG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:: This Repori is mades solsly for (he uss snd benelit of fe Client named on the front page of this Repot.



