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l F [ F Ao
! Consultants

- sm mum Pta Lid Company Registration No. 1995071988

S| UBEAVE 1 #0225 PAVA UBLINDUSTHIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J08933 TEL : (065) 625363561 FAX LGS 62563

Your Ref: D19000779MESH Date: 15 May 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCL19001990/Esd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SLR 6143U .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 13/05/2019 at the premises of M/s Cycle & Carriage Automotive Pte Ltd and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ;8% 4.619.00
Revised Estimate Amount 153 4.090.00
“Check”™ Irems Amount + 8% 309.00
Market Value : 8%
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%
Nett Value 1 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 3 Days

Yours faithfully,
Chen Tsue Yee
Automotive Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited (.o bo 1550001060 G5T &g o MECOO1LE 9
6 Ralfles Quay #21-00 Sngapore D48580
Tel: (65 6222 2311 Fax (65)6222 3547

Claims & oler Undenwriting Dept: J6 Robinson Roed #16-C1 City House Singapore 0SBA7 7
Tol (5} &507 3848 Fax: (65) BS07 3849
wiviisl s firsie apita :.rnrn.w,

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
29-01-2019 Our Ref No. D19000779MFSH
22-01-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHA9596M Third Party Vehicle. SLR6143U
208 PANDAN GARDENS
DON BONG
65684501/ 0 Fax No. 65651240

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Ce : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

CYCLE & CARRIAGE
AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Attention. NIL

HENRY KAQ

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit tha survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection

This s a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 15 May 2019 12:05 PM

To: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie'; '"CWS Motor Claims’

Cec: assignments; SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000779MFSH/1
Attachments: SLR 6143U - Preli Advise .pdf

Dear Henry,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLR 6143U.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
BIk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com)

Sent: Wednesday, 30 January 2019 2:47 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Ce: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000779MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{4089733)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 30 January 2019 2:26 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Henry Kao Cai lie
<HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D12000779MFSH/1



Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
Www.avg.com
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Register

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Crwner 1D Type:

Owner 10:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

\ehicle to be Exported:
intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Walue:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 13 May 2019

DADEI-MAE Dahata Eraiind

ed Vehicle

Singapore NRIC
923%C

SLR&143U

Me

13 May 201%
MITSUBISHI
ATTRAGE 1.2CVT
Red

2017
3A92UGBST47
MMBSTA13AHHODAZ03
57.0 kW (76 bhp)
$13,095.00

22 Aug 2017

22 pug 2017

0

$5,000.00

Yes
21 Aug 2027
%3,750.00

21 Aug 2027

A -Carup to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$46,489.00

$38,453.00

$42,203.00
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G Reg Mo JDCDRSHM | Coaprght € F016 AlG Sais Faatbs Insutsnce Fle Lic

Name of Policyholder  : WONG SIEV LING MRS LIM SIEW LING Vehicle No, : SLRo143U

Period of Insurance : 22 Aug 2018 To 21 Aug 2019 Folicy No. i 1700038407-01
Engine No. 1 3ASZUGBST4T Endorsement No.
Chassis No. ; MMBSTA1IAHHO0G303 Issued Date 3 30 Jul 2018
ABOUT THE COVER
Make/Modsl MITSUBISHI
Engine Capacity/Tonnage - 1,183.00 CC Sum Insured - Market Value First Year of Registration © 2017
Driver Restriction P NA Off Peak Car : Mo Inguring with COEPARF Yes

Person or Classes of Persons Entitled to Drive™

a) Tha Polcynholder
by Ay other persan wha is driving on the Policyhalder s sidar o with hisiher pemission.
T Pobicy wll ngemnify tne Polcyholdes or any authansed drider onty if haishe maets he 3pacifiad @ge condition,

Yau Bave 10 pay an Additensd sum of $3 000 as “Young andioe Inexperienced Driver Excass™ (Y IDR™ # Yoy are or Your Authonsed Driver named of urnamed) & under e age of I3 andior has jess than 3
RArE' Aring axponenca

. Age Condition All Age Condition

Limitation as to use®

s ssiy tar sacal, doimaste and plaasurs punposes and 1or \e Polcymoloers busimess

This Paiizy doss RoT cowr Lse R hirg o rewand, diveg lasan, drang bes!, racing, pace-mmssing, relabilly ¥isl o spaad-Ssong, the cariage of goods cifer thae sarmgles in coompchon willh any iraoe o
businery of uis S5 By puipsia i connaeisn sl Mekor Trads

Loss of Use 1500cc - 1600ce

* Limiasons rencersd moperative by Secdon § of the Motar Yenhigles (Thind-Pany Risks and Compensation] Act (Sap, 184} and Seclion 35 of the Rasd Transpar AL 1957 {Malagsiaj, are not to be
rcluded under Fase haadngs

Section 1
Fire < 50 Owen Damags - 2800, Thaft - $0. Flood Covar-50

Section 2
Fropary Damags - 50

Windscreen ; 3100

Mamed Driver and EXCess (when spaicasis)

WORG SIEW LING MRS LIM SIEWLING - $800 {Cwn Damage)

APPROVED REPORTING CENTRES/AUTHORISED REPAIRERS

1 Cycle & Camoge Authcrmed Serace Cerfes Add 70 Leng Fes Rd Seaapone 158054 Ba7
Tyl & Camage huthcemen Servce Cante (For windscrean clarm anly) Agdd- 330 Uit Ra 1
Lychk & Camage Bogy & Pard Conire Add: 209 Pandan Gardens Sngapsrs B03130 568450

iGapaye 40BESD ET451000

For othar appreved Reporting Cenfres/als sanonsed Reparers, pleass cortact ow 2d-hour scoiderr emangency holles & #85 B133 5200 Akematrcly, you may refer b0 A5 weDsiln wwie.ig.comsg
o AKF S5 Mol Spp Simply SR8 @0 dowrdsad *A1G 507 fram Tunds or Googie Flay

IMPORTANT NOTES

Hire Purchase Company/Employer's Loan; MA

Ve Peraby cariity Sad Tk policy 10 which this Cerificaie of Insurancs relaies & ssusd in accordance with the provisions of me Molor vemscles(Thind Fany Risks and Compeissation} Acl (Gap, 183), P v of
the Road Transpor Act, 1887 (Malaysia) and Molor Viehicles {Trerd Party Risis) Rules, 17258 (Malaysia).

Q500720783

ant
CYGLE & CARRIAGE - SHERNIMIT)

239 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAFORE 156930 ANSP-MUTOR AIG Asia Pacific Ingurance Pte. Lid.
Lemade pwritten by AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Ple, Lid AUTHORISED REPRESENTATIVE

FERE
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CHINESE

M R F (9080 | e,
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CYCLE & CARRIAGE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LIMITED
PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE

€e

oo

CYCLE & CARRIAGE 200 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609339 Tel: 65684555 Fax: 65691056 Mgg!;'g%”’
Co Reg Mo : 197701469G ESTIMATE GST Reg Mo : MR-8500111-X
Invoice Name & Address Owner Name & Vehicle Info

Reg No/Reg Date SLR6143U / 22/08/201
9 JALAN SIANTAN Date In/Mileage / ]
;EEEEEEE ;EEEE Chassis No MMBSTA13AHH006303
Engine No 3A92UGBSTAT |
Contact No Mobile: 97224260 LUISA Make /Model MIT/17MY ATTRAGE 1.2 CVT
Colour/Trim P01 RED METALLIC / BK BLACK
Account No Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIP No
CSM00041 Cash 24/01/2019/ 16:46 465 [ Tay Jian Ye 35696
Description of Goods | Services Qty Unit Price Disc% Amount
E PNTBBOOO ua Eﬁﬂ 1650.00
TO RENEW REAR BUMPER AND REPAIR END PANEL 37
E PNT98000 ) L)a 1260.00
PAINT WORK SPRAY RAER BUMPER AND END PANEL G
E PHTE2000 £ 80.00
TO TRANSFER REAR PARKING SENSOR TO NEW PART v
A 54900099 / 30.00
CHECK WIRING AND CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM
A 10028901 / 200.00
TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK USIMG HI-SCAN PRO TEST
USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST
M SUNDRY b7 80.00
TO APPLY ANTI COROSSION
M SUNDRY X 220,00
TO SUPPLY PARKING SENSOR
M SUNDRY s 20.00
SUNDRIES 5o e
M BRACKET,RR BUMPER,LH . .~ | 1.00 27.00 00.00 27.00
M BRACKET,RR BUMPER,.RH 1.00 27.00 00.00 27.00
M FACE,RR BUMPER ~ [ 1.00 740.00 00.00 740.00
M CLIP,FR BUMPER ~ A/L( / 10.00 3.00 00.00 30.00
M ANT,KEYLESS OPERATION,RR s > N 1.00 95.00 00.00 95.00
M BUZZER,KEYLESS OPERATIO,RR ‘r' .§5\ 1.00 90.00 00.00 90.00
M DUCT,RR VENTILATOR : 1.00 30.00 00.00 30.00
M COVER,RR VENTILATOR ;I 1.00 40.00 00.00 40.00
J ,'I'It’ ¥e L J,ﬁ?':- |
'/. 2 [v1 .':-r'Jfl.".I- aiL
17/§/14 | 19-4§
A -
TN Ao Consoitants encenotify
Confirmy, accepted by, (lowing:
u I.:. ::PSLrI::.rJ'IEf!T--'E afer spray painting Nett 4,619.00
oty 7% GST on  4619.00 323.33
o Paris pracas &
::ET;;“T onts Total Payable 4,942.33
RuthqriZed STRTREOVY and Company stamp
validity of this estimate is 14 days from date of gquote. This is a computer generated document, no signature is required.
Estimated costssquotedrare exeluding G5T. We would memtion that the above estimate is based en our initial inspection and does not include
any ad “m]q:mti or labour which may be required ifter repair work has commenced. Oceasionally worn or damaged parts are discovered
after work has started and needed for repairs or repldcement. However, should this occur, we would advise you. Please be informed that a
deposit of ‘50% of the above estimate is p commencement of the work. Payment for this may be made in cash, credit card or
cheque, Yau must also agree to pay full amount for renewal of the windscreen in the event of inadvertent breakage in the course of rengwing

the rubber seal or other repair requiring the removal of the windscreen.

Page 1 of 1



% Survevor . Steve - LKK
C@ | Exceptional Journeys Company : First Capital

CYCLE & CARRIAGE | DOA 2 22/01/2019

CSE : Don
Date of Survey : 13/05/2019

VEHICLE NO ¢ SLIG143U

MODEL y MITY 17MY ATTRAGE 1.2 CVT

WIP 356596

Email ;

Material -1 770.00

Labour < 3 1,340.00

Sub-Total L 2,110.00

Less Excess =

Total ;3 2,110.00

GST 7% L ¢ 147.70

Grand Total il | 2,257.70

Finalise By/Date : JoJodwd 12/06/2019

REVERT BACK WITHIN 7 DAYS,
OTHERWISE WILL PROCEED WITH INVOICING
[ ] SURVEYOR'S REPORT REQUIRED

REPAIR TOOK 3 OWORKING DAYS + Days | ) Weekends

Days | ) Public Holiday

+ 1 Survey - 10/01/2019 - Thu
TOTAL DAYS REPAIRTOOK = 4

TP Claim  FIRST CAPITAL - SHA9596M

[ ] Claim GIA / LTA fee

Claim Loss |Use [ JRental

l: Claim Medical Fee / Others

. [hird Party Report




€e

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

CYCLE & CARRIAGE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LIMITED
PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE
209 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609339 Tel: 65684555 Fax: 63691056

PRO-FORMA INVOICE

¢

A

MITSUBISHI

MOTORS

Co Reg Ho : 1977014696 THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE GST Reg Mo : MR-8500111-X
Involce Name & Address Owner Nama & Vehicle Info
M FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED Cust No/Mame /M5 WOMG SIEW LING MRS LIM STEW
Reg No/Reg Date SLRE1430  / 22/08/2017 |
MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT Date In/Mileage 13/05/2019/ 18982
36 ROBINSON ROAD #16-01 Chassis/Package MMBSTA13AHHOO6303 /DC1753C
i E JA92UGR5747 |
SINGAPORE 068677 ngine No b
Contact Mo Make/Model MIT/17MY ATTRAGE 1.2 CVT
13/05/ Calour/Trim PO RED METALLIC / BK BLACK
Aceount Mo Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIP No
CTPOOO4O Cash 12/06/2019/ 08:45  TLD 881 / Jojo Cheng 35606
Dascription of Goods | Services Qty Unit Price Disc% Amount
E PNTABO00 ~550.00
RENEW REAR BUMPER
E PNTIR000 #420.00
SPRAY PAINT HEAR EUMPER
E PNTBA000 AE0.00
[0 TRANSFER REAR PARKING SENSOR TO NEW PART
A 54900099 -~ 30.00
CHECK WIRING AND CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM
& 10028901 S 200,00
0 CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK. USTING HI- SCP-H PRO . TEST
USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST| L ' ¥
M SUNDRY - . - 60,00
APPLY ANTI COROSSION “ !
M SUNDRY /20,00
SUNDRIES
% FACE,RR BUMPER 1.00 740.00 00.00 « 740,00
% CLIP,FR BUMPER 10.00 3.00 00.00 30,00
£ TEXT
FIRST CAPITAL TP CLAIM SHA9506M
POA: 2270172019
SURVEYOR: STEVE LKK 13/06/2019
Cyele & Corriage celebrotes 120 years.
Visit www.cyclecarriage.com/120 for more info!
Parts 770.00 Nett 2,110.00 |
Labour 1,260.00 7% G5T on 2110.00 147.70
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialist Job 0.00 Total Payable 2,257.70
Diagnestics Job 0.00
Sundry/Others 80.00
Total(w/o G5T) 2,110.00

This s not an official tax inveice.

This is a computer generated document, no signature is reguired.

Page 1 of 1



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AJE BRE B 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408033
Govesso=— TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 189807198 GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCH%001990/Esd3n2
#16.01 O HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date 12062019 M"W”“W”mm
Code: FCI2
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 95%6M Veh. Inspected 5LR 6143V
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 0190007 78MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  HENRY KAOQ Assign Date 30/01/2019
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI ATTRAGE c.c 1193
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. MMBSTA13AHHOO0E303 Colour RED
Odometer 68774 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Meodification SPORTS RIM
General GOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |1B5/55 R15 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre 185/55 K15 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/55R15 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 185/55 R15 BRIDGESTOME 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  22/01/2019 Inspection Date 13/05/2019
Survey held at CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIA FTELTD
209 PANDAN GARDENS
SINGAPORE 609339
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,

5b, Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




' Vd V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Bd i DA B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg, Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607193-R Page MNo.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLR 6143U
3 3 Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | =5 rklhdp?:}] {sl,
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BRACKET RR BUMPER,LH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 27.00 -
1|BRACKET,RR EUMPER, RH {SN) NOT NECESSARY 27.00 -
1|FACE RR BUMPER (SN} DENTED T40.00 T40.00
10|CLIP.FR BUMPER (SN} MECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|ANT.KEYLESS OPERATION.RR (SN} MOT NECESSARY 895.00 -
1|BUZZER KEYLESS OPERATIORR (SN) WOT NECESSARY 90.00 -
1|DUCT RR VENTILATOR (SH) NOT NECESSARY 30.00 -
1|COVER.RR VENTILATOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 40.00 -
1|SUNDRIES (SN) MECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1,099.00 780,00
LABOUR
TO REMEW REAR BUMPER AND REPAIR END PANEL. 1,650.00 550.00
TO SUPPLY PARKING SENSOR. NOT NECESSARY 220.00 -
PAINT WORK SPRAY REAR BUMPER AND END PANEL. 1,260.00 420,00
TO TRANSFER REAR PARKING SENSOR TO NEW PART. 80.00 60.00
CHECK WIRING AND CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM. 30.00 30.00
TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK USING HI-SCAN 200.00 200.00
PRO TEST USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST.
TO APPLY ANTI COROSSION E0.00 60.00
3,520.00 1.320.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,619.00 2,110.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 2,110.00|

Report Ref No. CS/FCI119001990/Esd3n2

e

CHEN TSUE YEE

Automotive Assessor

BISCLAIMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:. This Report Is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client

3

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

named on the front page of this Report.




