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Print Sent Message

 
This mail is associated with :

  
*SHD9996B (C0384994)

 [SKR7686A]
 TP

 TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
 May 20 2016 1:00PM

 [RACHHPAL SINGH S/O NOOP SINGH]
 Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

  
 
From   LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 02/01/2018 09:41 AM.
To   AXA_CynthiaLoh
CC   AXA_SG; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com
Subject   Re: TP settlement - C0384994/GA089526
 
Dear Cynthia,

  
 We refer to the subject of this e-mail. We have inspected TP vehicle on 23.05.2016

  
 TP claim file has been dormant for  more than one(1) year.

  
 Third-party claimant is inactive in this particular case file.

  
 There is no follow-up, response or further action from them since inspection date.

  
 In view of no further development from TP’s side, we will temporarily close file and will submit our WP report to your good-office.

  
 In future, if TP will pursue their claim, we will notify you for our further handling.

  
 Thank you.
 
 
Regards,
Joy Irene
Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
DID: 6749 5792
 
 
 
 
 
 
<-- Original Message --> 
From: AXA_SG
To: LKK_HQ; sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 21/07/2017 04:28 PM
Subject: Re: TP settlement - C0384994/GA089526
 

 

 
 
Dear LKK,
 
Please expedite D/S.
 
Thanks & Regards,
Cynthia Loh
<-- Original Message --> 
From: AXA_SG
To: LKK_HQ;sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com
CC: AXA_SG
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Sent On: 07/06/2016 11:12 AM
Subject: TP settlement - C0384994/GA089526
 
Dear KENNETH KONG,

  
Please proceed for direct settlement if damages consistent.

  
Regards,

 Ong Li Li


