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W WY Pte Lid Company Reglstration No. 193607198R

51 UBLAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 405933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (B65) 61564315

Your Ref: D19000762MFSH Date: 31 January 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCLI9001967/R 1543

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Lid

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SHD 2337A .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 30/01/2019 at the premises of M/s Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 1S5 434392
Revised Estimate Amount 155 2,952.43
“Check” Ttems Amount 1 5% 216.68
Market Value 1 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value ;53
Nett Value 1 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages

at the rear n/s portion. =

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 5 Days

Yours faithfully,
Mohammed Rasul
Automotive Assessor



MS ‘ Fl rstca pital MS First Capital Insurance Limlted (cieg ho 1950000090 05T Reg hg M2 GO01676-9

6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Sngapore D4B580

Tel (B65) 6222 2311 Fax (65) 6222 3547

Claima & Hover Uedarwriting Cepts 15 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Sangagore 0G0A77
Tel: (B5) 6507 3B48 Fax (B5) 6507 3849

wiwwrmsfirsicapital com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Parson.
Contact No,

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
28-01-2019 Our Ref No. D19000762MFSH
28-01-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHBEB710P Third Party Vehicle. SHD2337A
6 BENOI PLACE
CHRISSY TEO
68610808/ 0 Fax No. 65152948

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No. 58416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

FRIME AUTO CLAIMS
SERVICE PTE. LTD.

MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Attention. NIL

MAY CHUA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspaction.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required




Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) '

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com=>
Sent: Thursday, 14 February 2019 10:25 AM
To: Alice Leong

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZE TO SHD2337A

Hi Alice,

Finalised amount of $ 2350.00 / 5 days lump sum confirmed

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkayto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

o

e T
-

" Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

From: Alice Leong [mailto:aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com]
Sent: Friday, 8 February, 2019 5:16 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: FINALIZE TO SHD2337A

Importance: High

Hi Rasul

Enclosed our after repair photos & our calculation sheet for your retention. Shall we finalize at LS $2,350/-
and 5 working days

Please let us have your confirmation within three days from our e-mail.

Thank you

Alice Leong
Manager, Motor Claims

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Lid

i Benoi Place Singapore 629927

T (65) 6861 0008 1 F(65) 6515 2048
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer

This e-mail (including all attachment) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to wham it is addressed. If you are not an intend recipient, please reply o us immediately and delete this message from your system.
You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.



Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auta) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com=>
Sent: Thursday, 31 January 2019 6:00 PM

To: 'May Chua Hui Chin’; 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: ‘assignments’; 'SUR'; 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000762MFSH/
Attachments: SHD 2337A - Preli Advise .pdf

Dear May,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SHD 2337A.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 30 January 2019 9:26 AM

To: 'CWS Mator Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'May Chua Hui Chin' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D12000762MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARIDYS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{(408033)

From; CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Wednesday, 30 January 2019 9:17 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; May Chua Hui Chin
<maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000762MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.

Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.
1



Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow Svstem

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




PRIME GROUP

GST Reg. No : 201606560M
& Benoi Place Singapore 629927
Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

Date: 25.01.2019

M35 First Capital insurance Lid
36 Robinson Road #16-01

City House
Singapore O6GBE77

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd

RE: ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR TO VEHICLE SHD2337A TOYOTA AXIO HYBRID 1.5 (2016)

To Supply
1} 1pc
2) 1set
37 Ape
1) 1pc
5) 1pc
6) 1pc
7)1 1pc
8) 1pc
9) 1pc

10 ) 1pc
11 ) 1pc
12 ) 2pcs
13 ) 1pc
14 ) 1pc
15 ) 1ipc
16 ) 1pc

Rear bumper Mg

Rear bumper clip A~ -

Rear bumper left retainer M *

Rear boot lid Bt~

Rear boot lid "Corolla” emblem M

Rear boot lid "Hybrid Synergy Drive" emblem R <

Rear boot lid "Axio" emblem nes <
Rear boot lid "Toyota" emblem &
Rear boot lid wheatherstrip
Rear boot lid lock

: nA
Rear boot lid catch X%
Rear boot lid hinges 7':1#
Rear end panel 4f* 0\ st
Rear end panel top garnish
Rear end panel top garnish clip A~ -
Left tail lamp lower bracket 7 _/ gv(_

To Supply S.Nett Parts

1)
2)

1pc
1pc

=
"Prime Taxi" sticker P&
"Dial -A-Cab" sticker a~=

@5121.60

R T W T W R W o S T T VR W T W S W S W S W S S W B

700.00
30.00
60.00

680.00
59.60
61.70
48.60
60.00

120.00

155.40
32.40

243.20

602.10

218.90

250.00
70.00

Sub total Parts

3,391.90

Less: 25% discount

(847.98)

L (L | U

£,543.92

55.00
45.00

Sub total 5.Nett Parts §

100.00



L/charges

1) Totuff kote. 5
2 ) Totransfer rear boot lid trim board, mechanism parts 5
3 ) Toremove rear bumper & rear boot lid. Repair rear end panel. Knock & 5

repair rear floor panel. Replace the above parts. Align & adjust rear
boot lid & rear bumper.

4 ) To putty, respray painting rear bumper, rear boot lid inlet & outlet , end 5
panel. To polish.

8,
5[].1]3/"
1905 §o0

05 b

Sub total L/charges S

1,700.00

Estimated Grand Jotal 5

4,343.92




PRIME GROUP

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd

G5T Reg. No : 201606560M
& Benoi Place Singapore 629927
Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 20948

Date: 29.01.2019

M5 First Capital Insurance 1.td
36 Robinson Road #16-01

City House
Singapore 068877

Attn: Mator Claims Dept

RE: ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR TO VEHICLE SHD2337A TOYOTA AXIO HYBRID 1.5 (2016)

To Supply
1) 1pc
2] 1set
3) 1pc
4) 1pc
5) 1p¢
&) lpc
7) 1pc
8} 1pc
9] 1pc

10} 1pc
11) 1pe
12 ) 2pcs
13) 1pc
14 1pc
15} 1pc
16 ) 1pc

Rear bumper D

Rear bumper clip M- "

Rear bumper left retainer A& ‘
Rear boot lid Bt~

Rear boot lid "Corolla” emblem My
Rear boot lid "Hybrid Synergy Drive” emblem fe <

Bear boot lid "Axio” amblem - -~

Rear boot lid “Toyota" emblem g 7~
Rear boot lid wheatherstrip el 7~

Rear boot lid lock X
Rear boot lid catch Y%
Rear boot lid hinges )‘:

i
Rear end panel &% =
Rear end panel top garnish

Rear end panel top garnish clip A= o

Left tail lamp lower bracket 7

To Supply S.Nett Parts

1)
2]

1pc
lpc

"Prime Taxi" sticker
"Dial -A-Cab" sticker

@5 121.60

BT P S P R W T W B T P P B o T P I T B ¥ T 0 S O S 7 )

700.00
10.00
60.00

680,00
55.60
61.70
48.60
60.00

120.00

155.40X_
32.40 X

243.20 X,

602,10

218.90 X_

250.00
70.00

Sub total Parts S

3,391.90 Jpb1.40

Less: 25% discount §

3

(847.98) - y1.48

254392 vy 1y

55.00
45.00

Sub total 5.Nett Parts $

100.00



L/charges

1)
r

3 )

4)

To tuff kote,

To transfer rear boot lid trim board, mechamsm parts

LKK Aulo Cansultants hence notify

the Repairer gL the ollowing:
= To resurvy Itaf spray painting
« To display damag [5) during resurvey

« Parts pricas are subjact 1o canfirmation
 Third party survey is on & "¥Withow! Frejudice” basis
v Ho illegal modification]s) & allowed

« Suppsermentary item(s) must be resurveyed and
is zubject to final approval from insurance Company

Acknowladgad by Repawes
Sienature:
Data:

'

o~
5 EG.G'D/'

To remove rear bumper & rear boot lid. Repair rear end panel. Knock & S w 6‘00
rapair rear floor panel. Replace the abave parts. Align & adjust rear
boot lid & rear bumper.

To putty, respray painting rear bumper, rear boot lid inlet & outlet , end 5 M é{]’D
panel. To polish,
Sub total L/charges 5 1,700.00 \Loy.0v
Estimated Grand Total 5 4,343.92
Yk
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Awve 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI19001967/R1sd3n2
3?;33::%5&? EES;EDSWGAPDRE 068877 Dt R-0enedis M“mmmmmm
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHB 6710P Veh. Inspected SHD 2337A
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19000762MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From MAY CHUA Assign Date 30/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA COROLLA AXIO c.c 1456
HYBRID 1.5
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. NKE1657142711 Colour BROWN
Odometer 103446 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |175/65 R15 GOODRIDE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |175/85 R15 GOODRIDE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |175/65R15 GOODRIDE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |175/65R15 GOODRIDE & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  28/01/2018 Inspection Date 30/01/2019
Survey held at PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE LTD
£ BENOI PLACE
SINGAPORE 629927
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REFORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR 5 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 233TA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya LIbi Industrial Park, Singapare 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 129607 198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-3607196-R

Page No.1of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 700.00 700.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIP NECESSARY 3000 30.00
1|REAR BUMPER LEFT RETAINER NECESSARY 80.00 60.00
1|REAR BOOT LID BENT 680.00 £80.00
1|REAR BOOT LID "COROLLA" EMBLEM MECESSARY 59.60 58.60
1|REAR BOOT LID "HYBRID SYNERGY DRIVE" EMBLEM NECESSARY 61.70 §1.70
1|REAR BOOT LID "AXI0" EMBLEM NECESSARY 48 60 48 60
1|REAR BOOT LID "TOYOTA" EMBLEM NECESSARY B0.00 50.00
1|REAR BOOT LID WEATHERSTRIP cuT 120.00 120.00
1|REAR BOOT LID LOCK NOT NECESSARY 15540 .
1|REAR BOOT LID CATCH NOT NECESSARY 32.40 -
2|REAR BOOT LID HINGES @$121.60 NOT NECESSARY 243.20 .
1|REAR END PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 602.10
LABOUR
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH SERVICEABLE 218.90 .
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIP NECESSARY 250.00 250,00
1|LEFT TAIL LAMP LOWER BRACKET SERVICEABLE 70.00 2
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -847 98 -517.48
2,543,092 1,552.42
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|"PRIME TAXI" STICKER (SN} NECESSARY 55.00 55.00
1|"DIAL-A-CAB" STICKER (SN) MECESSARY 45.00 45.00
100.00 100.00
LABOUR
TO TUFF KOTE. 50.00 50.00
TO TRANSFER REAR BOOT LID TRIM 50.00 50.00
BOARD MECHANISM PARTS.
TO REMOVE REAR BUMPER & REAR BOOT LID.REPAIR 700.00 600.00
REAR END PANEL KNOCK & REPAIR REAR FLOOR
PANEL REPLACE THE ABOVE PARTS ALIGN & ADJUST
REAR BOOT LID & REAR BUMPER INCLUSIVE OF THE
REPAIR OF REAR END PANEL,

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19001967/R1sd3n2
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1 Vdl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

‘;’__. 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya LIbi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199807198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page Mo.'2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (S)) ()

TO PUTTY RESPRAY PAINTING REAR BUMPER,REAR

S00.00 500.00

BOOT LID INLET & QUTLET,.END PANEL.TO POLISH.
1,700.00 1,300.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,343.92 2,952.42

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,350.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19001967/R1sd3n2

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Automotive Assessor B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M. MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Report is made solely for the use and benedit of the Cllent named on the front page of this Report.

bid 1o any ihird pary whe may reely onihe Reeom whelly of in parl. Any third pany acting of reolying oninis
Rapon, in whols or in parl. docs 30 3l his or her own risk,




