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-- Consuftants
Bdm BE =B Pte Lid Company Registration No. 139607198R

51 UHIAVE 1 #0225 PAYA URIINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINCAPORE 408933 TEL : (063 52363561 FAX @065 61504315

Your ref; D19000763MEFSH

Our ref: CS/FCI19001965/Avd3 Date : 26/2/2019

The Motor Claims Department
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. S]JR 5998A
We thank you for your instruction on 30/1/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
IW1/2019  at the premises of M/fs L NPTELTD

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :8811,265.12

Revised Estimate Amount : 853,000.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check" Items Amount : 5%

Markel Value ;8%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 8%

Nett Value ' 8%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
front portion

Comments/Present Status;
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser



MS@ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coieg ho 1950000060 G5T R B M2 00016755
& Raffies Quay #2100 Singapore DABSE0
Tek {65] 6222 2311 Fax |65) 6222 3547

Clainn & Mosor Undenwaiting Dept 36 Robinson Roed #LG-01 ity House Singapore 058877
Tel. (65] 6507 3048 Fax (65} 5507 3849
wwew. mafirstcapital.comsg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location

Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
29-01-2019 Our Ref No. D13000763MFSH
26-01-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHCT7269K Third Party Vehicle. SJR59984

23 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4 (SOUTH WING) #02-03B VICOM INSPECTION
CENTRE

JAMIE YAN

67444165/ 0 Fax No. 67444804

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: LIABILITY UNCLEAR:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD Attention. MIL
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

HENRY KAD

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 February 2019 9:34 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: ‘HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000763MFSH/1, SIR 5998A
Attachments: SJR 5998A PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir'fMadam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SIR 5998A
Date of survey: 30/1/2019
Number of days : 6 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phaone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 31 January 2019 2:15 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: 'HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000763MFSH/1, SIR 5998A

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SIR 5998A on 30/1/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



‘From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 30 January 2019 11:16 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cec: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg»; Henry Kao Cai Jie <Henrykao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000763MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. Av& This Emaﬂ has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software,
www.avg.com



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 31 January 2019 2:15 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Ce: 'HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000763MFSH/1, SJR 599BA

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJR 5998A on 30/1/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer,

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 30 January 2019 11:16 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Henry Kao Cai Jie
<HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000763M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

1
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Cwner 10 Type: Company
Cwner 1D 1835M
EvehiceDelails: .~ o R e e S R
Vehicle Mo SIRSGIHA
Yehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Ceregistration Date: 30 Jan 2019
Wehicle Make: CHEVROLET
Vehicle Model: OPTREA 1.6L A/T ABS AIRBAG 2WD 4DRE
Primary Cobour: Gray
Manufacturing Year; 2009
Engine Mo F1l4D33028641
Chassis Mo KLIMNA19619H101025
Maximurm Power Outpul: 80.0 kW (107 bhp)
Open Market Value: $8,351.00
Original Registration Date: 30 Jun 2009
First Registration Date: 30 Jun 2009
Transfer Count: 2
Actual ARF Paid: $8,351.00
Ellntended PARF Rebate Detall S e S e ]
PARF Eligibility: Yeg
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 29 Jun 2019
PARF Rebate Amount: %4,175.00
Eintunded COE Rubate Details o i e S e R U e
COE Expiry Date; 29 Jun 2019
COE Category: A= Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period(Years) 10
QP Paid: $11.620.00
COE Rebate Amount $486.00
Total Rebate Amount: $4,661.00

The information contzined hereinis carrect as at 30 Jan 2019

OK



MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 {South Wing) #02-03 Singapore 415933
Tel: (+65) 6243 1373 | Fax: (+65) 6243 1376
Reg. No: 201427944N ;

TO
ATTENTION
ESTIMATE REPORT

: FIRST CAPITAL
» MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

VEHICLE DETAILS

VEHICLE NO : SJR5998A
Ve(on
MODEL + CHEVROLET OFTRA 1.6 A
CHASSIS NO
ACCIDENT DETAILS DATE : 26-Jan-19
TIME : 21:35HRS

THIRD PARTY REQUESTOR / CONTACT JACK LI

DATE

: 30/01/2018
JOB TYPE : T/P CLAIM

CLAIM DETAIL : PARTS

SIN DESCRIPTION ard | ooe | TOoeuEst
1|BONNET " Jeadtd 1 |s 774008 774.00 | —
2|BONNET TOP LOCK ¢ 2 ¢ 1 1§ 149008 149.00 | ~
3|BONNET LOWERLOCK ot =~ 1 |s  24700]% 247.00 | +
4|BONNET HINGE o4 = 2 |3 20.00 | § 40.00 | ¥
5{FRONT BUMPER ¥ R4 _d. 1 |$ 101600|s  101600|
6|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER A 2 |s 4900 | § 98.00 | ~
7|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT ¢Ze— - 1 |s 542008 542.00 |~
BIFRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT SPONGE 4"‘""’“ s 120,00 | & 120.00
o|[FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE L £—F 1|5 80.00 | § 80.00 | =~

10|FRONT BUMPER FOGLAMP COVER "cﬂ,_rl , 2 |s 89.20 | § 178.40 | 7
11|RADIATOR GRILLE WITH CHROME & 1 |8  40400|$ 404.00 | =
12|RADIATOR GRILLE LOGO i 1|8 80.00 | $ 80.00 | =
13|HEADLAMP W ot 2 |'s 478005 95680 A —
14|HEADLAMP PANEL LIt Bead g 1% 280.00 | § 560-00 |2 &V
15|FRONT FENDER LNy 2 |s  39950|§ 799.00 |4
16|FRONT FENDER INNER cou{mwa i sl 2 18 90.50 | $ 181.00 |4
17|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL (CENTRE) " 1 |8 180008 180.00 | A
18|AIRCON CONDENSOR o4 1 |s 891003 o100 | —




19|RADIATOR N2 - 1 |5 72100|8% 721.00 | &
20|RADIATOR FAN COWLING ASSY My - 1 g 455.20 | & 455.20 If"
21|HORN i, i 1 |8 90.00 | § 90.00 | X
22|WASHER TANK N An 1 |§ 155208 15520 | ¥
< SLEHD TOTAL PRICE S  8716.80
CollSh LESS 10% 8 871.68
SUBTOTALPRICE §  7,845.12
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
SIN DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT SINETT | TOTAL SINETT
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE ~ BeX i |§ 50.00 | § 50.00 |~
2|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS(SET)  MNa- 1 |s 20.00 | § 2000 | —
3|CENTRE GRILLE CLIPS(SET)  me- 1 |s 2000 | § 2000 | -~
3|FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING CLIPS(SET) 20 | 1 |s 20.00 | § 20.00 | 4
4{COOLANT Mo~ 1 18 80.00 | § 80.00"| 410
130 TOTAL s 190.00
CLAIM DETAILS: LABOUR AND SPRAY PAINTING (FRONT)
TO PANEL BEAT, REMOVE AND
1|REPLACE PARTS $ 1.4991{ poo
i
2|TO SPRAY PAINT AFFECTED AREA s 140000| N
3|TUFF COAT $ 15000 ¥
4|WIRING AND BULB CHECK $ sogo] >
7
REMOVE AND REFIX AIRCON L (o
5|CONDENSOR AND REFILL GAS $ 120,00 < {0
REMOVE AND REFIX RADIATOR AND (o
6| COMDUCT PRESSURE TEST ] 39,915/1
;
TOTAL $3,230.00
ESTIMATE REPORT )4 c[nl A ;
oA W 667
TOTAL PARTS COST : § 8,035.12 X
s 3ofo)is. 4k
TOTAL LABOUR COST : § 3,230.00 i
TOTAL REPAIR COST 060 5.
(K Auta Con
PR —
SURVEYOR ) o ey l\) ¢ 3k
contacTho | “TiCtC TN FAX
PART BY PART /|LUMP,SUM oy o) m ety
Ackniowledged by Repaiel
Signature:
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> Back to OneMotoring

" Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Cwrer ID:
YWehicle Details

Wehicle Mo.:

Wahicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Wehicle Maodel:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No:

ChassisMo.:

Maxirmum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Criginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amaount:

The Information contained herein is correct as at 28 Jan 2019

PARF/COE Rebale Enquiry

Company
1835M

SIR5978A
s
28 Jan 2019

CHEVROLET

OPTRA 1.6L A/T ABS AIRBAG 2WD 4DR

Grey

200%

F16D33028641
KLIMAL?619H101025
BO.O kW (107 bhp)
£3,351.00

30 Jun 2009

30 Jum 2009

2

$8.351.00

Yes
29 Jun 2019
$4,175.00

29 Jun 20179

A~ Car (1500cc & below)
10

£11.6%0,00

£490.00

$4,665.00

MIESIVILE . GOV, SO IENVTF3CIoN/ENGUINeMEDS18 0 Y FUDNCOETCTELIErEQINPULT I F U N | RN _IUSrasusud |

kil



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libk Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 19980T198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607108-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automabile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCH9001965/Avd3n2

36 ROBINSON ROAD Date : 28-02-2019

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAFORE 063877

LI

Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, SHC T2689K Veh. Inspected SJR 5838A
Policy No. Coverage (3$) 0.00
Claim No. D19000763MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From HENRY KAD Assign Date 30/01/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model CHEVROLET OPTRA c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. KL1MA19619H101025 Colour GREY
Odometer 236560 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |193/55R15 DOUBLESTAR & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/55 R15 DOUBLESTAR & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/55 R15 DOUBLESTAR B mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/55 R15 DOUBLESTAR & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORT‘I{_}_N_
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  26/01/2019 Inspection Date 30/01/20189
Survey held at MG SOLUTION PTELTD
23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4
(SOUTH WING) #02-03B
VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE,
SINGAPORE 415933
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 6 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJR 5998A

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: G256 3561 FAX: G256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 10-9607198-R

Page No..1of 2

Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rh‘lhnp?;}} {:{"
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BONNET DENTED 774.00 774.00
1|BONNET TOP LOCK DAMAGED 149,00 149.00
1|BONMNET LOWER LOCK NOT NECESSARY 247.00 -
Z|BONNET HINGE @$20.00 NOT NECESSARY 40 00 =
1|FRONT BUMPER DISTORTED 1,016.00 1,016.00
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @$49.00 NECESSARY 98.00 898.00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT DAMAGED 54200 542 00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT SPONGE CRACKED 120.00 120.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE DEFORMED B0.00 a0.00
2|FRONT BUMPER FOGLAMP COVER @%$89.20 DEFORMED 178.40 178.40
1|RADIATOR GRILLE WITH CHROME CRACKED 404.00 404,00
1|RADIATOR GRILLE LOGO NECESSARY a0.00 BO.00
2|HEADLAMP @$478.00 CRACKED 956.00 956.00
2|HEADLAMP PANEL @$280.00 MN/S BENT 560.00 280.00
2|FRONT FENDER @$399.50 TO REPAIR SEE 799,00 -
LABOUR
2|FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING @$90.50 MOT NECESSARY 181.00 -
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL (CENTRE) TO REPAIR SEE 180.00
LABOUR
1|AIRCON CONDENSOR DENTED 891.00 891,00
1|RADIATOR NOT NECESSARY 721.00 "
1|RADIATOR FAN COWLING ASSY MOT NECESSARY 45520 -
1|HORN NOT NECESSARY 80,00 -
1|WASHER TANK MOT NECESSARY 165.20 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -871.68 -556.84
784512 5,011,586
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE (5N} BENT 50.00 50.00
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (SN) MECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1|SET CENTRE GRILLE CLIPS (SM) NECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1|SET FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING CLIPS (SN) MOT NECESSARY 20.00 -

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19001965/Avd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

£1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4115
Reg. Mo: 190607198R GST Reg. Mo. 18-9607198-R

Page Mo.2 of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
Qty 2E Workshop (5))| ()
1|COOLANT (SM) MECESSARY 80.00 40.00
190.00 130.00
LABOUR
TO PANEL BEAT REMOVE AND REPLACE 1,400.00 S00.00
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT FENDER
AND FRONT SUPPORT PANEL (CENTRE).
TO SPRAY PAINT AFFECTED AREA 1,400.00 800,00
TUFF COAT, NOT MECESSARY 150.00 -
WIRING AND BULB CHECK 80.00 30.00
REMOVE AND REFIX AIRCON CONDENSOR AND REFILL 120.00 60.00
GAS
REMOVE AND REFIX RADIATOR AND CONDUCT 80,00 £0.00
PRESSURE TEST.
3,230.00 1,550.00
GRAND TOTAL 11,2656.12 6,691.56
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,000.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19001965/Avd3n2
MARKET VALUE: $8,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $4,661.00=NETT VALUE: $3,339.00

% g‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solety for the use and benefit of the Clent named cn the front page of this Report.

d 16 sy Ehird party who md

[ Pk, Ay Srd oty




