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1/31/2019

::-'B_ack to OneMotoring

PARFIC.OF Rahata Fnnniry

Eanire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type:
Owner ID:

Company
2721M

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

WC1325T

No

31Jan 2019

ISUZU

CYH52S

White

2007

6WG1406571
JALCYH52577000050

$113,869.00
23 Oct 2007
23 Oct 2007
0

$0.00

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

No

$0.00

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

22 Oct 2022

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
5

$21,477.00

$16,003.00
$16,003.00

Please note that all future COE renewals for this vehicle can only be for a 5-year period, subject to the statutory lifespan (if

applicable) of the vehicle.

The information contained hereinis correct as at 31 Jan 2019

NUPSYIVILIE.gov.sg/a/vrvacuon/enyjuireepalepyrrunicoeioreuereginpulerumu | IWIN_IUSFUau4uua |



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Justin Wong <justin.wong@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 29 January 2019 2:38 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: Appoint LKK to conduct TP survey; Our Ref: C10002566
Attachments: PRI.pdf; GIA.PDF; QUOTATION.pdf

Importance: High

Hi Team,

Please accept survey assignment and liaise with TP workshop.
Take note that our insured has yet to report the accident.
Thank you.

Regards,

Justin Wong
Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2184
F +65 6725 0853

Budget Trusted

Service

Direct Awad

LA B R

INSUrance (eefo

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924

budgetdirect.com.sqg

auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.



From: kenjilee@woodlandstransport.com.sg <kenjilee @woodla ndstransport.com.sg>
*Sent: Tuesday, 29 January 2019 12:49 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: goo@woodlandstransport.com.sg; sichan@woodlandstransport.com.sg

Subject: PRI WC1325T VS SJISR DOA 26/01/19

Dear Sir

We are instructed by Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd to notify you of a road traffic accident on 26/01//2019 at about
18:08 hrs at Junction of Punggol Central & Punggol Road involving our client’s/customer’s vehicle registration number

WCI1325T and vehicle registration number SIJSR driven by you at the material time. A copy of the Singapore accident

statement /traffic police report filed is enclosed.

As aresult of the accident, our client’s /customer’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client/we proceed to repair the damaged
vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you or your insurer would like to conduct
a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our client/we shall

proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference to you.

Please send your surveyor to our premises at No. 8 Gul Circle, Singapore 629564.

Please contact Mr Chan at Tel: 6559 8984 / 9299 4122 for an appointment to view the vehicle.

For your immediate attention and action, please.

Thank you.

Thanks and Regards,

Rewsi Lee 442

Claims Department

@Woodlands Transport'

Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd

8, Gul Circle, Singapore 629564

Main Line :+65 6559 8988 Fax :+65 6898 2394
Direct Line : +65 6559 8954
www.woodlandstransport.com.sg €2

aTEroR

Group of Companies:  WTYSirave! 2 CASHBOX

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential



6\! ] WTS Engineering Pte Ltd

YOUR REF : SJI5R
OUR REF : JW/0119/176
28 January 2019
Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited
190 CLEMENCEAU AVENUE
#03-01
SINGAPORE SHOPPING CENTRE
SINGAPORE (239924)
Dear Sir

Fax No: 67250611

We are instructed by Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd to notify you of a road traffic accident on 26/01//2019

at about 18:08 hrs at Junction of Punggol Central & Punggol Road involving our client's/customer’s vehicle

registration number WC1325T and vehicle registration number SIJ5R driven by you at the material time. A copy

of the Singapore accident statement /traffic police report filed is enclosed.

As a result of the accident, our client's /customer’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client/we proceed to repair

the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you or your

insurer would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you within the

stipulated timeline, our client/we shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference to you.

Please send your surveyor to our premises at No. 8 Gul Circle, Singapore 629564.

Please contact Mr Chan at Tel: 6559 8984 / 9299 4122 for an appointment to view the vehicle.

For your immediate attention and action, please.

Kenji Le

Claims Department

Direct Line : (65) 6559 8954

Facsimile - (65) 6898 2394

Email : kenjilee@ woodlandstransport.com.sg

WTS Engineering Pte Ltd
8, Gul Circle, Singapore 629564 Tel: 6 550 8988 Fax: 6 898 2394

URL:www woodlandstransport.com.sq

Company Regislration Number : 200505706E

0 i, Yest



an'd. subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and
privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.



Shirley Hie_w (LKK Auto)

- —
From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 11 March 2019 9:09 AM
To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
Subject: FW: WC1325T AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ IS ..

- - - LI

" Suve the Earth Print only when necessary

From: Chan Soo Lye [mailto:slchan@woodlandstransport.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 8 March, 2019 9:54 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: WC1325T AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS

Dear Rasul,

Confirmed lump Sum $2900.00 and 5 working days.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Chan Soo Lye
Service Executive
WTS Engineering Pte Ltd

@Woodlands Transport’

Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd

8, Gul Circle, Singapore 629564

Direct Line : +65 6559 8984 Fax 1 +65 6862 2163
www.woodlandstransport.com.sg @

Group of Companies: ~ WTStravel 2 -ﬁ‘" CASHBOX

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) [mailto:Rasul@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 8 March, 2019 8:58 AM




To: Chan Soo Lye
Subject: RE: WC1325T AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS

Mr Chan,

Close at 2900

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

F IR L
SLERER W Save the Farthe Print only when necessary:

From: Chan Soo Lye [mailto:sichan@woodlandstransport.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 7 March, 2019 4:30 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: WC1325T AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS

Dear Rasul,

May | propose final repair adjust to $3000.00 and 5 days.
Because We need two mechanic to remove out to repair knock and weld damaged portion axle housing and brake
chamber ASM.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Chan Soo Lye
Service Executive
WTS Engineering Pte Ltd

@Woodlands Transport‘

Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd

8, Gul Circle, Singapore 629564

Direct Line : +65 6559 8984 Fax : +65 6862 2163
www.woodlandstransport.com.sg @

Group of Companies: ~ WTStravel 2 o CASHBOX

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) ilto:Rasul@I|kkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 7 March, 2019 9:32 AM

To: Chan Soo Lye

Subject: RE: WC1325T AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS



Hi Mr Chan,

Kindly assist finalise

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

L3 74 24~

SLRRER w Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 5 March, 2019 11:29 AM

To: 'Chan Soo Lye'

Subject: RE: WC1325T AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS

Hi Mr Chan,

Refer to attachment

As per request on labour 400 more not approved anyway, | have add up $ 200 dollar more on repairing for brake
chamber & axle housing

Finalised amount is $ 2800.00 / 4 days lump sum

Kindly confirm

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LS 2=

SERIR W Suve the Earthe Print only when necessary:

From: Chan Soo Lye [mailto:sichan@woodlandstransport.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 1 February, 2019 1:20 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: WC1325T AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS

Dear Rasul,
As per request , please refer the attached file.

As spoken , quotation S/NO 8 brake chamber asm and
S/NO 9 rear axle housing oil leaking.
Both under repair.

Quotation : Labour cost may | propose adjust to $1400.00.
(refer photos attached.)
Under lum sum repair.



Thank you.

Best Regards

Chan Soo Lye
Service Executive
WTS Engineering Pte Ltd

@Woodlands Transport

Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd

8, Gul Circle, Singapore 629564

Direct Line : +65 6559 8984 Fax 1 +65 6862 2163
www.woodlandstransport.com.sg €@

Group of Companies: ~ WTStravel B T CASHBOX



MWTS18013307 / Woodlands Transport Service Pte Lid - HQ Your NCD will be affected due to late reporﬂng
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 28/01/2019 16:43

SUBMITTED BY Goo Lee Ping Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 29/01/2019 12:41

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the detalls of the accident to speed up the claims process

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver

3, Information provided must be as truthful and accurale as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withalding of material facts may allow insurance companies to
repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.

7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to coples of the report being made avallable
aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 28/01/2019 16:43

Date Of Accident 26/01/2019 18:10

Exact Location Of Accident JUC OF PUNGGOL CENTRAL & PUNGGOL ROAD
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

Vehicle Registration Number WC1325T

Insured/Policyholder

Name Of Registered Owner WOODLANDS TRANSPORT SERVICE PTE LTD
Co Reg No 198102721M

Email Address NOEMAIL

Mobile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-98383481

Alternative Phone No OFFICE-65598954

Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturer ISUzZuU

Model CYH52S

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle? NO

If No, Please state action to be taken THIRD PARTY

Vehicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company LIBERTY INSURANCE PTE LTD
Type Of Coverage THIRD PARTY

Fleet Policy YES

Policy Number SD18V10482

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver TAN CHONG POH

NRIC No S1206455A

Date Of Birth 16/08/1956

Occupation OUTDOOR

Date Of Driving Pass 31/05/1985

Driving Experience 33 YEARS AND 7 MONTHS
Gender MALE

Mobile Number (LOCAL) +65-97830352
Fax Number (LOCAL) +65-68982394
Contact Number OFFICE-65598954

EMail Address NOEMAIL

Page 10of 12



Address

Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle invalved in this accident?

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)
involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?

If Yes,Please state which Police Station
POLICE STATION NAME [OTHER]

Was notice of intended Prosecution given?
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

BLK 621 BEDOK RESERVOIR ROAD #11-1476
470621
YES

COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
CLEAR
DRY

NO
2
YES
YES
YES

NO

YES

EUNOS NPP
NO

On 26/01/2019, at about 18 :08 hrs, | was approaching the junction of the Punggol central & Punggol Road and came to a
complete stop as the traffic light was red .| was about 4 cars length away from the junction.When suddenly, | felt an impact from
the back of my truck.| alighted and discovered that a vehicle SJJ5R on the 3rd lane facing oncoming traffic.l believe the vehicle
had collided onto the rear of my truck as there were debris of the said car at the rear of my truck.There was a vehicle SLN3731M
about 1 car length behind my truck.The car may have captured what happened .Subsequently, ambulance and traffic police
arrived al the scene and the driver of SJJ5R was conveyed to the hospital.As a result, my truck sustained damages.No one was

injured.

Attachment(s)

Are accidenl photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?

Was there any audio recorded?

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category

Name of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

Postcode

YES
NO
NO

SJJ5R

PRIVATE CAR

Page 2 of 12
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Insurance Company Name

Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Name

Approximate Age

Injuries Sustain

Injured person in which vehicle? SJJ5R
Were seat belts worn?

Was this injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Address
Postcode

YES

Page 3 of 12



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.
2. This Form must be completed by the Pol Ider and/or sed Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withholding of material
facts may allow insurance companies to repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by Insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance
companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Association of Singapore (GIA) for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by
interested parties.

7. By the lodgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of

the report being made available aforesaid.

8. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA)
| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

(a) My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore ("GIA") may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal information set out in this [form] and any other personal information \
provided by me or possessed by my Insurer (collectively the “Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information to all insurer{s) whao have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident {all insurer(s) who have insured
vehicle(s) invalved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the “Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Monetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority (such as the police), for the purpose(s)
of

(i) processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating to the claims;

(i) Investigating the accident and/or my claims;
(iil) carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

(iv) administering my claims (including the malling of correspondence, statements, invoices, reports or notices to me,
which could involve disclosure of certain persanal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

{v) complying with applicable law in administering, processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims. [collectively the
“Purposes”)

{b) allinsurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal Infarmation for one or more of the above Purposes; and

{c) my Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or
agents(including thelr lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the above Purposes.

(d) my Persanal Information will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
investigation and management in present and all future claims.

(e) the information so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosed:

(i} to allinsurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling ar managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the pirphses stated, or

{ii) fopeomplying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders,

L
Policyholder's Signature Driver's SiLna!u.re Reporting Centre Personnel’s Signature
Date & Time: {If driver is not the policyholder] Name:
Date B Time: NRIC/FIN No.:

Page 4 of 12
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Sketch Plan #2 Pg. 1
CSKETCH Pl AN

I
I I
I I
| | g Central
| # |
I I
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tle || T

A -WC1325T
B- SJI5R

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

Junction of Punggol Road & Punggol

DECLARATION
I/We declare t| regoing particulars are true in every respect.

QA

Policyholder's Signature Driver's shnature Reporting Centre Personnel’s Signature
Date & Time: (If driver is not the policyholder) Name:;
Date & Time: NRIC/FIN No.:

Page 50f 12



POLICE REPORT Pg. 1

SINGAPORE T

T/20190126/2167

Police Station Of Origin: fofs
Eunos NPP Report No. T/20190126/2167
629 Bedok Reservoir Road #01-1620

SINGAPORE 470629

Tel No: 1800-4439999

REPORT OF A TRAFFIC ACCIDENT

Date/Time Report Made: Vide Report No.-
26/01/2019 21:16

Station Diary No.:

{1}

InTformant’s.
adaillis AL U]

Name of Informant: Address:
TAN CHONG POH APT BLK 621 BEDOK RESERVOIR ROAD #1 1-1476
SINGAPORE 470621 ;
ID Type /1D No.: Contact No.: .
NRIC NO / S1206455A Home/Office: Mobile: 97830352
Nationality: Email:
, _SINGAPORE CITIZEN
Sex: Age: Date of Birth: | Type of Informant:
Male 62 16/08/1956 Driver
Race: Language: Institution / School Name:
Chinese English
Qccupation: Driving Licence Information:
MIXER TRUCK DRIVER Class:; 3,4,5 Date of Expiry:

‘i’ype of Loc:-ation:_
Accident: Straight Road
Location:
Along Road 1 Traveling Toward Road 2
PUNGGOL CENTRAL
PUNGGOL ROAD
Travelling from Punggoi Central towards Punggol Road
Weather; Road Surface: Road Speed Limit;
Clear Dry
Traffic Flow: Traffic Control: Traffic Volume;
One Way Traffic Light - Working Moderate
Type of Collision: Anyone conveyed by
Between Moving Vehicles - Head To Rear ambulance:
No — !

3. e 4 ‘Make ol n “No'ofPassan er
SJJ5R Car HYUNDAI 0
SLN3731M | Car MAZDA 0
WC1325T | Cement Mixer| 1ISUZU White Slightly |0

Truck XMA@

Page 6 of 12



POLICE REPORT Pg. 1

P M.

Police Station Of Origin: 2ot
Eunos NPP Report No. T/20180126/2167
828 Bedok Reservoir Road #01-1620

SINGAPORE 470629 CONTINUATION OF REPORT

Tel No: 1800-4439999

Lﬁz-rlﬁ Al A
Any Pedestrian Involved: No

| No. of Pedestrians Injured: NIL Use of Bedsstian Chossing HiA.
TAN CHONG POH ~ |IDNo. | S1208455A
Related Vehicle | WC1325T (Cement Mixer Truck) Contact No.| 97830352
Hospital/Clinic | NIL Class of Class: 34,5
Driving Date of Expiry: NIL
Licence &
Expiry Date
Date Treatment | NIL Date Discharge | NIL
No. of Days granted Medical Leave | NIL Degree of Injury | NIL

Brief Details.

On 26 Jan 2019 at about 5.50pm, | was driving my cement mixer truck (License Plate: WC1 325T) along
Punggol Central with the intention to turn right into Punggol Road. | was travelling alone and was on the
first of 4 lanes. | was traveliing on the first lane as it is the only lane that turns right into Punggol Road.

On the same day at about 6.08pm, | was approaching the junction of Punggol Central and Punggol Road,
| came to a complete stop at the traffic light was red. | was about 4 cars length away from the junction of
Punggol Central and Punggol Road. When suddenly, | felt an impact from the back of my truck. | alighted
from my truck and discovered a black Hyundai (License Plate: SJJ5R) on the third lane facing oncoming
traffic. | believe the black Hyundai had collided onto the left rear side of my truck as there were debris of
the black car on the road near the left rear of my truck, There was a black Mazda (License Plate:
SLN3731M) about 1 car length behind my truck, this said vehicle has an in-car camera and may have
captured what happened.

Traffic Police and Ambulance were at scene. The driver of the black Hyundai was conveyed by
ambulance. | did not managed to get the particulars of any drivers. There is no in-car camera in my truck.
| am not injured. | am lodging this report as requested by Traffic Police. The reference number is
F/20190126/0206 and the Investigation Officer is Bei Fang (Tel: 65476415).

Page 7 of 12



POLICE REPORT Pg. 1

SINGAPORE
POLICE FORCE

Police Station Of Origin:

Eunos NPP

629 Bedok Reservoir Road #01-1620
SINGAPORE 470629

Tel No: 1800-4439999

Sketch Plan
Informant is not able to provide sketch plan

LT

01

30f3
Report No. T/20180126/2167

CONTINYATION OF REPORT

"4 IMPORTANT: Please attach a copy of your vehicle's Insurance Certificate to this report. If you don't have
the certificate with you now, please fax a copy to 65474885 stating the report number as reference.

P
Signature Of Officer Recording The Repprt/
G/
Sr Staff Sgt MUHAMED SHAMIR S/O HA 1D
GHOUSE ™

Signature Of Informant;

Signature Of Interpreter:
Not applicable

Officer In Charge Of Case:
TP/GIT/

S| YEO CHUN JIAN
Contact No.: 65476213

Date/Time: ;
26/01/2018 21:16

Classification Of Case:

Authentication Stamp
NP166
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| G\D WTS Engineering
WTS Engineering Pte Ltd
8 Gul Circle, Singapore 629564 Tel: 65598984 Fax: 68622163
Company Registration Number: 200505706E
Quotation
DATE: 29/01/19 LOCATION: Gul Workshop
VEHICLE NO: WC1325T Q REF No: Q19/01/982
DRIVER: TAN CHONG POH DEPARTMENT:  WTS Mixer Truck Department
ATTENTION TO: ACCIDENT DATE: 26/01/19
PREPARED BY: Chan Soo Lye REF No: jw-0118-176
SIN | Description | Qty l Cost per Unit] Amount S$
Spare Parts

1 |[FIBRICATE WASHING BUCKET 1/ 1 350 350.00( (9,

2 |FIBRICATE REAR LHS METAK MUDGUARD COVER M v il 1 300 300.00

3 |REARLHS MUDGUARD RUBBER ELAP 4N /~ 1 30 30.00 '”;L

4 |REARLHS TAIL LAMP C#&4 rd 1 150 150.00 1(,31"

5 |FIBRICATE REAR LHS TAIL LAMP BRACKET. !‘trw\/ ~ 1 120 120.00 .

6 |BOLT,BRACKET ,TRUNION #As ~ 6 12 72.00

7 |ROD ASSY, TORQUE REAR SUSP o ~ 1 1018.9 1,018.90

8 |BRAKE CHAMBER ASM ? ' ¥ 1 1650.25 1,650.25

9 |REAR AXLE HOUSEING ( USED NET PRICE) /. for*-ﬂ/ 1 2000 2,000.00
Labour Costs ,

1 TO REMOVE AND RE-INSTALL LHS REAR TYRE FOR FACILITY 1 1600 oA, .00
REPAIR.CHECK REAR TRUNNION BRACKET CONDITION AND 12 S-(}
REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS TORQUE ROD ASSY REAR {/‘-'\9'6 ,a'
SUSPENSION , BRAKE CHAMBER ASM AND REAR AXLE HOUSEING..

2 |TOWING SERVICE -1 TRIP. - B} 1 150] | 150.00)/

TOTAL: 7,441.15
Total Amount SGD 7,441.15
Remarks: 1330
cinl. 1S
b [O /’
. | | .
A 2411 Lo 261\ L 2a/1[[9
Signature of WOrkshop Dpt Signature of Department Heai \Slgnature of Claim D&panment
A

R

Surveydr Sign:

<
' SUMWrName_[M
ot b €340 Hs




. @ WTS Engineering

WTS Engineering Pte Ltd

8 Gul Circle, Singapore 629564 Tel: 65598984 Fax: 68622163

Company Registration Number: 200505706E

Quotation
DATE: 31/01/19 LOCATION: Gul Workshop
VEHICLE NO: WC1325T7 Q REF No: Q19/01/983
DRIVER: TAN CHONG POH DEPARTMENT: WTS Mixer Truck Department
ATTENTION TO: ACCIDENT DATE: 26/01/19
PREPARED BY: Chan Soo Lye REF No: JW-0119-176
SIN | Description ] Qty ] Cost per Unltl Amount S$| %
Spare Parts Wi
1 |TORQUE ROD BRACKET 1 ., 300 A7 30000 / 25%
2 |REAR LHS TYRE 192X80X22.5 S/M PS5V 1 F7, 360 A 3peb0| A
J ‘TOTAL: 660.00
Total Amount SGD 660.00
Remarks: 50’]
SUPPLEMENTARY QUOTATION 2

3:{('(7‘

Signature of Workshop Dpt

Signature of Department Head

Surveyor Sign:

Surveyor Name:

Date: ____

—— ———

/M/ 11 77

Signature of Claim Department

= r{'53-7(>
L - 15 oV
e 10
Mrr‘l';r ?dq:
/ 252"
S =
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198BR GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AUTO & GENERAL INSURANCE (S) PL Ref : CS/AGI19001928/R1sd3e2
S ENENGEA AV B T
15?3558”52‘ cs:ﬁg%?l\f\l%NgEErﬁ}sgglNGAPORE Date: 13032019
239924
Code: AGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJJ 5R Veh. Inspected WC 1325T
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. C10002566 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JUSTIN WONG Assign Date 29/01/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model ISUZU CYH528 c.c 15681
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2007
Chassis No. JALCYH52S77000050 Colour WHITE
Odometer 263901 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[295/80 R22.5 AUSTONE 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |295/80 R22.5 AUSTONE 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |295/80 R22.5 (D) AUSTONE 8/8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |295/80 R22.5 (D) AUSTONE 8/8 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  26/01/2019 llnspection Date 30/01/2018
Survey held at WOODLANDS TRANSPORT SERVICE PTE. LTD.
8 GUL CIRCLE
SINGAPORE 629564
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

5 Working Days




' ’d 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. WC 1325T
Description of Parts Condiion'ie | 2t MeEEN 3| OurAdjusted
Q‘V 9schR - o Workshop ()| (5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FIBRICATE WASHING BUCKET BENT 350.00 350.00
1|FIBRICATE REAR LHS METAK MUDGUARD COVER BENT 300.00 300.00
1|REAR LHS MUDGUARD RUBBER FLAP TORN 30.00 30.00
1|REAR LHS TAIL LAMP CRACKED 150.00 150.00
1|FIBRICATE REAR LHS TAIL LAMP BRACKET TO REPAIR SEE 120.00 -
LABOUR
6|BOLT, BRACKET, TRUNION @$12.00 NECESSARY 72.00 72.00
1|ROD ASSY, TORQUE REAR SUSP BROKEN 1,018.90 1,018.90
1|BRAKE CHAMBER ASM TO REPAIR SEE 1,650.25 -
LABOUR
1|REAR AXLE HOUSEING TO REPAIR SEE 2,000.00 -
LABOUR
1|TORQUE ROD BRACKET (ADDITIONAL) BENT 300.00 300.00
LESS 15% DISCOUNT - -333.14
5.991.15 1,887.76
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR LHS TYRE 192X80X22.5 (SN) (ADDITIONAL) (70%) |CUT 360.00 252.00
360.00 252.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE AND RE-INSTALL LHS REAR TYRE FOR 1,600.00 1,350.00
FACILITY REPAIR. CHECK REAR TRUNNION BRACKET
CONDITION AND REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS TORQUE
ROD ASSY REAR SUSPENSION, BRAKE CHAMBER ASM
AND REAR AXLE HOUSEING. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR
OF FIBRICATE REAR LHS TAIL LAMP BRACKET, BRAKE
CHAMBER ASM AND REAR AXLE HOUSEING.
TOWING SERVICE - 1 TRIP 150.00 150.00
1,750.00 1,500.00
GRAND TOTAL 8,101.15 3,639.76
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,900.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/AGI19001928/R1sd3e2

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




