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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Quantum Risk <Info@quantum-risk.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 February, 2019 5:21 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: New Assignment from insurer - SLB4153M (OD) // QRM REF : SLB4153M (OD) / 

DOA : 26/01/2019 [External Confidential]

Hi Gerald Poh , 

 

Good day to you. 

 

As confirmed earlier that there’s no fee incurred. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Regards, 

Nurrasyiqah 

Admin Assistant  

 
8 Ubi Road 2 

#06-07 Zervex Building 

Singapore 408538 

Tel: +65 6444 2112  

Fax: +65 6538 0121  

 

Quantum Risk Management (S) Pte Ltd Company registration 201415836W 
The information contained in this message and any attachment(s) may be privileged and confidential and is intended for the exclusive use of the 
addressee designated. If you are not the addressee any disclosure, reproduction, distribution, on-transmission, dissemination or use of the 
communication is strictly prohibited. Whilst any attachments may have been checked for viruses you should rely on your own virus checking 
programmes and procedures. To facilitate our communications we will store on our database your e-mail name and address together with any other 
contact details you have provided. Any views expressed in this message are those of the individual sender, except where the sender specifically 
states them to be the views of  Quantum Risk Management Pte Ltd. 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  

Sent: 27 February 2019 3:22 PM 

To: Quantum Risk <Info@quantum-risk.com.sg> 

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: New Assignment from insurer - SLB4153M (OD) // QRM REF : SLB4153M (OD) / DOA : 26/01/2019 

[External Confidential] 

 

Lonpac External - Confidential 
Dear Nurrasyifaq, 

 
We wish to advise that our insured has withdrawn his OD claim 

and shall bear the repair to his vehicle on his own. 
 
We confirmed that there is no fee incurred since the vehicle has yet to be 

survey.    
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Best Regards 

Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 

From: Quantum Risk [mailto:Info@quantum-risk.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February, 2019 2:01 PM 
To: peiying@smemotor.com.sg; GERALD POH WEE BIN 

Cc: Ong Soo Ching; Philomin Raj Jenifer Monica 
Subject: RE: New Assignment from insurer - SLB4153M (OD) // QRM REF : SLB4153M (OD) / DOA : 26/01/2019 

 

Hi Pei Ying , 

 

As spoken earlier, you have confirmed the vehicle is not in for survey. 

 

Kindly contact us for survey arrangement (1 day advance). 

 

Hi Gerald Poh  ,  

 

We acknowledge receipt of the assignment and will update you on our findings upon completion of survey. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Regards, 

Nurrasyiqah 

Admin Assistant  

 
8 Ubi Road 2 

#06-07 Zervex Building 

Singapore 408538 

Tel: +65 6444 2112  

Fax: +65 6538 0121  

 

Quantum Risk Management (S) Pte Ltd Company registration 201415836W 
The information contained in this message and any attachment(s) may be privileged and confidential and is intended for the exclusive use of the 
addressee designated. If you are not the addressee any disclosure, reproduction, distribution, on-transmission, dissemination or use of the 
communication is strictly prohibited. Whilst any attachments may have been checked for viruses you should rely on your own virus checking 
programmes and procedures. To facilitate our communications we will store on our database your e-mail name and address together with any other 
contact details you have provided. Any views expressed in this message are those of the individual sender, except where the sender specifically 
states them to be the views of  Quantum Risk Management Pte Ltd. 
 

From: Do-Not-Reply <do-not-reply@merimen.com>  

Sent: 20 February 2019 12:20 PM 

To: Quantum Risk <Info@quantum-risk.com.sg> 

Subject: New Assignment from insurer - SLB4153M (OD) 
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Dear Sir/Mdm, 

 

Please note that the Insurer has assigned this case to Quantum Risk Management Pte Ltd for survey. 

 

To view this record, please login to www.merimen.com.sg 

 

 

Thanks, 

The Merimen Team  

 

This is an auto-generated email. Do not reply to this email.  

 

 

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software. 

www.avg.com  

 


