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SG 98 VIOTORPTE LTD

4001, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1 #01-21 SINGAPORE 588622
Tel: 6452 4868 Fax: 6452 4868
Emall; sg_motor_enferprise@yahoo.com.sg

Date: 29 January 2019

To @ LKK By Fax: 62564315
Attn - Mr Bryan
Tel
VEHICLE NO FF 4887D Yamaha RXZ
ACCIDENT DATE 26th January 2018
Description Oty Quotation §
1 Fuel Tank Pevk N 1 450.00 L—
2 Head Lamp # covns Dol 1 380,00 &
3 Head Lamp Cover € 1 180.00
4 Handle Bar Z WF 1 15500 &
5 RH Mirror Owd 1 65.00 —«—
B8 Head Lamp Stay Z W4 1 12500 & —
7 Front Mudguard ¢ 1 155.00 —
8 Brake Lever bk 1 68.00 =
8 Balancer p. u|g 1 sat E-ﬁﬂaﬂ-ﬁﬂ [
10 Fork Tube 2 Aishndr~ 2 48000 <
11 Front RH Signal b Waa- 1 95.00 —
12 Brake Pedal |64 1 8500
13 Gear Shifter g =1 1 80.00 %,
14 Gear Pedal ¥ HM 1 75.00 r@® K
15 Exhaust Pipe €uw 1 380.00~
18 Rear Fool Rest Bracket ket 1 95.00 A4
17 Rear Foot Rest Rubber RH bl 1 60.00
18 Front Foot Rest RH 4 l,_-,_*- 1 88.00
Sub-Total 3.176.00
Legs 10% 31780
: Sup-Total 285840
‘1\ n) M# L 'S:*E\_’_, » — = = I

Trond Yodt Bk Signid [ o B0
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3581 FAX. 6256 4315

Reg No 199607188R GST Reg, No 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

B SHENTON WAY #24-01
AXATOWERSINGAPORE DG8811

Ret CC4/ASM18001902/Dhb3

Date : 28-01-2019

[N

Code: ASM
i Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHB 9792H Veh, Inspected FF 48870
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 29/01/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model| c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Madification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  26/01/2019 Inspection Date 30/01/2018
Survey held at SG 58 MOTOR PTE LTD
BLK 4001 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 1
#01-21 SINGAPORE 568622
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




172842019 Claim Portal

<« Service Request Details

Claim
S9MOD1C2L

Reforence

None #

Loss Date
lanuary 26, 2019

Resjuest Date
January 29, 2019

D= Date
February 7, 2019

Vendar MNamie '“
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) Ruge W
Tvpe of Loss

Third Party Viehicle Damage

Services
Pending verification - Direct Settlement

Actions

Mext Step
Agree to perform service

J

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
FF4BETD

Make
TPVD

hmsmmmmw.mlmmmmnManﬂmmm himif/sarvice-requests/?serviceReguestNumbar=35883 12



Catherine Ehnnﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: 5g Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.comsg>

Sent: Monday, 28 January, 2019 6:19 PM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey
Cc Sg Motor

Subject: Pise arrange PRI on bike FF 4887D as per attached
Attachments: FF 48870 PRI pdf

Categories: Shailendra

Attn: Maotor Claims Dapt

Plse arrange PRI on bike FF 4887D as per attached.

Thank You

Aegards
Leena

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Bik 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898



Hsiao Tnna (LKKAuto) '
l"

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 May 2019 1:14 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuUto)

Cc: Sg Motar

Subject: LKK Ref CC4/ASM 19001902/Dhb3 (Our ref: FF 4BB7D)
Attachments: FF 4BB7D Claim Status,pdf

Refer to the above claim, we would like to do a direct
settlement for the property damage to our client's bike FF 48870

Allached plse find the relevant documents for your perusal

1) Invoice for Cost of Repairs
2) GIA Report
3) Police Report

Plse advise liability.

We seek your assistance 1o expedite this claim as we wish lo
close the file.

Thank You

Regards
Leena

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898



Hsiao TnnE (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong ILKKAutD)

Sent: Sunday, 25 August 2019 11:52 AM

To: 5g Motor

Cc Sg Mator

Subject: RE: LKK Ref CC4/ASM19001902/Dpb3 (Our ref: FF 4887D)

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Please be informed that liability is unclear, Kindly advise if there is any evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos /
PIR) from your client.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
fram this negotiation of terms/settlement.

in the event of new evidence belng discovered or subseguently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liabllity/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settiement.”

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEKEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 67az2-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 2o2-25 | S(408033)

From: 5g Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 August 2019 3:57 PM

To: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: LKK Ref: CC4/ASM19001902/Dpb3 (Our ref: FF 4887D)

Dear Hsiao Tong

May | know the status for this case.

Thank You

Regards
Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 645268098



On Wednesday. 12 June 2019, 10:12:41 am GMT+8, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear SirsMdm,

We refer to the above matter

Please be infarmed that liability is unclear. Our insured driver reported that your client drive too close to his taxi and
hit onto his taxi. Attached here with a copy of our insured driver accident report for your easy reference.

Kindly let us have evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) in order for us to look into the matter

Appreciate and early reply

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
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It Yes.against whom?
Circumstances of Accident

On 26.01.2019 at abiout 1600 hours, | was heading lowards Capn Hotel Lobby Driveway. Su{_ﬂanh; | felt an
(FF4BB7D) which was travelling so close on my nght and hit onto my lax nght side front porton,

Attachmenl(s)

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability,
whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settiement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/infiuence on the issucs of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards.

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auts Consultants e Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhi@iikkauto com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Libi Avenue |, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000 & yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 June 2018 12:06 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @ kkauto.com:

Cc: Sg Motor r_entarpri ahoo.

Subject: LKK Rel: CC4/ASM 19001802/Dhb3 (Our ref: FF 4B87D)

Dear Vic

May | know the liability for this case.



Thank You

Regards

Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd
Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 560622

Tel 64524898 Fax 64526898

On Wednesday, 29 May 2019, 1:14:26 pm GMT+8, Sg Motor

Refer to the above claim, we would like to do a direct

settlement for the property damage to our client's bike FF 4887D

Attached plse find the relevant documents for your perusal

1) Invoice for Cost of Repairs

2) GIA Repon

3) Police Report

Fise advise liability.

We seek your assistance to expedite this claim as we wish to

close the file

Thank You



Regards

Leena

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd
Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel 64524898 Fax 54526896



Cnzae Claim Portal

 <TP - Mandate IA> - S9MO1C2L [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
« Rt A BT DN e o1 2019

Type
@ CQuestion

Message

Liability: 50%. Both parties had given a conflict of version. No video/ concrete evidence from both parties.
Inform Ol about third party clam.Will let insurance to handle. We seek your mandate up to 50% -
$1.275.00(all-in). TP-Mandate |A had been uploaded in Smartclaims, Kindly let us have your
approval/instruction. Hslao Tang - 21 Nov 2019

E3

nips:ivp smanciams.axa. com sg'clam-poralhtmindex-vondor-servce-roguests. himit servce-requestsiew-message’ Tservica Requesthumbe. 1
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Immediate Advice

To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 21/11/2019

Survey Details:

Date of loss 26-Jan-19
Date of appointment 29-Jan-19
Date of survey 30-Jan-19
Location of survey SG 98 MOTOR PTE LTD

Vehicle Details:

Claim Type: Third party
Vehicle number FF 4887D
Make and Model YAMAHA RXZ
Date of registration b/1/19EE
Excess
Market Value SB.000
Parf Rebate 54,421
Nett Loss 53,579
Repair details:
[initial Estimate E 3,718.40 |
Proposed/Revised repair cost:
Parts S 2,660.40
Check items (estimate) S -
Labour S 410.00
Total S 3.070.40
Lump Sum(if applicable) 5 2,450.00

|Number of days for repair |

al
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No video/ evidence submitted by both parties. Propose 50/50.

Mandate:
Liability(TP) 50%
Proposed repair cost 5 2.450.00
Loss of use S 100.00 |(4days x $25)
Loss of rental MIL no. of days
Loss of income NIL no. of days
5 2,550.00

@50% | 5 1,275.00
LTA search fees NIL
Others NIL
Proposed Total s 1,275.00




Hsiao Tou lu{KAutnz

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuUtD)
Sent: Friday, 22 November 2019 5:48 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: New message for service request 95993, vehicle number FF4887D
12612018
[] [EMAIL TD TF: LIABILITY UNCLEAR* REQUEST EVIDENCE CHT |10.01:09
A4
' - = m | ~ [12erz018
[]/SENT LETTER TO O VIA EMAIL (30/50) CHT [10:08:00
' AM

Message AXA Liabliity S0% Both parfies had given a conflict of version, No video/
cancrete evidence from both parties. Inform Ol about third party claim Wil let insuranca to 211172019,
[]'handie, We seek your mandate up to 50% - $1.275.00(all-in). TP-Mandate |A had been CHT 02345 AM
uploaded In Smariclaims, Kindly let us have your approvalinstruction. Hsiao Tong — 21

Nov2019 .
2211112019
[] 12211119 9:12 Al NG Stacey —pls proceed LSP |oas08 Al

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

—--Driginal Message-----

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 22 November 2012 9:14 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.coms

Subject: PW: New message for service request 95993, vehicle number FF4887D

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | emall: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

——0QOriginal Message-—
From: stacey.ng@axa.com.sg [mallto:stacey.ng@axa.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 22 November 2019 9:13 AM



Hsiao Tnng (LKKAuto)

From: Sg motor enterprise Glam <sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.comsg>
Sent: Friday, 6 December 2019 12:47 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: LKK Ref CC4/ASM19001902/Dpb3 (Our ref: FF 4887D)

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Ok accpetance pls provide DV

thank you
rse

On Wednesday, 4 December 2019, 05:24:53 pm GMT+8, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter

We are of the opinion that this is a case of confiicting versions. There 1s no concrete evidence(ie Video footage) yet
to support either party's version. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident repor for your
perusal.

Strictly without admission of liability whatever, but with a view towards a resolutions of your client's claim in the above
matter without resort to litigation, we are prepared to offer at a global sum of $1,250.00(all-in) towards your client's
claim

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed ! inferred from this negotiation of terms/seitlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

fest Regards,



Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chegwht®klkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Sunday, 25 August 2019 11:52 AM

To: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo com.sg>

Subject: RE: LKK Ref CC4/ASM19001902/Dpb3 (Our ref: FF 4B870)

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Please be informed that liability is unclear Kindly advise if there is any evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos /
PIR) from your client

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of lability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settiement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlemeant.”

Hest Regards,
Hsian Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-2197 | email: chewht® |kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108



Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 20 August 2019 3:57 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto com>
Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo com.sg>; Vic (LKKAuto) < Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: LKK Ref CC4/ASM19001202/Dpb2 (Our ref. FF 4887D)

Dear Hsiao Tong

May | know the status for this case.

Thank You

Regards

Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd
Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industnial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel 64524898 Fax: 64526898

On Wednesday, 12 June 2019, 10:12:41 am GMT+8, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,



Ve refer to the above matter.

Flease be informed that liability Is unclear Our insured driver reported that your client drive too close to his taxi and
hit onto his taxi. Attached here with a copy of our insured driver accident report for your easy reference

Kindly let us have evidences (le: video footage/ scene photes / PIR) in order for us to look into the matter.

Appreciate and early reply
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

Plehie 1@ W2 A4k GIA repord

e

It Yes.against whom?
Circumstances of Accident

On 26.01.2019 at about 1600 hours, | was heading towards Capri Hotel Lobby Driveway. Suddenly | [eit an
(FF48870) which was travelling so close on my nght and hil onto my laxi righl side front portion,

Attachment(s)

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of lability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

4



In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid

Phone 6742-3197 | emall: chewhi@lkkaulo com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday. 11 June 2018 12:06 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto com>

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor _enterpnse@yahco com.sg>
Subject: LKK Ref: CC4/ASM 18001302/0hb3 (Our ref. FF 4B87D)

Dear Vic

May | know the liability for this case

Thank You

Regards

Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd
Bl 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1



Singapore 569622

Tel 64524898 Fax: 64526898

On Wednesday, 28 May 2019, 1:14:26 pm GMT+8, Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo com sg> wrole

Refer to the above claim, we would like to do a direct
settlement for the property damage to our client’s bike FF 4887D

Attached plse find the relevant documents for your perusal

1) Invoice for Cost of Repairs
2) GIA Report
3) Police Report

Plse advise liability

We seek your assistance to expedite this claim as we wish to
close the file.

Thank You

Regards
Leena

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel 64524898 Fax: 645268598



SG 98 VIOTORPTELTD

4001, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1 #01-21 SINGAPORE 588622
Tel! 6452 4680 Fax: 6452 4088

Emall: sg_motor_snierprize@yahoo.com.sg
DATE: 28 May 2019 Invoice No: SGS8-PD-18-055
AXA |nsurance S'pore Ple Lid LETTER OF DEMAND
8 Shenton Way
H2T-01 AXA Towers
SINGAPORE 068811
Yaour Insured: SHB 9792H

Date of Accident:  26-Jan-18

Location: Changi Business Park Central 1 outside C.C.P

FINAL REPAIR COSTS
VEHICLE NO. _FF 4887D (Yamaha RX2)

Cost of Repair for Vahicle No.: FF 4887D {lump sum) $2 450.00
Loss of Use: 4 days x $30 $120.00
Total: $2.570.00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS: TWO THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED SEVENTY ONLY
Noloes:

1. AN cheque paymeni should be "Cmassd” and meds payable fo SG 58 MOTOR PTELTD
2. All chogue should hive eiir "lmvoles No™ writlen on the reverss side of the chaque
2. For lurthar enguirias on this lnvolcs, plesse fel free to contact us

W

5G 98 Motor Pte Ltd
LG




SG 98 VIOTORPTELTD

4001, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1 #01-21 SINGAFORE 569822
Tel: 6452 4888 Fax: B452 4558

Email: mg_motor_snierprissi@yahoo.com.sg

DATE: 28 May 2019 Invoice No: 5G98-PD-18-055

AXA Insurance S'pore Pte Lid PD - Direct Settlement
8 Shenton Way

#27-01 AXA Towers

SINGAPORE DBBB11

Your Insurad: SHB §782H
Date of Accident  28-Jan-18

Location: Changl Business Park Central 1 outside C.C.P

FINAL REPAIR COSTS
VEHICLE NO. FF 4887D (Yamaha RXZ)

Cost of Repair for Vehicle No.: FF 4B87D (lump sum) $2,450.00
Total: $2,450.00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS: TWO THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED FIFTY ONLY
Hotas:

1. Al chegua paymend should b "Crossad” and made payabls io $G 58 MOTOR FTELTD
2 NI cheque should have aur “Invalce Mo® wrillen on the roverse side of the chegue
3. For furlher anguides on this involee, please foel froa ta conlnct us

5G 98 Motor Pte Ltd
18




_" 1 74 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Al B 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park, Singapare 408833
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 128607158R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

GMMiM!MW

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

S TORERGAORE ot owe:ssssan | [N
ATTN.STACEY NG Code: ASM
=
Insured Veh. SHB 8792H Veh. Inspected FF 4887D
Policy No. VPX/P1680520 Coverage () 0.00
Claim No. S8MO1C2ZL Excess (§) 0.00
ﬂuinn From Assign Date 28/01/2019
Make & Model YAMAHA RXZ. c.C 133
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 1988
Chassis No. 2UX000791 Colour PURPLE / BLUE _
Odometer 93185 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD

R/H Front Tyre |70/80 R18 DUNLOP 3mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre |BO/SOR18 g DUNLOP amm

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAM&GEE A.T TI-fE N‘.'S & DJ'S EDDY

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

Accident Date  26/01/2018 Inspection Date 30/01/2019
Survey held at SG 98 MOTOR PTE LTD

BLK 4001 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 1
ﬂ1-21 SINGAPDRE 569622

—

5, Remarks
e |5 T S ———=—— — VNIRRT e B

A)THE INSPECTION WﬁS EDNDUCTED ON A"‘MTHDUT PREJUDIGE' BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

4 Working Days




7

X

L7L”

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL 8258 1561 FAX: 82568 4315

Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. Mo. 18-9607188-R Page No.|1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. FF 4887D

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FUEL TANK (CONSISTENT) DENTED - 450,00 450.00
1|HEAD LAMP COVER (CONSISTENT) BROKEN . 380,00 300.00
1|HEAD LAMP COVER (CONSISTENT) cur 180.00 180.00
1|HANDLE BAR (CONSISTENT) BENT “155.00 155.00
1|RH MIRROR (CONSISTENT) cuT 65.00 65.00
1|HEAD LAMP STAY (CONSISTENT) BENT 125.00 125.00
1|FRONT MUDGUARD (CONSISTENT) cuT © 155,00 155.00
1|ERAKE LEVER (CONSISTENT) BROKEN 68.00 68.00
1|SET BALANCER O/S (CONSISTENT) cuTt 130.00 65.00
2|FORK TUBE (CONSISTENT) DISTORTED » 480.00 480.00
1|FRONT RH SIGNAL (CONSISTENT) BROKEN 85.00 89500
1|BRAKE PEDAL (CONSISTENT) BENT 85.00 85.00
1|GEAR SHIFTER (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 80.00) B
1|GEAR PEDAL (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 75.00 -
1|EXHAUST PIPE (CONSISTENT) cut 380.00 380.00
1|REAR FOOT REST BRACKET (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 95.00 -
{|REAR FOOT REST RUBBER RH [CONSISTENT) BROKEN 60.00 60.00
1|FRONT FOOT REST RH (CONSISTENT) BENT / CUT 88.00 £8.00
1|FRONT LEFT HAND SIGNAL (CONSISTENT) BROKEN 85.00 85.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -327.10 -295.60
2,843.90 2,660.40

LABOUR
TOWING FEES. - 40.00 30,00
REMOVE & REPLACE PARTS ALIGN & ETC. -~ 250,00 180.00
:ErWE & REPLACE FORK TUBE & TOP UP FORK DIL 120.00 80.00
L.

PUTTY ,RESPRAY PAINT 2 TONE 450.00 120.00
860.00 410.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,803.90 3,070.40

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM19001902/Dpa3q2




ANG BRYAN TANI
Automoltive Assessor | Investigator

Ri%isil
Py I

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18001902/Dpa3q2

[ 1 Tull ha! NeROrt winaly

DISCLAMIER OF LLABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repor is mads sslely for the uss snd benefit ol the Client namsd an (he front pege of this Repon.

I
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