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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page | of |

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type: Business
Owner ID: 1997M
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: GBH4592R
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 26 Mar 2019
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: HIACE VAN TURBO 5DR MT
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2018
Engine No.: 1KD2806098
Chassis No.: JTFHTO2P100243053
Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value: $28,138.00
Original Registration Date: 13 Jun 2018
First Registration Date: 13 Jun 2018
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $1,407.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 12 Jun 2028
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10 h
QP Paid: $29.901.00
COE Rebate Amount: $27,549.00
Total Rebate Amount: $27,549.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 26 Mar 2019

OK

https://vrl lta.gov sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBefore Dereglnput 2FUNCTION  1D=F030...

26-Mar-19



Estimate Repon hitp://z] .ocadn com/accidents/claims/estimate_reporuC101894

7-ONE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &, 2lk D #801-85/87, Autobay@Kaki Bukit Singapored 17883

Tel: 82502115/6634211) Fax: E634212

Emall: service @r-one.com.sg . enguiry@2-one com. Sg

sutcsent v @ renspreeence Company Hegistration No. 201118055N

ESTIMATE
m"c"'”"ﬂ"m“H i B B Code - C101894
286 Jala " i i
208049 R S N Date in  25/03/2019

Vehicla Num. : GEH4592R
Modal : Toyota Hiace Van Turbo SDR MT
Chassis/Eng# : JTFHTOZP1002430531KD2B0G08E

Contact : 92365333 84691864

Parts and Labour Assesment

Description of part Qty Unit Price Amount
Front Door Side Mirror RH M.6o 1 pa2.40 </ r-~| | 98240 .

Sublotal before discount g82.40

Percentage dscount  25% 24660

Sub-totnal 1 T36.80

Parts-total T36.80

LABOUR

Description Price

To provide labour, workmanship to changs the above damaged bodypans, repai, 20000 /¢

re-construct and re-align body structure, body alignments and damaged
consistent 1o the acadent.

Labour Total 200.00
Parts & Labour Total 936.80
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¥ L7 2*
Consultants
A mmm Pl Company Registration No. 199607198R

S1UBIAVE L #02-25 PAYA URIINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAFORE 408953 TEL @ (0451 62363561 FAN : (65} LR LUE R R

Your ref: DMI9HO00052T
COhur ref: CC4/EQI19001896/Uja3 Date: 28/03/2019

The Motor Claims Department

M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. GBH 4592R
We refer to the above matter,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 26/03/2019
at the premises of M/s _Z-One Automotive Pte Lid - Kaki Bukit and have the following 1o report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8§ 936.80

Revised Estimatle Amount : 5% T68.70

"Check" Items Amount 1 5% -

Total (Including Check Items) : §% T68.70

Market Value : 5% -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 58 .

Nett Value : 5% -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the - o
O/S Mirror

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 1.0 days

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



Catherine Chunﬂ (LKK Autn!

From: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.comsg>

Sent: Manday, 28 January, 2019 2:59 PM

To: assignments

Ca Admin A

Subject: Our ref: DM18HO00052/JT (DS) PRS TO BE ARRANGE @ Z-ONE KAKI BUKIT /
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH4592R & GBCB715D ON 02/01/2019 AT 1830HRS

Attachments: SAS252974B pdf, GBH4592R - PRS PDF

Dear Catherine,

Attach the PRS request and our insured driver’s GIA report.
Please arrange to attend to the PRS and proceed with direct settlement if liability is established.

Thank you.

Regards, g%m‘},ﬁ\”\ Q } ﬂ%gm
Janet Tan "QW N

Senior Executive | Claims

eqnsuronce

il & e

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 656223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWW.BQINsUrance.Com.sg

Privileged/Confidential information may be contoined in this messoge. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify ti
From: Yvonne Yong [mailto:service @z-one.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, January 28, 2019 2:51 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: Re: (DS} PRS TO BE ARRANGE @ Z-ONE KAKI BUKIT / ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH4592R & GBC8715D ON
02/01/2019 AT 1830HRS

Hi Janet,
Kindly appoint LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd.
Thank you!

Best Regards,
Yvonne Yong



Z-One Automotive Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #01-85/87 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit Singapore 417883
Tel: 66342112 /62502115 Fax: 6634 2122

From: lanet Tan

Sent: Monday, January 28, 2019 1:53 PM

To:

Subject: RE: (DS) PRS TO BE ARRANGE @ Z-ONE KAKI BUKIT / ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH4592R & GBCB715D ON

02/01/2019 AT 1830HRS

Without Prejudice
Save As To Costs

Dear Yvonne,

For pre repair survey request, please email to eqiprs@eqinsurance.com.sg

We shall be appointing our surveyor to attend to the pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle.

Below is a list of motor surveyors in our panel, Please revert within 2 working days if you agree or have any objections to t

we do not hear from you, you are deemed to have agreed to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors listed by us. £
proposed motor surveyors to the said assignment.

1) AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd 2) Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
Tel: 6255 0808 Tel: 6286 0155
Fax: 6849 9155 Fax: 6284 1539
Contact Person: Sophia
3) LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd 4) Priority Services
L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Tel: 62934822
Tel: 6281 6690 / 62832866 Fax: 62963283
Fax: 6281 8748 Contact Person: Sharon
Contact Person: Amy/ Grace
5) RT Appraisal Pte Ltd 6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 67486076 Tel: 6256-3561
Fax: 67480361 Fax: 6741-4108
Contact Person: Elson/Elgene
7) Kelvin Automotive Appraising Services 8) Automotive Appraiser & Surveying
Tel: 81825263 Services
Fax: 67461148 Tel: 96623655
Contact Person: Kelvin Fax: 67655662
Contact Person: Mr Chee
9) JP Knights Pte Ltd 10) Appraisals Associates Pte Ltd
Tel: 63450068 Tel : 67472822
Fax: 63445328 Fax: 67470070




11) Infiniti Appraisal Service
Tel : 96684818/90099001
Fax: 64587432

If you object to all the motor surveyors as proposed by us, please provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors whom you ¢
We shall revert to you within 2 working days.

Meanwhile, we reserve our rights on Post-Repair Inspection, kindly contact us or our appointed surveyor before you retun
Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

eéir)_surqnce

' 1:,-- s

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190

Www.egqinsurance.com.sg
W\ A Mernber of Citystate >

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t!

From: Rose Koh
Sent: Thursday, January 24, 2019 2:32 PM
To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqin CE.COM.SE>

Ce: Adeline Chua <adeline.chua @eqinsurance.com.sg>
Subject: FW: (DS) PRS TO BE ARRANGE @ Z-ONE KAKI BUKIT / ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH4592R & GBC8715D ON

02/01/2019 AT 1830HRS

Hi janet

Fyna.

Regards,

Rose Koh

edinsuronce

e Fan



"~ A Member of Citystate

@—S“

Pty -|'|'|,1f-'|.1.-'|":-'1_l"u.||'ﬂ.'ll.tl' mfarmplion Moy be confomed in s missooe | pouw ore o he intended recigient, please aolily Bhe sender immediately end delete ol copied of

From: Yvonne Yong [mailto:service@z-one.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, January 24, 2019 2:25 PM

To: Joel Goh

Cc: Marketing

Subject: Fw: (DS) PRS TO BE ARRANGE @ Z-ONE KAKI BUKIT / ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH4592R & GBCB715D ON
02/01/2019 AT 1830HRS

Reminder

From: Yvonne Yong

Sent: Monday, January 21, 2019 4:17 PM

To: Joel Goh

Subject: (DS) PRS TO BE ARRANGE @ Z-ONE KAKI BUKIT / ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH4592R & GECB715D ON
02/01/2019 AT 1830HRS

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Attached PRS for your kind attention.

Please send us your list of 10 surveyor for us to choose.
Do contact Yvonne Yong @ 97552115 for any necessary.
Thank you!

Best Regards,

Yvonne Yong

Z-One Automotive Pte Ltd

| Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #01-85/87 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit Singapore 417883
Tel: 66342112/62502115 Fax: 6634 2122



Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LEKAuUto)
Sent: Thursday, 28 March, 2019 9:56 FM
To: ‘Janet Tan'
Ce: Admin A; Joy Irene (LKKAuto), CS A Team
Subject: RE: Our ref DM19HO00052/)T (DS) PRS TO BE ARRANGE @ Z-ONE KAKI BUKIT /
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH4592R & GBCB715D ON 02/01/2019 AT 1830HRS
Attachments: Preliminary Advice.pdf. TP ESTIMATE - MARKED.pdf; TP GIA REPORT pdf
Categories: HMK
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE”
SAVEAS TO COSTS
EQI refl: DM19HOODDOSZ/]T

LKK REF: CC4/EQI19001896/Uja3
Dear Janet,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: GBH 4592R
We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
- TP GIA report

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2409,

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Hest Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultanis Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67314108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 28 January, 2015 3:08 PM

To: 'Janet Tan' <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our ref; DM19HO00052/JT (D5) PRS TO BE ARRANGE @ Z-ONE KAKI BUKIT / ACCIDENT INVOLVING
GBHA4592R & GBCB715D ON 02/01/2019 AT 1830HRS

Dear Janet,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be Infarmed that vehicle currently not in the warkshop, repairer will arrange.
1



Best Regards,

Yvonne Yong

Z-One Automotive Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #01-85/87 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit Singapore 417883
Tel: 66342112 /62502115 Fax: 6634 2122

From: Janet Tan

Sent: Monday, January 28, 2019 1:53 PM

To: service@z-0ne.com.sg

Subject: RE: (DS) PRS TO BE ARRANGE @ Z-ONE KAKI BUKIT / ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH4592R & GBC8715D ON
02/01/2019 AT 1B30HRS

Without Prejudice
Save As To Costs

Dear Yvonne,

Far pre repair survey request, please emall to egiprs@eginsurance com.sg

We shall be appointing our surveyor to attend to the pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle.

Below is a list of motor surveyors in our panel. Please revert within 2 working days if you agree or have any objections to th
we do not hear from you, you are deemed to have agreed to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors listed by us, A'
proposed motor surveyors to the said assignment.

1} AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd 2) Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
Tel: 255 0BO8 Tel: 6286 0155
Fax: 6849 9155 Fax: 6284 1539
Contact Person: Sophia
3) LBS Automotive Appralsal Pte Ltd 4) Priority Services
L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Tel: 62934822
Tel: 6281 6690 / 62832866 Fax: 62963283
Fax: 6281 8748 Contact Person: Sharon
Contact Person: Amy/ Grace
5) RT Appraisal Pte Ltd 6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 67486076 Tel: 6256-3561
Fax: 67480361 Fax: 6741-4108
Contact Person: Elson/Elgene
7} Kelvin Automotive Appraising Services 8) Automotive Appraiser & Surveying
Tel: 81825263 Services
Fax: 67461148 Tel: 96623655
Contact Person: Kelvin Fax: 67655662
Contact Person: Mr Chee
9) JP Knights Pte Ltd 10) Appraisals Associates Pte Ltd
Tel: 63450068 Tel : 67472822
Fax: 63445328 Fax: 67470070




Saswel Boad 01700 Tower Block MND Comples Singapore 065110
tel 65 G223 3433 | fom 65 6324 3903

AW ETINEUTENEE COm &g

J.. A Member of Citystate 5..5

Prrvileged/ Confidential information muoy be contained in this message. /f you are not the intended reclplent, please notify the seader immediately and delete all coples of it

From: Yvonne Yong 1

Sent: Thursday, January 24, 2019 2:25 PM
To: Joel Goh

Cc: Marketing

Subject: Fw: (DS) PRS TO BE ARRANGE @& Z-ONE KAKI BUKIT / ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH4592R & GBCB715D ON
02/01/2019 AT 1830HRS

Reminder

From: Yvonne Yong
Sent: Monday, January 21, 2019 4:17 PM
To: Joel Goh

Subject: (DS) PRS TO BE ARRANGE @ Z-ONE KAKI BUKIT / ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH4592R & GBCB715D ON
02/01/2019 AT 1830HRS

Dear SirfMdm,

Attached PRS for your kind attention.

Please send us your list of 10 surveyor for us to choose.
Do contact Yvonne Yong @ 97552115 for any necessary.
Thank you!

Best Regards,

Yvonne Yong

Z-One Automotive Ple Ltd

I Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #01-85/87 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit Singapore 417883
Tel: 66342112/62502115 Fax: 6634 2122



Z-ONE AUTOMNOTIVE PTELTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 5, Blk D #01-85/87,A 2 y@Kaki Bukit Singapore417883

Tel: 52502115/66342112 Fax: 663421

Emall: servicei®@z-one.com.sg ; enguind@2-one.com.sg

sutoMotive © srerormasnce Company Registration No. 201118055N

Our Ref : GBH4592R

Your Ref . GBC8715D

05" April 2019
BY EMAIL & POST
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00,
Tower Block MND Complex
Singapore 069110

Attention: Janet Tan — Motor Claims Dept.
Dear Janet Tan,
CLAIMANT: OLD CHIN KITCHEN

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH4592R & GBCB8715D ALONG AIRPORT ROAD TWDS KPE ON
02/01/2019 AT 1830HRS

We refer 1o the above matter.

As the quantum was agreed between your surveyor and our Ms Yvonne, we are submitting our claims as follows:

1. Cost of Repair (7% GST) § 82251
2. Lossof Use For 1 Day x $120.00 5 120.00
3. LTA & GIA search fee $ 2900
$ 9M1.51

Total:

A copy each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:

(1) GIA Report

(2} Final Repair Bill

(3) GIA Receipt

(4) Letter of Authority

(5) Certificate of Insurance

Yours fail‘.h_ﬁiﬂi &N

Z-one Automotive Pte Ltd
Ecls



YLD G0

51 UBEAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CC4/EQI19001896/Uja3
08 APRIL 2019

YU TAT RENOVATIONS PTE LTD
YISHUN 5T, 23
SINGAPORE 768441

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBC 8715D AND GBH 4592R ON 02/01/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED to
resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy
taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotlations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20%
for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your
policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be
protected.

Please call us if you have further queries,

Yours faithfully,

.

(.fn\! Ire:i?
DiE+-6841 2409

FAX: 6741 4108
Email: joyirene@lkkauto.com

L. EQ INSLIRANCE COMPANY LIMITED
{Motor Cloims Dept]



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS AbH WOH 2
& GOLE36Y ALONG
. oeT wei0 buvoaim G .
ON Ul I'-"- | =AY 1 4l 3

I/ We, hereby appomnt Z-ONE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD to be my agent and |/'We authonze my said agent
to give you all instructions pertaining 1o the conduct of my claim including instructions to commence legal
proceedings in court in my name against the third party driver/or his employvers, if applicable.

** My said agent also has my authority to decide on my behalfl whether to accept any offer of
settlement from the third party and/or his insurers.

I understand and accept that until 1 revoke my said agent’s authority in writing to vou, | am bound by all
mstructions given by my said agent to vou

. ** Upon settlement of the third party claim and in case the settlement monies was sent to me/us hy

the third party’s insurers, I/'We undertake to pay you and my/our Solicitor the cost of repair settled
and related expenses and disbursement incurred.

My vehicle is repaired on my own will without any inducement, threat or promise.

\ 0id Chin Kitche:
II" . i a4 1 'u
m Lt '---:,,h! {0 N
!
Signature N, )
(Company's stamp if applicable)
Nm: M i | ',_,_1.
NRIC No: 65311993 w
Address 35, ke  Besa
i Tad Pais vy



Final Bill http://z] ocadn.com/sccidents/claims/printing /C101894

Z-ONE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Blk D 201-85/87, Autobay@Kaki Bukit Singapore417883

§

Tel: 51502115/66342112 Fax: 66342122

Emall; service @ 1-one.com g . enguiryS1-0ne com sg

sutomotee @ renrorwanct Company Registration No 201118055

TAX INVOICE
DOld Chin Kiichen Date - 05042019
aiﬁ'r‘::;qhﬁum Dae in: 25/03/2018
Singapore 200049 Vehicle Num. - GBH4582R
Contact : 92365333 B4691964 MakeModel ; Toyots Hiace Van Turbo SOR MT-2018
Chassis/Eng# . JTFHTO2P100243053/1KD2806098
Accident Date - 02/01/2018
Claim Na : C101684
Reference
Policy No. : 5101142040 (12/06/2018)
Amount §
FART BY PART REPAIR 766.70
AS PER SURVEYOR REFPORT
DATED 26/03/2018
BY LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
EA&0E Sub%: TEB.TO
Add GST (7% ) §: 53.81
' Total Amount § 82251

Z-ONE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

| of ] 5/4/2019, 12:57 pr



GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
§ Raffies Q #18-00. Singa 028580
INSURANCE Frone -5 6224 0010 Fax -85 6224 0030
ASSCCIATION Cperating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to 5pm
‘ r s GS5T Registration No M400017735

- W (T
LT .

TAX INVOICE -

Our Ref No GR-18-007190 1 o
Date of Request 14/01/2018 Your Ref No AJTK.Z (GEH4592R). °

CROSSBORDERS LLC

133 New Bridge Road #23-03/04/05
Chinatown Painl

Singapore 059413

Dear SirMadam,

Date of Accident 02/01/2018
Vehicle No GBH4582R
Flace of Accident AIRPORT RD TWDS KPE
Involving Vehicle No.  GBCB715D

With reference 1o your application for the accident report, we have attached the following acocent reparis as reguested
DOCUMENTS |ACCIDENT LOCATION PER DOC (5%) aTY  |AMDUNT (5%)
GBC87150 AIRPORT RD TWDS KPE 14 001 1308
GST Amount 082
Total Amount Duea (GST Inclusive) 14.00|

Tha n-nngnprmrldud to you are taken from the original reporns forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for

any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the repors or their images
Thank You
This is a computer generated document and requires no signature:

For GIARMC Official use
Date
[¥] GIRQ || Cash | ] Cheque
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Irveaice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raflles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSUWCE Phone: +65 5224 0010 Fax; +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours Monday to Friday 2am o S5pm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

GST Regietralion No: M40D017735

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No GR-18-007187
Date of Request 14101/2018 Your Ref No: AJTK Z (GBH4592R)
CROSSBORDERS LLC

133 New Bridge Road #23-03/04/05
Cninatown Paint
Singapore 059413

Dear SirfMadam,

Your Search Criteria:

Date of Accident: o2mzoe

Place of Acocidant AIRPORT RD > KPE
Chent Vehicie Nao: GBH459ZR

DESCRIPTION

AMOUNT (53]

E-File Search Fes (Public)

14.02

GST Amount

0.88

Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive)

15.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated documant and requires no signalure.,

For GIARMC Official use.
Date
[X] GIRO | | Cash | | Cheque

hitps feingapore. menmen com/clumsiindex cfmTfusebor= MTRsasBlusescion=dsp_geninviphrefid=20282228CFID=460403204CF T OKEN=50,,

a2
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Company Registration Ho. 1¥60T158R

SR AVE L S22 PAYA UHE INDUSTHIAL PARK, SINGAPORE JURSAE TEL @ (D65 62563561 FAN @ (0651 62564315

To: M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 17/07/2018
THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT
— GBC 8715D {Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DM18HOO00052/JT
enicle No
GBH 4592R (TP Veh) |Our Ref No.: CC4/EQI19001896/Uja3q2
Date of Accident 2112019
Liability 100% -
Final Rapair Cost F $ 32251 - N
Loss of Use '8 100.00 1 days
Rental (If any) '8 days
Others: '3 29.00
-1

851.51
Final Settlement Sum |: § 951.51
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1)

Z-0ONE AUTOMOTIVE FTE LTD

£

9 851.51

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrinl Park. Singapors 408833
TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6258 4315
Reg. No: 185607188R GST Reg. No. 18-86071B8-R

¥ L

sda BE B

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblie

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref : CC4/EQI19001886/Ujadq2

VAR

5 MAXWELL ROAD

#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 17-07-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code: EQI
P Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBC B715D Veh. Inspected GBH 4582R
Policy No. OMCPHQ18-000353 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DM18HO000520T Excess () 0.00
Assign From  JANET Assign Date 28/01/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA HIACE (M) c.c 2982
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. JTFHTD2P 100243053 Colour SILVER
Odomaeter 26733 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NiL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185R15 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185R15 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185R15 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185R15 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S MIRROR
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 02/01/2019 Inspection Date 26/03/2019
Survey held at Z-ONE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 8,
HBLK C#01-52 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
Ba. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WTTHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b, Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 1 Working Days
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VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 6258 4315

DSTLAIMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely far the use and benefil of he Chent nemed on he fron pege of This Regpaen

Hi Hablliy of respensikiiily whatseerer, i cuntact or bart 3 accested to any third gacty whe may reply o0 the Reparl wholls or bn pars Ary third sarty scting a¢ melying an this
Bamort. in s o in oarl does 50 ui his oF her own risk

Reg MNo: 188607T1868R GST Reg No 18-89607185-R Page No. 1o
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBH 4592R
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
2 pt Workshop (§))] ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT DOOR SIDE MIRROR RH CUT /| DAMAGED 982.40 891 60
LESS 25% DISCOUNT 24560 -222 80
T36.80 668.70
LABOUR
TO PROVIDE LABOUR WORKMANSHIP TO CHARGE THE 200.00 100.00
ABOVE DAMAGED BODYPARTS REPAIR,RE-
CONSTRUCT AND RE-ALIGN BODY STRUCTURE ,BODY
ALIGNMENTS AND DAMAGED CONSISTENT TO THE
ACCIDENT
200.00 100.00
GRAND TOTAL 836.80 T6B.TO
- ;
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS I 768.70|
Report Ref No. CC4/EQI19001886/Uja3gq2
CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser



Joanne E{LI{I( Auto)

From: Joanne Lee [LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 18 July 2019 3:52 PM

To: ‘janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg’

Ce: Joylrene@lkkauto.com’

Subject: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBC 8715D (OI) and GBH 4592R (TP) on
02/01/2019

Attachments: LKK REPORT & PHOTO.pdf; TP DS SUPPORTING DOCUMENT. pdf

Dear Sir'Madam,
Please be informed that the above-mentioned case had been settled.
Enclose herewith final report & relevant documents for your necessary action please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

JOANNE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@ikkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933



