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MS@FirstCapital

6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (65) 6222 2311 Fax: (65) 6222 3547

Claims & Moter Underwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877

Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax: (65) 6507 3849
wwwi.msfirstcapital.com.sg

MS First Capital Insurance Limited (cReg ho, 195000106C GST Reg Mo M2 00016769

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

25-01-2019 Our Ref No.
23-01-2019 Claim Type.
SHAB910X Third Party Vehicle.

TTS CENTRE 383 SIN MING DRIVE

D19000688MFSH

Third Party

SMH3675

Contact Person. KAVI
Contact No. 82927422/ 0 Fax No. 67411626
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
A inted
PPOInte LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

TTS EUROCARS PTE

Cc : Workshop LTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge HENRY KAO

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




1302019
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The information contained herein is correct as at 30 Jan 2019

> Back to OneMotoring

nduire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

PARF/MNF Rehate Fnnilirg

Singapore NRIC
4751A

SMH3675L
No

31Jan 2019
B.MW.

2181 SPORT GRAN TOURER AUTO

White
2017
31889940B38A15A
WBA2D320305)58506
100.0 kW (134 bhp)
$32,205.00

21 Jan 2019

21 Jan 2019

0

$37.087.00

Yes
20 Jan 2029
$27.815.00

20 Jan 2029

E - Open - all except motorcycle
10

$32.909.00

$32.104.00

$59,919.00

OK

nups:yvr.i@a.gov.sgia/vriyacuon/enquireepalesyruplicserorepereginput rFUNG | IUIN_IUSFUsuguud | |

i



Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

= —————
From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 7 March 2019 11:32 AM
To: kavi@tts.com.sg; shabir@tts.com.sg
Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: SMH3675K - FINALISE
Hi Kavi,

Finalised amount confirmed

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-
25 | S(408933) Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.

From: Kavi [mailto:kavi@tts.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 7 March, 2019 11:12 AM
To: shabir@tts.com.sg; Rasul (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SMH3675K - FINALISE

Dear Rasul,

Please find attached amended invoice.
Repair cost $5436.93 before GST.
Repair days 04

Please confirm

Regards,

Ms. Kavi

Motor Claims Officer

-----Original Message--—-

From: Shabir [mailto:shabir@tts.com.sg]
Sent: 27 February, 2019 4:09 PM

To: rasul@lkkauto.com

Cc: kavi@tts.com.sg

Subject: SMH3675K - FINALISE

Hi Rasul,



Refer to attached finalise invoice.
Repair cost $4,681.24 before GST.
Repair days 04

Please confirm

Best Regards
Mohamed Shabir
After Sales Manager

We are committed to the preservation of the environment. Please print this email only if it is absolutely necessary.
TTS Motor Group Pte Ltd (Co Reg No: 1987029992Z) TTS Eurocars Pte Ltd (Co Reg

No: 200413930H)

383 Sin Ming Drive TTS Centre Singapore 575717

Tel: (65) 6462 1111 Ext123 Fax: (65) 6741 1626

Email; shabir@tts.com.sg Website: www.tts.com.sg

Disclaimer: The information contained in this email, including any attachments, may contain confidential
information of TTS Motor Group Pte Ltd / TTS Eurocars Pte Ltd. This email is intended only for the use of the
addressee(s) listed above. Unauthorized review, dissemination or any other use of the information contained in this
email is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error or have reason to believe that you are not
authorized to receive it, please notify the sender by return email and promptly delete this email F***



Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

—— e e e e
From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 31 January 2019 5:53 PM
To: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie'; 'CWS Motor Claims'
Cc: ‘assignments’; 'SUR'; 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)'
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000688MFSH/1
Attachments: SMH 3675L - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Henry,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SMH 3675L.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 28 January 2019 10:28 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Henry Kao Cai lie' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000688MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 28 January, 2019 9:32 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Henry Kao Cai Jie
<HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000688MFSH/1




Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



| B 74 7d

i Consultants
Bdm Bm = Pte Ltd Company Registration No. 199607198R

31 UBLAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D19000688MFSH Date: 31 January 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI19001764/R1sd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Lid

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ SMH 3675L .
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 30/01/2019 at the premises of M/s TTS Eurocars Pte Ltd and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S$ 10.119.03
Revised Estimate Amount : 88 5.370.43
*Check” Items Amount : S§ 1,771.35
Market Value : S8
LTA Reimbursement Value - S8
Nett Value : S§

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the o/s front portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 6 Days

Yours faithfully,
Mohammed Rasul
Automotive Assessor



MTT519011873/ TTS Eurocars Pre Lid - Sin Ming
EMTRY DATE & TIME: 24/01/2019 19:11
SUBMITTED BY: Natarajan Kavidha Rajan

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the detalls of the accident to speed up the claims process

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver,

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of matenal facts may allow insurance companies to
repudiate policy liability

4, The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interesied parties.

?% By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made available
aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 24/01/2019 19:11

Date Of Accident 23/01/2019 04:20

Exact Location Of Accident LIANG COURT DROP OFF POINT
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

Vehicle Registration Number SMH3675L

Insured/Policyholder

Name Of Registered Owner TAN SIAK KIANG

NRIC No S1144751A

Email Address NOEMAIL

Mobile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-97927754
Alternative Phone No OFFICE-93233180

Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturer BMW

Model 2181-1.5 ACTIVE TOURER BUSINESS (F45) (A)

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident PERSONAL

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy NO
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken THIRD PARTY

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company HL ASSURANCE PTE LTD
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleet Policy NO

Policy Number MP309205

Cover Note Number
Driver

Name of Driver
NRIC No

Date Of Birth
Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Mobile Number
Fax Number
Contact Number
EMail Address

TAN SIAK KIANG
S1144751A

04/07/1955

INDOOR

17/11/1995

23 YEARS AND 2 MONTHS
FEMALE

(LOCAL) +65-97927754

OFFICE-93233180
NOEMAIL

Page 1 of 23



“Address
Postcode
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)
involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?

If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given?

If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO ATTACHMENT

Attachment(s)

Are accident phatos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?
Was there any audio recorded?

89 PASIR RIS GROVE #11-25
518214

NO

OWNER

COLLISION - OPENING DOOR OF VEHICLE
CLEAR
DRY

NO
2
NO
NO
YES

NO

NO

NO

YES
YES
NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category

Name of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

Posicode

Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

SHA8910X

TAXI

YONG SEET LOONG (YANG XULONG)
S73348827Z

92702682

Page 2 of 23



Sketch Plan #2

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1 Pleass raport cormpctly the detalls of the accident to speed up the claims process.

1. Tha Form must be compieted by the Policvholder snd/or the Authonsed Oriver.

3. information provided must be as truthiul and accurste as possible. Any witful misregresentation or withholding of material
factd may aliow insurance companies to repudiate policy liabllity.

4. Tha issue ano accegitance of this Farm by iuurance compansd is not an agmistion of policy Gability on the part of the ingurance

6. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Recards Management Centre established tiy the General Insurance
Association of Singapore (GIA) for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made svatable upon application by
Interested parties

7. By the iodgment of tnis rEDON 10 The INSUrEss, Vou heredy consent 1o the archiving of this report at the centre and 1o copwes of
the repot being made svailable sforasaid

8 Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act [PDPA]
| understand. acknowledge. agree and consent that:

lal My Insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Assockabon of Singapore | "GIA") may/are permittad to collect, uss,
diselase and/or process my personal data/personal informanion 581 put in this [form) and any other personal infosmation
provided by me or passessed by my imsurer (collectively the “Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer auch
Pertonal Infarmation 1o all insurer(s] who have insured vehicie(s) involved in this acoident {all msurer(s) who have insured
wehicke{s] involeed In this accident thall be collectively referred 10 34 the "Insurers”), the Inturers’ lawyery/law lirms, the
Monetary Avthority of Singapore and any reievant government agency/authority (such as the policel. for the purpose(s)
of

{i] protessing. handiing and/or dealing wath my tiaims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary
Investigations raiating 1o the claims,

{h} Investigating the accdent and/or my claims.
(Wi} carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enguiries by me;

(iv} pdmiristering myy claims (including the malling of correspondence, statements, invoices, reports or notices to me,
which could involve disclosurs of cernain perscnal dat about me 10 bring about delivery of the same as well 35 on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages), and/or

[v] camplying with applicabile law In administering, processing, handling and/er dealing with ey clalms [eollectively the
"Purposes”|
() ali insureris] who have Insured vehilcle(s) Involved In this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law fitms, may/are permitted
to collect., use, disclose #nd/or process my Personal information for one or more of the above Purposes: and

{e] my Personal Information may/@n be disclossd by any of the Insurers and/or GIA 1o their third party service providers ot
sgents(inciiding their Bwyers/law firma) which may be sited outuds of Singapore, fur one or mare of the above Purposes.

{dl my Personal Information will also be coliected and used 1o compile dams history for the purpose of fraud detection,
Investigation and management in present and al! futurs claims.

[e) the information so collected under [d) above may be shared / disclosed:

(1) roall nsurers andfor any pther thind parties that Bsist in evaluating. investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

{H] For complying with requirements under any raguistions, laws or court orders

Policyholder's Sgnature ! Driver's Signsture Reporting Centre s Slgnature
Date & Tiene: (M driwer in mot the policyhalder| Name
Date & Time: NRIC/FIN No.:

Page 4 of 23



Sketch Plan

\ A — SMIA3E75L
\ G — svas9106c
\ : e

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

WHILE  Dluuwily JRsse) ATAL MR PAMENGER Diow Tax
SUA Fh0 X At Flev (i LA Mo BT m) AL o WY
Frenl #O647  Opie M AjTesin

DECLARATION
U'We declars the foregoing particulars are true in every respect. 1
Q‘\ l\_l/ "’l \
Policyholder's Signature = Drivar's Signature Reporting Centre Sersonnal’s Signaturs
Date & Time (i driver is not the policyholder) Name:

Date & Time: NRIC/FIN No.:

Page 3 of 23



TTS EUROCARS PTE LTD } « v
* 383 Sin Ming drive Singapore 575717

Date : 18/2/2016

RE: VEHICLE REPAIR QUOTATION

Insurance Company : First Capital Insurance
Vehicle Reg No : SMH3675C

Name of Insured :

Policy Number

Date of Accident : 23.01.2019

Tyre of Claim f Third Party Claim
Model : BMW 218l

Chassis No - WBA2D320305J58506

We are please to submit our estimate of repairs to the above mention vehicle.

Parts Labour
1 FRONT BONNET P~ $ 987.00
FRONT BONNET INSULATOR/ HEAT)( nn
2 SHIELD % A% $ 120.00
3 FRONT BUMPER C“J - $ 91546 .
4  FRONT BUMPER LOGO A~ ~ $  98.00.
5  RHF HEADLAMP $¢&~ = $ 951.45.
6 RHF HEADLAMP BRACKET - $ 12480
7 RHF HEADLAMP BALLAST ~ % vt $ 777.68
8 RHF HEADLAMP ECU/ECM -’ $ 89210
9  RHFFENDER tA P $ 671.70 ~
10 FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER i R-H L% $  70.00.
11 BUMPER CLIPS @ $8.00 x Spcs A~ 7 $  40.00 -
12 RHSIDEMIRROR Y ( fncomsitfesd ) N $ 74000
13 RH SIDE MIRRROR COVER?( no~ $ 190.00
14 RH SIDE MIRROR SIGNAL LAMPYC A ™ $ 105.00
Sub Total Parts $ 6,683.19
Less 5% $ 334.16
Total Parts $ 6,349.03
1 Sundries s, 3° /M
2 Wiring connection and check. -5 60w 120700,
uff kote and spr nti r roofi 120700
3 T spray anti rust proofing $ gbéiv‘ﬂ/
4 Labour charges to dismantle & refix RHF fender
bonnet, front bumper, front headlamp and side mirror
To repair and adjust affected portion to specific dimension. $ 780 ‘9000/0
5 To spray paint front bonnet, front bumper, front
RH fender, RH side mirror and all other
accident affected portion -~ $ 789 4 M{J
6 To remove and refix rh door panel, trim board $ n" 200.00

to replace rh side mirror



7 To conduct and adjust headlamp focus and
angle, calibration and coding for steering
radius

8 Sealant for body panel, front bonnet and
front rh fender

7 To conduct ECU programming, check and

clear fault codes, restore programme modules

s %o 38600
s— Co Jﬂéﬂ

5 [So 55000

Total (Labour) $ 3,770.00
Sub Total : $6,349.03 + $3,770.00 $ 10,119.03
GST 7% $ 708.33
Grand Total : $ 10,827.36

The above estimates are base on visual inspection and it is possible that further materials and labour may be required upon
dismantling. Should this occur, we will submit supplementary quotation for further approval.

(jou aauay u _J

q,\’\
ASu \

H‘o A0 (o0 6K

3o{bf/]q @ I(F(Po
Roswra B o



TAX INUOICE

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Docusent No: IK1$-300153

36 ROBINSON ROAD date  : 07/03/2018
116-01
CITY HOUSE
SINGAPORE 068877 Stag 10 ¢ KAVIOWA
Vehicle No ; SHH3ETSL decount No : FIRSTCAP
B4 2181 SPORT GRAN TOU Tob Ko : TIS-100208
Miteage : 1635 Page |
lescaiption Quantity U Price Dlacd  Anount
FRONT BONKET [ 481,00 941,00 < 1
FRONT BUKPER | 918,46 osds | 3715361
FRONT BUMPER OGO I 9800 9,00 , ( )
RAF HEADLANF | 95148 951,45 - S{
RHF FENDER I8 81110 - -
FRONT BURPER SIDE RETAINER 0.0 - ( 35 Het
BUMPER CLIPS S R0 .00 ~ —
LESS $§ PARTS DISCOUNT | 186,68 186,68
SUNCRIES | 30.00 20.00 -
VIRING AND CONNECTION CHECK | §0.00 60.00 -
TUFF KOTE AND SPRAY ANTI RUSTING I 80,00 §0.00
LASOUR CHARGE TO DISWANTLE AKD REFIX RHF FENDER BONNET I 750.00 15000
FRT BUNPER FRT HEAULAMP ANO SIOF NIRROR TO REPAIR AND ADJUST o
AFFECTED FORTION T0 SPECIFIC DINENSION j e
SPRAY PAINT FRT BONNET FRT BUMPER FET RA FENDER RN SIDE I 750.00 ww s [
NIRROR AND ALL OTHER ACCIDENT AFFECTED PARTS .
CONDUCT AND ADJUST HEADLANP FOCUS AND ANGLE CALIBRATION I 30,00 30.00
COOING FOR STEERING RADIUS /
SEALANT #0R 800Y PANEL FRT BONNET AND FRT RH FENDER I 60.00 §0.00 - )
CONDUCT ECU PROGRARMING CHECK/CLEAR FAULTCODE I 150.00 150.00
RESTORE PROGRANNING MODULES
rie [ Sile
‘ cc {‘_ orgV
ALk
—
Total  5,436.83
0.00
* fcknouledgenent by Custoser * 7,008 65T Pus 180,59
I conglam that the goofs stafed in hid {nvodce have Nett Total 5,817.52

been recelved by me in go0d working oxder and condition.
I further confinm that all deavices andfox xepair jobs
dtated in this {nvoice axe completed and done o ay
satisfaction.

ITS EURGCARS PTE L

Nane|Signatuse/RRIC No/Co Stamp [where appliceble)

TTS EUROCARS pte g

A member of the TTS Motor Group

Company Reg. No: 200413830H GST No: 20-0413830.H

383 Sin Ming Drive, TTS Centre, Singapore 575717 « Sales: +65 6842 2222 + Admin: +65 6757 0122 » After Sales: +65 6757 2622 » Fax: +65 6741 1626

Branch: 15, Commonwealth Lane, Lot A1, Commonwealth Car Mall. Singapore 148554 « Tol: +65 6462 1111 » Fax: +65 6252 4834

24 Hours Emergency Assistance: +65 8475 2722

Wabyile www tts con



’ Y V4 V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl B . 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R
Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI19001764/R1sd3e2
#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date 08-03-2019 H"m“lm"lmﬂ ||"||
Code: FCI2
1= Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHA 8910X Veh. Inspected SMH 3675L
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19000688MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  HENRY KAO Assign Date 28/01/2019
& Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model B.MW. 218l c.c 1499
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2019
Chassis No. WBA2D320305.58506 Colour WHITE
Odometer 668 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |245/45R18 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/45R18 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |245/45R18 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |245/45R18 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/01/2019 [Inspection Date 30/01/2019
Survey held at 335 SMITH ST CHINATOWN COMPLEX
Repairer TTS EUROCARS PTE LTD
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMH 3675L

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Page No.:1 of 2

- - Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Worksh op?g” '.'(8{
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BONNET BENT 987.00 987.00
1|FRONT BONNET INSULATOR / HEAT (NPA) NOT NECESSARY - -
1|SHIELD NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER cuT 915.46 915.46
1|FRONT BUMPER LOGO NECESSARY 98.00 98.00
1|RHF HEADLAMP SCRATCHED 951.45 951.45
1|RHF HEADLAMP BRACKET SERVICEABLE 124.80 -
1|RHF HEADLAMP BALLAST SERVICEABLE 777.68 .
1|RHF HEADLAMP ECU / ECM SERVICEABLE 892.10 2
1|RHF FENDER BENT 671.70 671.70
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH NECESSARY 70.00 70.00
5|BUMPER CLIPS @$8.00 NECESSARY 40.00 40.00
1|RH SIDE MIRROR (NOT NECESSARY) NOT CONSISTENT 740.00 -
WITH THE IMPACT
1|RH SIDE MIRROR COVER NOT NECESSARY 190.00 ;
1|RH SIDE MIRROR SIGNAL LAMP NOT NECESSARY 105.00 -
LESS 5% DISCOUNT -334.16 -186.68
6,349.03 3,546.93
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SUNDRIES (SN) NECESSARY 80.00 30.00
80.00 30.00
LABOUR
WIRING CONNECTION AND CHECK. 120.00 60.00
TUFF KOTE AND SPRAY ANTI RUST PROOFING. 120.00 60.00
LABOUR CHARGES TO DISMANTLE & REFIX RHF 1,200.00 750.00
FENDER BONNET, FRONT BUMPER, FRONT HEADLAMP
AND SIDE MIRROR TO REPAIR AND ADJUST AFFECTED
PORTION TO SPECIFIC DIMENSION.
TO SPRAY PAINT FRONT BONNET, FRONT BUMPER, 1,200.00 750.00

FRONT RH FENDER, RH SIDE MIRROR AND ALL OTHER
ACCIDENT AFFECTED PORTION.

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19001764/R1sd3e2




’ V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

b‘. ; ‘. ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
Description of Parts. 3 Condition | Estimate By |Our Adjusted
ay | P dition {\yorkshop (8)]  ($)
TO REMOVE AND REFIX RH DOOR PANEL, TRIM BOARD |NOT NECESSARY 200.00 B
TO REPLACE RH SIDE MIRROR.
TO CONDUCT AND ADJUST HEADLAMP FOCUS AND 150.00 30.00
ANGLE, CALIBRATION AND CODING FOR STEERING
RADIUS.
SEALANT FOR BODY PANEL, FRONT BONNET AND 150.00 60.00
FRONT RH FENDER.
TO CONDUCT ECU PROGRAMMING, CHECK AND CLEAR 550.00 150.00
FAULT CODES, RESTORE PROGRAMME MODULES.
3,690.00 1,860.00
GRAND TOTAL 10,119.03 5,436.93
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | I 5,436.93
Report Ref No. CS/FCI19001764/R1sd3e2
M %g‘
MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor B.Eng, AMSOE , AMIRTE,AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser




