LOT: Priority : NORMAL / URGENT - ;
Reference Ng - CV\SV“LHOO“‘H l(V Claim No. Ssae(q IN OPS: Yes/No DOA:
From (Person) : Momcy _ of meiQ Ref:

Date/Time : 35\1\@‘ ' MV S

- TYPE: M.Car/ M. Cycle / Bus /Van/ Lérry / Taxi/ Prime Mover / Truck / Trailer or
Vehicle No ; .GE\ 3018 D.0.A/As Ar Ml\\‘\

Make & Model: - - NASS{n Uy Van NEW CAR PRICE:$ _
Registration Date: ~ © X%(5]>oos : : MV:$ lek-1ale  Quote by :__Sywmen
COE Expiry Date: . . Js\>|>o>o . FS:$ Date -'-‘S\\\\'l‘
LTA Total Rebate Amount:  (PARF) - + (COE) = SV:$ ‘
Calculation for LTA Rebats: ) Calculation for Valuation:
{a) COE Period: X12= Mihe - jAverage MV ’ 3
As At ' ’ -
- = Mths Ca!culation.for Rezjossesse;i vehicle:
. = Mths  {High demand ve.ﬁ.icié;:..,,.Yes, [No |- 8§
{(b).Balance Months : : ' vehicle -3
el - 8
b ) =
L) - $
(a) : : Lon
o .:-;', . s o Englne Capacrty A =§"‘~Hig'h.-.-./ili_6w' -- &
@) Bl = 2= < ik . £:3|Europe / Asia- Car R
Regmer Berore/After MAY 2002 ' . }Car Condition: Godd/Falr/Poo:/Bumt - )
(e) F‘ARF = (OMV) X X = . |No.oftransfer:..-. . . | - $
LTA Totdi Rebaie Amount: (d)+(e) Other deduc:tlon :’_"_ ’ T - $
Salvage Value(LTA Rebate - 5%):, Forced:Sales:Valte derived - = $ -

|Pate/Time | 7 A.c.tidnl/ lnstruction .. . . - |Additional Information:




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 25 January 2019 3:56 PM

To: ‘Monica Chung'’; SUR

Subject: RE: Market Value of GY3018R  Our Ref: 582614

Dear Monica,

The market value of GY 3018R is $10K-$12K (Estimated) as at Jan 2019.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Monica Chung <Monica_Chung@sg.msig-asia.com>
Sent: Friday, 25 January 2019 11:08 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Market Value of GY3018R Our Ref: 582614

Dear all, .
Please let us have the market value. Date of accident - 16/01/19
Thanks.

Regards,

Monica Chung
Executive, Claims Services (Motor)
D: +65 6594 2552 | F: +65 6225 7402 | monica_chung@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg o @ G

A Member of [RYRTLYAE INSURANCE GROUP



> Back to OneMotoring

Enqmre PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

”Vehlc|e0wnerPart|culars -

M NC IR AN

» aner iD '[ype éusiness
OwneriD: 7800)
Vehicle Details
Vehlcle No.: GY3018R
Vehlcle to be Exported Yes
lntended Dereglstrat|on Date i 25J)an 2019
Vehicle Make N|S§AN
Vehicle Model: URVAN 5DR
Prlmary Colour VS|Iver ]
Manufacturlng Year 7 2005
Engine No.: 7 ZD30046481
Chassis No.: JN1MG4E2520712708
Maxmum Power Output - -
~ Open Market Value: ~ $22,664.00
7 7Or|gm:j1| R“egrlsrtratron Date: 26 FétTZOOS
First Registration Date: 26 Feb 2005
Transfer Count 1 ' ~ ]
Actual ARF Paid: '$1,13400
Intended PARF Rebate Details
. PARF Eligibility: No
" PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
" PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 25Feb2020
COE Category: C- Goods Vehlcle &Bus
’ COE Per|od(Year§') 5
PQP Paid: © $29,236.00
COE Rebate Amount: $6,334.00
Total Rebate Amount: $6,334.00
Message

— §\1 N

Please note thot all future COE renewals for this vehlcle can onIy be for a 5-year perlod subject to the statutory lifespan (if appllcable) of the

vehlcle

The mformatnon contained herem is correct as at 25 Jan 2019

OK



Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear all,

Monica Chung <Monica_Chung@sg.msig-asia.com>
Friday, 25 January 2019 11:08 AM

SUR

Market Value of GY3018R  Our Ref: 582614
PARF_COE Rebate Enquiry.pdf

Please let us have the market value. Date of accident - 16/01/19

Thanks.

Regards,

Monica Chung

Executive, Claims Services (Motor)
D: +65 6594 2552 | F: +65 6225 7402 | monica chung@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Sin

®0

9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg

60

A Membes of BARET1] INSURANCE GROUP

gapore 048581 | T: +65 6220



