Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 16 May, 2019 2:28 PM

To: Sg Motor

Cc: Sg Motor; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Insured: JRM 376 (Our ref: JRM 376) LKK REF CC4/11119001686/Dha3
Attachments: JRM 376 Claim status.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Leena,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is clear subject to
the BOLA guideline settlement.

We are currently preapring report for mandate approval.
We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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" Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Sg Motor [mailto:sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 2 May, 2019 12:38 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Sg Motor

Subject: Your Insured: JRM 376 (Our ref: JRM 376)

Refer to the above claim, we would like to do a direct
settlement for the property damage to our client's bike JRM 376

Attached plse find the relevant documents for your kind perusal
1) Invoice for Cost of Repairs

2) Police Report
3) Log Card



We seek your assistance to expedite this claim as we wish
to close the file.

Thank You
Regards

Leena

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898



