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51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (65) 62563561 FAX : (D65) 62564315

Your Ref: XB8053A Date: 22™ February 2019

Our Ref: CS/EGI19001631/Ugd3

The Motor Claims Department
ERGO Insurance

Attn: Steve
Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO,_ YM 2346A

We thank you for the instruction on _23/01/2019.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 24/01/2019 at the premises of M/s KAl LIANG MOTOR and have the

following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 2,663.00 .
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 900.00 (Lump Sum)
“Check™ ltems Amount 1 5% -

Lump Sum Repair Estimate Amount : 5% -

Market Value : 5§ -

LTA Reimbursement Value : S§ -

Nett Value 5 -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
front windscreen cracked.

Comments/ Present Status:

Damages consistent.
Days of repair: 0.5 days.
We have NOT authorize repair.

Yours faithfully

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser



Catherine Chnnﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: Steve Lim <steve.lim@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 January, 2019 4:57 PM

To: SUR (sur@lkkauto.com); Admin-D (LKKAuto) (admin-d@lkkauto.com)
Cc: 5iti Rahman; ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)

Subject: FW: FW: Accident claims (Our insured: XB80534)

Hi LKK,

Please assist on below PRS. Our insured yet to report the accident

Steve Lim
Manager - Claims

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-05 Suntec Tower Five
Singapare 038585

O - +65 6829 9197

Fax. +B65 6829 9247

steve lim@erqge.com.sq

WA BIO0. GO, 50 E RG 0

ER'Q_ECI is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Warldwide, ERGO ia representad in more than 30 countries and concentrates
on Eurape and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carmiers

Dieciaimes This mEssage and s attachmeanis are confivential, intended only for the named adaresses, and may be prvieged If you are not the entendad recipisnt, you
Enould nod discloas, distribute, copy of use thes communication. f you are nob the intended recipkent. pleass notify the sender by return emall and delele this MEssage
By opening any attachment [o this message. you agree 10 accepd the risk that it may contain a virus or damaging code, and you agree that ERGO Insurance Pta Ltd. wadl
ned b kable for any loss or damage thereoy caused

From: Kai Liang Kai Liang [mailto:kailiangmaotorservice@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 23 January, 2019 4:54 FM

To: Steve Lim

Subject: Re: FW: Accident claims (Our insured: XB8053A)

Hi Steve

We select LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid

Thanks

Tan

On Wed, Jan 23, 2019 at 4:20 PM Steve Lim <steve.lim{@ergo.com.sg> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir,



We acknowledged receipt of your email below for the PRS request as below,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016”, do select an assessor from the
list helow,

1 AlS Automabile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
2 FTA FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd

3 1AS Infiniti Appraisal Service

b PK P Knights Pte Ltd

5 |LBS L.B.5 Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

6 |LKK LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

7 Ps Priority Services

3 VAC Vicom Ltd

Kindly let us have your reply on the selection of the surveyor.

Steve Lim

Manager - Claims
ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-06 Suntec Towar Five
Singapore 038965

DID.: +B5 6829 9147

Fax.. +B5 G824 9247

teve lim@ergo.com,

MWW B 0. COM, 54 E I t G 0

ERGO s -ane of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe Worldwide ERGO Is represented in miore than 30 countries and
cancentrates on Eurcpe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), ang of the warld's lea ding risk carriers



|EMAIL DISCLAIMER

The infermation contained in this email communication is confidential. You should only read, disclose, re-transmit, copy, distribute, act in reliance on or
commercialize the information if you are authorized to do so. If you are not the intended recipient of this email communication, please notify the sender by
ireplying to the emall and destroy any electronic or paper copy of this message.

Any views expressed in this email communication are those of the individual sender. ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. does not represent, warrant or guarantae
that the integrity of this communication has been maintained or that the communication is free of errors, virus or interference.

ERGO Insurance Ple. Ltd. asserts copyright in respact lo this email including any attachment. No part may be reproduced by any process or for any
purpose withoul prior wrillen permission,

(hzclaimer This message and its aHachments are conlidential, infended anly for the named addressen. and may be prvileged. H you sre not the intended recigsent
vou shawd nof disclose, distribute, copy of use this communication. If you are nod the intended recigient please |1-:pr|l"3,- the sendsar by return email and daiele s
message. By opening any attachment 1o 1his messags: you agree fo accept the risk that @ may contain 8 virus or damaging code, and you agres that ERGO Insurance
Pre Lid wall not be liabde for any loss or damags 1heraby caused

From: Eileen Cheng

Sent: Wednesday, 23 January, 2019 3:48 PM
To: Steve Lim

Cc: Charlie Neo

Subject: FW: Accident claims

Dear Steve,

Flease assist. Thanks.

VWarmest Regards,

Eileen

From: Kai Liang Kai Liang [mailto:kailiangmotorservice@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 23 January, 2019 12:15 PM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.
Subject: Accident claims

To accident claims dept

Virus-free. www.avg.com







Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 22 February 2019 11:45 AM

To: 'Steve Lim'; assignments

Cc 5iti Rahman; SUR; ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)
Subject: RE: FW: Accident claims (Our insured: XBBO53A)

Attachments: CSEGI19001631Ugd3.pdf

Dear Steve,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of YM 2346A.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email: sigwse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 3(408933)

From: Steve Lim <steve. lim@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 25 January 2019 2:28 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Siti Rahman <Siti.Rahman@ergo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims
Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: FW: Accident claims (Our insured: XB8053A)

Hi Shiau Chan,

Mot registered. Please quote our vehicle number

Steve Lim
Manager - Claims

ERGO Insurance Ple. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-05 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038985

DID.. +65 6629 9197

Fax. +65 6829 9247

steve imEergo com.sg

ERGO

ERGO is one of the major insurance grougs in Germany and Europe Workdwide, ERGO ks representad in more than 30 countries and concenirates
on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading nisk carners

Wi Brgo Com. 549

[hsclzimer This message and its attachmenis are confidantal, intanded any for the named addresses, and may be prvileged I you are nat the inténded recpient, yol
shaukd not disclose, distribute, copy or use this communication If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender by relurn emall and delete this message
By opening any attachment lo this message. you agree fo accept the nsk that it may contain & virus or damaging code, and you agree that ERGO Insurance Ple Lid, wi
nof be liable far any loss or damage thereby caused

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 25 January, 2019 2:27 PM

To: Steve Lim; assignments



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 25 January 2019 2:27 PM

To: ‘steve Lim'; assignments

cc: ‘siti Rahman®: SUR; ‘ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)
Subject: RE: FW: Accident claims (Our insured: XB8053A)

Dear Steve,

please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle YM 2346A on 24/01/2019.
We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Kindly advise us the claim number of above mentioned.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: fash-3561 | email: si wwsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 25 January 2019 10:25 AM

To: 'Steve Lim' <steve.lim@ergo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Siti Rahman' <Siti. Rahman@ergo.com.sg=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; '‘ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims
Department)' <claims@ergo.com.sg=

Subject: RE: FW: Accident claims (Our insured: XB8053A)

Dear Steve,

Moted, with thanks.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #oz-25 | 5{408933)

From: Steve Lim |rnai1tu:5teve.lim@grgc,com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 25 January 2019 10:23 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Siti Rahman <Siti.Rahman@ergo.com.sg=; SUR <sur@I|kkauto.com>; ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. {Claims
Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg=

Subject: RE: FW: Accident claims (Our insured: XB8053A)

Hi Nivitha,
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PARFINOF Rehata Frning

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner |D:
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
FARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Company
7180N

YM2346A

No

25 Jan 2019
MITSUBISHI
FM&57MSRDEC
Blue

2005
6016982088
FM&57MB10005

$58,351.00
25 Jan 2006
25 Jan 2006
2

$2,918.00

Mo

$0.00

31 Dec 2020

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
5

$22,416.00

$11,545.00

$11,545.00

Please note that all future COE renewals for this vehicle can only be for a 5-year period, subject to the

statutory lifespan (if applicable) of the vehicle.

The information contained herein is correct as at 25 Jan 2019

MERSVLIE. QoV.SQitavriactonenguireanae sy uniceeroreLeraginput - UNG TILIN_IUSFUIUiGuud |1 LA
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KAI LIANG MOTOR SERVICE

AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT

BLK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #01-101 SINGAPORE 417883
TEL: 67474189 FAX:6743116

ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD
5, TEMASEK BLVD
SINGAPORE 038985

CLAIM DEPT: TP CLAIM

DATE: 23/01/2019

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YM2346A | XB8053A BUKIT BATOK WEST AVE 8 (CONST SITE)

REPAIRING QUOTATION
1PC FRONT WINDSCREEM [ 5V (A% $1967.10
1PC FRONT WINDSCREEM RUBBER SV $647.10 Y
. (-1 LESS10% $ 261.20
GUM /A $60.00
CHANGE FRONT WINDSCREEM LABOUR $250.00 / (7/)
2hba 3R =
TOTOL $-2663:00 3
/ Ly
T | e
. 1 ,* P 4 A
Vo'l Al | |8V -
A il A
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: G258 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD

5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD

Ref - CS/EGI19001631/Ugd3n2

IR

#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date :  22-02-2019
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
i Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. XB 8053A Veh. Inspected M 23464
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. XBBOS3IA Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  STEVELIM Assign Date 23/01/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI FMBST C.C 7545
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. FMBSTMB 10005 Colour BLUE
Odometer 408496 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification MIL
General GOooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [11R22.5 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Front Tyre |11R225 DUNLOP & mm
R/H Rear Tyre 11 R22.5 (D) DUNLOP B/& mm
L/H Rear Tyre |11 R225 (D) DUNLOP B/6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT WINDSCREEN CRACKED.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  22/01/2018 Inspection Date 24/01/2019
Survey held at KAl LIANG MOTOR SERVICE
BLK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE B
#01-101 AUTOBAY @KAKI BUKIT
SINGAFPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
BJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 0.500 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. YM 2346A
: te By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Estimate By
Workshop ($)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN CRACKED 1,967.10 1,300.00
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN RUBBER SERVICEABLE 647,10 =
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -261.42 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -325.00
2,352.78 a75.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|GUM (SN) NOT MECESSARY £0.00 -
60.00 =
LABOUR
CHAMNGE FRONT WINDSCREEN LABOUR. 250.00 150.00
250.00 150.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,662.T8 1,125.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REFAIRS 900.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS/EGI19001631/Ugd3n2
CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report I8 made sobely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report,




