Vie (LKKAuto)

m—
From: ONG U U <llong@lonpac.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 3 July, 2019 11:04 AM
To: Vic (LKKAuUto)
Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A
Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021356 REQUEST FOR DIRECT

SETTLEMENT - SMH1520M & SKJ58417 ON 21/01/2019 LKK REF
CC4/LPC19001560/T1ha3 [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Vic

Please proceed.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all { ¥ ) Jonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpehi@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 July, 2019 10:40 AM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021356 RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT -
SMH1520M & SKJ5841Z ON 21/01/2019 LKK REF CC4/LPC19001560/T1ha3

Your Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021356
Our Ref: CC4/LPC19001560/T1ha3

Dear Li L,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKJ 5841Z(0I1) AND SMH 1520M (TP) ON 21/01/2019

We refer to the subject matter and to the assignment dated 23" January 2019 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct
Settlement with our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

It was reported that our Insured vehicle reversed and collided to the stationary TP vehicle.

As such, liability is not to our Insured's favour

We propose to offer to TP repairer "PERFOR ITED" as below:
TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 4,717.57 S 2,659.97
Loss of Rental w/gst (570 x 2 days) 5 149.80 S 149.80




GIA Search Fee 5 2.00 5 200
TOTAL | § 4,869.37 $ 2,811.77
Breakdown of days is as follows:
Our surveyor's recommended days to repair 3 days
CLAIMED TOTAL | 2 days

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

e

FEY .
SLLRER = Sgve the Earth- Print only when necessary

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibiled, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mall in emor, pleaze do nol
read this e-mall or any attached llems. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copiles thereof, and inform the
sender thal you have deleled the e-mail_all altachments and any copies thereal. Thank you.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 27 February, 2019 9:32 AM
To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A; CS A Team; Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021356 RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SMH1520M & 5KI5841Z ON

21/01/2019

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVE AS TO COSTS

LPC ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021356
LKK REF: CC4/LPC19001560/T1fa3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed revert of vehicle: SMH 1520M
We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:

e TP estimated cost of repair

e Preliminary advice

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Poh Kin and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2132,

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.
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Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwani@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51. Pava Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{4080933]

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 24 January, 2019 9:07 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto,.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>;
Poh Kin [LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021356 RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SMH1520M & SKI5841Z ON
21/01/2019

Dear Mel Kwan

Please see attached for our Insured’s GIA report.

Regards,

Ong Li LI

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Te

( 65) 6296 2706

| -
-

| The all {8e%) lonpac.com.sg
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65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax:

—

From: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto) [mallto:Melkwan@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 23 January, 2015 7:16 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_5SG; Admin A; CS A Team; Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021356 RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SMH1520M & 5K15841Z
ON 21/01/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE®
SAVE AS TO COSTS

LPC ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021356
LKK REF: CC4/LPC19001560/fa3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our necessary action.
Our case handler in-charge is Poh Kin and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2132.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou,
Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366 o055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 23 January, 2019 3:33 PM

To: 'ONG LI LI' <llong@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Ce: 'MT_Claim_5G'<mt _claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021356 RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SMH1520M & 5KI5841Z ON
21/01/2019

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@|kkanto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrinl Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408543)

From: ONG LI Ll [mailto:llong@lonpac.com

Sent: Wednesday, 23 January 2019 8:56 AM

To: PBSP <pml-phsp@simedarby.com.sg>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>; assignments@Ikkauto.com;
Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Subject: Our Ref: 1B/19/19/VP05/021356 RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SMH1520M & 5KI5841Z ON
21/01/2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Caroline

Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for survey and assessment of liability,
Dear Catherine/Nivitha

FYA

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all (. ¥ ) lonpac.com.sg




From: PBSP [mailto:pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 23 January, 2019 8:38 AM

To: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SMH1520M & SKJ5841Z ON 21/01/2019

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

We have instructions from our client to seek repair cost and loss of use/car rental from you through Direct
Settlement

Attached is the estimates and supporting documents for your consideration.
Please let us have your confirmation that you agree that liability is clear and we may proceed with Direct Settlement.

If Direct Settlement is approved, kindly let us have your offer for LOU / rental.

Thank you

Regards,

Caroline

Cfo Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 155941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the
named addressee ("the Recipient”) and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or
proprietary to the Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws.
If you are not the intended Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding
and/or printing the Message. Please notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete
all copies of the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the
Message being infected by computer virus or other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions
expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and do not necessarily represent those of Sime
Darby's.”

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WwWw.avE.CoOm
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F_'qrfqnnance Motors Limited

(i
Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road
#17- 04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555
Attention: Motor Claims
“Without Prejudice"

09 April 2019
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SMH1520M & SKJSBH ZON 21. 01.21}19

Dear Sirs
‘We refer to the above matter,

The accident was caused solely by the negligence on the part of your insured. As a result of
the said accident, our client has suffered losses which are set out hereunder as follows:-

Cost of repair S$§ 265997
Car Rental : S$ 14980
GlAsearchfee : 5% 2.00
Total : S% 2811.77

A copy of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:

1, Copy of Accident Report

2. Copy of Final Repair bill & GIA search slip

3. Copy of Car Rental bill & Car Rental Agreement & Certificate of Insurance
4. Copy of ldentification Card & Driving License

5. Copy of Letter of Authorisation

Please note that you or your insured should send us an acknowledgement of receipt of this
letter within fourteen (14) days from the date of this letter, failing which our client will have no

alternative but to commence legal proceedings against you without any further notice to you or
your insured.

Should you have a counterclaim against our client arising out of the accident, you are also
required to send a letter giving full particulars of the counterclaim together with all relevant
supporting documents within eight (8) weeks of your receipt of this letter,

For any correspondence, please contact Ms Caroline Tan at 6319-0174 / Fax, 6479-4601 or
email to pmil-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg.

Yours sincerely

Cresendo Lagman
Customer Service Manager, Body & Paint



Performance Motors Limited

A b 2 e Srw Dty Gmup

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

ACCIDENT INVOLVING i1 1570 g “kT909417 on 21le l;‘uh‘

2 P | = i '\ L.-t"-:!" !:I' i L AT
h_IERENCE [ O n 1\ owner of Vehicle Registration No. "'+ | L 201
hereby authorise Performance Motors Limited to submit, correspond, negotiate and
settle my claim for cost of repair and/or uninsured losses arising from the above accident.

| further authorise Performance Motors Limited to execute, sign, seal and deliver all
documents whatsoever in relation to this matter and to accept and receive any payment
due to me in respect of my claim above.

| hereby declare that all acts and documents done by virtue of this Letter of Authorisation
on my behalf shall be good valid and effectual to all intents and purposes whatsoever as if
the same had been done or executed by me in person,

| further confirm that the acceptance by Performance Motors Limited of the settlement
amount in respect of such claim shall constitute the full discharge of my claim in respect of
such loss and damage.

Signed by:

Name) [, Wb Leamy Teeact (Date) »7 f'i""
NRICNo.: 3Tomitv

In the presence of:

A
(O
Name: CLECENDO Loémfr  (Date) -11![1'}{'{“&

NRICNo: S272%942 T
FORM ‘THEE MOTORS LikiTE

L srcira T og
e .

FORM B1 VERSION 1-SEPT 2017




LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : 18/19/19/VPO5/021356
DATE : 08B JULY 2018

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We, LOW WAI LEONG TERENCE confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of SKJ 5841Z the sum of Singapore Dollars
Two Thousand Eight Hundred Eleven and Cents Seventy Seven Only ($2.811.77)
in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of property claim competent to
me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim
sustained by me/us whether now or hereafier (0 become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident to my vehicle, SMH 1520M on 21 JANUARY
2019 along CLEMENTI WEST STREET 2 CAR PARK.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LOW KOK TONG /
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made
by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly 1o M/S
PERFORMANCE MOTORS LTD.

I/'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

]

fH"

Signature ¢f vehicle owner/Date

1 I f p
leatael L~ ';',‘:i'fﬂ

Name of vehicle owner/Date
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SERVICE TAX INVOICE

Repair Order No. : Bl 1338919 Page Ho. : 1 of 2
Invoice Number : 2084043 / WSB
Date IN : 19/02/2019 fnvoies Dare . 04/04/2019
Motor Claim Advisor: Han Kwan Yong Payment Terms : 30 Days From Invoice
| Invoice By : Toh Jing Xuan
[ - CUSTOMER INFORMATION - - INVOICE TO - 158
Mr Low Wai Leong Terence Lonpac Insurance Bhd
61 Chestnut Avenue 300 Beach Road
#10-07 #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore Singapore 199555
| Singapore 679522

" REGN. NO. CHASSIS HO. RECN. DATE MCDEL MILEAGE
| SMH1520M ENS51150 14/01/2019 X1 SDRIVE1BI 2743
----LABOUER 1--- - NETT

To make good the rear bumper including replacemeant of 850.00
damaged parts and knock oul dented area caused by the
accidenl.
To respray rear bumper. 934.00
To check electrical wiring systems and lightings at the 160.00
rear section for proper function.
Sundries. 40.00
INS CLAIMS : ACCIDENT REPAIR. DIRECT SETTLEMENT. 0.00

DATE OF ACCIDENT : 21.01.2019. 3RD PARTY CAR : SKJ58412
YOUR REF NO : NIL

VEHICLE WAS SURVEYED BY MR TAUFIKH FROM LKK AUTO ON
19.02.2019 AT 4:30PM. AUTHORISED REPAIR BY MR CHONG
POH KIN FROM LKK AUTD ON 30,01.2019 VIA EMAIL.

PROPOSE CAR RENTAL = $1408.80. THE AMOUNT IS SUBJECTED 0.00
TO INSURANCE COMPANY CONFIRMATION,

GlA SEARCH FEE = $2.00. 0.00

Total Labour 1: 1.5?‘.130

Petatil

- = = = EARTS = — gty Price NETT

REAR BUMPER MIDDLE TRIM PANEL (PDC) 1 242.80 242 80

REAR BUMPER TRIM BOTTOM [LINES) 1 231.25 231.25

REAR RH REFLECTOR 1 3780 37.80

Totasl Parts H _ﬁv‘l-ﬁid




- el Performance Motors Limited

A slenber of the Sime Darby Group
A, REg. Mo QN0 OET Eep. Mo MI-BEIUOAL-s

118, Alesandra Ecad

103, Alesandrs Eosd 280, fmmpong ArEna Boad Eime Sariny Sualnass Centre

Aim# Darty Perforsasce Centie Exgl CIast Jenpre Singapoce 159B4d

Sisgapore LI¥REL Sirgapcee 4ialot Tel, EM1805I8 (hfrerinlies

el 433 ibales & Admip| el E31%0AEN [AftErEalad EITSOS A0 (Motoerad)
E¥1P0111 (AfrmrdSsles) Fax. & HaFTTY Fax, EATEEED] Infrardalea

Tax E&TLTTTE EATREE2a IWisrserad

SERVICE TAX INVOICE

Repalr Order No. : Bl 1338919 Page No. ¢ 2 0of 2
Invoice Number : 2084043 / WSB

Date IN  19/02/2019 Invoice Date : 04/04/2019
Motor Claim Advisor: Han Kwan Yong Payment Terms : 30 Days From Invoice
Invoice By : Toh Jing Xuan
~ ———— S
Labour Charges : 1,834.00 Total lLabour & Parts Charges : 8% 2,485.95
Parts Charges t 511.85 Less Insurance Excess : 5% 0.00
Lubricant /Misc 40.00 Invoice Total Amount Exclude GST : 5% 2,485.95
GST & 7% : 5% 174.02
Invoice Total Amount Include GST : 8% 2.659.97
Computer generated invoice. No signature is required. Ihmm-; Payable Include GST : s$

All amounts are in Singapore Dallars,

Work was carried out subject to the Company's Terms and Conditions of Service.

Mo complaints will be entertained unless reported within seven (7) days of the date of this invoice.
For credit purchases. interest [@1% per month will be debited on overdue amounts




SIME DARBY SERVICES PTE LTD

Thetry dinternational Liceanses

305 Alespadrn Anad, #0501

Vantage Atomotive Cantre, Singapome 1535942

o (65) B447 3388 1 |B5) 6345 7247

Co Reg Mo 187TSDIDESW OST Reg Mo M2-0021988-4

TO BE PAID BY

PAYMENT = MC - 30000000066

HIRER'S DETAILS
TITLE MH
NHAME LOW WAI LEDNG TERENCE
ADDARESS 81 CHESTNUT AVENLUE
#1007
SINGAPORE 678522
NRIC/PASSPORT NO SEMg1ToC ISSUE 19112018
%mm SINGAPORE
NSE sSxapsiToc EXPIRY a0n1 272000
ISSUED BY SINGAPORE
NATIONALITY SINGAPOREAN DOB 21031883
FREQUENT FLYER NO
LOCAL CONTACT B1383310
HOTEL
COMPANYS DETAILS
NAME
ADDRESS
IMPORTANT NOTICE

« Hirer is hable for @8 iraffic ines including sdmem fees hat ae issued by
Singapore or Malaysia sutnontes for @ grece pariod of 12 moaniha Fam Me
date of car retum

« A security deposil depenting on the respactive car group rented will be withhaid
on the Hirg's credd card

= Any accident has 10 be reparmiad within ihe rex] working cay to Sme Daroy

Pie Lid, In the svent of failung 1o report. hirgr shall be labie for any
incurred by Sime Darty Services Ple Lid or chalms made by the offer
party.

+ Smoking. durians and pets are nol sliowed in the vehicie An additional 3 days
rardad would be imposed If amoking ang curan smel/psls fur in delectag
PN Car retum

+ Hirer must inflorm Sime Darty Senices Pl Lid in advance for yehicie drop-oft
in Thrifty Malaysin renting Iocation. A ans-way rental fes and Malaysia
suicharge ang apphcable as stated in cur Ons Way Rental pobcy

+ Hurar 1 responsdile for any Missing temp/car accesscnes of loss of keys will
be chianged accordingly

+ The excess do nol cover |} Cal acoessories i) Loas of key i) Vandalism
v} Alcohol/intoxicants/dregs

+ Vehecies nre prohibned to be dnven mito Thasland

= Strictly no key-drop services aliowed, secunty depost will b= lorfeited

Thie vihecis i renbed subsec to all erms and conditiong on thes page and on the
faverse sice whether printed or handwritten Hiner represents that hey nave read
undarstand and pgres with the conditions of the rental agresment. Tha hirer
authonsas all amounts dus under the rantal agreement ta be charged 1 the heer's
credit card shown on 1his form

ADDITIONAL DRIVERS:

RENTAL AGREEMENT NUMBER - 55005185

RENTAL LOCATION SHORT TERM-HO [SINSS)-THRIFTY
CHECROUT

UNIT # / REGN NO DODOZESS / SLLAT1SH

MAKE & MODEL HYUNDAI HYUNDAI Elantrs 1 8
CAR GROUP GIVEN G CHARGE F
KILOMETER OUT 2402

PETROL LEVEL OUT FULL

DATE & TIME OUT 181022018 1145

DUE DATE & TIME IN IZH0XA0NE 1145

CHECKIN LOCATION SHORT TERM-HQ (SINSS)- THRIFTY
RENTAL RATES

A5 INSURANCE CLAIME RATES 2017
DAILY @ 55 7000
EXTRA DAY @ 5% TO 00

EXTRA HOUR @ 53 1400

TOTAL: 5% 224.T0

FOR RATES TO APPLY

MINIMUM 34 HOURS
CAR MUST BE RETURNED TO RENTING LOCATION

ON THE DUE DATE

INSURANCE
BY INITIALS, THE HIRER

INCLUSIVE LDW

NON-WAINVERABLE DAMAGE EXCESS 5% 1.500 00 (5iN USE]

DECLINES PAI @ 55 500 PER DAY

DECLINES WSL @ 5§ 5.00 PER DAY

THIS CAR IS FOR SINGAPORE USE ONLY THERE IS NO INSURANCE
COVERAGE FOR USE OUTSIDE SINGAPORE

OTHER CHARGES
FUEL SERVICES @ 53270/ LITRE

CASH & CHEQUE DEFOSIT

BMVY OWNER SEH1520M
PML CE5A HAN

HI RESERVATION
RES D2 TACO=
JOE RAHMAN REF SRC PHONE

Prirted on 16-Fab-2018 1458
Emered by Joe Rahman

A -r Matots Company



TAX INVOICE

Ty

Invoice No. 55 - 513

| MR LOW WA| LEONG TERENCE

e &1 CHESTMUT AVENUE # 1007
SINGAPORE 479522

L

INVOICE DATE : 22-FEB 2019

SIME DARBY SERVICES PTE LTD
Thritty Interrational Licensas

305 Alpxandia Aoad, #03-0

Yantage Autormotive Cantre, Singapors 155943
p (B5) BA4T 3388 | (B5) B34S 24T

Go, Rep Mo 19TS0VDESW GST Reg. Mo M2-0021586-4

i

Foge

-

|

R.A. No. 55005395 | JOE RAHI

[

TILE i MR KILOMETER OUT/AIN IO22402 ) 22472

AUTHORITED DRIVER i LOW WAI LEONG TERENCE KILOMETER DRIVEN 70

HNRIC /PASSPORT NO, T SHIFITOC PETROL LEVEL OUT/IN +  FULL 7 FULL

MAKE & MODEL + HYUMDAI ELANTRA | 4 DATE & TIME OUT + |9-FEB 2019 11:45

CARREGISTRATION NO. @ SLLS715H [/ UNIT # ; DOOZE95 DATE & TIME IN 3 21-FEB 2019 1815

CAR GROUP GIVEN I G CHECK IN LOCATION i SHORT TERM-HQ [SIM55]-THRIFTY

CAR GROUP CHARGED : F NO. OF DAY(S5) CHARGED : 2 DAY(5) 7 HOUR(S)

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT  AMOUNT BEFORE GST AMOIN

(sGD) GST [SGD) oM (sG
INSURANCE CLAIMS RATES 2007
2 DAY(S) i@ 70,00/ DAY 140,00 080 14¢
§ HOURS) (i $14.00 F HOUR T, 4,50 74
WAIVED EXCESS HOURS DUE TO CAR REPAIR MUK UP =70, 00 =4 90 -T4
INFORMED LATE
SUB-TOTAL 140,00 9,80 149
REMARKS: BMW OWNER SME ) S20M TOTAL (S5GD) ; 14000 9.80 149
ML CSA AN
* I[TEMS NOT SUBJECT TOGST
MO XXXXXXNXXXXX2639 -149
BALANCE DUE il

NOTE:

I/ WE HEREBY AGREE TO THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND BE HELD LIABLE FOR ALL AMOUNT DUE UNDER THI
AUGREEMENT, ALL TRAFFIC FINES INCLUIING ADMIN FEES INCURRED DURING PERIOD OF HIRE; ANY COSTS INCURRE|
BY SIME DARBY SERVICES PTE LTD FOR MY FAILURE TO REPORT ANY ACCIDENT WITHIN 24 HOURS. FINAL CHARGE®
SUBJECT TO FULL INSPECTION OF THE VEIHICLE BY A COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

K

Prir

wirécard
HERTY - ALERRANDRA
0§ ALE

WANDRE POAD
#05-ka VANTAGE AUTOMOTIVE CENTRE
SINAPCRE | 5840;

CAALE J 1L 2 i
Hln-nnmnfms

TI: 39263134 INV:012189
BATCH 003832 TRACE : 020099
ORDER : 012189 - 003832020009
APR/AUTH CODE - T33140

MOTO SALES

LR IR

MASTER  <e**+ ssss ssss 2539
ENT Mamual HEF D00 | O
BASE : 5% 149,80
TOTAL T S§ 14980

ALCORDTNG T TeE CARD |SSUER ACRESMENT

| MEEE 1O Far TWE SBOeE TOTAL m:wr[
Free CLSTOMUN CXipY see

HIRER'S AND/OR ADDITIONAL DRIVER'S SIGNATURE

A Metore Company

Enfered by  Mur Ezham COmar
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GENERAL

Our Rel No: GR-19-012622
Date of Reguest: 22/101/2019
Performance Molors Limited

303 Alexandra Road

Sime Darby Performance Cantre
Singapore 159941

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam o Spm

GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Your Rel No: Online Purchasa

Dear Sir'Madam,

Enguiry Date 22/01/2018

Enquiry By Melanie Satiawati

TP Vahicle No. SKJ58412

Accident Date 21/01/2019

Enguiry Result

TP Vahicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel, No.
SKJ5B41Z Lonpac Insurance Bhd 19/04/2018-18/04/2018 +65 62507368
Thank You,

The images pravided to you are taken from the orginal repons forwarded 1o the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association of

Singapore and we lake no respansibility for thelr accuracy or contents and shall be under no lkabillty whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of
of in connection wilh the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated documen! and requires no signature.

hitps:/fsingapore. menmen comiciaims/index.cim Plusebox=MTRsashluseacnon=dsp_genimiphrefid=203T2364CFID=4T3458304CFTOKEN=208. ..
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1222018, Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

GENM 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

INSUME Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 3am to Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE O redistration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Qur Ref No: GR-18-012622
Date of Reguest 2210172019 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Performance Maotors Limited
303 Alexandra Road
Sime Darby Performance Centre
Singapore 159941
Dear SirfMadam,
Enguiry Date 22/01/2018
Enguilry By Melanie Setiawali
TP Vehicle No. SKJ5841Z
Accident Date 21/01/2018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (55)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You

This is a compuier generated documeni and requires no signature,

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:

[X] GIRO [ ] Cash | | Cheque

hitps-/isingapore. merimen.comiciaims/index cim ?fusebox=MTRsasifuseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=2037236ACFID=473458304CF TOKEN=20e .

22



