Cecilia ChnnE (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 11 April 2019 8:55 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim 5G

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> YOUR REF: 18/19/19VP05/021349 **(OUR REF:

CCe/LPC12001558/Apa3) ** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 9733H & SLW 9748 ON
21/01/2019 ** [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Cecilia,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards
Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255
i

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 10 April, 2019 10:52 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Subject: FW: <SEEK MANDATE> YOUR REF: 18/19/19VP05/021349 **(OUR REF: CC6/LPC19001558/Apa3) **
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 9733H & SLW 974B ON 21/01/2019 **

Lonpac Ref: 18/19/19VP05/021349
LKK Ref: CC4/LPC19001558/Apa3

Dear Sirs/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 23/01/2019 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is a T-Junction collision. Liability is not in our driver's favour.

summary to offer to third party repairer, “NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD" is as follows: -



Claimed Amount Revised Amount
|. Cost of Repair [w/GST) $ 15,489.32 $ 5.243.00
2. Loss of Use [05days x $120.00) $ 600.00 $ 600.00 (05days x $120.00)
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee 3 7.45 $ 7.45
Total | $ 16,096.77 S5 5,850.45

**05days recommendation for repair
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for vour perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval,

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



| NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTELTD |

Our Ref : NPI11903-0023/ SLW9748B 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
Your Ref :SKD9733H Blk C #01-43 Autobay@KB
Date : 06" March 2019 Singapore 417883
LDI'IFIEIC Insurance Bhd WITHOUT PREJUDICE

300, Beach Road #17-04/07
The Concourse,
Singapore 199555

Dear Sirs,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLW9748B & SKD9733H AT 855 WOODLANDS ST 83 CARPARK ON
21.01.2019, 06:00HR

We are instructed by EZ-SWIFT CAR RENTAL & LEASING PTE LTD to claim damages and losses
against you in connection with the above captioned road traffic accident which our client’s
vehicle SLW974B was damaged by vehicle SKD9733H driven by your insured at the material
time.

We are instructed that the said accident was caused by your insured’s negligent driving and/or
management of the vehicle. As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle was damaged and

our client has been put to loss and expenses, particulars of which are as follows:

1) Repair Costs S 4,900.00
2) Loss of Use for 05 days (Grab Vehicle) 5 600.00
3) LTA Search Fees 5 7.45

S 5,507.45

A copy each of the following supporting document is enclosed:

1) Final Repair Bill
2) LTA Receipt

Please let us have t.rﬂur-""theque for the sum $5,507.45 made payable to us, NEW HOCK TECK
MOTOR PTE LTD in the next 14.days.

1

Yours faithfully,

NEW HOCK TECKMOTOR PTE LTD

s )~



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Lid
Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

Blk 1 #01-43

Singapore 417883

Dear Sir, .
Accident on 4 {llr, [ ,j 20| a . f: i 4, l;

Involving Vehicles ﬁ_ WgiIu B, SkEDA3IS3H

Along 8§55 Woeediond( ¢} §3 covpovt

_ : . e CLWAAUR
I'We, the registered owner/driver of vehicle registranion no: > L L”___ i -
have invalved in the above accident.

I'We hereby authorize New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd to commence repairs of the said vehicle

forthwith.

I'We agree 10 assign the whole proceeds of my/our comprehensive/third party claim to you and our
solicitor, o - . to act on my/our behalf in respect of the
ahove matter. And if applicable, my/our solicitors shall accept this as my/our irrevocable authority to
pay the amount as deemed compensated direct to you after deduction of their costs on a Solicitor and

client bhasis.

['We undertake to co-operate fully with you and our solicitors to ensure that claim is successtul.

I'We also authorize you to sign all discharge vouchers/indemnity forms and all necessary papers in

relation with the above claim in my/our absence.

Your kind co-operation in this matter will be much appreciated.

Ao pSING a2
Yours truly, (2 8§ °
ra \ I W |‘£ .
[ / ‘='-:'_f,'_::-
II' .‘fI( —
Crwner's Signature

{Company’s stamp 1f applicable)

Nam I?E_J:.;,'._.; 'n.lfl | 'I rE il,'-ﬁ'r'ﬂ‘ L. X Lt 'hﬁl"r\.r“ ]K'L UiV

el Al \
NRILC No.: ARV Y N
Date: i’ "\L WA




Assignment

To: New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd (Workshop)

; ; . . i Y
In consideration for your agreement to repair my motor vehicle registration no. SLWSH U.P,

and to defer demanding for payment of the cost of repair, I/'we the undersigned do herebhv
irrevocably assign absolutely to vou all the proceeds of my/our claim(s) including damages, interest,
costs and expenses (including legal costs / disbursements payable on a party and party basis which
are to be paid to the parties so entitled including solicitors. vehicle appraisers and other experts /

consultants).

LI'We further confirm that payment to you only or to any person authorised by you to receive
payment shall constitute a good and effectual discharge of the obligations by any party of the

aforesaid proceeds of my/our claim(s).

[/'We authorise you expressly to give notice of this assignment to the party concerned.

[/'We confirm that by this assignment, I'we shall not be entitled in law to receive any payment. If a
cheque is sent to me/us, I'we shall return same to the sender as l'we am/are precluded from

accepting any payment.

/]
Dated this 2| dayl_.ﬁ;"' D1
()7 =
T
Signature :
Name : fE-EL:XJ(:{"I' v MVUCM x:__:'-'-‘x'.-\' i
ID No. ; [N Pedfe]
Address : 201 OAJ
Witness Signatwre /A ;’/\1 e
f{*g N
Witness Name : Chew/Yue Yin
Witness ID ; S8826618H
Witness Address ' 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-43

Singapore 417883



’ ' LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO : 18/19/19/vp035/021349
DATE 2 11/04/2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We. EZ-SWIFT CAR RENTAL & LEASING PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from
M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of SKD 9733H the sum of
Singapore Dollars Five Thousand and Five Hundred Only (85.500.00) in full and final
satisfaction. liquidation and discharge of property claim competent to me/us upon the
said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by
me/us whether now or hereafter 1o become manifest. arising either directly or indirectly
from an accident to my vehicle, SLW 974B on 21 JANUARY 2019 along/at 855
WOODLANDS ST 83 CARPARK.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (SAFIAH BINTE DARSIN
{LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made
by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/s NEW
HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD.

I/'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of liability
basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our insured’s recovery
action. -

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

EZ-SWIFT CAR RENTAL & LEASING PTELTD
,,,,,,,,,, Reg Ma.: 201724540M
MName of vehicle owner/Date I||'1‘ 19 1 Kaki Bukit Aveniue 6

Block A #01-11 Autobay@¥aki Bukit
Singapore 417883



W AB 482 AT TR 3]
NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE. LTD.

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Blk C #01-43 Autobay@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883

Email: admin@nhtmotor.com Website: www.nhtmotor.com

Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 67417276
UEN: 201718370K

TAX INVOICE

Lonpac Insurance Bhd Invoice No NPL1903-0024
300, Beach Road #17-04/07 Date 06-Mar-19
The Concourse,
Singapore 199555 Date of Accident 21-Jan-19
Vehicle No. SLWS74B
Client: EZ-SWIFT CAR RENTAL & LEASING PTE LTD Model Type Mitsubishi Lancer
Descriptions Amount
Lump Sum Repair Cost 4,900.00
| Total | 4,900.00

SIN DOLLARS: FOUR THOUSAND AND NINE HUNDRED ONLY

2 MO
¥ M .r_.
/Rf?/___ O

I

~20CK




Recein hitps: vrl i govisg Tia vrl acuon completePavment 'FUNCTIO!

> Back to OneMotoring

>

Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

(G5T Registration Mo, ; Md-0006529-7

Print Date/Time 21 Jan 2019/ 11:20:10
Receipt Date/Time | 21 Jan 2019/ 11:20:10
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. | ITNET-00000-190121-000978

Previous Receipt No

S/N Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
Ma. GST (5%) (58] (S5)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SKD9733H
As at 21 Jan 2019/06:00:00

Insurance Co: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
1 Insurance Enquiry - SKDA733H

Ee]
Enquiry Fee 7.00 0.49 7.49
201890121111935002230
Sub-Total 7.00 .49 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.48 7.49
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable T.45
Paid By
Credit Card:
Exmnoooxd 469 \isalastarCand 7.45
Total 7.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 7.45
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00
-

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider [ financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.

1 of ] 21/1/2019, 11:20 AM



