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LK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD(OD) -

« Service Request Details

Claim
59MD1B84

Reference
None &

Loss Date
January 1%, 2019

Request Date
January 23, 2019

Due Date
January 30, 2019

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD)

Type of Loss
Own Damage

Services
Arcelerated survey and authaorize

Actions

Next Step
Agree to perform service

Detline $Work 1[ accopt Wark

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
SIM7733K

Make
BMW

Menu



LKK AUTO COMNSULTANTS PTE LTD

STIVILE MUldiead

280 WOODLANDS, ., 757322

Primary Contact/Insured

CHUA TIONG KEE

BLK 33 MARSILING DRIVE, #05-363, 730033, Singapore
91095010

NCDDANNY@GMAIL.COM

Claim Handler

ANG Yvanne
65688044461
yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions

0On) =
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EXCESS NIL
Messages Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics Notes
Document Type _ Document SubType
v L

= Lipload Documents

MAME B Accident Statement

TYPE Reports & Statement

SUB-TYPE

AUTHOR Merimen

DATE UPLOADED

NAME B GIA SHD6661LPDF

TYPE Reports & Statement

SUB-TYPE GIA Report

AUTHOR VISHNU BATHAM Shekhar



NAME

TYPE

SUB-TYPE

AUTHOR

DATE UPLOADED

NAME

TYPE

SUB-TYPE

AUTHOR

DATE UPLOADED

NAME

TYPE

SUB-TYPE

AUTHOR

DATE UPLOADED

MNAME

TYPE

SUB-TYPE

AUTHOR

B GIA SHCA648G PDF

Reports & Statement

GIA Report

VISHNU BATHAM Shekhar

January 23, 2019

B GIA SHCS005T.PDF

Reports & Statement

GIA Report

VISHNU BATHAM Shekhar

January 23, 2019

B ESTIMATE. pdf

Forms / Claim Documents

Estimate / Quotation

VISHNU BATHAM Shekhar

January 23, 2019

B EMAIL OD PRIpdf

Letters and Correspondence

Woarkshop

VISHNU BATHAM Shekhar
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> Back to OneMotoring

PARFICNF Raraws Frniiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 3600H
33 R0 o 1 N 3 S e i e i~ i S
Vehicle No.: SIMTT33K
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 24 Jan 2017
Vehicle Make: B.MW
Vehicle Madel; J40L1 3.0L A/T ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR HID SR
Primary Colour Grey
Manufacturing Year: 2010
Engine No.: 09427456N54B30A
Chassis No.: WBAKB42040CYB3247
Maximum Power Qutput; 240.0 kW (321 bhp)
Open Market \Value: $78.546400
Original Registration Date: 30 Jul 2010
First Registration Date: 30 Jul 2010
Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: $78,564.00
LT IER 1A T 0 e s e s =i 1 |
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 29 Jul 2020
PARF Rebate Amount: $43,210.00 ﬁ iﬁ_j'/’
COE Expiry Date: 29 Jul 2020
COE Category E - Open Category
COE Period(Years) 10
QP Paid: $39.000.00
COE Rebate Amount: §5.236.00
Total Rebate Amount $48.4446.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 24 Jan 2019
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“ Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

E

From: Elite Automotive <elite.automotivel3@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 7 August 2019 11:00 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SJM 7733K DOA : 10/01/2019

Attachments: 0708201910575 pdf

Hi Shirley,

Good day! Kindly refer to attached DV and tax invoice, please assist submit to AXA for proceed payment. Thanks!

Regards,
Christy

On Tue, 6 Aug 2019 at 17:27, Elite Automotive <elite.automotiveli@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Rasul,

We accept the offer $20K. Thanks!

Regards,

Christy

On Wed, 31 Jul 2019 at 18:47, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Christy,

Finalised amount of $ 20,000 (repair limit) / 12 days lump sum is confirmed

Best Regards,



Iijiuul | Assessor

LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-1561 | email: Rusul@ [kknuto.com | fax: 6841-4915
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

I e
e R~ Save the Earthe Print only when necessary

From: Elite Automotive [mallto:elite.automotive13@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 24 January, 2019 3:36 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SIM 7733K DOA : 10/01/2019

Hi Rasul,

Good day! Just as spoken on phone, this car repair limit should be 520k, our client car got sunroof, same the
model in the SG CAR MART. Kindly refer to attached photo. Thanks!

Regards,

Christy



On Thu, 24 Jan 2019 at 15:25, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Email to me the sunroof photo

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall: Rasul@lkkaute.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51. Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

¥ S
IKK = Save the Sarth- Frint only when necessery:

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 24 January, 2019 3:19 PM
To: "elite.automotivel3@gmail.com'
Subject: SIJM 7733K DOA : 10/01/2019

Hi Christy,

Repair limit for this vehicle is 13K only

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lud

Phone: G256-9561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
3
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S=SR== == Sove the Larth- Print only when pecessary:

Regards,

Regards,

Regards,



Shirlsz Hiew !LI{I{ Autn!

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 31 January 2019 12:55 PM

To: ‘Elite Automotive’

Cc SUR

Subject: RE: SJM 7733K DOA ; 10/01/2019

Dear Elite,

As instructed by our client, please proceed at repair cost not exceeding $20,000.00 (inclusive
supplementary) to repair the insured vehicle SIM 7733K (Excess $0/-) on lump Sum basis.

[f there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handlar

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phonae: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkayto.com | fax: 5256-4315
Bik 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Elite Automotive [mailto:elite. automotive 1 3@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 24 January, 2019 3:36 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SIM 7733K DOA : 10/01/2019

Hi Rasul,

Good day! Just as spoken on phone, this car repair limit should be $20k, our client car got sunroof, same the
model in the SG CAR MART. Kindly refer to attached photo. Thanks!



VISHNU BATHAM Shekhar

From: Elite Automotive <elite.automotivel3@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, January 22, 2019 6:09 PM

To: 5G AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey

Cc: SG AXA Insurance SM Claims Service Team
Subject: Claim Own Damage For Vehicle No: SIM 7733K
Attachments: 22012019180637 pdf

Categories: Shekhar

Hi,

Good day! Kindly refer to attached estimate and accident report, please arrange surveyor come down for
survey this vehicle, Thanks!

Regards,

Christy

-



%

From: Rasul (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 24 January 2019 4:44 PM

To: Veron Chen [LEKAuUtD)

Subject: FW: SJM 7733K DOA : 10/01/2019

Attachments: IMG_0599.JPG; IMG_0598JPG; IMG_0600JPG; IMG_0601.JPG

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: f256-2561 | email: Rasul@lkkputo.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51. Pava Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1. #o2-25 | S{408933)

F IR, e
Se=RER == Save the Earthe Print only when necessary

From: Elite Automotive [mallto:elite.automotivel3@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 24 January, 2019 3:36 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuta)

Subject: Re: SIM 7733K DOA : 10/01/2019

Hi Rasul,

Good day! Just as spoken on phone, this car repair limit should be $20k, our client car got sunroof, same the
model in the SG CAR MART. Kindly refer to attached photo. Thanks!

Regards,
Christy

On Thu, 24 Jan 2019 at 15:25, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Email to me the sunroof photo



Bes_l Regards,
Rasul | Assessar

LKK Auto Consultanis Pte Litd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rusul@@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408033)
| -K -

- N ]

i Save the Earth Print only whes pecessary

I

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 24 January, 2019 3:19 PM
To: 'elite.automotive13@gmail.com'
Subject: SJM 7733K DOA : 10/01/2019

Hi Christy,

Repair limit for this vehicle is 13K only

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: f256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto com | fax: 68414315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

F K =
SESRER =W Lo the Srthe Frint only when mecessary:



Rasul (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday. 24 January, 2019 3:19 PM
To: ‘elite.automotivel 3@ gmail com’
Subject: SIM 7733K DOA : 10/01/2019

Hi Christy,

Repair limit for this vehicle is 13K only

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasuli [kkauto.com | fax: 68414715
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue i, #02-25 | S(q08933)

F LY =~
LER2IT ZT sove the Earth: Frint only when necessary-
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Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 25/01/2019

Survey Details:

Date of loss 19-Jan-19

Date of appointment 23-lan-19

Date of survey 24-lan-19

Location of survey 280 WOODLANDS
INDUSTRIAL PARK ES #01-17
HARVEST@WOODLANDS
SINGAPORE 757322

Vehicle Details:

Claim Type: Own Damage

Vehicle number SIM 7733K

Make and Model BMW 740LI 3.0 A/T ABS/D/AB
2WD

Date of registration 30-Jul-10

Excess S0

Market Value 469,000

Parf Rebate 548,446

Nett Loss 520,554

Repair details:

[initial Estimate | 34,741.60]

Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts $14,202.60
Check items (estimate) 58,529.00
Labour 53,560.00
Total $26,291.60
Lump Sum(if applicable) $20,000.00|(ESTIMATE)

[Number of days for repair_| 12 DAYS |
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Remarks:

DAMAGES CONSISTENT, REPAIR COST ECONOMICAL WE
HAVE AUTHORIZE REPAIR. REPAIRER AGREED TO
UNDERTAKE THE REPAIR COST NOT EXCEEDING

$ 20,000.00 ON LUMP SUM BASIS.

[ insssagaiery Mgt by il i Wi ol T VR

w g VI

Mandate:
Liability(TP) %
Proposed repair cost S
Loss of use % |no. of days
Loss of rental 5|no. of days
Loss of income S|no. of days
LTA search fees 5
Others 5
Proposed Total HVALUE!
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MBACTRO0S513 | inmman Ao Car
ENTRY DATE & TIME 21012018 1141
BLBANTTED BY. Sandy Fang Jing Chyl

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1, Pleass report '.'ﬂr‘l'-';"ﬂ'lr e detalls of the aoccident 10 spesd up the Clalms process

2 This Form must be compléted by the Policyholder andlor ihe Authorised Driver

3. Information provided must be &8 truthiiil and accurate as posaitis Amy willul msrepresentation ar withalding af masenal facls may allow nsErance Companes 1o

repudiate policy lability

4 Tha maus and scceptanca of this Form by insurance companies & nal an admission of policy Habllity an the pant of the insurance comoares

5. Any false reporting may be referred 1o the Police for investigation.

& This report will be forwarded by the insuters of the GlA Records Managemenit Cenire established by the Ganeral Insurance Associalion of Sngapore (GIA] for

armchiving and thai copies of this report will, 'or a fee. be made available upon apphcation by inleresiad parkies

T. By the ndgemsant of his report 1o the nsurers. you hareby consend 1o the arctiing of hie repor @ the cenne 5nd 16 Copwes of tha repont Being made aveilabls
foreLai

ploresmd

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Repon 210172019 11:41

Date Of Accidemnt 19/01/2019 22:00

Exact Location Of Accidant BAYFRONT AVENUE LAMPPOST 13F TOWARD TEMASAK
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registratlon Number
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Regisiered Owner
NRIC No

Email Address

Mobile Phone Nao

Altarnative Phone Mo
Vehicle Particulars
Manufaciurar

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

lime of accident

Ara you claiming under your own insurance policy

for rapair to your vehicla?

If No, Please state aclion to be taken

Vehicle Calegory

Insurance Company
Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage
Fleat Policy

Palicy Number

Caover Mote Number
Driver

Mame of Drivar

NRIC No

Date Of Birth
Occupalion

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

SIM7T33K

CHUA TIONG KEE
ST1T3600H
NCODANNY@EGMAIL.COM
(LGCAL) +65-81095010
OTHERS-21095010

BMW

74001 3.0L AT ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR HID SR

YES

PRIVATE CAR

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

GA241805N1

CHUA TIONG KEE
S7173600H

15/08/M1871

INDOOR

03M0Mea2

26 YEARS AND 3 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-81085010

OTHERS-81095010
NCDDANNY@GMAIL COM

Page 1 of 21



BLK 108A CANBERRA WALK

Address #05-11

Posicode 751108
VWas driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OWNER

Vehicle Registration Number of Drivar's Cwn
Vehicle

Insurance Company af Drivar's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident CHAIN COLLISION
Weather Condiions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY
Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle invalved in this accident? NO
Number of vehicles (including own vehicle) 4

invedved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any mnjured conveyed 1o hospital by NO
ambulance?

Was any other materal or properly damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown person(s) NO
soliciting/ofering accidant claims assistance

Number of Passengers |Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

Was the accidenl repartad to the palice? NO

If Yes Please state which Palice Station

Was notice of inlended Prosecution given? ND

If Yes againsl whom?7

Circumstances of Accident

PLEASE REFER TO THE ATTACHMENT

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available lor attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NG

Was there any audio recorded? NO

Vehicle Registration Number SHCEE48G
Vehicle MakeModel/Colour

Datailes Of Properties

Vehicle Category TAXI
Name of Drver SEE LUB HOK
MRIC/Passport Number 500056908
Cantact Number 81099369

Addrass

Postcode

Insurance Company Nama

Nature Of Damage

Ma. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 2

Venhicle Registration Number SHCH005T

ra

Page 2 of



Vehicle Make/Model/Colour

Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category TAXI

Mame of Driver WONG SO0ON CHAI
MRIC/Passport Number 50082439C
Contact Number 97501009

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Nature Of Damage

Mo. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Vahicle Registration Number SHDE661L
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour

Details Of Proparties

Vahicle Category TAXI

Name al Driver YU CHIN SENG
NRIC/Passport Numbet 25674168
Contact Number 86226711
Address

Fostcode

Insurance Company Name
Natura Of Damage

Mo. Of Passenger (Including Driver]

F‘._u?-_' 3 21
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. - SKETCH PLAN

BAYFRONT AVE  TOwWARD TEMASAK |

A: SFMIF33K ESLEE }_"‘_E!__C_’__

B : SHC 648G = 5. — -

————— — —

C: SHCs005T
D SHDELEI L

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

| wee drung  @long  The Yo t/ep# o7 gggﬁox\.'f Ave

when / .F&/a/snfvu PRW a4 Fax; Gu.f..;a,f Lo a/sAp

e road . 17 War Sfro  Pudiltn od | Ada’ "

Mana ¢ 4o ftact Tn Fmi . TS ek bud H

wa-j") 20 iZ7e o/fc‘za/cf o *""5:’ Cor eplliokd 7T

K A ia Arond .

DECLARATION

I{Wedeciare the foregoing particulars are true in eypry respect

Palic hnl:uer 5 hn.ﬂu-e Driver's Signature Reporting Centre Pervonne!’s Signature
Date & Time .wf.r/.’w;? 77.30 4 (1 driver is not the policyhalder] Name
Cate B Time: NRIC/FIN No



233 redefining / insurance

(NG

L peee peug (e Tieig Yoo SDPBEO, cuons

HOR

authorized driver of vehide [Regisiration Na, ["Vehicle') do heraby
authorize 1he [Workshop/Insurer] to repair the Vehicle on a lump sum basis instead of pan
by pan.

2. The Workshop/insurer] has explained 1o me the difference batween lump sum repalr and
part by part repalr and the consequences of my authorization for lump sum repalr for the
Vishicle.

3. | understand that with lump sum repalr, the Workshop may use n mixture of genulne parts,
original equipment manulaciurer (CEM) parts, reconditioned and second hand parts to
carry oul the repair and | nota that the [Waorkshopl/insurer] will not be furnishing a detailed
breakdown of pans or price for such lump sum repair.

4 | am aware that AXA Insurance Ple Lid ("AXA Insurance”) does nol encourage lump sum
repalr as AXA Insurance strongly recommends repairs for vehicles on a paft by part basis
for Iransparency reasons. | confirm thal | will hold AXA Insurance harmiess from any claims
arising from the lump sum repair of the Yehicle which | have authorized.

5 " Tobe applicoble wherg pereon awthorizing is the authorizod divar.

| confirm that | have the sulthority from the aowner of the Vehicle jo authorize the lump sum
rapairs and that | have duly nolified ihe owner of 1he Vehicle of the contents of this Lelter
ol Authorzallon,

Signied and acknowledged by,

Signature of policyholder! suthorized driver® and company stamp (where applicable)
Date:

\4;.':_15!".{- r
)

Name and ture of workshop personnel Including workshop stamp
Date: '.I.Al-'l ,I #'

*authorized driver fo elther he named drivers as per molar Insurance policy or in the case of commerciai
vehicles, permilled ditvers who are permilisd lo diive the insured Vahicle.



ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD
' 280 Woodlands Industnial Park E3. #01-17.
' Harvest (@ Woodlands Singapore 757322
Tel: 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475

Vehicle Number : SIM 7733K

Vehicle Model : BMW 740L1 cchww - d BVE]
Chassis Number : WBAKB42040CY83247 Estimated Repair Cost
SN Parts Description Oty Price
] BONNET M7 1S 2900.00
2 BONNET LOCK M tpe Z s 3180.00
2 BONNET LOCK CATCH ”f’ 'rc,/f 5 160,000
4 BONNET CENTER LOCK CATCH ¥ s 45.00%
S BONNET INSULATION A&~ I 300.00
6  BONNET INSULATION CLIPS A4t <~ 5§ 125.00
7 BONNET RUBBERSTRIP A~ ~ I8 50.00
8  BONNET CENTER RUBBERSTRIP At~ — 1§ 45.00
9 BONNET HINGES (LH & RH) RH-% /LH-‘L Gve pC 2 s 180,00
I FRONT BUMPER pTorss /7 18 1 500,00
Il FRONT BUMPER CLIPS A~7 s 50,00
12 FRONT BUMPER CHROME MOULDING LI & R OB% 7 1§ 96,00
13 FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE (LH & RIDR$-0E[LH-X e s 70,00
14 FRONT BUMPER CENTER GRILLE m§ ~~ IS 68,010
15 FRONT BUMPER INNER SPONGE €A #~ IS 70,011
16 FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT frd =~ | S S00.00
17 FRONT BUMPER BRACKET A% < - 30,00
18 FRONT BUMPER INNER V-BAR Bf 77 » J 44.00
19 HEADLAMP NOZZLE (L1 & RH) RH 08 fud=X It 360,00
M HEADLAMP NOZZLE COVER (LH & RH)RH-0F [LH =% T 100,00
21 HEADLAMP NOZZLE HOSE 4 = 18 4800
22 HEADLAMP TOP RUBBER (1L H & RH) Y% - 140,000
23 HEADLAMP ( LH & RH) (HID) -8 {LH-—I/M 2 S 600,00
24 HEADLAMP RH BALLAST Ple ! S 800,00
25 HEADLAMP RH BULB C#4 e Z S 760,00
36 HEADLAMP PANEL RH ¥ % Refoir (R 130,00
27 FRONT GRILLE (LH & RH) CRA I 350,00
28 FRONT GRILLE INNER B ~L‘HETW ¥ / erp s 240.00
29 SUPPORT PANEL P9 % / buc I 630,00
10 FoGLAMPRH ¥/ CtR 1 S 270.00
31 FRONT SPLASH SHIELD (LH & Rj-hlﬂ*!bﬂ-{‘-“*"‘ (gl S 660.00
12 FRONT SPLASH SHIELD CLIPS pa- =~ )n’;w 100.00
33 olcooter R T 70 s 740.00
34 BRAKE AIR DUCTRH CRA 7~ 1 S 63.00
35 FRONT FENDER RH & LH Rt ~bwt | L= fepae” 717 2460.00
36 FRONT FENDER UPPER GARNISH (LH & RH\R‘*"M,"’H"{“ ZI[*s 300,00
37 FRONT FENDER UPPER GARNISH CLIPS (LH & RH) Fﬁzﬁm,& 100.00
38 AIRCONSUCTIONPIPE B3 BT/ i 350.00
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|

ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
280 Woodlands Industrial Park ES, #01-17.
Harvest (@ Woodlands Singapore 757322

Tel: 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475

39 AIRCON PRESSURE PIPE %_ BT~

I S 310.00
40 AIRCON DISCHARGE PIPE " BT ! S 310,00
41 ENGINE UNDER COVER ﬁ Wy P 1 5 200,00
42 ENGINE UNDER COVER CLIPS #2 NEe.~ 0 S 3o e
43 (HASSIS MEMBER RH ’,,_rm'y/ 1 b 250H0.00)
Spare Parts Total Prnice S 2453600
Cost Price =10% S 2453.60
S 26,989.60)
S/N Special Nett ltems: Oty |
| FRONT BUMPER DISTANCE SENSOR TYes s S 1610007 -1
: : L ? ’ ! P 4 : 5 P"‘ -
2 FRONT BUMPER DISTANCE SENSOR HOLDER As- & )(: 'r-"ffé 420,00
1 FRONT BUMPER DISTANCE SENSOR SEAL  Ram g 7(.& STper 4200
4 FRONT NUMBER PLATE WITH HOLDER 1844 /7 ISET Wﬁfu
Special Nett Total S 215200
Spare Part's Total Price a 29141.60
‘* ..fi"!__.q *F_ ¥ ‘H"‘IV

ASulL
qfaurotmés'
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ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

" 280 Woodlands Industrial Park ES. #01-17,

Harvest (@ Woodlands Singapore 757
Tel: 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475

Vehicle Number : SIM 7733K
Vehicle Model : BMW 74011
Chassis Number : WBAKB42040CYR3247

W
7z

Labour Descriptions

I LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE & INSTALL FRONT END
ATTACHMENTS & FITTINGS TO ENABLE REPAIRS: TO
STRAIGHTEN & REPAIRS RH HEADLAMP PANEL. FRONT
LH & RH FENDER AND FRONT SUPPORT PANEL: TO
REMOVE & REPLACE FRONT DAMAGED PARTS AS

LISTED ABOVE.
£

2 TOSPRAY PAINTING ON: BONNET (INNER, OUTER).
FRONT BUMPER. FRONT SL'PEDR? PANEL AND FRONT

BOTH FENDER. FRONT RH DOOR

wa

& FITTINGS TO ENABLE REPAIRS: TOVACUUM &
CHARGES UP GAS

4 TOREMOVE & INSTALL RADIATOR & HOSES &

ELECTRICAL FANS TO ENABLE REPAIRS: INCLUDING

PRESSURIZE COOLING.

1

TO REMOVE & REPLACE HEADLAMP. CHECK
LIGHTING & FOCUS HEADLIGHTS.

6 TODRILL 7 PCS SENSORS HOLES AND REPLACE
SENSORS.

T TOREMOVE & REPLACE HEADLAMP WIPER JET C'W

MOTOR. RE-ALIGN & TEST FUNCTION.

8 TOCARRY OUT E.C.U. CHECK. REMOVE & CLEAR
FAULT CODES AFTER NECESSARY ACCIDENT
REPAIRS.

Ay SUABOUR'CHARGE FOR TOP UP ENGINE COOLANT

Thied ety sbrvey I on @ “Withoot P

& & & & % & =

Sarr TR o
Sipy B (e

Rrhnowisnnad by Hepsioed
Skrnmtire

Dsta: i

TO REMOVE & INSTALL A/C CONDENSER |, A/C PIPINGS

yeed 3 20 | tiirlng rSUVEY Labour Tonal

Pans & Labour Tomal

Charges
5 JME'I {‘m
S :M[J |§ o
8 20000 30
S ! r/mﬂ'ﬁ Jo
S LD Co
S | }Mﬁ ¥ gﬂ
S 100,00 X
S 3l (So
8 | S
5 360000
S 34741.60
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ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

280 Woodlands Industrnial Park ES, #01-17,
Harvest (@ Woodlands Singapore 757322
Tel: 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475

Vehicle Number : SIM 7733K
Vehicle Model : BMW 740L1
Chassis Number : WBAKB42040CYR3247

Estimated Repair Cost

S'N Parts Description Oty Price

| BONNET W7 E 2000.00

2  BONNET LOCK M e r s 380400 |10
3 BONNET LOCK CATCH M7 Ipe A s 16000 51
4 BONNET CENTER LOCK CATCH X3V 1S 45.00 X

5 BONNET INSULATION A&~ (I 300.00

6 BONNET INSULATION CLIPS A4 7~ 25§ 125.00

7 BONNET RUBBERSTRIP A~ 1S 50.00

8 Bnhm:t L]:??I!l;:R RUBBI—.RSIRII-T Eﬁris"“ I8 45.00

9 BONNET HINGES (LH & RH) RH=" pC 2 S 180,00 X

10 FRONT BUMPER JTorss ~~ 18 1500.00

11 FRONT BUMPER CLIPS A= ([ 50,00

12 FRONT BUMPER CHROME MOULDING LH & RHO® 7~ 2§ 96.00

13 FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE (LH & RH) R #- 0 [LH-X$YC e 7040 75
14 FRONT BUMPER CENTER GRILLE M4 1S 68.00

IS FRONT BUMPER INNER SPONGE €A 7~ . 70,00

I6  FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT frd =~ 1S 800,00

17 FRONT BUMPER BRACKET A% © 2 8 30.00

I8 FRONT BUMPER INNER V-BAR Bf 7~ 2 S 44.00

19 HEADLAMP NOZZLE (LH & RH) f¥ %/LH-K‘”"" [p<Z, s 36000 (67
20 HEADLAMP NOZZLE COVER (LH & RH}RH-OE{LH—M”L/ S 10800 5O
21 HEADLAMP NOZZLE HOSE o <~ 1S 48.00

22 HEADLAMP TOP RUBBER (LH & RH) )% ¢4 2 8 140.00

23 HEADLAMP ( LH & RH) (HID)R#-s0 [LH = 7. O “ 2§ $600.00

24 HEADLAMP RH BALLAST Plle ~ 1S 010,00

35 HEADLAMP RH BULB C# 7 | e Z S 76060 3&0
26 HEADLAMP PANEL RH 7 IS 130.00

27 FRONT GRILLE (LH & RH) CRA ~ 2 8 350.00

28 FRONT GRILLE INNER BRAC I:I'W oy g 240.00

29 SUPPORT PANEL PP - 4 S 630,00

30 FOGLAMPRH 7 (m”” (. 270.00

31 FRONT SPLASH SHIELD (LH & R}{am'sd—f'-“-")‘m'l [ 66040 1% 9
12 FRONT SPLASH SHIELD CLIPS pa- =~ (oS 10000 £ o
33 OILCOOLER RH ¥ o0 ~ s 740,00

34 BRAKE AIR DUCT RiI CRA 7~ |8 65.00

35 FRONT FENDER RH & LT R ~bwt | LH-fepa” ﬁJ[F_S 2460700 [ L5+
36 FRONT FENDER UPPER GARNISH (LH & RH) R“r'h,'-“" ZIfes 300:60 /5 9
37 FRONT FENDER UPPER GARNISH {'1-|P5.|J-t¢'¢k|lam2f(ﬁ.?ﬂfn,& 10060 3 0
38 AIRCON SUCTIONPIPE 7, Lt i Ml 350.00
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ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
280 Woodlands Industrial Park ES. #01-17,
Harvest (@ Woodlands Singapore 757322
Tel: 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475
39 AIRCON PRESSURE PIPE - W 7

| s 310.00
7
40 AIRCON DISCHARGE PIPE - H- i - | S 310.00
41 ENGINE UNDER COVER o e-& - S 200.00
42 ENGINE UNDER COVER CLIPS f: Asa- 20 5 100.00
43 CHASSIS MEMBER RH '.‘fm]/ | b 2500.00 %
Maal - - 3
o Spare Parts Total Price 5 24536.00
1 .I}? Cost Price +10% S 2453.60
2 / S 2698960
. ) +f O
0 b1k
S/N Special Nett ltems: - Oty X
1 FRONT BUMPER DISTANCE SENSOR A 2 "z-fﬁ ;9(4; S Hlo I,brl'ﬂ.’ﬁt:- -9
2 FRONT BUMPER DISTANCE SENSOR HOLDER M~ wtll 7005 STp~> 420, ]
3 FRONT BUMPER DISTANCE SENSOR SEAL Rem e (s STpar 420 |
4 FRONT NUMBER PLATE WITH HOLDER 18£8 /~~ 1SET : 5o
Special Nett Total $ 2152.00
Spare Part's Total Pnce 5 29141.60
., 697460 HoUL- N
gl
rn|| -IJ 1) u.r q@m&g

7 o ta.)
2,560

ko - dowp
18, ¢ * ?#L/J

Ml s
. a2 50 ‘)&l‘bl[ﬁ (@ o9 b
0
_ 'Jﬁk (&S - NIL
Ry = hdberieo{

- Ruawrnny b e
Fi\tﬂl) fm:‘dl- |He of

_ caft S ""-/’"V
wd"""h.'k"“g g'l ‘ r‘ Page20f3



ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
280 Woodlands Industrial Park ES, #01-17,
Harvest (@ Woodlands Singapore 757322

Tel: 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475

Vehicle Number : SIM 7733K
Vehicle Model : BMW 740LI
Chassis Number : WBAKB42040CYR83247

Labour Descriptions

Charges

L

h

LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE & INSTALL FRONT END
ATTACHMENTS & FITTINGS TO ENABLE REPAIRS; TO
STRAIGHTEN & REPAIRS RH HEADLAMP PANEL, FRONT
LH & RH FENDER AND FRONT SUPPORT PANEL: TO
REMOVE & REPLACE FRONT DAMAGED PARTS AS
LISTED ABOVE.

ol
TO SPRAY P:E'[NTING ON: BONNET (INNER, OUTER),
FRONT BUMPER. FRONT SUFEDR';' PANEL AND FRONT
BOTH FENDER, FRONT RH DOOR.

TO REMOVE & INSTALL A/C CONDENSER . A/C PIPINGS
& FITTINGS TO ENABLE REPAIRS: TO VACUUM &
CHARGES UP GAS.

TO REMOVE & INSTALL RADIATOR & HOSES &
ELECTRICAL FANS TO ENABLE REPAIRS: INCLUDING
PRESSURIZE COOLING.

TO REMOVE & REPLACE HEADLAMP. CHECK
LIGHTING & FOCUS HEADLIGHTS.

TO DRILL 7 PCS SENSORS HOLES AND REPLACE
SENSORS.

TO REMOVE & REPLACE HEADLAMP WIPER JET C/'W
MOTOR, RE-ALIGN & TEST FUNCTION.

TO CARRY OUT E.C.U. CHECK. REMOVE & CLEAR
FAULT CODES AFTER NECESSARY ACCIDENT
REPAIRS

LABOUR CHARGE FOR TOP UP ENGINE COOLANT
Labour Total

Parts & Labour Total

250000 [ b v

:}Mﬁu [§uo

20000 )0

100.00 XN

W[f o
‘ywmﬁlflﬁ(““‘

350
‘.,,.-'-"—

5600.00

34741.60
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Claim No :

OWN DAMAGE CLAIM DISCHARGE VOUCHER

TO AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTELTD

| / We hereby declare that the repairs to my / our vehicle registration no

grm ¥B3L

| / We acknowledge that payment of the sum of $ 2], 49000 e/

have been completed to my / our satisfaction and

the repairer for such repair shallbe in full discharge of my /our under

Policy No : G ?“"'f‘ I?OfJ I in respect of the damage causelld!m my / our

.

<aid motor vehicle in the accident which occurred on the lq l

Poli ver/ On Be
Name : (hun Tihg_ Kee
NRIC No ; , S 1133 boo

L
Signature : _%&Z}‘i
1

Date - » ]1”'?

With modern technology, glass remaval miy
sffect the memory of the default security 1etting.
if It happen, we cannot be responsile for the reselling

Remarks




Elite .
AuUutTomotive pte Lt sssevics

%_/
=
Co.Regn No: 2017001960

280 Woodlands Industrial Park ES #01-17 Harvest@Woodlands (S) 757322 GST.Reg.No: 2017001960
Hotline: 8660 6722 Tel: 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475 Emall: elite.automative13@gmail.com

TAX INVOICE NO : EAL1S08-359

Messrs  : AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Date : 7/8/2019

Address : 8 SHENTON WAY, #27-01
SINGAPORE D6BB11

Emall Muobile : Home/Office Tel :
No Description Qty Amount
ICLE NO: SJM 7733K 40Ll

1 |LUMP SUM REPAIR 1 | S 20,000.00

$ 20,000.00

GST| 7% |$ 1,400.00

Total | § 21,400.00

Elite Autemotive Pte Lid Custamer Signature & Company Stamp



